BID TABULATION

Grader Blades, Cutting Edges, Pick Blades and Bits
Bid No. 5334
Opening: Thursday, July 14, 2016 at 1:00 p.m.

Bid Deposit —
C
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| 5 |2 |58
Name / City State o O Z <
H & L Mesabi, Hibbing, MN \ v $21,755.00 $113,794.85 $43,024.81 $26,840.00
Valley Blades, Waterloo, Ontario \ v $24.487.20 $93,933.74 $36,303.48 $26.088.48
Titan Machinery, Hermantown, MN N N $31.899.10 | $115.123.43 $39.545.05 $51,085.08
Winter Equipment, Willoughby, OH \ N No Bid No Bid $42,945.97 $41,602.00
Ziegler, Duluth, MN N \ $20,607.40 No Bid No Bid $26,815.54

/s/ Rosie Hagberg

Bids Opened By:

In Presence Of:

/s/ Pamela Waldriff




