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  Official Newspaper
     Legal Notices $4.20 0.2991 $2.60 0.15476 $4.24 0.3014 $4.40 0.3143 $4.80 0.32432
     Board Proceedings $4.20 0.2991 $2.60 0.15476 $4.24 0.3014 $4.40 0.3143 $4.80 0.32432
  Notice of Expiration of Redemption
     1st Publication No Bid No Bid $2.60 0.15476 $4.24 0.3014 $4.40 0.3143 $4.80 0.32432
     2nd Publication No Bid No Bid $2.60 0.15476 $4.24 0.3014 $4.40 0.3143 $4.80 0.32432
  Financial Statement
     1st Publication No Bid No Bid $2.60 0.15476 $4.24 0.3014 $4.40 0.3143 $4.80 0.32432
     2nd Publication/Location No Bid No Bid $2.60 0.15476 $4.24 0.3014 $4.40 0.3143 $4.80 0.32432
  Delinquent Tax List
     1st Publication No Bid No Bid $2.60 0.15476 $4.24 0.3014 $4.40 0.3143 $4.80 0.32432
     2nd Publication No Bid No Bid $2.60 0.15476 $4.24 0.3014 $4.40 0.3143 $4.80 0.32432

Distribuiton
Accept Procurement Card
Proposal Form/Worksheet
Non-Collusion
Extend Other Political Subdivisions

Weekly Weekly Weekly

Duluth 
News-Tribune

Duluth  MN

Weekly

Bids Opened By:                                                                             In Presence Of:                                    

Yes
No Yes

No No
Yes Yes

No

No

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

Yes
Yes
Yes

No
Yes

Proctor 
Journal

Proctor  MN

Cook 
Herald News

Cook  MN

BID TABULATION
Legal Advertising 2016

RFB 5283

Opening:  Tuesday, November 17, 2015
Time:  1:00 PM 

Ely 
Echo

Ely  MN

Zenith 
News

Cloquet  MN

Daily
Yes
Yes
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