








October 2014 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount

0 NOBID $54,000.00

2 0 NO BID $10,000.00

3 116 Ginga Beleza Newton $8,800.00 $8,800.00

4 117 Carl WClark and Jennifer DClark $4,700.00 $4,700.00

5 0 NOBID $26,500.00

6 0 NO BID $10,500.00

7 0 NOBID $20,100.00

8 0 NO BID $45,000.00

9 112 Robert KVDS and Darleen KVDS 511,800.00 $22,000.00

10 0 NO BID 52,400.00

II 127 John D Alsaker and Florence Amy Alsaker 55,100.00 $5,100.00

12 0 NO BID 5153,900.00

13 a NO BID S18,2oo.00

14 122 Cynthia Carlson and Timothy Carlson $16,100.00 $16,100.00

IS 0 NO BID $52,000.00

16 0 NO BID 58,800.00

17 108 Friends ofSax-Zim Bog $42,750,00 $42,750.00

18 123 Clayton Brown and Carol Brown $5,000.00 $15,000.00

19 0 NO BID S5,100.00

20 0 NO BID 511,600.00

21 0 NO BID S2,OOO.00

22 0 NO BID $3,000.00

23 0 NO BID $360.00

24 0 NO BID $660.00

2S 0 NO BID 5330.00

26 0 NO BID $360.00
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27 0 NO BID S660.00

28 0 NO BID S660.00

29 0 NOBID S660.00

30 0 NOBID S660.00

31 0 NO BID S550.00

32 0 NO BID S660.00

33 0 NO BID S660.00

34 0 NO BID S660.00

35 0 NO BID SI.725.00

36 0 NO BID S660.00

37 0 NO BID S660.00

38 0 NO BID SI.725.00

39 0 NO BID SI.800.00

40 0 NO BID $3.000.00

41 0 NO BID S6.825.00

42 0 NOBID S5.625.00

Total Tracts 42 Total Value S546.250.00

Pu led Tracts 0 Pulled Tracts Value SO.OO

Net Available Tracts 42 Net Total Value S546,250.oo SI14.450.00

Total Tracts Sold 7

Percent or Available Tracts Sold 16.67% Percent or Appraised Value Sold 20.95%
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