








October 2013 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount

108 Shaun Blasey and Corey Flahcrty S20.500.00 S25.000.00

2 0 NOB[D SI2.600.00 SO.OO

3 0 NO BID S32.ooo.00 SO.OO

4 [20 Ryan Perkovich $32.000.00 S32.000.00

5 0 NO BID 1 SI8.200.00 SO.OO

6 0 NOBID $3.500.00 SO.OO

7 0 NO BID SI0.500.00 SO.OO

8 0 NO BID S57.400.00 SO.OO

9 0 NOBID 16.800.00 SO.OO

10 0 NO BID S25.500.00 SO.OO

II 0 NOBID S25.650.00 SO.OO

12 114 Rachellc Maloney and Palriek Maloney S24.000.00 $24.000.00

13 999 PULLED S4,OOO.00 SO.OO

14 0 NO BID 17,000.00 SO.00

15 0 NOBID S6.500.00 $0.00

16 0 NO BID S6,OOO.00 SO.OO

17 118 Kenneth Sletten and Wanita Sletten S16,900.00 S16,900.00

18 109 William K Miller and Stephanie J Hemphill $19.300.00 119.300.00

19 112 Lindsey Elizabeth Royer and Matthew Wayne Conito 12,350.00 12.350.00

20 0 NOBID S28.000.00 $0.00

21 0 NO BID S8.000.00 SO.OO

22 0 NOBID SI3.100.00 SO.OO

23 0 NO BID S26,500.00 $0.00

24 0 NOBID S26,500.00 $0.00

25 0 NO BID S500.00 $0.00

26 0 NO BID S500.00 $0.00
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27 0 NO BID $40000 $0.00

28 0 NO BID $400.00 $0.00

29 0 NO BID $12,300.00 $0.00

30 0 NO BID $425.00 $0.00

31 0 NO BID 540000 $0.00

32 0 NO BID 5400.00 50.00

Total Tracts 32 Total Value 5448,125.00

Pulled Tracts Pulled Tracts Value 54,000.00

Net Available Tracts 31 Net Total Value 5444,125.00 5119,550.00

Tolal Tracts Sold 6

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 19.35~{' Percent of Appraised Value Sold 26.92%
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