June 2015 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 115 George L Bailey $28,000.00 $28,000.00
2 0 NO BID $8,750.00 $0.00
3 0 NO BID $9,000.00 $0.00
4 0 NO BID $70,000.00 $0.00
5 0 NO BID $6,150.00 $0.00
6 0 NO BID $131,000.00 $0.00
7 0 NO BID $83,000.00 $0.00
8 0 NO BID $749,500.00 $0.00
9 0 NO BID $6,250.00 $0.00
10 122 Ashli Hales $18,500.00 $27,000.00
11 0 NO BID $9,000.00 $0.00
12 0 NO BID $28,200.00 $0.00
13 0 NO BID $21,500.00 $0.00
14 999 PULLED $3,800.00 $0.00
15 0 NO BID $21,300.00 $0.00
16 0 NO BID $25,750.00 $0.00
17 0 NO BID $24,000.00 $0.00
18 107 Virgil W Lindstrom and Karen J Lindstrom $40,000.00 $80,000.00
19 126 Kathy Kangas $6,300.00 $24,500.00
20 117 Marilyn M Peterson $78,400.00 $91,000.00
21 0 NO BID $38,000.00 $0.00
22 0 NO BID $9,200.00 $0.00
23 0 NO BID $15,750.00 $0.00
24 0 NO BID $13,650.00 $0.00
25 0 NO BID $18,600.00 $0.00
26 0 NO BID $15,000.00 $0.00
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27 0 NO BID $23,000.00 $0.00
28 118 John Longhenry $4,500.00 $4,500.00
29 0 NO BID $1,750.00 $0.00
30 0 NO BID $5,000.00 $0.00
31 0 NO BID $2,100.00 $0.00
32 0 NO BID $1,700.00 $0.00
33 0 NO BID $22,300.00 $0.00
34 0 NO BID $400.00 $0.00
35 0 NO BID $2,900.00 $0.00
36 120 Seppo Tasaranta and Seija Tasaranta $28,500.00 $30,000.00
Total Tracts 36 Total Value $1,570,750.00

Pulled Tracts 1 Pulled Tracts Value ~ $3,800.00

Net Available Tracts 35 Net Total Value $1,566,950.00 $285,000.00
Total Tracts Sold 7

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 20.00% Percent of Appraised Value Sold 18.19%
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