October 2017 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22170169 NO BID $167,800.00 $0.00
2 C22170170 One Roof Community Housing, a Minnesota nonprofit ¢ $5,100.00 $5,100.00
3 C22170203 NO BID $30,100.00 $0.00
4 C22170172 Joseph Sauve $6,800.00 $6,800.00
5 C22170215 NO BID $21,700.00 $0.00
6 C22160233 PULLED $38,950.00 $0.00
7 C22160240 NO BID $133,000.00 $0.00
8 C22170173 NO BID $49,000.00 $0.00
9 C22170174 Kristine S Willenson $12,000.00 $12,000.00
10 C22170178 NO BID $7,700.00 $0.00
11 C22170179 NO BID $7,700.00 $0.00
12 C22170180 NO BID $20,800.00 $0.00
13 C22170181 Kathleen Anne Johnson $24,250.00 $24,250.00
14 C22170184 NO BID $43,500.00 $0.00
15 C22170071 NO BID $38,400.00 $0.00
16 C22170186 NO BID $61,000.00 $0.00
17 C22170187 Barbara Koralia $33,400.00 $33,400.00
18 C22170188 NO BID $38,250.00 $0.00
19 C22170190 Carl Wagner $27,000.00 $27,000.00
20 C22170214 Zenith Terrace Associates, LLP $12,000.00 $165,000.00
21 C22170213 Zenith Terrace Associates, LLP $18,000.00 $30,000.00
22 C22170205 Kristi-Leigh Jensen $10,400.00 $18,000.00
23 C22170154 NO BID $27,100.00 $0.00
24 C22170155 NO BID $4,700.00 $0.00
25 C22170157 NO BID $4,400.00 $0.00
26 C22170158 NO BID $1,600.00 $0.00
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27 C22160003 NO BID $3,300.00 $0.00
28 C22160004 NO BID $3,700.00 $0.00
29 C22170156 Mary Kaye Kuzma $2,600.00 $2,600.00
30 C22170206 Joel Del Caro $21,400.00 $21,400.00
31 C22170207 Tip Top Chimney LLC $28,000.00 $28,000.00
32 C22170137 NO BID $3,800.00 $0.00
33 C22170139 Brenda Ryberg $3,600.00 $3,600.00
34 C22170208 NO BID $38,450.00 $0.00
35 C22170140 Karl A Rother and Krystal A Rother $2,400.00 $2,400.00
36 C22170141 Karl A Rother and Krystal A Rother $8,000.00 $8,000.00
37 C22170130 NO BID $10,300.00 $0.00
38 C22170129 NO BID $14,000.00 $0.00
39 C22170131 NO BID $9,600.00 $0.00
40 C22170132 NO BID $11,000.00 $0.00
41 C22170133 NO BID $6,100.00 $0.00
42 C22170134 NO BID $6,000.00 $0.00
43 22160084 NO BID $400.00 $0.00
44 C22160083 NO BID $400.00 $0.00
45 C22170150 NO BID $9,600.00 $0.00
46 C22170136 NO BID $5,900.00 $0.00
47 C22170135 Shannon Babb $6,100.00 $6,100.00
48 C22170142 NO BID $2,100.00 $0.00
49 C22170209 NO BID $15,200.00 $0.00
50 C22170210 NO BID $25,700.00 $0.00
51 C22170211 Mark Fenlason $23,100.00 $25,000.00
52 C22170163 NO BID $3,000.00 $0.00
53 C22170164 NO BID $5,100.00 $0.00
54 C22170166 Bradlee A Koski $3,000.00 $3,000.00
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55 C22170151 Jeffrey Kline and Gerald Kline $5,100.00 $5,100.00
56 C22170152 NO BID $600.00 $0.00
57 C22150171 NO BID $3,600.00 $0.00
58 C22160056 NO BID $2,000.00 $0.00
59 C22170146 Jesse Gulbranson $7,300.00 $7,300.00
60 C22110121 NO BID $4,950.00 $0.00
61 C22170147 NO BID $29,200.00 $0.00
62 C22170148 Mitchell Tieg Troumbly $58,400.00 $58,400.00
63 C22170191 Elizabeth Gilbert Marinos $16,500.00 $16,500.00
64 C22170193 Tara L Tyo $20,950.00 $20,950.00
65 C22170194 NO BID $19,200.00 $0.00
66 C22110076 NO BID $13,100.00 $0.00
67 C22130146 Martin Lehto and Elaine Lehto $3,350.00 $3,350.00
68 C22110130 Theodore J Kimmes $6,900.00 $6,900.00
69 C22170195 NO BID $65,700.00 $0.00
70 C22170196 Nathaniel Aili $38,600.00 $38,600.00
71 C22170197 Brandon R Behrends $3,700.00 $3,800.00
72 C22170198 Michael T Nelson $10,000.00 $10,000.00
73 C22130097 NO BID $3,600.00 $0.00
74 C22170216 Kevin Hard $115,500.00 $150,000.00
75 C22140031 Brackett Paine and Rachel Paine $3,100.00 $3,100.00
76 C22170149 NO BID $18,700.00 $0.00
77 C22170199 NO BID $19,300.00 $0.00
78 C22160043 NO BID $44,150.00 $0.00
79 C22160177 NO BID $63,349.23 $0.00
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Total Tracts

Pulled Tracts

Net Available Tracts
Total Tracts Sold

Percent of Available Tracts Sold

79

1

78

30

38.46%

Total Value $1,693,349.23

Pulled Tracts Value $0.00
Net Total Value $1,693,349.23 $745,650.00

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 44.03%
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