October 2018 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22150051  NOBID $1,260.00 $0.00
2 C22170041  NOBID $5,000.00 $0.00
3 C22180062  NOBID $11,850.00 $0.00
4 C22180063  Kayli Staubus $2,250.00 $3,100.00
5 C22180076  NOBID $16,200.00 $0.00
6 C22180208  NOBID $4,650.00 $0.00
7 C22180216  NOBID $5,100.00 $0.00
8 C22180217  NOBID $15,225.00 $0.00
9 C22180209  NOBID $8,300.00 $0.00
10 C22180218  DLM Company LLC $6,975.00 $14,500.00
11 C22180256  NOBID $4,350.00 $0.00
12 C22180093  NOBID $9,000.00 $0.00
13 C22180211  NOBID $10,275.00 $0.00
14 C22150062  NOBID $420.00 $0.00
15 C22180257  NOBID $3,375.00 $0.00
16 C22180254 Talle and Associates, Inc $8,025.00 $19,000.00
17 C22180082  Allen Brandt $7,950.00 $7,950.00
18 C22180221  Michael Hudson $2,025.00 $2,025.00
19 C22180223  Luke Johnson $2,325.00 $2,325.00
20 C22180083  NOBID $3,675.00 $0.00
21 C22180212  NOBID $7,200.00 $0.00
22 C22180145  NOBID $500.00 $0.00
23 C22180267  NOBID $23,950.00 $0.00
24 C22180251  NOBID $4,725.00 $0.00
25 C22180238  Jean Seline $1,275.00 $5,000.00
26 C22180149  NOBID $250.00 $0.00
Friday, October 12, 2018 Page 1 of 5



Tract Contract Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
27 C22170357 NO BID $375.00 $0.00
28 C22170356 NO BID $3,075.00 $0.00
29 C22170353 NO BID $3,525.00 $0.00
30 22180097 James Haugen and Marjorie Haugen $8,400.00 $8,400.00
31 C22180152 PULLED $20.00 $0.00
32 C22170315 NO BID $14,925.00 $0.00
33 C22180235 Mitchell J. Farrell $90,500.00 $90,500.00
34 C22180234 NO BID $27,100.00 $0.00
35 C22170350 NO BID $1,650.00 $0.00
36 C22170349 NO BID $1,650.00 $0.00
37 C22170348 NO BID $1,650.00 $0.00
38 C22180230 NO BID $29,900.00 $0.00
39 C22180105 Briarwood Estates LLC $15,225.00 $15,225.00
40 C22180206 NO BID $8,600.00 $0.00
41 C22180191 NO BID $3,900.00 $0.00
42 C22180192 NO BID $2,500.00 $0.00
43 C22180193 NO BID $2,200.00 $0.00
44 C22180194 NO BID $2,200.00 $0.00
45 C22180195 NO BID $2,200.00 $0.00
46 C22170376 NO BID $6,600.00 $0.00
47 C22180233 NO BID $21,700.00 $0.00
48 C22180069 NO BID $5,250.00 $0.00
49 C22180259 NO BID $3,750.00 $0.00
50 C22180260 NO BID $3,450.00 $0.00
51 C22180261 NO BID $12,675.00 $0.00
52 C22170311 NO BID $4,425.00 $0.00
53 C22170320 NO BID $5,025.00 $0.00
54 C22170321 NO BID $3,750.00 $0.00
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55 C22170322 NO BID $5,025.00 $0.00
56 C22170327 NO BID $28,800.00 $0.00
57 C22170326 NO BID $7,800.00 $0.00
58 C22180109 NO BID $6,825.00 $0.00
59 C22180110 NO BID $3,975.00 $0.00
60 C22180157 NO BID $1,175.00 $0.00
61 C22180113 NO BID $13,425.00 $0.00
62 C22180229 Richard Reger and Carol Reger $3,225.00 $3,225.00
63 C22180158 NO BID $325.00 $0.00
64 C22180268 Richard S. Jensen $8,250.00 $11,500.00
65 C22180253 Samuel Adams $4,575.00 $7,000.00
66 C22180252 Michael Clement $4,275.00 $4,275.00
67 C22180248 Michelle E. Hanson $12,675.00 $20,000.00
68 C22180228 NO BID $6,975.00 $0.00
69 C22180247 Richard Welch $2,850.00 $6,000.00
70 C22180242 Austin McClellan $9,975.00 $15,000.00
71 C22180245 NO BID $14,025.00 $0.00
72 C22170330 NO BID $2,250.00 $0.00
73 C22180122 NO BID $3,300.00 $0.00
74 C22180244 NO BID $9,525.00 $0.00
75 C22180243 NO BID $9,525.00 $0.00
76 C22180227 NO BID $7,800.00 $0.00
77 C22180127 William Storbeck $3,800.00 $3,800.00
78 C22180262 John Barto and Karen Barto $225.00 $1,000.00
79 C22180226 Milton Clifford Beyer, Jr $7,125.00 $7,125.00
80 C22180264 Christian Mark Peterson $5,550.00 $11,000.00
81 C22180265 Jared Mevissen $3,600.00 $3,600.00
82 C22180241 NO BID $20,175.00 $0.00
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83 C22150178 Alexandra Pitheon Weselenak and Gabe Trujillo $50.00 $200.00
84 C22150180 Paul M. Williams, Joan M. Norton, Nancy A. Davidson a $13,860.00 $13,860.00
85 C22090113 PULLED $50.00 $0.00
86 C22090112 PULLED $10.00 $0.00
87 C22090133 PULLED $50.00 $0.00
88 C22090135 PULLED $50.00 $0.00
89 C22090130 PULLED $50.00 $0.00
90 C22090156 PULLED $50.00 $0.00
91 C22090137 PULLED $75.00 $0.00
92 C22090157 PULLED $50.00 $0.00
93 C22090116 PULLED $100.00 $0.00
94 C22180213 NO BID $115,000.00 $0.00
95 C22160024 NO BID $4,900.00 $0.00
96 C22180089 Rory M. Blazevic and Katelyn T. Blazevic $33,900.00 $46,500.00
97 C22180173 NO BID $1,125.00 $0.00
98 C22180266 Seth C. Aili and Rosa L. Aili $58,900.00 $58,900.00
99 C22180190 Kirk M. Marleau and Karen N. Marleau $7,575.00 $7,575.00
100 C22180214 NO BID $8,100.00 $0.00
101 C22180314 NO BID $12,600.00 $0.00
102 C22180240 NO BID $11,325.00 $0.00
103 C22180239 Norma Janke $38,775.00 $41,000.00
104 C22150121 NO BID $68,000.00 $0.00
105 C22150120 NO BID $72,000.00 $0.00
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Total Tracts

Pulled Tracts

Net Available Tracts
Total Tracts Sold

Percent of Available Tracts Sold

105

10

95

28

29.47%

Total Value $1,105,995.00
Pulled Tracts Value $0.00
Net Total Value $1,105,995.00 $429,585.00

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 38.84%
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