June 2017 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22170061 NO BID $80,500.00 $0.00
2 C22170062 NO BID $84,800.00 $0.00
3 C22170033 Michael J Letourneau $24,800.00 $24,800.00
4 C22170040 NO BID $23,300.00 $0.00
5 C22160220 NO BID $10,500.00 $0.00
6 C22170030 NO BID $10,700.00 $0.00
7 C22170028 NO BID $29,500.00 $0.00
8 C22170049 NO BID $10,700.00 $0.00
9 C22170013 NO BID $4,300.00 $0.00
10 C22170050 NO BID $29,700.00 $0.00
11 C22170016 Soup Town, LLC $33,800.00 $45,000.00
12 C22120110 NO BID $7,000.00 $0.00
13 C22140226 NO BID $56,000.00 $0.00
14 C22170036 NO BID $51,800.00 $0.00
15 C22170037 NO BID $63,300.00 $0.00
16 C22170042 NO BID $30,400.00 $0.00
17 C22170071 Bob Billington $38,400.00 $38,400.00
18 C22140122 John T Sargent and Ruth A Sargent $10,680.00 $22,000.00
19 C22140123 Andrea Kuzel and Bradley Kuzel $11,576.00 $11,700.00
20 C22140124 Andrea Kuzel and Bradley Kuzel $11,712.00 $15,000.00
21 C22140125 Athony Socher $11,168.00 $16,500.00
22 C22170083 PULLED $11,200.00 $0.00
23 C22170044 NO BID $32,850.00 $0.00
24 C22170074 NO BID $19,500.00 $0.00
25 C22170045 Christina Martin $2,700.00 $2,700.00
26 C22170032 Larry McLaughlin $3,400.00 $3,400.00
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27 C22170046 Travis Nelson $35,000.00 $39,500.00
28 C22170021 NO BID $4,000.00 $0.00
29 C22170020 NO BID $2,100.00 $0.00
30 C22170031 Paul Panichi and Jennifer Panichi $5,400.00 $5,400.00
31 C22170043 Phillip Medina $4,100.00 $4,100.00
32 C22160211 Riley Bixby and DreAnna Plaisted $2,600.00 $2,600.00
33 C22170014 NO BID $2,600.00 $0.00
34 C22170015 NO BID $2,600.00 $0.00
35 C22170079 NO BID $22,800.00 $0.00
36 C22170078 NO BID $3,800.00 $0.00
37 C22170077 PULLED $5,100.00 $0.00
38 C22170080 Terrence K Driscoll and Jeanne M Driscoll $7,800.00 $10,500.00
39 C22160080 Jacob Norman and Ben Norman $400.00 $400.00
40 C22170048 Travis Niemi $5,000.00 $5,000.00
41 C22170038 NO BID $26,800.00 $0.00
42 C22170039 Terry L Davis and Gina L Davis $3,800.00 $3,800.00
43 C22170022 PULLED $11,400.00 $0.00
44 C22170076 Samuel Guillen and Christine M Guillen $6,800.00 $6,800.00
45 C22170075 NO BID $6,300.00 $0.00
46 C22170023 NO BID $11,200.00 $0.00
47 C22170024 NO BID $12,000.00 $0.00
48 C22170025 NO BID $16,300.00 $0.00
49 C22170082 NO BID $9,900.00 $0.00
50 C22170026 NO BID $14,200.00 $0.00
51 C22170010 David Jerlcovich $2,200.00 $2,200.00
52 C22170081 NO BID $21,600.00 $0.00
53 C22170011 George Michael Pogachnik $7,200.00 $7,200.00
54 C22170012 NO BID $21,500.00 $0.00
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55 C22170035  NOBID $17,700.00 $0.00
56 C22160017  Tamara Lehti $1,000.00 $1,000.00
57 C22170019  NOBID $11,000.00 $0.00
58 C22170060  NOBID $53,300.00 $0.00
59 C22170059  NOBID $32,700.00 $0.00
60 C22170063  NOBID $27,200.00 $0.00
61 C22170057  PULLED $41,200.00 $0.00
62 C22170058  PULLED $33,800.00 $0.00
63 C22170018 Leianne Knoll Krajewski and Ryan Krajewski $14,000.00 $14,000.00
64 C22170027  NOBID $24,500.00 $0.00
65 C22170073  Kevin Christiansen $32,100.00 $52,500.00
66 C22170017  NOBID $10,100.00 $0.00
67 22170072 Pine Forest Properties $9,100.00 $9,100.00
68 C22170029  David Tedman $16,900.00 $16,900.00
69 C22170052  NOBID $49,000.00 $0.00
70 C22170053  NOBID $64,000.00 $0.00
71 C22170054  NOBID $54,500.00 $0.00
72 C22170055  NOBID $16,000.00 $0.00
73 C22160142  NOBID $59,500.00 $0.00
74 C22160143  NOBID $60,000.00 $0.00
75 C22170056  NOBID $61,500.00 $0.00

Total Tracts 75 Total Value $1,667,886.00

Pulled Tracts 5 Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Available Tracts 70 Net Total Value $1,667,886.00 $360,500.00

Total Tracts Sold 25

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 35.71% Percent of Appraised Value Sold 21.61%
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