February 2017 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22160237 NO BID $34,969.99 $0.00
2 C22160225 NO BID $9,500.00 $0.00
3 C22160220 NO BID $48,053.47 $0.00
4 (22160233  NO BID $48,700.00 $0.00
5 C22160200 NO BID $7,300.00 $0.00
6 C22160195 NO BID $19,500.00 $0.00
7 C22120020 NO BID $5,300.00 $0.00
8 C22160240 NO BID $166,300.00 $0.00
9 C22160086 Paul Michael Rainaldi $12,000.00 $13,500.00
10 C22160227 NO BID $67,900.00 $0.00
11 C22160055 PULLED $125,000.00 $0.00
12 (22160206  NO BID $39,300.00 $0.00
13 C22160222 NO BID $11,600.00 $0.00
14 (22160223  NO BID $100,000.00 $0.00
15 (22160196 ~ PULLED $25,100.00 $0.00
16 C22160234 Tyler Burzynski $22,900.00 $63,000.00
17 C22160208 NO BID $10,000.00 $0.00
18 C22160203 NO BID $25,600.00 $0.00
19 C22140217 NO BID $599,600.00 $0.00
20 C22160235 NO BID $33,200.00 $0.00
21 C22160232 Laura Rose Lindemood $22,200.00 $52,000.00
22 C22160228 Jesse Hall and Amy Kelly-Hall $24,300.00 $37,000.00
23 C22160199 NO BID $6,000.00 $0.00
24 C22160231 NO BID $21,100.00 $0.00
25 C22120025 NO BID $4,500.00 $0.00
26 C22120026 NO BID $14,100.00 $0.00
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27 22120027 Maurice H Elkins, Jr and Cynthia S Otto $5,250.00 $5,250.00
28 C22160211 NO BID $24,500.00 $0.00
29 C22160226 NO BID $5,400.00 $0.00
30 C22160212 NO BID $4,300.00 $0.00
31 C22160213 NO BID $3,100.00 $0.00
32 C22160183 NO BID $7,300.00 $0.00
33 C22160204 NO BID $10,500.00 $0.00
34 C22160205 NO BID $6,800.00 $0.00
35 C22160214 NO BID $25,000.00 $0.00
36 C22160215 NO BID $1,000.00 $0.00
37 C22160015 NO BID $4,100.00 $0.00
38 C22160210 Rudolph Krueger $2,100.00 $2,500.00
39 C22160209 NO BID $2,700.00 $0.00
40 C22140219 NO BID $6,400.00 $0.00
41 C22160216 James Marano $10,500.00 $10,500.00
42 C22140220 NO BID $40,000.00 $0.00
43 C22160229 Ethan Humphreys $23,400.00 $23,400.00
44 C22120100 NO BID $960.00 $0.00
45 C22160230 NO BID $12,500.00 $0.00
46 C22160207 NO BID $2,200.00 $0.00
47 C22160198 David Scott Nordlund and Amanda Irene Nordlund $8,500.00 $8,500.00
48 C22130056 NO BID $21,300.00 $0.00
49 C22110131 NO BID $24,000.00 $0.00
50 C22110132 NO BID $25,750.00 $0.00
51 C22150114 NO BID $24,960.00 $0.00
52 C22140038 NO BID $123,120.00 $0.00
53 C22150107 NO BID $38,000.00 $0.00
54 C22160042 NO BID $30,000.00 $0.00
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55 C22160188 NO BID $168,000.00 $0.00
56 C22160179 NO BID $168,000.00 $0.00
57 C22150102 NO BID $3,600.00 $0.00
58 C22160238 Shawn Gulbranson $3,208.00 $3,208.00
59 C22140090 NO BID $14,560.00 $0.00
60 C22150008 NO BID $30,400.00 $0.00
61 C22160193 NO BID $70,100.00 $0.00
62 C22160194 NO BID $45,500.00 $0.00
63 C22160201 John Walsh and Joyce Walsh $56,800.00 $56,800.00
64 C22150178 NO BID $400.00 $0.00
65 C22160192 NO BID $9,300.00 $0.00
66 C22120104 NO BID $10,920.00 $0.00
67 C22120106 NO BID $15,600.00 $0.00
68 C22160221 NO BID $29,800.00 $0.00
69 C22120107 Rodney Politano and Judith Politano $13,840.00 $13,840.00
70 C22120103 NO BID $14,880.00 $0.00
71 C22120101 NO BID $12,000.00 $0.00
72 C22160180 William D Rippy and Mary L Rippy $15,000.00 $30,000.00
73 C22160186 Jeremy M Wood $18,100.00 $19,000.00
74 C22160185 Robert Lee Arch and Kristina Lynn Arch $6,400.00 $6,400.00
75 C22140238 NO BID $13,600.00 $0.00
76 C22130094 NO BID $17,360.00 $0.00
77 C22160024 NO BID $7,000.00 $0.00
78 C22120136 NO BID $18,400.00 $0.00
79 C22120142 NO BID $1,400.00 $0.00
80 C22150101 NO BID $1,360.00 $0.00
81 C22150105 NO BID $6,560.00 $0.00
82 C22160189 NO BID $16,200.00 $0.00
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83 C22140240 NO BID $24,000.00 $0.00
84 C22110069 NO BID $12,800.00 $0.00
85 C22140244 NO BID $14,000.00 $0.00
86 C22140237 NO BID $12,000.00 $0.00
87 C22140241 NO BID $8,960.00 $0.00
88 C22140236 NO BID $13,440.00 $0.00
89 C22140039 NO BID $4,080.00 $0.00
90 C22120040 NO BID $8,000.00 $0.00
91 (22120041  NO BID $5,840.00 $0.00
92 C22150014 NO BID $2,320.00 $0.00
93 C22130053 NO BID $3,725.00 $0.00
94 C22160178 David Fischer and Kissandra Fischer $7,800.00 $14,000.00
95 C22150106 David Laes and Christina Laes $8,320.00 $8,320.00
96 C22150182 NO BID $400.00 $0.00
97 22160202 Shawn Day $127,000.00 $155,000.00
98 C22160174 NO BID $82,000.00 $0.00
99 C22160175 NO BID $72,500.00 $0.00
100 C22160176 David J Limpus and Stephanie F Limpus $73,000.00 $73,000.00

Total Tracts 100 Total Value $3.266,136.46

Pulled Tracts 2 Pulled Tracts Value $150,100.00

Net Available Tracts 98 Net Total Value $3,116,036.46 $595,218.00

Total Tracts Sold 19

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 19.39%

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 19-10%

Thursday, February 09, 2017

Page 4 of 4





