Timber Auction Results
February 16, 2023

Sealed Bid Auction
Tract |Contract Bidder Appraised |[Bidup [Sold Price Down
Payment
1/C19230001 Sokoloski $23,887.45 17% $27,964.78 $3,583.12
Logging
2/C19230002 No Bid $557.00
31C19230003 Sunne Logging $18,865.72 44% $27,175.33 $2,829.86
4/C19230004 Boise White Paper $33,261.39 12% $37,215.00 $4,989.21
LLC
5/C19230005 Boise White Paper $30,183.03 51% $45,677.00 $4,527.45
LLC
6/C19230006 No Bid $4,610.88
7/C19230007 Boise White Paper $28,959.58 21% $35,140.00 $4,343.94
LLC
8/C19230008 Mike Nielsen $13,473.83 34% $18,087.04 $2,021.07
Logging
91C19230009 No Bid $15,994.73
10/C19230010 Mike Nielsen $20,417.69 35% $27,465.40 $3,062.65
Logging
11{C19230011 Mike Nielsen $32,953.61 22% $40,274.71 $4,943.04
Logging
12/C19230012 Mike Nielsen $5,926.37 13% $6,686.82 $888.96
Logging
13/C19230013 Watters $72,845.58 86%, $135,513.50 $10,926.84
Excavating
14/C19230014 Island Lake $22,004.73 80% $39,546.00 $3,300.71
Logging
15/C19230015 Lobb Forest $459.00 100% $918.00 $68.85
Enterprises LLC
16/C19230016 No Bid $15,549.00
17/C19230017 No Bid $15,130.33
18/C19230018 Greg Cook $24,995.44 54% $38,405.00 $3,749.32
Logging
19/C19230019 No Bid $4,475.02
20/C19230020 No Bid $10,140.14
21/C19230021 Watters $17,911.48 182% $50,518.00 $2,686.72
Excavating
22/C19230022 Watters $9,460.79 93% $18,302.00 $1,419.12
Excavating
23/C19230023 Watters $7,174.53 106% $14,810.13 $1,076.18
Excavating
24/C19230024 Watters $28,015.86 176% $77,310.00 $4,202.38
Excavating
251C19230025 Sappi Fine Paper $13,667.03 22% $16,656.39 $2,050.05
26/C19230026 Island Lake $70,211.53 150%| $175,343.50 $10,531.73
Logging

27|C19230027 No Bid $17,688.00



Tract |Contract

28/C19230028
29|C19230029

30/C19230030

31/C19230031

32/C19230032

No Bid
Watters
Excavating

Fjeran Forest
Products Llc

Watters
Excavating

Watters
Excavating

Total Offered:
Average Bid up:
Total:

Appraised |Bidup [Sold Price

$3,884.00
$84,485.10 131%| $195,085.00 $12,672.77
$3,490.00 79% $6,247.00 $523.50
$39,219.96 108% $81,426.46 $5,882.99
$12,298.16 144% $29,995.00 $1,844.72
$702,196.96
77%
$614,167.86 $1,145,762.06 $92,125.18



Feb, 16, 2023 Timber Auction Results

PIKE LAKE AREA

Appraised Avera!ge Average Sold Total
Volume Sold Volume Appraised Value Apprased Total Sold
Value
ASH 599 438 $4.34 $5.05 $2,596.90 $2,210.50
ASPEN 8,264 7,939 $25.57 $64.84 $211,343.44 $514,729.14
BALM OF GILEAD 102 99 $25.43 $62.84 $2,594.30 $6,221.50
BALSAM FIR 768 511 $8.30 $10.43 $6,377.17 $5,329.58
BASSWOOD 542 520 $6.97 $7.20 $3,778.74 $3,743.76
BIRCH 1,663 1,234 $5.80 $14.01 $9,644.96 $17,290.00
MAPLE-RED 1,068 869 $4.77 $10.60 $5,097.39 $9,208.00
MAPLE-SUGAR 776 664 $5.32 $11.12 $4,128.21 $7,383.82
PINE-JACK 206 206 $19.51 $35.00 $4,019.06 $7,210.00
PINE-NORWAY 1,391 1,391 $21.13 $46.35 $29,390.72 $64,471.50
PINE-WHITE 311 311 $22.60 $53.86 $7,030.00 $16,748.96
SPRUCE-BLACK 1,843 79 $11.23 $24.37 $20,701.57 $1,925.00
SPRUCE-WHITE 489 395 $17.01 $23.35 $8,315.62 $9,221.72

Totals 18,022 14,656 $315,018.08  $665,693.48



VIRGINIA AREA

Appraised Avera!ge Average Sold Total
Volume Sold Volume Appraised Value Apprased Total Sold
Value
ASH 132 132 $5.16 $9.07 $681.00 $1,197.02
ASPEN 11,301 9,591 $22.64 $36.06 $255,856.64 $345,856.09
BALM OF GILEAD 8 8 $24.50 $38.00 $196.00 $304.00
BALSAM FIR 2,213 1,543 $8.56 $10.56 $18,935.93 $16,299.96
BIRCH 3,377 2,240 $5.58 $11.34 $18,843.86 $25,406.69
CEDAR-N.WHITE 2 2 $5.00 $5.00 $10.00 $10.00
MAPLE-RED 2,128 1,662 $4.53 $12.99 $9,633.94 $21,588.90
PINE-JACK 1,716 1,379 $14.02 $19.47 $24,052.99 $26,842.72
PINE-NORWAY 378 318 $4.85 $2.78 $1,831.71 $884.31
PINE-WHITE 23 23 $23.12 $24.00 $531.76 $552.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 2,638 1,373 $15.92 $22.41 $42,004.14 $30,762.10
SPRUCE-WHITE 832 390 $12.80 $23.28 $10,651.75 $9,080.49
TAMARACK 484 117 $2.73 $10.98 $1,320.66 $1,284.30

Totals 25,232 18,778 $384,550.38  $480,068.58



Total County

ASH
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BASSWOOD
BIRCH
CEDAR-N.WHITE
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
PINE-JACK
PINE-NORWAY
PINE-WHITE
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE
TAMARACK
Totals

Appraised
Volume

731
19,565
110
2,981
542
5,040
2
3,196
776
1,922
1,769
334
4,481
1,321
1,263
44,033

Average

Sold Volume Appraised

570
17,530
107
2,054
520
3,474
2
2,531
664
1,585
1,709
334
1,452
785
117
33,434

Value
$4.48
$23.88
$25.37
$8.49
$6.97
$5.65
$5.00
$4.61
$5.32
$14.61
$17.65
$22.64
$13.99
$14.36
$2.29

Average Sold
Value

$5.98
$49.09
$60.99
$10.53

$7.20
$12.29

$5.00
$12.17
$11.12
$21.48
$38.24
$51.80
$22.51
$23.31
$10.98

Total
Apprased

$3,277.90
$467,200.08
$2,790.30
$25,313.10
$3,778.74
$28,488.82
$10.00
$14,731.33
$4,128.21
$28,072.05
$31,222.43
$7,561.76
$62,705.71
$18,967.37
$2,888.66
$701,136.46

Total Sold

$3,407.52
$860,585.23
$6,525.50
$21,629.54
$3,743.76
$42,696.69
$10.00
$30,796.90
$7,383.82
$34,052.72
$65,355.81
$17,300.96
$32,687.10
$18,302.21
$1,284.30
$1,145,762.06



Sealed Bid Results Detail

February 16, 2023

Tract Contract Contractor Name

Tract1 C19230001

Sokoloski Logging
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Boise White Paper LLC
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Tract3 C19230003

Sunne Logging
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Boise White Paper LLC
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED

App.

23.83
9.58
6.31
5.00

16.26

16.72

23.83
9.58
6.31
5.00

16.26

16.72

23.83
9.58
6.31
5.00

16.26

19.27

16.72

23.83
9.58
6.31
5.00

Bid

28.83
10.00
6.50
5.01
16.50
17.00

25.00
10.00
10.00
10.00
25.00
25.00

36.15
10.10

6.53

6.00
25.10
25.10
25.10

25.00
10.00
10.00
10.00

Volume

786.00 Cds
220.00 Cds
149.00 Cds
90.00 Cds
64.00 Cds
37.00 Cds

786.00 Cds
220.00 Cds
149.00 Cds
90.00 Cds
64.00 Cds
37.00 Cds

617.00 Cds
251.00 Cds
36.00 Cds
74.00 Cds
25.00 Cds
27.00 Cds
14.00 Cds

617.00 Cds
251.00 Cds
36.00 Cds
74.00 Cds

Value Winning

$22,660.38
$2,200.00
$968.50
$450.90
$1,056.00
$629.00

$27,964.78

$19,650.00
$2,200.00
$1,490.00
$900.00
$1,600.00
$925.00

$26,765.00

$22,304.55
$2,535.10
$235.08
$444.00
$627.50
$677.70
$351.40

$27,175.33

$15,425.00
$2,510.00
$360.00
$740.00

Bid

*Winner*

*Winner*

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name

PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Sokoloski Logging
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Tract4 C19230004

Boise White Paper LLC
ASPEN

BALSAM FIR

BIRCH

MAPLE-RED

PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE
TAMARACK

Tract5 C19230005

Boise White Paper LLC
ASPEN

BALSAM FIR

BIRCH

MAPLE-RED

PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Delack Logging, Inc.
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR

App.

16.26
19.27
16.72

23.83
9.58
6.31
5.00

16.26

19.27

16.72

23.83
9.58
6.31
5.00

16.26

19.27

16.72
3.49

28.59
11.49
7.57
6.00
19.51
20.06

28.59
11.49

Bid

25.00
20.00
20.00

28.83
10.00

6.50

5.01
16.50
19.50
17.00

25.00
10.00
10.00
10.00
25.00
20.00
20.00

5.00

44.00
11.50
10.00
10.00
25.00
21.00

41.25
12.50

Volume

25.00 Cds
27.00 Cds
14.00 Cds

617.00 Cds
251.00 Cds
36.00 Cds
74.00 Cds
25.00 Cds
27.00 Cds
14.00 Cds

1067.00 Cds
279.00 Cds
116.00 Cds
239.00 Cds

97.00 Cds
69.00 Cds
19.00 Cds

3.00 Cds

985.00 Cds
102.00 Cds
66.00 Cds
32.00 Cds
4.00 Cds
4.00 Cds

985.00 Cds
102.00 Cds

Value Winning

$625.00
$540.00
$280.00

$20,480.00

$17,788.11
$2,510.00
$234.00
$370.74
$412.50
$526.50
$238.00

$22,079.85

$26,675.00
$2,790.00
$1,160.00
$2,390.00
$2,425.00
$1,380.00
$380.00
$15.00

$37,215.00

$43,340.00
$1,173.00
$660.00
$320.00
$100.00
$84.00

$45,677.00

$40,631.25
$1,275.00

Bid

*Winner*

*Winner*

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name

BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Sokoloski Logging
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Sunne Logging
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Tract7 C19230007

Boise White Paper LLC
ASH

ASPEN

BALSAM FIR

BIRCH

MAPLE-RED

PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Tract8 C€19230008

Mike Nielsen Logging
ASH
ASPEN

App.

7.57
6.00
19.51
20.06

28.59
11.49
7.57
6.00
19.51
20.06

28.59
11.49
7.57
6.00
19.51
20.06

5.00
2145
8.62
5.68
5.00
14.64
17.35
15.05

5.00
23.83

Bid

7.60
7.60
20.00
22.00

30.00
12.00
7.57
6.01
20.00
20.06

40.53
11.59
8.10
6.00
20.00
40.00

5.00
25.00
10.00
10.00
10.00
25.00
20.00
20.00

6.00
32.01

Volume

66.00 Cds
32.00 Cds
4.00 Cds
4.00 Cds

985.00 Cds
102.00 Cds
66.00 Cds
32.00 Cds
4.00 Cds
4.00 Cds

985.00 Cds
102.00 Cds
66.00 Cds
32.00 Cds
4.00 Cds
4.00 Cds

13.00 Cds
1043.00 Cds
228.00 Cds
106.00 Cds
31.00 Cds
106.00 Cds
94.00 Cds
41.00 Cds

12.00 Cds
544.00 Cds

Value Winning

$501.60
$243.20
$80.00
$88.00

$42,819.05

$29,550.00
$1,224.00
$499.62
$192.32
$80.00
$80.24

$31,626.18

$39,922.05
$1,182.18
$534.60
$192.00
$80.00
$160.00

$42,070.83

$65.00
$26,075.00
$2,280.00
$1,060.00
$310.00
$2,650.00
$1,880.00
$820.00

$35,140.00

$72.00
$17,413.44

Bid

*Winner*

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name App.

BALSAM FIR 9.58
BIRCH 6.31

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

ASH 5.00

ASPEN 23.83
BALSAM FIR 9.58
BIRCH 6.31

Tract C19230010
10
Mike Nielsen Logging
ASPEN 23.83
BALSAM FIR 9.58
BIRCH 6.31
MAPLE-RED 5.00
Tract C19230011
11
Mike Nielsen Logging
ASPEN 23.83
BALSAM FIR 9.58
BIRCH 6.31
MAPLE-RED 5.00
PINE-JACK  16.26
SPRUCE-BLACK 16.72
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.72
TAMARACK 349
Tract C19230012
12

Mike Nielsen Logging

ASH 5.00

ASPEN 23.83
BALSAM FIR 9.58
BIRCH 6.31

Bid

9.58
10.00

10.00
31.10
10.00
10.00

32.10
11.50
9.25
9.25

26.04

9.58
15.59

6.00
19.22
21.15
21.15
11.66

5.01
25.00
9.58
15.00

Volume

20.00 Cds
41.00 Cds

12.00 Cds
544.00 Cds
20.00 Cds
41.00 Cds

829.00 Cds
55.00 Cds
12.00 Cds
12.00 Cds

283.00 Cds
57.00 Cds
29.00 Cds
17.00 Cds

801.00 Cds

707.00 Cds
11.00 Cds

105.00 Cds

2.00 Cds
187.00 Cds
15.00 Cds
60.00 Cds

Value Winning

$191.60
$410.00

$18,087.04

$120.00
$16,918.40
$200.00
$410.00

$17,648.40

$26,610.90
$632.50
$111.00
$111.00

$27,465.40

$7,369.32
$546.06
$452.11
$102.00
$15,395.22
$14,953.05
$232.65
$1,224.30

$40,274.71

$10.02
$4,675.00
$143.70
$900.00

Bid

*Winner*

*Winner*

*Winner*

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name

CEDAR-N.WHITE
PINE-NORWAY
PINE-WHITE
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Tract C19230013

13
Watters Excavating
ASH
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Futurewood Corporation
ASH

ASPEN

BALSAM FIR

BIRCH

MAPLE-RED
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Island Lake Logging
ASH
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Jatco Inc.
ASH

App.

5.00
29.59
23.12
19.27
16.72

5.50
26.21
10.53

6.94

5.50
21.20
18.39

5.50
26.21
10.53

6.94

5.50
21.20
18.39

5.50
26.21
10.53

6.94

5.50
21.20
18.39

5.50

Bid

5.00
29.59
24.00
19.27
16.72

10.00
48.50
12.00
12.00
15.00
25.00
25.00

5.50
37.00
11.00
12.00
12.00
22.00
22.00

10.00
30.00
15.00
10.00
10.00
25.00
25.00

5.50

Volume

2.00 Cds
9.00 Cds
23.00 Cds
5.00 Cds
2.00 Cds

42.00 Cds
1869.00 Cds
203.00 Cds
1598.00 Cds
1159.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
212.00 Cds

42.00 Cds
1869.00 Cds
203.00 Cds
1598.00 Cds
1159.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
212.00 Cds

42.00 Cds
1869.00 Cds
203.00 Cds
1598.00 Cds
1159.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
212.00 Cds

42.00 Cds

Value Winning

$10.00
$266.31
$552.00
$96.35
$33.44

$6,686.82

$420.00
$90,646.50
$2,436.00
$19,176.00
$17,385.00
$150.00
$5,300.00

$135,513.50

$231.00
$69,153.00
$2,233.00
$19,176.00
$13,908.00
$132.00
$4,664.00

$109,497.00

$420.00
$56,070.00
$3,045.00
$15,980.00
$11,590.00
$150.00
$5,300.00

$92,555.00

$231.00

Bid

*Winner*

*Winner*

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name

ASPEN

BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

ASH

ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Sappi Fine Paper
ASH
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Tract C19230014

14
Island Lake Logging
ASH
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Futurewood Corporation
ASH
ASPEN

App.

26.21
10.53
6.94
5.50
21.20
18.39

5.50
26.21
10.53

6.94

5.50
21.20
18.39

5.50
26.21
10.53

6.94

5.50
21.20
18.39

5.00
23.83
9.58
19.27
16.72

5.00
23.83

Bid

47.25
10.53
7.00
5.50
22.00
22.00

12.50
38.10
11.00
12.50
12.50
25.00
25.00

5.50
26.21
10.53

6.94

5.50
21.20
18.39

10.00
46.00
15.00
25.00
25.00

5.00
40.05

Volume

1869.00 Cds
203.00 Cds
1598.00 Cds
1159.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
212.00 Cds

42.00 Cds
1869.00 Cds
203.00 Cds
1598.00 Cds
1159.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
212.00 Cds

42.00 Cds
1869.00 Cds
203.00 Cds
1598.00 Cds
1159.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
212.00 Cds

63.00 Cds
701.00 Cds
48.00 Cds
214.00 Cds
24.00 Cds

63.00 Cds
701.00 Cds

Value Winning

$88,310.25
$2,137.59
$11,186.00
$6,374.50
$132.00
$4,664.00

$113,035.34

$525.00
$71,208.90
$2,233.00
$19,975.00
$14,487.50
$150.00
$5,300.00

$113,879.40

$231.00
$48,986.49
$2,137.59
$11,090.12
$6,374.50
$127.20
$3,898.68

$72,845.58

$630.00
$32,246.00
$720.00
$5,350.00
$600.00

$39,546.00

$315.00
$28,075.05

Bid

*Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name App.

BALSAM FIR 9.58
SPRUCE-BLACK 19.27
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.72

Jatco Inc.
ASH 5.00
ASPEN 23.83
BALSAM FIR 9.58
SPRUCE-BLACK 19.27
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.72

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
ASH 5.00
ASPEN 23.83
BALSAM FIR 9.58
SPRUCE-BLACK  19.27
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.72

Tract C19230015
15
Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
BALSAM FIR 1.00
BIRCH 1.00
MAPLE-RED 1.00
PINE-JACK 1.00
PINE-NORWAY 1.00

Nelson Logging LLC
BALSAM FIR 1.00
BIRCH 1.00
MAPLE-RED 1.00
PINE-JACK 1.00
PINE-NORWAY 1.00

Bid

10.00
20.00
20.00

5.00
42.50
9.58
20.00
20.00

10.00
40.00
10.00
25.00
25.00

2.00
2.00
2.00
2.00
2.00

1.25
1.25
1.25
1.25
1.25

Volume

48.00 Cds
214.00 Cds
24.00 Cds

63.00 Cds
701.00 Cds
48.00 Cds
214.00 Cds
24.00 Cds

63.00 Cds
701.00 Cds
48.00 Cds
214.00 Cds
24.00 Cds

36.00 Cds
5.00 Cds
2.00 Cds

107.00 Cds
309.00 Cds

36.00 Cds
5.00 Cds
2.00 Cds

107.00 Cds
309.00 Cds

Value Winning
Bid
$480.00
$4,280.00
$480.00

$33,630.05

$315.00
$29,792.50
$459.84
$4,280.00
$480.00

$35,327.34

$630.00
$28,040.00
$480.00
$5,350.00
$600.00

$35,100.00

$72.00
$10.00
$4.00
$214.00
$618.00

$918.00 *Winner*

$45.00
$6.25
$2.50
$133.75
$386.25

$573.75

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name

Tract C19230018
18
Greg Cook Logging
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE
TAMARACK

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN

BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR

BIRCH

MAPLE-RED

PINE-JACK
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE
TAMARACK

Tract C19230021
21
Watters Excavating
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BASSWOOD
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
SPRUCE-WHITE

App.

23.83
24.50
9.58
6.31
5.00
16.26
19.27
16.72
3.49

23.83
24.50
9.58
6.31
5.00
16.26
19.27
16.72
3.49

23.83
24.50
9.58
7.12
6.31
5.00
5.54
16.72

Bid

38.00
38.00
20.00
12.00
12.00
25.00
25.00
25.00

5.00

36.00
36.00
10.00
6.50
5.00
18.00
20.00
20.00
4.00

71.50
71.50
10.00

9.00
10.00
12.00
12.00
20.00

Volume

680.00 Cds
8.00 Cds
29.00 Cds
22.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
175.00 Cds
251.00 Cds
26.00 Cds
9.00 Cds

680.00 Cds
8.00 Cds
29.00 Cds
22.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
175.00 Cds
251.00 Cds
26.00 Cds
9.00 Cds

652.00 Cds
4.00 Cds
88.00 Cds
22.00 Cds
44.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
124.00 Cds
7.00 Cds

Value Winning Bid
Bid Error

$25,840.00
$304.00
$580.00
$264.00
$72.00
$4,375.00
$6,275.00
$650.00
$45.00

$38,405.00 *Winner*

$24,480.00
$288.00
$290.00
$143.00
$30.00
$3,150.00
$5,020.00
$520.00
$36.00

$33,957.00

$46,618.00
$286.00
$880.00
$198.00
$440.00
$468.00
$1,488.00
$140.00

$50,518.00 *Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name

Fjeran Forest Products Llc
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BASSWOOD
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
SPRUCE-WHITE

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN

BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BASSWOOD

BIRCH

MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
SPRUCE-WHITE

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BASSWOOD
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
SPRUCE-WHITE

Jatco Inc.
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BASSWOOD
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR

App.

23.83
24.50
9.58
712
6.31
5.00
5.54
16.72

23.83
24.50
9.58
712
6.31
5.00
5.54
16.72

23.83
24.50
9.58
712
6.31
5.00
5.54
16.72

23.83
24.50
9.58
712
6.31
5.00
5.54

Bid

57.00
57.00
12.00
10.00
10.00
10.00
10.00
18.00

60.00
60.00
10.00

7.50

8.00
10.00
10.00
20.00

56.00
56.00
15.00
10.00
15.00
15.00
15.00
25.00

55.50
55.50
10.00
7.12
6.31
5.00
5.54

Volume

652.00 Cds
4.00 Cds
88.00 Cds
22.00 Cds
44.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
124.00 Cds
7.00 Cds

652.00 Cds
4.00 Cds
88.00 Cds
22.00 Cds
44,00 Cds
39.00 Cds
124.00 Cds
7.00 Cds

652.00 Cds
4.00 Cds
88.00 Cds
22.00 Cds
44.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
124.00 Cds
7.00 Cds

652.00 Cds
4.00 Cds
88.00 Cds
22.00 Cds
44.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
124.00 Cds

Value Winning Bid
Bid Error

$37,164.00
$228.00
$1,056.00
$220.00
$440.00
$390.00
$1,240.00
$126.00

$40,864.00

$39,120.00
$240.00
$880.00
$165.00
$352.00
$390.00
$1,240.00
$140.00

$42,527.00

$36,512.00
$224.00
$1,320.00
$220.00
$660.00
$585.00
$1,860.00
$175.00

$41,556.00

$36,186.00
$222.00
$880.00
$156.64
$277.64
$195.00
$686.96



Tract Contract Contractor Name

SPRUCE-WHITE

Nels Kimball
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BASSWOOD
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
SPRUCE-WHITE

Sappi Fine Paper
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BASSWOOD
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
SPRUCE-WHITE

Tract C19230022

22
Watters Excavating
ASH
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
SPRUCE-WHITE

Jatco Inc.
ASH

App.

16.72

23.83
24.50
9.58
712
6.31
5.00
5.54
16.72

23.83
24.50
9.58
7.12
6.31
5.00
5.54
16.72

5.00
23.83
24.50

9.58

6.31

5.00

5.54
16.72

5.00

Bid

17.00

25.00
25.00
9.58
7.12
6.31
5.00
7.00
16.72

45.20
45.20
19.58
17.12
16.31
15.00
15.54
26.72

5.00
30.00
30.00
10.00
15.00
15.00
15.00
22.00

5.00

Volume

7.00 Cds

652.00 Cds
4.00 Cds
88.00 Cds
22.00 Cds
44.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
124.00 Cds
7.00 Cds

652.00 Cds
4.00 Cds
88.00 Cds
22.00 Cds
44.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
124.00 Cds
7.00 Cds

172.00 Cds
47.00 Cds
8.00 Cds
104.00 Cds
374.00 Cds
426.00 Cds
50.00 Cds
91.00 Cds

172.00 Cds

Value Winning

$119.00

$38,723.24

$16,300.00
$100.00
$843.04
$156.64
$277.64
$195.00
$868.00
$117.04

$18,857.36

$29,470.40
$180.80
$1,723.04
$376.64
$717.64
$585.00
$1,926.96
$187.04

$35,167.52

$860.00
$1,410.00
$240.00
$1,040.00
$5,610.00
$6,390.00
$750.00
$2,002.00

$18,302.00

$860.00

Bid

*Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name

ASPEN

BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
SPRUCE-WHITE

Nels Kimball
ASH
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
SPRUCE-WHITE

Sappi Fine Paper
ASH
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
SPRUCE-WHITE

Tract C19230023
23
Watters Excavating

ASPEN

BALSAM FIR

PINE-NORWAY

PINE-WHITE

SPRUCE-WHITE

App.

23.83
24.50
9.58
6.31
5.00
5.54
16.72

5.00
23.83
24.50

9.58

6.31

5.00

5.54
16.72

5.00
23.83
24.50

9.58

6.31

5.00

5.54
16.72

23.83

9.58
29.59
23.12
16.72

Bid

26.00
26.00
10.00
6.31
5.00
5.54
17.00

5.00
25.00
25.00

9.58

6.31

5.00

6.00
16.72

5.00
25.30
25.30

9.58

6.31

5.00

5.54
16.72

23.83

9.58
40.00
55.00
16.72

Volume

47.00 Cds
8.00 Cds
104.00 Cds
374.00 Cds
426.00 Cds
50.00 Cds
91.00 Cds

172.00 Cds
47.00 Cds
8.00 Cds
104.00 Cds
374.00 Cds
426.00 Cds
50.00 Cds
91.00 Cds

172.00 Cds
47.00 Cds
8.00 Cds
104.00 Cds
374.00 Cds
426.00 Cds
50.00 Cds
91.00 Cds

1.00 Cds
1.00 Cds
72.00 Cds
216.00 Cds
1.00 Cds

Value Winning
Bid
$1,222.00
$208.00
$1,040.00
$2,359.94
$2,130.00
$277.00
$1,547.00

$9,643.94

$860.00
$1,175.00
$200.00
$996.32
$2,359.94
$2,130.00
$300.00
$1,521.52

$9,542.78

$860.00
$1,189.10
$202.40
$996.32
$2,359.94
$2,130.00
$277.00
$1,521.52

$9,536.28

$23.83
$9.58
$2,880.00
$11,880.00
$16.72

$14,810.13 *Winner*

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name

Fjeran Forest Products Llc
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
PINE-NORWAY
PINE-WHITE
SPRUCE-WHITE

Jatco Inc.
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
PINE-NORWAY
PINE-WHITE
SPRUCE-WHITE

Nels Kimball
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
PINE-NORWAY
PINE-WHITE
SPRUCE-WHITE

Nelson Logging LLC
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
PINE-NORWAY
PINE-WHITE
SPRUCE-WHITE

Tract C19230024
24
Watters Excavating
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
SPRUCE-BLACK

App.

23.83

9.58
29.59
23.12
16.72

23.83

9.58
29.59
23.12
16.72

23.83

9.58
29.59
23.12
16.72

23.83

9.58
29.59
23.12
16.72

23.83
24.50
9.58
6.31
5.00
19.27

Bid

23.83

9.58
30.00
23.50
16.72

23.83

9.58
34.00
27.50
16.72

23.83

9.58
30.00
25.00
16.72

23.83

9.58
35.00
30.00
16.72

71.50
71.50
10.00
15.00
10.00
20.00

Volume

1.00 Cds
1.00 Cds
72.00 Cds
216.00 Cds
1.00 Cds

1.00 Cds
1.00 Cds
72.00 Cds
216.00 Cds
1.00 Cds

1.00 Cds
1.00 Cds
72.00 Cds
216.00 Cds
1.00 Cds

1.00 Cds
1.00 Cds
72.00 Cds
216.00 Cds
1.00 Cds

948.00 Cds
20.00 Cds
114.00 Cds
272.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
10.00 Cds

Value Winning

$23.83
$9.58
$2,160.00
$5,076.00
$16.72

$7,286.13

$23.83
$9.58
$2,448.00
$5,940.00
$16.72

$8,438.13

$23.83
$9.58
$2,160.00
$5,400.00
$16.72

$7,610.13

$23.83
$9.58
$2,520.00
$6,480.00
$16.72

$9,050.13

$67,782.00
$1,430.00
$1,140.00
$4,080.00
$390.00
$200.00

Bid

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name

SPRUCE-WHITE

Douglas Hustad
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN

BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR

BIRCH

MAPLE-RED
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Jatco Inc.
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED

SPRUCE-BLACK

App.

16.72

23.83
24.50
9.58
6.31
5.00
19.27
16.72

23.83
24.50
9.58
6.31
5.00
19.27
16.72

23.83
24.50
9.58
6.31
5.00
19.27
16.72

23.83
24.50
9.58
6.31
5.00
19.27

Bid

22.00

30.00
30.00
12.00
10.00
10.00
25.00
25.00

47.00
47.00
10.00

6.50

6.00
20.00
20.00

56.00
56.00
15.00
15.00
15.00
25.00
25.00

66.00
66.00
10.00
6.50
5.00
20.00

Volume

104.00 Cds

948.00 Cds
20.00 Cds
114.00 Cds
272.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
104.00 Cds

948.00 Cds
20.00 Cds
114.00 Cds
272.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
104.00 Cds

948.00 Cds
20.00 Cds
114.00 Cds
272.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
104.00 Cds

948.00 Cds
20.00 Cds
114.00 Cds
272.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
10.00 Cds

Value Winning
Bid
$2,288.00

$77,310.00 *Winner*

$28,440.00
$600.00
$1,368.00
$2,720.00
$390.00
$250.00
$2,600.00

$36,368.00

$44,556.00
$940.00
$1,140.00
$1,768.00
$234.00
$200.00
$2,080.00

$50,918.00

$53,088.00
$1,120.00
$1,710.00
$4,080.00
$585.00
$250.00
$2,600.00

$63,433.00

$62,568.00
$1,320.00
$1,140.00
$1,768.00
$195.00
$200.00

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name App.

SPRUCE-WHITE 16.72

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
ASPEN 23.83
BALM OF GILEAD  24.50
BALSAM FIR 9.58
BIRCH 6.31
MAPLE-RED 5.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 19.27
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.72

Nels Kimball
ASPEN 23.83
BALM OF GILEAD  24.50
BALSAM FIR 9.58
BIRCH 6.31
MAPLE-RED 5.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 19.27
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.72

Sappi Fine Paper
ASPEN 23.83
BALM OF GILEAD  24.50
BALSAM FIR 9.58
BIRCH 6.31
MAPLE-RED 5.00
SPRUCE-BLACK 19.27
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.72

Tract C19230025
25
Sappi Fine Paper
ASH 5.00
ASPEN 23.83
BALM OF GILEAD  24.50
BASSWOOD 7.12

Bid

20.00

42.00
42.00
12.00
15.00
15.00
25.00
25.00

25.00
25.00
9.58
7.00
5.00
19.27
16.72

47.90
47.90
19.58
16.31
15.00
29.27
26.72

5.00
23.83
24.50

7.12

Volume

104.00 Cds

948.00 Cds
20.00 Cds
114.00 Cds
272.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
104.00 Cds

948.00 Cds
20.00 Cds
114.00 Cds
272.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
104.00 Cds

948.00 Cds
20.00 Cds
114.00 Cds
272.00 Cds
39.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
104.00 Cds

225.00 Cds
157.00 Cds

3.00 Cds
498.00 Cds

Value Winning Bid
Bid Error

$2,080.00

$69,271.00

$39,816.00
$840.00
$1,368.00
$4,080.00
$585.00
$250.00
$2,600.00

$49,539.00

$23,700.00
$500.00
$1,092.12
$1,904.00
$195.00
$192.70
$1,738.88

$29,322.70

$45,409.20
$958.00
$2,232.12
$4,436.32
$585.00
$292.70
$2,778.88

$56,692.22

$1,125.00
$3,741.31

$73.50
$3,545.76



Tract Contract Contractor Name

BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR

Tract C19230026

26
Island Lake Logging
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD

Greg Cook Logging
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD

Sappi Fine Paper
ASPEN
BALM OF GILEAD

Tract C19230029

29
Watters Excavating
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
PINE-JACK
PINE-NORWAY
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Fjeran Forest Products Llc
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR

App.

6.31
5.00
5.54

26.21
26.95

26.21
26.95

26.21
26.95

26.21
26.95

28.59
11.49

7.57
19.51
35.51
23.13
20.06

28.59
11.49

Bid

15.00
5.00
5.54

65.50
65.50

58.80
58.80

53.00
53.00

46.00
46.00

71.50
12.00
10.00
35.00
78.50
25.00
25.00

58.00
15.00

Volume

344.00 Cds
344.00 Cds
233.00 Cds

2613.00 Cds
64.00 Cds

2613.00 Cds
64.00 Cds

2613.00 Cds
64.00 Cds

2613.00 Cds
64.00 Cds

2055.00 Cds
79.00 Cds
86.00 Cds
206.00 Cds
417.00 Cds

69.00 Cds
187.00 Cds

2055.00 Cds
79.00 Cds

Value Winning
Bid
$5,160.00
$1,720.00
$1,290.82

$16,656.39 *Winner*

$171,151.50
$4,192.00

$175,343.50 *Winner*

$153,644.40
$3,763.20

$157,407.60

$138,489.00
$3,392.00

$141,881.00

$120,198.00
$2,944.00

$123,142.00

$146,932.50
$948.00
$860.00
$7,210.00
$32,734.50
$1,725.00
$4,675.00

$195,085.00 *Winner*

$119,190.00
$1,185.00

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name

BIRCH
PINE-JACK
PINE-NORWAY
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Futurewood Corporation
ASPEN

BALSAM FIR

BIRCH

PINE-JACK
PINE-NORWAY
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Hull Forest Products
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
PINE-JACK
PINE-NORWAY
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Island Lake Logging
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
PINE-JACK
PINE-NORWAY
SPRUCE-BLACK
SPRUCE-WHITE

Jatco Inc.
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
PINE-JACK

App.

7.57
19.51
35.51
23.13
20.06

28.59
11.49

7.57
19.51
35.51
23.13
20.06

28.59
11.49

7.57
19.51
35.51
23.13
20.06

28.59
11.49

7.57
19.51
35.51
23.13
20.06

28.59
11.49

7.57
19.51

Bid

10.00
24.00
42.00
25.00
25.00

64.10
11.50

8.00
22.00
40.00
23.25
23.25

40.00
11.49
10.00
20.00
40.00
23.13
20.06

70.00
15.00
15.00
30.00
55.00
30.00
30.00

72.50
11.50

8.00
24.50

Volume

86.00 Cds
206.00 Cds
417.00 Cds

69.00 Cds
187.00 Cds

2055.00 Cds
79.00 Cds
86.00 Cds
206.00 Cds
417.00 Cds

69.00 Cds
187.00 Cds

2055.00 Cds
79.00 Cds
86.00 Cds
206.00 Cds
417.00 Cds

69.00 Cds
187.00 Cds

2055.00 Cds
79.00 Cds
86.00 Cds
206.00 Cds
417.00 Cds

69.00 Cds
187.00 Cds

2055.00 Cds
79.00 Cds
86.00 Cds

206.00 Cds

Value Winning Bid
Bid Error

$860.00
$4,944.00
$17,514.00
$1,725.00
$4,675.00

$150,093.00

$131,725.50
$908.50
$688.00
$4,532.00
$16,680.00
$1,604.25
$4,347.75

$160,486.00

$82,200.00
$907.71
$860.00
$4,120.00
$16,680.00
$1,595.97
$3,751.22

$110,114.90

$143,850.00
$1,185.00
$1,290.00
$6,180.00
$22,935.00
$2,070.00
$5,610.00

$183,120.00

$148,987.50
$908.50
$688.00
$5,047.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App.

PINE-NORWAY 35.51

SPRUCE-BLACK ~ 23.13
SPRUCE-WHITE  20.06

Sappi Fine Paper
ASPEN  28.59
BALSAM FIR  11.49
BIRCH 7.57

PINE-JACK 19.51
PINE-NORWAY 35.51
SPRUCE-BLACK 23.13
SPRUCE-WHITE 20.06

Tract C19230030

30
Fjeran Forest Products Lic
ASPEN 5.00
BIRCH 5.00
MAPLE-RED 5.00
PINE-NORWAY 5.00
PINE-WHITE 5.00

Nelson Logging LLC
ASPEN 5.00
BIRCH 5.00
MAPLE-RED 5.00
PINE-NORWAY 5.00
PINE-WHITE 5.00

PotlatchDeltic Land & Lumber
ASPEN 5.00
BIRCH 5.00
MAPLE-RED 5.00
PINE-NORWAY 5.00
PINE-WHITE 5.00

Bid

52.50
24.00
24.00

62.10
3149

7.57
39.51
55.51
40.89
40.89

15.00
10.00
10.00
8.00
8.00

6.00
5.00
5.00
7.50
5.00

10.00
5.00
5.00
5.00
5.00

Volume

417.00 Cds
69.00 Cds
187.00 Cds

2055.00 Cds
79.00 Cds
86.00 Cds
206.00 Cds
417.00 Cds

69.00 Cds
187.00 Cds

89.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
579.00 Cds
10.00 Cds

89.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
579.00 Cds
10.00 Cds

89.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
10.00 Cds
579.00 Cds
10.00 Cds

Value Winning

$21,892.50
$1,656.00
$4,488.00

$183,667.50

$127,615.50
$2,487.71
$651.02
$8,139.06
$23,147.67
$2,821.41
$7,646.43

$172,508.80

$1,335.00
$100.00
$100.00
$4,632.00
$80.00

$6,247.00

$534.00
$50.00
$50.00
$4,342.50
$50.00

$5,026.50

$890.00
$50.00
$50.00
$2,895.00
$50.00

$3,935.00

Bid

*Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name

Tract C19230031

31
Watters Excavating
ASH
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
PINE-WHITE

Douglas Hustad
ASH
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
PINE-WHITE

Futurewood Corporation
ASH

ASPEN

BALSAM FIR

BIRCH

MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR
PINE-WHITE

Island Lake Logging
ASH
ASPEN
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
MAPLE-SUGAR

App.

5.50
26.21
10.53

6.94

5.50

6.09
25.44

5.50
26.21
10.53

6.94

5.50

6.09
25.44

5.50
26.21
10.53

6.94

5.50

6.09
25.44

5.50
26.21
10.53

6.94

5.50

6.09

Bid

5.50
55.00
11.00
10.00
15.00
15.00
25.44

10.00
30.00
12.00
10.00
10.00
10.00
30.00

6.00
43.67
12.00

7.00
10.00
10.00
26.00

10.00
46.00
15.00
15.00
15.00
15.00

Volume

41.00 Cds
1377.00 Cds
62.00 Cds
61.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
257.00 Cds
9.00 Cds

41.00 Cds
1377.00 Cds
62.00 Cds
61.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
257.00 Cds
9.00 Cds

41.00 Cds
1377.00 Cds
62.00 Cds
61.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
257.00 Cds
9.00 Cds

41.00 Cds
1377.00 Cds
62.00 Cds
61.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
257.00 Cds

Value Winning

$225.50
$75,735.00
$682.00
$610.00
$90.00
$3,855.00
$228.96

$81,426.46

$410.00
$41,310.00
$744.00
$610.00
$60.00
$2,570.00
$270.00

$45,974.00

$246.00
$60,133.59
$744.00
$427.00
$60.00
$2,570.00
$234.00

$64,414.59

$410.00
$63,342.00
$930.00
$915.00
$90.00
$3,855.00

Bid

*Winner*

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name App.

PINE-WHITE 25.44

Jatco Inc.
ASH 5.50
ASPEN 26.21
BALSAM FIR 10.53
BIRCH 6.94

MAPLE-RED 5.50
MAPLE-SUGAR 6.09
PINE-WHITE 2544

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

ASH 5.50

ASPEN 26.21
BALSAM FIR 10.53
BIRCH 6.94

MAPLE-RED 5.50
MAPLE-SUGAR 6.09
PINE-WHITE 25.44

Sappi Fine Paper

ASH 5.50

ASPEN 26.21
BALSAM FIR 10.53
BIRCH 6.94

MAPLE-RED 5.50
MAPLE-SUGAR 6.09
PINE-WHITE 25.44

Tract C19230032
32
Watters Excavating
BALSAM FIR 9.58
BIRCH 6.31
MAPLE-RED 5.00
PINE-NORWAY  29.59

Bid

26.00

5.50
47.25
10.53

6.94

5.50

6.09
2544

10.00
45.00
12.00
10.00
10.00
10.00
26.00

5.50
32.20
10.53

6.94

5.50

6.09
2544

10.00
10.00
10.00
75.00

Volume

9.00 Cds

41.00 Cds
1377.00 Cds
62.00 Cds
61.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
257.00 Cds
9.00 Cds

41.00 Cds
1377.00 Cds
62.00 Cds
61.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
257.00 Cds
9.00 Cds

41.00 Cds
1377.00 Cds
62.00 Cds
61.00 Cds
6.00 Cds
257.00 Cds
9.00 Cds

63.00 Cds
43.00 Cds
5.00 Cds
323.00 Cds

Value Winning

$234.00

$69,776.00

$225.50
$65,063.25
$652.86
$423.34
$33.00
$1,565.13
$228.96

$68,192.04

$410.00
$61,965.00
$744.00
$610.00
$60.00
$2,570.00
$234.00

$66,593.00

$225.50
$44,339.40
$652.86
$423.34
$33.00
$1,565.13
$228.96

$47,468.19

$630.00
$430.00
$50.00
$24,225.00

Bid

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name

PINE-WHITE
SPRUCE-WHITE

Bell Timber, Inc.
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
PINE-NORWAY
PINE-WHITE
SPRUCE-WHITE

Douglas Hustad
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
PINE-NORWAY
PINE-WHITE
SPRUCE-WHITE

Hedstrom Lumber Co Inc
BALSAM FIR

BIRCH

MAPLE-RED
PINE-NORWAY
PINE-WHITE
SPRUCE-WHITE

Island Lake Logging
BALSAM FIR
BIRCH
MAPLE-RED
PINE-NORWAY
PINE-WHITE
SPRUCE-WHITE

Jatco Inc.
BALSAM FIR

App.

23.12
16.72

9.58
6.31
5.00
29.59
23.12
16.72

9.58
6.31
5.00
29.59
23.12
16.72

9.58
6.31
5.00
29.59
23.12
16.72

9.58
6.31
5.00
29.59
23.12
16.72

9.58

Bid

60.00
20.00

9.60
7.00
5.00
55.00
30.00
17.00

10.00
10.00
10.00
40.00
30.00
20.00

11.50

7.57
19.38
35.51
27.74
20.06

15.00
15.00
15.00
55.00
55.00
20.00

9.58

Volume

76.00 Cds
5.00 Cds

63.00 Cds
43.00 Cds
5.00 Cds
323.00 Cds
76.00 Cds
5.00 Cds

63.00 Cds
43.00 Cds
5.00 Cds
323.00 Cds
76.00 Cds
5.00 Cds

63.00 Cds
43.00 Cds
5.00 Cds
323.00 Cds
76.00 Cds
5.00 Cds

63.00 Cds
43.00 Cds
5.00 Cds
323.00 Cds
76.00 Cds
5.00 Cds

63.00 Cds

Value Winning

$4,560.00
$100.00

$29,995.00

$604.80
$301.00
$25.00
$17,765.00
$2,280.00
$85.00

$21,060.80

$630.00
$430.00
$50.00
$12,920.00
$2,280.00
$100.00

$16,410.00

$724.50
$325.51
$96.90
$11,469.73
$2,108.24
$100.30

$14,825.18

$945.00
$645.00
$75.00
$17,765.00
$4,180.00
$100.00

$23,710.00

$603.54

Bid

*Winner*

Bid
Error



Tract Contract Contractor Name App.

BIRCH 6.31
MAPLE-RED 5.00
PINE-NORWAY 29.59
PINE-WHITE 23.12
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.72

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
BALSAM FIR 9.58
BIRCH 6.31
MAPLE-RED 5.00
PINE-NORWAY  29.59
PINE-WHITE  23.12
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.72

Nelson Logging LLC
BALSAM FIR 9.58
BIRCH 6.31
MAPLE-RED 5.00
PINE-NORWAY  29.59
PINE-WHITE ~ 23.12
SPRUCE-WHITE 16.72

Bid

6.31
5.00
38.50
25.00
16.72

10.00
10.00
10.00
40.00
25.00
20.00

9.58
6.31
5.00
35.00
28.00
16.72

Volume

43.00 Cds
5.00 Cds
323.00 Cds
76.00 Cds
5.00 Cds

63.00 Cds
43.00 Cds
5.00 Cds
323.00 Cds
76.00 Cds
5.00 Cds

63.00 Cds
43.00 Cds
5.00 Cds
323.00 Cds
76.00 Cds
5.00 Cds

Value Winning

$271.33
$25.00
$12,435.50
$1,900.00
$83.60

$15,318.97

$630.00
$430.00
$50.00
$12,920.00
$1,900.00
$100.00

$16,030.00

$603.54
$271.33
$25.00
$11,305.00
$2,128.00
$83.60

$14,416.47

Bid

Bid
Error



Bid Summary - All Bids

Sealed Bid Auction 2/16/2023

Tract Contract

1

10

C19230001

C19230003

C19230004

C19230005

C19230007

C19230008

C19230010

Appraised Bidder
Value

23,887.45
Sokoloski Logging
Boise White Paper LLC

18,865.72
Sunne Logging
Sokoloski Logging
Boise White Paper LLC

33,261.39
Boise White Paper LLC

30,183.03
Boise White Paper LLC
Delack Logging, Inc.
Sunne Logging
Sokoloski Logging

28,959.58
Boise White Paper LLC

13,473.83
Mike Nielsen Logging
Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

20,417.69
Mike Nielsen Logging

Total Bid
Value

27,964.78
26,765.00

27,175.33
22,079.85
20,480.00

37,215.00

45,677.00
42,819.05
42,070.83
31,626.18

35,140.00

18,087.04
17,648.40

27,465.40



Tract Contract

11

12

13

14

15

18

21

C19230011

C19230012

C19230013

C19230014

C19230015

C19230018

C19230021

Appraised Bidder
Value

32,953.61
Mike Nielsen Logging

5,926.37
Mike Nielsen Logging

72,845.58
Watters Excavating
Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
Jatco Inc.
Futurewood Corporation
Island Lake Logging
Sappi Fine Paper

22,004.73
Island Lake Logging
Jatco Inc.
Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

Futurewood Corporation

459.00
Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
Nelson Logging LLC

24,995.44
Greg Cook Logging

Futurewood Corporation

17,911.48
Watters Excavating
Futurewood Corporation

Island Lake Logging

Total Bid
Value

40,274.71

6,686.82

135,513.50
113,879.40
113,035.34
109,497.00
92,555.00
72,845.58

39,546.00
35,327.34
35,100.00
33,630.05

918.00
573.75

38,405.00
33,957.00

50,518.00
42,527.00
41,556.00



Tract Contract

22

23

24

25

26

C19230022

C19230023

C19230024

C19230025

C19230026

Appraised
Value

9,460.79

7,174.53

28,015.86

13,667.03

70,211.53

Bidder

Fjeran Forest Products Llc
Jatco Inc.

Sappi Fine Paper

Nels Kimball

Watters Excavating
Jatco Inc.

Nels Kimball

Sappi Fine Paper

Watters Excavating
Nelson Logging LLC
Jatco Inc.

Nels Kimball

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

Watters Excavating
Jatco Inc.

Island Lake Logging
Sappi Fine Paper

Futurewood Corporation

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

Douglas Hustad
Nels Kimball

Sappi Fine Paper

Island Lake Logging

Total Bid
Value

40,864.00
38,723.24
35,167.52
18,857.36

18,302.00
9,643.94
9,542.78
9,536.28

14,810.13
9,050.13
8,438.13
7,610.13
7,286.13

77,310.00
69,271.00
63,433.00
56,692.22
50,918.00
49,539.00
36,368.00
29,322.70

16,656.39

175,343.50



Tract Contract

29

30

31

32

C19230029

C19230030

C19230031

C19230032

Appraised

Value

84,485.10

3,490.00

39,219.96

12,298.16

Bidder

Futurewood Corporation
Greg Cook Logging
Sappi Fine Paper

Watters Excavating

Jatco Inc.

Island Lake Logging
Sappi Fine Paper
Futurewood Corporation
Fjeran Forest Products Llc

Hull Forest Products

Fjeran Forest Products Llc
Nelson Logging LLC

PotlatchDeltic Land &
Lumber

Watters Excavating
Island Lake Logging

Jatco Inc.

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

Futurewood Corporation
Sappi Fine Paper
Douglas Hustad

Watters Excavating
Island Lake Logging
Bell Timber, Inc.

Douglas Hustad

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

Total Bid
Value

157,407.60
141,881.00
123,142.00

195,085.00
183,667.50
183,120.00
172,508.80
160,486.00
150,093.00
110,114.90

6,247.00
5,026.50
3,935.00

81,426.46
69,776.00
68,192.04
66,593.00
64,414.59
47,468.19
45,974.00

29,995.00
23,710.00
21,060.80
16,410.00
16,030.00



Tract Contract

Appraised
Value

Bidder

Jatco Inc.
Hedstrom Lumber Co Inc

Nelson Logging LLC

Total Bid
Value

15,318.97
14,825.18
14,416.47
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