October 2020 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22200119 100050 NO BID $7,350.00 $0.00
2 C22200104 124055 Doug Anderson $126,350.00 $175,300.00
3 C22200174 124057 Fathers Rise Together $26,709.81 $26,709.81
4 C22200120 9000002751  NO BID $30,525.00 $0.00
5 C22200121 9000002752  NO BID $9,500.00 $0.00
6 C22200173 103927 Richard Joseph Havron and Rita Elizabet $3,225.00 $3,225.00
7 C22200122 124070 The Birch Group $14,934.98 $30,634.98
8 C22200123 105017 NO BID $4,575.00 $0.00
9 22200124 124077 Mark William Litynski and Heather Mari $26,650.00 $30,100.00
10 C22190012 105072 NO BID $1,550.00 $0.00
11 C22200048 124087 PULLED $10,080.00 $0.00
12 C22200125 123176 NO BID $4,950.00 $0.00
13 C22200126 123178 Cobby Properties, LLC $2,475.00 $2,475.00
14 C22200127 124099 Negley Properties, LLC $1,950.00 $3,150.00
15 C22200128 124100 Negley Properties, LLC $1,950.00 $1,975.00
16 C22200129 9000002753 NO BID $3,450.00 $0.00
17 C22200028 117753 NO BID $1,300.00 $0.00
18 C22200130 105812 NO BID $82,350.00 $0.00
19 C22200030 105862 Mark Waldo Vosburg $100.00 $6,000.00
20 C22200015 123214 Chad Svaleson $200.00 $1,425.00
21 C22200131 124134 NO BID $16,400.00 $0.00
22 C22200106 106430 James A Bailey and Tracy Lee Bailey $8,775.00 $11,700.00
23 C22200107 106436 Eric Joseph Gunderson $675.00 $1,275.00
24 C22200132 106544 Doug D Gustafson $22,700.00 $25,000.00
25 C22200133 106545 Nathan Mark Erickson and Corey James $24,075.00 $39,600.00
26 C22200134 106546 Ryan David Frederick and Nicole Marie $27,150.00 $29,100.00
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27 C22200135 106547 Mossy Rose Acres LLC $31,700.00 $31,700.00
28 C22200136 124157 Joseph Lewis Jance $1,350.00 $5,851.00
29 C22200137 107211 William Eugene Berwald and Cathy Jean $22,600.00 $22,600.00
30 C22200138 9000002754  William Eugene Berwald and Cathy Jean $27,400.00 $27,400.00
31 C22200139 107866 NO BID $31,600.00 $0.00
32 22200140 107871 Aaron Robert Kelson and Roxanne Fife K $1,575.00 $15,600.00
33 C22200141 108339 NO BID $92,400.00 $0.00
34 C22200143 109255 NO BID $3,100.00 $0.00
35 C22200144 109325 Stan Peterson $16,800.00 $16,800.00
36 C22200145 9000002755 Jason Dean Steeves $1,125.00 $3,151.00
37 C22200146 9000002756  Scott Robert Bradt and Lorrie Beth Bradt $2,025.00 $3,900.00
38 C22200147 109399 Scott Robert Bradt and Lorrie Beth Bradt $3,000.00 $5,200.00
39 C22200148 109401 Chad Richard Oliverson $3,525.00 $5,200.00
40 C22200149 109402 Mark Dale Manning $1,125.00 $3,050.00
41 C22200150 9000002757  Mark Dale Manning $3,975.00 $4,450.00
42 C22200151 9000002758 Mark Dale Manning $3,150.00 $4,050.00
43 C22200152 122853 NO BID $74,300.00 $0.00
44 C22200153 9000002759  Gregory Allen Jarvela $33,300.00 $33,300.00
45 C22200019 123759 Colin D Ulmer $150.00 $510.00
46 C22200021 9000002672  Colin D Ulmer $200.00 $520.00
47 C22200023 122865 Colin D Ulmer $100.00 $920.00
48 C22200016 123275 Colin D Ulmer $150.00 $520.00
49 C22200154 118132 NO BID $16,125.00 $0.00
50 C22200155 110871 NO BID $12,750.00 $0.00
51 C22200156 123771 Kelly Dwane Cresap $29,925.00 $65,100.00
52 C22200157 120624 Joshua Erick Friday and Bridget Elizabet $51,075.00 $70,000.00
53 C22200108 120647 Fife Land Investments $20,600.00 $35,200.00
54 C22200109 123307 NO BID $17,537.88 $0.00
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55 C22200158 113899 Ronald Roger Alarcon and Laura Louise $1,050.00 $1,225.00
56 C22200159 124178 David P Cook $1,300.00 $3,050.00
57 C22200160 124046 Arthur Desautell $35,450.00 $35,750.00
58 C22200161 124002 PULLED $10,050.00 $0.00
59 C22200024 114068 NO BID $1,125.00 $0.00
60 C22200162 9000002760  PULLED $5,100.00 $0.00
61 C22200110 124009 David B Carlson $4,200.00 $4,200.00
62 C22200013 123326 The Birch Group $600.00 $660.00
63 C22200163 124198 Robert J Paget $11,600.00 $19,400.00

Total Tracts 63 Total Value $1,033,087.67

Pulled Tracts 3 Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Available Tracts 60 Net Total Value $1,033,087.67 $806,976.79

Total Tracts Sold 42

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 70.00%

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 78.11%
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