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1RWLFH�LV�KHUHE\�JLYHQ�WKDW�WKH�6W��/RXLV�&RXQW\�$XGLWRU�VKDOO�VHOO�WR�WKH�KLJKHVW�ELGGHU�WKH�GHVLJQDWHG�WLPEHU�
ORFDWHG�RQ�WKH�IROORZLQJ�GHVFULEHG�SDUFHOV�RI�ODQG�IRUIHLWHG�WR�WKH�VWDWH�IRU�WKH�QRQSD\PHQW�RI�WD[HV�ZKLFK�KDYH�
EHHQ�FODVVLILHG�DQG�DSSUDLVHG�DV�SURYLGHG�E\�0LQQHVRWD�6WDWXWHV���������6XEG����������VXEMHFW��LQ�SDUW��WR�WKH�
IROORZLQJ�FRQGLWLRQV� 
�� 7R�EH�HOLJLEOH�WR�ELG�DW�D�6W��/RXLV�&RXQW\�7LPEHU�DXFWLRQ��D�5HVSRQVLEOH�2SHUDWRU�$SSOLFDWLRQ�)RUP�PXVW�EH�RQ�ILOH�

DW�WKH�6W��/RXLV�&RXQW\�/DQG�DQG�0LQHUDOV�'HSDUWPHQW������:HVW��QG�6WUHHW��6XLWH������'XOXWK��01��������DW�OHDVW�
���WZR��ZRUNLQJ�GD\V�SULRU�WR�WKH�DXFWLRQ��$Q�DSSOLFDWLRQ�FDQ�EH�REWDLQHG�DW�DQ\�/DQG�DQG�0LQHUDOV�'HSDUWPHQW�
2IILFH� 

�� 7KH�WLPEHU�ZLOO�EH�VROG�WR�WKH�KLJKHVW�ELGGHU�EXW�IRU�QRW�OHVV�WKDQ�WKH�WRWDO�DSSUDLVHG�7UDFW�9DOXH��$�ELG�YDOXH�SHU�XQLW�
PXVW�EH�LQGLFDWHG�IRU�HDFK�VSHFLHV�OLVWHG��7KLV�ELG�YDOXH�ZLOO�EH�DSSOLHG�WR�HDFK�VSHFLH��%LG�YDOXH�SHU�XQLW�PXVW�PHHW�
RU�H[FHHG�WKH�DSSUDLVHG�ELG�YDOXH�SHU�XQLW��6W��/RXLV�&RXQW\�UHVHUYHV�WKH�ULJKW�WR�DFFHSW�RU�UHMHFW�DQ\�RU�DOO�ELGV� 

�� $OO�ELG�IRUPV�PXVW�EH�UHFHLYHG�LQ�WKH�/DQG�&RPPLVVLRQHU¶V�2IILFH�E\������3�0��RQ�)HEUXDU\��WK��$OO�ELGV�PXVW�EH�RQ�
WKH�RIILFLDO�ELG�IRUP� 

�� $������ELG�ERQG��L�H��SHUVRQDO�FKHFN��SD\DEOH�WR�WKH�6W��/RXLV�&RXQW\�$XGLWRU�LV�UHTXLUHG�DQG�PXVW�EH�LQFOXGHG�
ZLWK�WKH�ELG�IRUP��2QH�ELG�ERQG�ZLOO�FRYHU�DOO�WUDFW�ELGV�DQG�ZLOO�EH�UHWXUQHG�LI�WKH�ELGV�DUH�QRW�WKH�VXFFHVVIXO�ELGGHU��
)RU�D�VXFFHVVIXO�ELGGHU��WKH�ELG�ERQG�ZLOO�EH�DSSOLHG�WR�WKH�GRZQ�SD\PHQW�RQ�WKH�ILUVW�WUDFW�DZDUGHG� 

�� 6XFFHVVIXO�ELGGHUV�ZLOO�KDYH����EXVLQHVV�GD\V�WR�VXEPLW�D�FKHFN��SD\DEOH�WR�WKH�&RXQW\�$XGLWRU��IRU�����RI�WKH�
DSSUDLVHG�WUDFW�YDOXH�IRU�HDFK�WUDFW�DZDUGHG��)DLOXUH�WR�PDNH�DQ\�RU�DOO�RI�WKHVH�GRZQ�SD\PHQWV�RQ�WLPH�ZLOO�UHVXOW�LQ�
WKH�IRUIHLWXUH�RI�WKH�ELG�ERQG��6XFFHVVIXO�ELGGHUV�ZLOO�EH�QRWLILHG�E\�PDLO� 

�� 6KRXOG�WKH�VXFFHVVIXO�ELGGHU�QRW�VXEPLW�WKH�GRZQ�SD\PHQW�RQ�WLPH��WKH�VDOH�PD\�EH�DZDUGHG�WR�WKH�QH[W�KLJKHVW�
ELGGHU��,Q�WKH�FDVH�RI�WLH�ELGV��WKH�VXFFHVVIXO�ELGGHU�ZLOO�EH�GHFLGHG�E\�WKH�WRVV�RI�D�FRLQ�E\�WKH�$XGLWRU� 

�� 6W��/RXLV�&RXQW\�KDV�GHYHORSHG�DQ�(QYLURQPHQWDO�0DQDJHPHQW�6\VWHP�WR�DVVLVW�LW�LQ�PHHWLQJ�WKH�6XVWDLQDEOH�����
)RUHVWU\�,QLWLDWLYH��6),��VWDQGDUG�DQG�LV�FHUWLILHG�WR�WKLV�VWDQGDUG� 

�� 0DQ\�RI�WKH�WUDFWV�KDYH�VSHFLDO�UHTXLUHPHQWV��7KH�6W��/RXLV�&RXQW\�/DQG�DQG�0LQHUDOV�'HSDUWPHQW��RIIHUV�VDOHV�RI�
YDULRXV�VL]HV��VSHFLHV�DQG�SURGXFWV�WR�PHHW�WKH�QHHGV�RI�D�ZLGH�YDULHW\�RI�SXUFKDVHUV��7KHUH�DUH�VRPH�VDOHV�RIIHUHG�
RQ�WKLV�DXFWLRQ�WKDW�DOORZ�WKH�SXUFKDVHU�WR�GHFLGH�LI�WKH\�ZDQW�WR�SXUFKDVH�WKH�VDOH�DV�RIIHUHG��HLWKHU�DOO�VSHFLHV�
VFDOHG�RU�D�PL[�RI�VFDOHG�DQG�62$9�VSHFLHV��RU�FKRRVH�WR�KDYH�DOO�WKH�VSHFLHV�VROG�DV�62$9��7KHVH�DUH�LGHQWLILHG�
ZLWK�WKH�IROORZLQJ�VHQWHQFH�LQ�WKH�FRPPHQWV�RI�HDFK�WUDFW��³7KH�SXUFKDVHU�KDV�WKH�RSWLRQ�WR�SXUFKDVH�WKLV�VDOH�DV�
DGYHUWLVHG�RU�WR�SXUFKDVH�DOO�VSHFLHV�DV�6ROG�2Q�$SSUDLVHG�9ROXPH��62$9�´��,I�WKHUH�LV�DQ\�FRQIOLFW�EHWZHHQ�WKH�
7LPEHU�6DOH�3DFNDJH�DQG�WKLV�DGYHUWLVHPHQW��WKH�7LPEHU�6DOH�3DFNDJH�LV�WKH�FRQWUROOLQJ�GRFXPHQW��7KH��
7LPEHU�6DOH�3DFNDJH�FRQWDLQV�PDSV��YROXPH�DQG�YDOXHV��FRQWUDFW�LQIRUPDWLRQ�DQG�KDUYHVW�SURYLVLRQV��DQG�LV�����
DYDLODEOH�DW�WKH�DSSOLFDEOH�$5($�2)),&(�OLVWHG�EHORZ�RU�RQ�WKH�FRXQW\�ZHEVLWH��67/28,6&2817<01�*29� 
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3OHDVH�1RWH� 

6XFFHVVIXO�ELGGHUV�RI�VDOHV�ZLWK�WKH�RSWLRQ�RI�FKRRVLQJ�6ROG�2Q�$SSUDLVHG�9ROXPH��62$9��ZLOO�KDYH�
WHQ������EXVLQHVV�GD\V�WR�FKRRVH�WKH�RSWLRQ�IRU�WKH�VDOH�V���$������ELG�ERQG��L�H��SHUVRQDO�FKHFN��
SD\DEOH�WR�WKH�6W��/RXLV�&RXQW\�$XGLWRU�LV�UHTXLUHG�DQG�PXVW�EH�SDLG�WKH�GD\�RI�WKH�DXFWLRQ��2QH�ELG�
ERQG�ZLOO�FRYHU�DOO�SXUFKDVHG�WUDFWV�WKDW�KDYH�DQ�62$9�RSWLRQ� 

6XFFHVVIXO�ELGGHUV�XVLQJ�D�/HWWHU�RI�&UHGLW�WR�VHFXUH�WKH�SXUFKDVH�RI�D�VDOH�ZLOO�KDYH�WHQ����������
EXVLQHVV�GD\V�WR�SURYLGH�WKH�/HWWHU�RI�&UHGLW�WR�WKH�/DQG�DQG�0LQHUDOV�'HSDUWPHQW��$������ELG�ERQG��
L�H��SHUVRQDO�FKHFN��SD\DEOH�WR�WKH�6W��/RXLV�&RXQW\�$XGLWRU�LV�UHTXLUHG�DQG�PXVW�EH�SDLG�WKH�GD\�RI�
WKH�DXFWLRQ��2QH�ELG�ERQG�ZLOO�FRYHU�DOO�SXUFKDVHG�WUDFWV�WKDW�ZLOO�EH�VHFXUHG�E\�/HWWHU�RI�&UHGLW� 

7LPEHU�6DOH�2SHUDWRUV�PXVW�KDYH�WKH�IROORZLQJ�PLQLPXP�WUDLQLQJ�IRU�DW�OHDVW�WKH�RZQHU�RI�WKH�ILUP�
DQG�WKH�IRUHPDQ�ZKR�ZLOO�VXSHUYLVH�WKH�ORJJLQJ�RQ�6W��/RXLV�&RXQW\�/DQGV� 

· 0DVWHU�/RJJLQJ�&HUWLILFDWLRQ��RU 

· 0LQQHVRWD�/RJJHU�(GXFDWLRQ��0/(3��0HPEHU�LQ�*RRG�6WDQGLQJ��RU�6),�7UDLQLQJ�
),67$�PHPEHU��RU 

· 7UDLQLQJ�HTXLYDOHQW�WR�WKH�0LQQHVRWD�6),�,PSOHPHQWDWLRQ�&RPPLWWHH�7UDLQLQJ��������
6WDQGDUG�IRU�D�WUDLQHG�3URIHVVLRQDO�/RJJHU����������������� 

$OO�ILHOG�HPSOR\HHV�PXVW�KDYH�WUDLQLQJ�LQ�EHVW�PDQDJHPHQW�SUDFWLFHV� 
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Sales Map

St. Louis County February 17, 2022 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 1 C22-641724 Sale Administrator: Casey Anderson
Virginia Area
C19220001

Total Appraised: $2,185.00
Down Payment Required: $327.75

Twp. 64N Rge. 17W  Sec. 24

Total Acres: 45.2 Expires: 4/15/2025 48° 0.951' N  92° 26.786' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Pine-Norway 3.8 9.4 24.9
Pine-Jack 3.4 7.7 4.1
Aspen 3.3 7.7 3.3
Pine-White 3.1 9.1 2.8
Balsam Fir 2.9 6.6 1.3
Birch 1.7 5.5 0.3

Comments:
All species will be scaled.

Access:
Purchaser will be required to secure a Road Use Permit from the USFS LaCroix Ranger District. USFS gate restricts access to the 
sale, contact Sale Administrator for access through the gate.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 10 Cords @ $5.00 = $50.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 10 Cords @ $5.00 = $50.00
Birch pulpwood 1 Cords @ $5.00 = $5.00
Red Maple pulpwood 1 Cords @ $5.00 = $5.00
Jack Pine pulpwood 15 Cords @ $5.00 = $75.00
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 394 Cords @ $5.00 = $1,970.00
White Pine pulpwood 5 Cords @ $5.00 = $25.00
White Spruce pulpwood 1 Cords @ $5.00 = $5.00

Total Appraised Value: $2,185.00



C19220001



Sales Map

St. Louis County February 17, 2022 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 2 C22-641904 Sale Administrator: Casey Anderson
Virginia Area
C19220002

Total Appraised: $1,980.00
Down Payment Required: $297.00

Twp. 64N Rge. 19W  Sec. 4

Total Acres: 61.8 Expires: 4/15/2025 48° 3.034' N  92° 47.239' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Pine-Norway 3.4 10.3 8.2
Oak-Red 2.7 10.5 1.7
Pine-White 2.8 10.3 0.6
Spruce-White 3.1 9.2 0.6
Balsam Fir 2.1 7.2 0.4
Maple-Red 2.1 7.6 0.3

Comments:
All species will be scaled.

Block Operational Periods
2 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

Operational Periods:
Block #1 operation period is from August 1 to March 10.

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 5 Cords @ $5.00 = $25.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 5 Cords @ $5.00 = $25.00
Birch pulpwood 12 Cords @ $5.00 = $60.00
Red Maple pulpwood 15 Cords @ $5.00 = $75.00
Red Oak pulpwood 101 Cords @ $5.00 = $505.00
Jack Pine pulpwood 5 Cords @ $5.00 = $25.00
Norway Pine pulpwood 220 Cords @ $5.00 = $1,100.00
White Pine pulpwood 18 Cords @ $5.00 = $90.00
White Spruce pulpwood 15 Cords @ $5.00 = $75.00

Total Appraised Value: $1,980.00

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Aspen pulpwood 5
Balsam Fir pulpwood 5
Birch pulpwood 3 9
Red Maple pulpwood 3 12
Red Oak pulpwood 4 97
Jack Pine pulpwood 5
Norway Pine pulpwood 220
White Pine pulpwood 15 3
White Spruce pulpwood 15



C19220002



Sales Map

St. Louis County February 17, 2022 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 3 C22-652010 Sale Administrator: Brandon Pierzina
Virginia Area
C19220003

Total Appraised: $1,895.00
Down Payment Required: $284.25

Twp. 65N Rge. 20W  Sec. 10

Total Acres: 102.5 Expires: 4/15/2025 48° 7.621' N  92° 53.599' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.7 13.9 5.7
Pine-Jack 4.5 13.2 2.8
Maple-Red 2.2 7.9 2.8
Birch 2.8 8.6 1.9
Ash 3.7 10.8 1.9
Balsam Fir 2.1 6.6 1.4

Comments:
-The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or as Sold On Appraised Volume (SOAV).
-Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.
-This sale is being re-offered with a reduced price.
-Undefined portions of the harvest area on the sale map 
are dry soil operable- meaning harvesting around wetland 
inclusions, lowland drainages and unstable soils, along 
with road construction through ash and spruce wetlands 
will be needed to achieve this. Contact Sale Administrator 
for more details.

Block Operational Periods
1, 2 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Ash pulpwood 185 Cords @ $1.00 = $185.00
Aspen pulpwood 590 Cords @ $1.00 = $590.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 138 Cords @ $1.00 = $138.00
Basswood pulpwood 2 Cords @ $1.00 = $2.00
Birch pulpwood 191 Cords @ $1.00 = $191.00
Red Maple pulpwood 282 Cords @ $1.00 = $282.00
Jack Pine pulpwood 297 Cords @ $1.00 = $297.00
Norway Pine pulpwood 25 Cords @ $1.00 = $25.00
Black Spruce pulpwood 116 Cords @ $1.00 = $116.00
White Spruce pulpwood 67 Cords @ $1.00 = $67.00
Tamarack pulpwood 2 Cords @ $1.00 = $2.00

Total Appraised Value: $1,895.00

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Ash pulpwood 41 144
Aspen pulpwood 201 389
Balsam Fir pulpwood 37 101
Basswood pulpwood 2
Birch pulpwood 50 141
Red Maple pulpwood 79 203
Jack Pine pulpwood 150 147
Norway Pine pulpwood 6 19
Black Spruce pulpwood 103 13
White Spruce pulpwood 9 58
Tamarack pulpwood 2



C19220003



Sales Map

St. Louis County February 17, 2022 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 4 C22-661819 Sale Administrator: Christopher Lintula
Virginia Area
C19220004

Total Appraised: $29,487.37
Down Payment Required: $4,423.11

Twp. 66N Rge. 18W  Sec. 7, 19

Total Acres: 49.7 Expires: 4/15/2025 48° 11.594' N  92° 42.382' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.2 11.0 28.9
Balsam Fir 3.1 8.8 1.5
Spruce-White 4.9 13.0 0.5
Birch 3.4 9.5 0.3
Balm Of Gilead 4.2 9.5 0.3

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree skidding will not 
be allowed if the sale is purchased as a scaled option.

Access:
The purchaser will be required to secure a Road Use Permit from the LaCroix Ranger District in Cook, MN.  The Road Use Permit will 
involve road toll fees or a maintenance agreement.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 1443 Cords @ $19.44 = $28,051.92
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 15 Cords @ $19.44 = $291.60
Balsam Fir pulpwood 75 Cords @ $9.29 = $696.75
Birch pulpwood 15 Cords @ $5.54 = $83.10
White Spruce pulp & bolts 28 Cords @ $13.00 = $364.00

Total Appraised Value: $29,487.37



C19220004



Sales Map

St. Louis County February 17, 2022 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 5 C22-662034 Sale Administrator: Shontel Adam
Virginia Area
C19220005

Total Appraised: $53,064.94
Down Payment Required: $7,959.74

Twp. 66N Rge. 20W  Sec. 34, 35

Total Acres: 85.6 Expires: 4/15/2025 48° 9.364' N  92° 52.834' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.8 11.6 20.1
Balsam Fir 3.6 7.9 6.0
Pine-Jack 6.0 11.7 4.8
Spruce-White 6.5 15.1 2.1
Pine-Norway 6.6 18.7 1.2
Spruce-Black 4.7 8.9 0.7

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).  Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Block Operational Periods
1 & 2 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 1759 Cords @ $19.44 = $34,194.96
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 16 Cords @ $19.44 = $311.04
Balsam Fir pulpwood 527 Cords @ $9.29 = $4,895.83
Birch pulpwood 57 Cords @ $5.54 = $315.78
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 378 Cords @ $18.13 = $6,853.14
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 95 Cords @ $32.91 = $3,126.45
Black Spruce pulpwood 64 Cords @ $13.69 = $876.16
White Spruce pulp & bolts 182 Cords @ $13.69 = $2,491.58

Total Appraised Value: $53,064.94

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Aspen pulpwood 861 898
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 11 5
Balsam Fir pulpwood 148 379
Birch pulpwood 12 45
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 32 346
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 95
Black Spruce pulpwood 3 61
White Spruce pulp & bolts 32 150



C19220005



Sales Map

St. Louis County February 17, 2022 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 6 E22-601502 Sale Administrator: Tom Salzer
Virginia Area
C19220006

Total Appraised: $9,560.79
Down Payment Required: $1,434.12

Twp. 60N Rge. 15W  Sec. 2, 11 and Twp. 61N Rge. 15W  
Sec. 35

Total Acres: 36.3 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 42.419' N  92° 12.745' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.2 13.3 13.5
Balsam Fir 2.4 7.9 0.9
Spruce-Black 3.2 8.8 0.8
Spruce-White 5.4 14.7 0.7
Maple-Red 2.5 8.5 0.4
Pine-Jack 4.0 14.0 0.2

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Access:
Access road to the sale area must be blocked to satisfaction of the Seller.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 474 Cords @ $17.67 = $8,375.58
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 2 Cords @ $16.98 = $33.96
Balsam Fir pulpwood 35 Cords @ $8.26 = $289.10
Birch pulpwood 10 Cords @ $5.04 = $50.40
Red Maple pulpwood 17 Cords @ $2.97 = $50.49
Jack Pine pulpwood 4 Cords @ $16.48 = $65.92
Black Spruce pulpwood 30 Cords @ $13.93 = $417.90
White Spruce pulpwood 24 Cords @ $11.56 = $277.44

Total Appraised Value: $9,560.79



C19220006



Sales Map

St. Louis County February 17, 2022 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 7 E22-601609 Sale Administrator: James Simons
Virginia Area
C19220007

Total Appraised: $60,805.40
Down Payment Required: $9,120.81

Twp. 60N Rge. 16W  Sec. 3, 4, 9 and Twp. 61N Rge. 16W  
Sec. 34

Total Acres: 175.1 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 42.394' N  92° 22.399' W
Blocks: 4

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.1 7.9 18.9
Balsam Fir 2.8 7.7 0.6
Maple-Red 2.3 7.8 0.3
Birch 3.8 9.5 0.2
Ash 4.4 9.9 0.2
Pine-White 5.3 15.3 0.1

Comments:
-The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as
advertised, or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV), except white pine must be scaled.
-Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Access:
North Pike (Dahl) Forest Management Road

Block Operational Periods
All Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Ash pulpwood 26 Cords @ $3.00 = $78.00
Aspen pulpwood 3321 Cords @ $17.67 = $58,682.07
Balsam Fir pulpwood 108 Cords @ $8.26 = $892.08
Birch pulpwood 41 Cords @ $5.04 = $206.64
Red Maple pulpwood 53 Cords @ $2.97 = $157.41
Jack Pine pulpwood 9 Cords @ $16.48 = $148.32
White Pine pulp & bolts 13 Cords @ $21.63 = $281.19
Black Spruce pulpwood 3 Cords @ $13.93 = $41.79
White Spruce pulpwood 22 Cords @ $14.45 = $317.90

Total Appraised Value: $60,805.40

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3 Block 4
Ash pulpwood 7 11 8
Aspen pulpwood 832 1076 591 822
Balsam Fir pulpwood 20 16 13 59
Birch pulpwood 22 3 2 14
Red Maple pulpwood 47 1 5
Jack Pine pulpwood 2 7
White Pine pulp & bolts 13
Black Spruce pulpwood 3
White Spruce pulpwood 5 17
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Sales Map

St. Louis County February 17, 2022 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 8 E22-611618 Sale Administrator: Robert Cozzo
Virginia Area
C19220008

Total Appraised: $26,452.35
Down Payment Required: $3,967.85

Twp. 61N Rge. 16W  Sec. 18, 19

Total Acres: 96.1 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 45.557' N  92° 25.450' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.5 7.6 13.4
Birch 4.2 6.5 2.6
Maple-Red 2.7 4.7 0.8
Spruce-White 6.8 10.7 0.8
Spruce-Black 4.1 6.4 0.6
Balsam Fir 2.4 4.1 0.4

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On 
Appraised Volume (SOAV).
Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Block Operational Periods
1, 2 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Ash pulpwood 5 Cords @ $3.00 = $15.00
Aspen pulpwood 1312 Cords @ $17.67 = $23,183.04
Balsam Fir pulpwood 37 Cords @ $8.26 = $305.62
Birch pulpwood 240 Cords @ $5.04 = $1,209.60
Red Maple pulpwood 70 Cords @ $2.97 = $207.90
Black Spruce pulpwood 51 Cords @ $13.93 = $710.43
White Spruce pulpwood 71 Cords @ $11.56 = $820.76

Total Appraised Value: $26,452.35

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Ash pulpwood 5
Aspen pulpwood 856 456
Balsam Fir pulpwood 28 9
Birch pulpwood 176 64
Red Maple pulpwood 55 15
Black Spruce pulpwood 38 13
White Spruce pulpwood 25 46



C19220008



Sales Map

St. Louis County February 17, 2022 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 9 E22-631436 Sale Administrator: James Simons
Virginia Area
C19220009

Total Appraised: $16,487.06
Down Payment Required: $2,473.06

Twp. 62N Rge. 13W  Sec. 6 and Twp. 63N Rge. 13W  Sec. 
31, 32 and Twp. 63N Rge. 14W  Sec. 36

Total Acres: 62.2 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 53.346' N  92° 2.529' W
Blocks: 3

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.1 9.2 13.3
Birch 3.5 8.6 0.6
Balsam Fir 2.5 7.2 0.4
Maple-Red 2.5 7.5 0.3
Spruce-White 4.5 10.6 0.2
Spruce-Black 4.0 8.0 0.0

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale 
as advertised or as Sold On Appraised Volume 
(SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree chipping/
grinding will not be allowed if the sale is purchased 
as a scaled option.

Access:
#404 Wolf Lake Road
Culvert installation may be needed and culverts will be supplied upon request.

Block Operational Periods
All Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 896 Cords @ $17.67 = $15,832.32
Balsam Fir pulpwood 27 Cords @ $8.26 = $223.02
Birch pulpwood 42 Cords @ $5.04 = $211.68
Red Maple pulpwood 18 Cords @ $2.97 = $53.46
Black Spruce pulpwood 2 Cords @ $13.93 = $27.86
White Spruce pulpwood 12 Cords @ $11.56 = $138.72

Total Appraised Value: $16,487.06

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3
Aspen pulpwood 265 472 159
Balsam Fir pulpwood 14 13
Birch pulpwood 6 29 7
Red Maple pulpwood 3 5 10
Black Spruce pulpwood 2
White Spruce pulpwood 3 9
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Sales Package

Tract #: 10 V22-571314 Sale Administrator: Brandon Pierzina
Virginia Area
C19220010

Total Appraised: $13,350.66
Down Payment Required: $2,002.60

Twp. 57N Rge. 13W  Sec. 11, 12, 14

Total Acres: 126.8 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 25.864' N  91° 56.772' W
Blocks: 3

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Birch 4.3 12.3 10.2
Aspen 4.6 12.3 2.9
Maple-Red 3.2 10.0 2.5
Balsam Fir 3.1 8.4 1.9
Spruce-Black 3.3 8.6 0.3
Tamarack 4.8 12.4 0.2

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale 
as advertised or as Sold On Appraised Volume 
(SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree chipping/
grinding will not be allowed if the sale is purchased 
as a scaled option.

Access:
Access for this timber sale will require a road use permit from the US Forest Service. Once timber sale is completed, a berm will need 
to be put in place at the intersection of 452A and 425AA.

Block Operational Periods
1, 2, 3 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 342 Cords @ $14.14 = $4,835.88
Balsam Fir pulpwood 248 Cords @ $8.26 = $2,048.48
Birch pulpwood 1253 Cords @ $4.03 = $5,049.59
Red Maple pulpwood 344 Cords @ $2.37 = $815.28
Black Spruce pulpwood 38 Cords @ $13.93 = $529.34
Tamarack pulpwood 27 Cords @ $2.67 = $72.09

Total Appraised Value: $13,350.66

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3
Aspen pulpwood 16 22 304
Balsam Fir pulpwood 96 67 85
Birch pulpwood 242 378 633
Red Maple pulpwood 164 42 138
Black Spruce pulpwood 18 20
Tamarack pulpwood 17 10



C19220010
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Sales Package

Tract #: 11 V22-581319 Sale Administrator: John Muhich
Virginia Area
C19220011

Total Appraised: $32,402.06
Down Payment Required: $4,860.31

Twp. 58N Rge. 13W  Sec. 19, 20

Total Acres: 65.1 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 29.690' N  92° 1.913' W
Blocks: 3

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 6.8 14.0 12.5
Pine-Norway 7.2 18.5 4.7
Birch 4.5 10.7 3.0
Maple-Red 3.2 8.5 1.9
Balsam Fir 2.9 9.2 0.9
Pine-White 4.9 12.8 0.4

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV) except for White and Red Pine.

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Block Operational Periods
1 and 3 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

Access:
Existing driveway is in place off Skibo Road.  All roads and trails planned for use are on county ownership.
Operational Periods:
Block 2:  Dry soil after August 1st or during frozen ground conditions, as per harvest provisions.  August 1st date was chosen 
to prevent bark beetle damage on Red and White Pines.

Blocks 1 and 3 is dry soil operation after July 1st or during frozen ground conditions.

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulp & bolts 824 Cords @ $21.21 = $17,477.04
Balsam Fir pulpwood 60 Cords @ $10.32 = $619.20
Birch pulp & bolts 198 Cords @ $6.05 = $1,197.90
Red Maple pulpwood 68 Cords @ $3.56 = $242.08
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 7 Cords @ $19.78 = $138.46
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 321 Cords @ $35.90 = $11,523.90
White Pine pulp & bolts 33 Cords @ $25.96 = $856.68
White Spruce pulp & bolts 24 Cords @ $14.45 = $346.80

Total Appraised Value: $32,402.06

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3
Aspen pulp & bolts 402 84 338
Balsam Fir pulpwood 52 4 4
Birch pulp & bolts 110 35 53
Red Maple pulpwood 20 48
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 5 2
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 148 64 109
White Pine pulp & bolts 33
White Spruce pulp & bolts 14 3 7
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Tract #: 12 V22-581522 Sale Administrator: Karl Rudstrom
Virginia Area
C19220012

Total Appraised: $15,006.42
Down Payment Required: $2,250.96

Twp. 58N Rge. 15W  Sec. 22

Total Acres: 32.7 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 29.836' N  92° 13.569' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.7 11.9 21.7
Spruce-White 4.9 11.8 1.4
Birch 3.4 8.4 1.1
Balsam Fir 2.8 8.2 0.6
Pine-Jack 5.2 8.0 0.4
Maple-Red 2.0 7.0 0.0

Comments:
-The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or as Sold On Appraised Volume (SOAV).
-Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.
-A minimum of $1,000 of the down payment will be 
retained and will be held until satisfactory completion of 
the contract.

Access:
See Sale Administrator for gate key.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 710 Cords @ $19.44 = $13,802.40
Balsam Fir pulpwood 18 Cords @ $9.29 = $167.22
Birch pulpwood 37 Cords @ $5.54 = $204.98
Red Maple pulpwood 1 Cords @ $3.26 = $3.26
Jack Pine pulpwood 12 Cords @ $18.13 = $217.56
White Spruce pulpwood 47 Cords @ $13.00 = $611.00

Total Appraised Value: $15,006.42
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Tract #: 13 V22-602113 Sale Administrator: Karl Rudstrom
Virginia Area
C19220013

Total Appraised: $2,370.00
Down Payment Required: $355.50

Twp. 60N Rge. 21W  Sec. 13, 14

Total Acres: 166.1 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 41.090' N  92° 56.723' W
Blocks: 4

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Spruce-Black 3.1 7.7 3.8
Birch 3.1 8.8 2.8
Aspen 4.5 12.1 2.7
Tamarack 3.2 9.0 1.5
Spruce-White 4.4 10.9 1.4
Balm Of Gilead 4.0 10.2 1.3

Comments:
-This sale is being re-offered with a reduced price.
-Sale can be purchased SOAV or as a scaled option.
-Larch Beetle Damage in Block 4a. It is recommended to 
harvest as soon as possible to capture live volume. There is 
approximately 57 cords of dead tamarack not included in 
the sale volume on this block. If purchaser utilizes the dead 
tamarack, this dead timber in 4a will be charged at the live 
tamarack price.

Access:
Access is off of Taconite State Snowmobile Trail.
Potential access through the State from the East of Block 4a off of Mudhole Road. This access route must be secured by purchaser.

Block Operational Periods
1, 2, 3, 4 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 446 Cords @ $1.00 = $446.00
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 197 Cords @ $1.00 = $197.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 130 Cords @ $1.00 = $130.00
Birch pulpwood 455 Cords @ $1.00 = $455.00
Red Maple pulpwood 13 Cords @ $1.00 = $13.00
Black Spruce pulpwood 579 Cords @ $1.00 = $579.00
White Spruce pulpwood 231 Cords @ $1.00 = $231.00
Tamarack pulpwood 319 Cords @ $1.00 = $319.00

Total Appraised Value: $2,370.00

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3 Block 4
Aspen pulpwood 208 147 87 4
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 41 100 56
Balsam Fir pulpwood 33 61 17 19
Birch pulpwood 105 191 57 102
Red Maple pulpwood 7 6
Black Spruce pulpwood 187 279 41 72
White Spruce pulpwood 40 82 62 47
Tamarack pulpwood 18 301
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Tract #: 14 V22-602115 Sale Administrator: Karl Rudstrom
Virginia Area
C19220014

Total Appraised: $87,163.23
Down Payment Required: $13,074.48

Twp. 60N Rge. 21W  Sec. 15

Total Acres: 82.6 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 41.043' N  92° 59.247' W
Blocks: 3

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.6 11.4 13.2
Pine-Norway 6.7 14.4 13.2
Pine-Jack 6.0 10.2 10.3
Birch 4.6 9.5 2.8
Balsam Fir 3.3 9.7 1.6
Maple-Red 3.2 8.5 1.1

Comments:
- Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree
chipping/grinding will not be allowed.
-All species must be scaled.

Access:
Sale access to Block 1 is through existing trail off of Perch Lake Road approximately 1.3 miles East of Hwy 5. Taconite Trail may be 
used for access to Blocks 2 & 3 (See Harvest Regulations).

Block Operational Periods
1, 3 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st
2 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 1147 Cords @ $21.21 = $24,327.87
Balsam Fir pulpwood 125 Cords @ $10.32 = $1,290.00
Birch pulpwood 227 Cords @ $6.05 = $1,373.35
Red Maple pulpwood 95 Cords @ $3.56 = $338.20
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 855 Cords @ $19.78 = $16,911.90
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 1079 Cords @ $38.90 = $41,973.10
Black Spruce pulpwood 16 Cords @ $17.41 = $278.56
White Spruce pulpwood 45 Cords @ $14.45 = $650.25
Tamarack pulpwood 5 Cords @ $4.00 = $20.00

Total Appraised Value: $87,163.23

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3
Aspen pulpwood 2 509 636
Balsam Fir pulpwood 2 37 86
Birch pulpwood 44 14 169
Red Maple pulpwood 27 68
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 369 34 452
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 681 8 390
Black Spruce pulpwood 16
White Spruce pulpwood 45
Tamarack pulpwood 5
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Tract #: 15 B22-531314 Sale Administrator: Drake Schroeder
Pike Lake Area
C19220015

Total Appraised: $7,160.00
Down Payment Required: $1,074.00

Twp. 53N Rge. 13W  Sec. 13, 14, 23

Total Acres: 96.2 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 4.528' N  91° 56.876' W
Blocks: 4

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Maple-Sugar 3.3 11.1 15.0
Birch 4.7 12.8 6.5
Basswood 6.0 13.2 4.9
Ash 3.0 10.6 1.2
Aspen 5.4 15.0 0.3
Maple-Red 3.5 10.0 0.1

Comments:
No skidding in Blocks 1 and 3.  All timber must be 
removed with a forwarder.

Block Operational Periods
1, 2, 3, 4 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Ash pulpwood 76 Cords @ $5.00 = $380.00
Aspen pulpwood 28 Cords @ $5.00 = $140.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 7 Cords @ $5.00 = $35.00
Basswood pulpwood 181 Cords @ $5.00 = $905.00
Birch pulpwood 374 Cords @ $5.00 = $1,870.00
Red Maple pulpwood 16 Cords @ $5.00 = $80.00
Sugar Maple pulpwood 750 Cords @ $5.00 = $3,750.00

Total Appraised Value: $7,160.00

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3 Block 4
Ash pulpwood 20 56
Aspen pulpwood 12 8 8
Balsam Fir pulpwood 3 4
Basswood pulpwood 24 13 138 6
Birch pulpwood 120 97 85 72
Red Maple pulpwood 14 2
Sugar Maple pulpwood 321 148 203 78
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Tract #: 16 B22-541333 Sale Administrator: Robert Benson
Pike Lake Area
C19220016

Total Appraised: $51,942.63
Down Payment Required: $7,791.39

Twp. 54N Rge. 13W  Sec. 27, 28, 33, 34

Total Acres: 130.9 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 7.547' N  91° 59.089' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.0 10.7 14.0
Spruce-Black 4.4 8.3 5.5
Balsam Fir 3.6 10.5 2.4
Balm Of Gilead 2.8 8.3 1.1

Block Operational Periods
1, 2 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 1809 Cords @ $19.44 = $35,166.96
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 143 Cords @ $18.68 = $2,671.24
Balsam Fir pulpwood 351 Cords @ $9.29 = $3,260.79
Black Spruce pulpwood 692 Cords @ $15.67 = $10,843.64

Total Appraised Value: $51,942.63

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Aspen pulpwood 931 878
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 96 47
Balsam Fir pulpwood 47 304
Black Spruce pulpwood 87 605
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Tract #: 17 F22-501935 Sale Administrator: Daniel Preiner
Pike Lake Area
C19220017

Total Appraised: $32,024.88
Down Payment Required: $4,803.73

Twp. 50N Rge. 19W  Sec. 35

Total Acres: 82.2 Expires: 4/15/2025 46° 46.531' N  92° 42.719' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.9 12.1 20.2
Maple-Red 2.0 7.5 3.0
Birch 3.6 10.4 1.3
Balsam Fir 2.7 8.4 0.7
Spruce-Black 4.6 11.5 0.6
Maple-Sugar 2.0 7.3 0.0

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV)
Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Access:
This sale will be accessed off of Pine Drive.

Block Operational Periods
1, 2 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 1679 Cords @ $17.67 = $29,667.93
Balsam Fir pulpwood 55 Cords @ $8.26 = $454.30

SOAV Birch pulpwood 105 Cords @ $5.04 = $529.20
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 239 Cords @ $2.97 = $709.83
SOAV Sugar Maple pulpwood 3 Cords @ $2.97 = $8.91

Black Spruce pulpwood 47 Cords @ $13.93 = $654.71
Total Appraised Value: $32,024.88

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Aspen pulpwood 784 895
Balsam Fir pulpwood 41 14
Birch pulpwood 80 25
Red Maple pulpwood 68 171
Sugar Maple pulpwood 3
Black Spruce pulpwood 9 38
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Tract #: 18 F22-521719 Sale Administrator: Mark Baker
Pike Lake Area
C19220018

Total Appraised: $13,644.64
Down Payment Required: $2,046.70

Twp. 52N Rge. 17W  Sec. 19, 20

Total Acres: 69.9 Expires: 4/15/2025 46° 58.454' N  92° 31.794' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.7 12.0 8.0
Balsam Fir 3.1 6.8 4.9
Basswood 5.3 13.9 4.5
Maple-Sugar 4.3 12.2 3.5
Maple-Red 3.7 9.3 2.6

Comments:
Contact Administrator for details and to arrange a site visit.

Block Operational Periods
ALL Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

Access:
Road work will be required to access this sale for summer operations, and as a condition of operating this sale.    
Existing trails will be widened and extended, culverts placed, and gravel placed to stabilize new road segments. The distances total 
approximately 4,000 feet of improvements, primarily to get into Block 2.  After harvest, the roads must be bermed to the 
satisfaction of the seller.
Operational Periods:
Sale may be worked under dry summer conditions, but when significant fall rain occurs all work will cease.

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 549 Cords @ $15.90 = $8,729.10
Balsam Fir pulpwood 347 Cords @ $7.22 = $2,505.34

SOAV Basswood pulpwood 308 Cords @ $3.91 = $1,204.28
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 178 Cords @ $2.67 = $475.26
SOAV Sugar Maple pulpwood 238 Cords @ $3.07 = $730.66

Total Appraised Value: $13,644.64

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Aspen pulpwood 298 251
Balsam Fir pulpwood 297 50
Basswood pulpwood 105 203
Red Maple pulpwood 78 100
Sugar Maple pulpwood 36 202
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Tract #: 19 F22-541911 Sale Administrator: Steven Boberg
Pike Lake Area
C19220019

Total Appraised: $68,483.44
Down Payment Required: $10,272.52

Twp. 54N Rge. 19W  Sec. 11, 12

Total Acres: 102.3 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 10.395' N  92° 42.564' W
Blocks: 4

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.2 10.3 27.1
Balsam Fir 2.3 6.9 2.7
Birch 2.2 8.0 0.5
Balm Of Gilead 1.8 8.5 0.2

Comments:
Contact Sale Administrator for access to pit.  The purchaser 
has the option to purchase this sale as advertised or to 
purchase all species as Sold On Appraised Volume (SOAV). 
Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is purchased 
as a scaled option.

Access:
Sale can be accessed approximately .3 miles north of where Owl Avenue and Arkola Road intersect.

Block Operational Periods
1, 2 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

Aspen pulpwood 2800 Cords @ $22.97 = $64,316.00
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 23 Cords @ $22.08 = $507.84
Balsam Fir pulpwood 293 Cords @ $11.35 = $3,325.55

SOAV Birch pulpwood 51 Cords @ $6.55 = $334.05
Total Appraised Value: $68,483.44

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3 Block 4
Aspen pulpwood 710 733 758 599
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 8 8 7
Balsam Fir pulpwood 56 83 86 68
Birch pulpwood 10 14 15 12
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Tract #: 20 K22-511528 Sale Administrator: Tim Rutka
Pike Lake Area
C19220020

Total Appraised: $7,686.47
Down Payment Required: $1,152.97

Twp. 51N Rge. 15W  Sec. 28

Total Acres: 38.4 Expires: 4/15/2025 46° 52.793' N  92° 15.144' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Balsam Fir 3.5 8.8 5.7
Birch 4.1 10.8 5.3
Aspen 5.0 13.4 5.2
Ash 3.5 8.7 2.7
Maple-Sugar 3.3 9.0 1.8
Balm Of Gilead 4.2 11.5 0.9

Comments:
This sale is in the Emerald Ash Borer Quarantine Area.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground

Operational Periods:
Hours of operation will be between 7 AM and 8 PM.

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

SOAV Ash pulpwood 110 Cords @ $3.00 = $330.00
Aspen pulpwood 200 Cords @ $17.67 = $3,534.00
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 36 Cords @ $16.98 = $611.28
Balsam Fir pulpwood 213 Cords @ $8.26 = $1,759.38

SOAV Basswood pulpwood 25 Cords @ $4.34 = $108.50
SOAV Birch pulpwood 197 Cords @ $5.04 = $992.88
SOAV Sugar Maple pulpwood 66 Cords @ $3.41 = $225.06

Black Spruce pulpwood 9 Cords @ $13.93 = $125.37
Total Appraised Value: $7,686.47
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Tract #: 21 K22-511605 Sale Administrator: Erik Anton
Pike Lake Area
C19220021

Total Appraised: $50,229.10
Down Payment Required: $7,534.37

Twp. 51N Rge. 16W  Sec. 5 and Twp. 52N Rge. 16W  Sec. 
32

Total Acres: 83.6 Expires: 4/15/2025 46° 56.179' N  92° 24.128' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 6.4 12.3 29.4
Maple-Red 3.6 11.3 4.8
Maple-Sugar 2.9 10.9 1.4
Ash 3.9 9.7 1.0
Balsam Fir 2.9 8.6 0.5

Comments:
Sale is within the Emerald Ash Borer Quarantine Area.

Access:
Sale access will be frozen ground off the Highway 8 Grade Forest Management Road. A frozen ground access will be constructed for 
approximately 0.5 miles up a powerline right-of-way that bisects the Highway 8 Grade Forest Management Road. An alternate upland 
pre-existing access exists and can be used for sale access from the east.

Block Operational Periods
All Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

SOAV Ash pulpwood 86 Cords @ $3.30 = $283.80
Aspen pulpwood 2458 Cords @ $19.44 = $47,783.52
Balsam Fir pulpwood 45 Cords @ $9.29 = $418.05

SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 398 Cords @ $3.26 = $1,297.48
SOAV Sugar Maple pulpwood 119 Cords @ $3.75 = $446.25

Total Appraised Value: $50,229.10

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Ash pulpwood 43 43
Aspen pulpwood 1131 1327
Balsam Fir pulpwood 18 27
Red Maple pulpwood 183 215
Sugar Maple pulpwood 57 62
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Tract #: 22 K22-531435 Sale Administrator: Tim Rutka
Pike Lake Area
C19220022

Total Appraised: $9,231.94
Down Payment Required: $1,384.79

Twp. 53N Rge. 14W  Sec. 35

Total Acres: 60.1 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 1.781' N  92° 4.859' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Birch 4.2 11.4 5.5
Aspen 5.2 13.4 3.5
Maple-Sugar 3.5 10.6 2.2
Pine-White 6.4 19.6 1.5
Spruce-White 5.5 14.0 1.1
Balsam Fir 3.2 7.5 1.0

Comments:
Sale is in the Emerald Ash Borer Quarantine Area.
No extensions will be allowed.

Operational Periods:
Harvest and skidding may occur from September 15th to April 15th due to wood turtle concerns.

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

SOAV Ash pulpwood 22 Cords @ $3.00 = $66.00
Aspen pulpwood 197 Cords @ $17.67 = $3,480.99
Balsam Fir pulp & bolts 59 Cords @ $8.26 = $487.34

SOAV Birch pulpwood 333 Cords @ $5.04 = $1,678.32
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 5 Cords @ $2.97 = $14.85
SOAV Sugar Maple pulpwood 141 Cords @ $3.41 = $480.81

Norway Pine pulp & bolts 17 Cords @ $29.92 = $508.64
White Pine pulp & bolts 81 Cords @ $21.63 = $1,752.03
White Spruce pulp & bolts 66 Cords @ $11.56 = $762.96

Total Appraised Value: $9,231.94
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Sales Map

St. Louis County February 17, 2022 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 23 K22-551407 Sale Administrator: Tim Rutka
Pike Lake Area
C19220023

Total Appraised: $15,818.86
Down Payment Required: $2,372.83

Twp. 55N Rge. 14W  Sec. 7 and Twp. 55N Rge. 15W  Sec. 
12

Total Acres: 48.3 Expires: 4/15/2025 47° 16.085' N  92° 10.253' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.4 10.9 15.2
Balsam Fir 3.6 9.6 4.1
Maple-Red 2.7 7.2 1.8
Birch 3.8 10.9 0.7
Spruce-White 6.3 16.1 0.7
Spruce-Black 4.9 11.4 0.5

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Total For All Blocks

SOAV Ash pulpwood 10 Cords @ $3.00 = $30.00
SOAV Aspen pulpwood 733 Cords @ $17.67 = $12,952.11
SOAV Balsam Fir pulpwood 198 Cords @ $8.26 = $1,635.48
SOAV Birch pulpwood 36 Cords @ $5.04 = $181.44
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 86 Cords @ $2.97 = $255.42
SOAV Black Spruce pulpwood 25 Cords @ $13.93 = $348.25
SOAV White Spruce pulpwood 36 Cords @ $11.56 = $416.16

Total Appraised Value: $15,818.86
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Exhibit B1.  Harvesting Provisions

Standard Contract Provisions
1. Access, Landings and Skid Trails

1.1.  Location

Std - The location and construction of roads, skid trails, and landings must be approved by 
the Seller.

1.1.1

Std - Place fueling and maintenance areas outside of filter strips, riparian management 
zones and wetlands, where possible. Locations must be approved by the Seller.

1.1.2

1.2.  Specifications

Std - No leaning, hanging or bent trees will be left, nor will stumps or debris be pushed 
against standing timber.

1.2.1

Std - Placement of earthen material or corduroy may be required to prevent excessive 
rutting on roads or skid trails, as determined by the Seller.

1.2.2

Std - All borrow pits, ditches and other exposed soil areas must be sloped to 2:1 or flatter 
unless approved by the Seller.

1.2.3

Std - All logging roads and skid trails must be shaped so as to allow for proper drainage 
and erosion control at all times.

1.2.4

Std - Water control structures, such as water bars, slash mats, diversion channels, hay 
bales or other appropriate measures must be constructed and maintained as needed or as 
determined by the seller.

1.2.5

1.3.  Maintenance

Std - Purchaser must maintain or immediately repair any access that is located on an 
established road or trail. If damage occurs to a public road, purchaser will immediately 
contact the Seller and the road authority for direction and repair requirements.

1.3.1

1.4.  Gating and Signing

Std - A sign, provided by the Seller, with the Timber Harvesting Contract number will be 
posted and maintained by Purchaser on the access to the sale area.

1.4.1

2. Slash

Std - No slash may be left within 50 feet of any road, trail, stream, red painted harvest 
boundary or structure unless otherwise agreed upon.

2.0.1

3. Harvest Practices

Std - Cutting must proceed in a manner which will protect site productivity and ensure 
regeneration.

3.0.1

Std - Painted boundary trees must not be cut.3.0.2

Std - Exposure of mineral soil must be minimized in filter strips.  Equipment movement 
in the filter strip should generally be perpendicular to the wetland and not parallel to it.

3.0.3
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Exhibit B1.  Harvesting Provisions

Standard Contract Provisions
Std - Skidding of timber within the right-of-way or across any road must be approved by 
the Seller.

3.0.4

Std - Stump heights must be no more than the stem diameter or 10" whichever is less.3.0.5

4. Reserves

Std - Reserve and limit damage to pre-existing coarse woody debris.4.0.1

5. Operational Periods

5.1.  Harvest and Skidding

Std - Purchaser is responsible for monitoring conditions and postponing, shutting down or 
modifying operations to prevent site damage.

5.1.1

Std -If this contract was purchased under restricted bidding conditions, the contract is 
deemed non-transferable and cannot be reassigned.

5.1.16

7. Other

Std - If an unsafe condition is identified, the purchaser is required to take immediate steps 
to mitigate the hazard and notify the Seller.

7.0.1

8. Scaling of Timber

Std - Products to be ground scaled must be piled so that an accurate scale can be made.8.0.1

Std - Consumer Scaling 
(1) The instructions in the load ticket booklet are part of this agreement.
(2) A scale ticket must accompany each load of scaled species delivered.
(3) Any penalties assessed against the Purchaser will be charged to

the contract and subtracted from any block credit, downpayment
balance or will be billed for each penalty assessed.

(4) Consumer Scaling is not allowed after the contract completion date unless a
Consumer Scaling extension has been authorized by the Seller. Therefore, with the 
exception of SOAV wood and wood under a Consumer Scaling extension, all cut products 
that remain on the landings must be scaled by the seller.

8.0.2

Std - Purchaser must give the Seller three days notice before on-site scales will be made.  
The Seller's costs may be billed to the Purchaser for all scaling involving less than 30 
cords per scaling trip.

8.0.3

9. Timber Utilization

Std - No snags or coarse woody debris may be utilized.9.0.1
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Exhibit B1.  Harvesting Provisions

Standard Contract Provisions
Std - All bole material in the main stem of trees of the species listed in the Contract as 
harvest trees which contain one 100-inch cordwood sticks with a top diameter of at least 3 
inches for spruce and tamarack and 4 inches for all other species are included in the sale 
volume.All other material will be defined as residual (tops, limbs and undersized).

9.0.2

 Std - Purchaser will be billed for any timber that is sold and not utilized.9.0.3

Std - Some or all of the down payment may be held to ensure removal of bio-fuels piles.9.0.4

Std - Piles left on site beyond one year from  completion of a Block may be disposed of 
by the Seller at the Purchaser's expense.

9.0.5

Std - The Purchaser will notify the Seller of their intention to store cut products, including 
residues to be chipped, prior to placing any piles. The location of piles and their size will 
be at the Seller's discretion.

9.0.6

Std - No less than 20% of the harvested tops on the sale must be reserved and evenly 
distributed on the site. The Seller and Purchaser will determine which species or 
combination of species will have tops reserved. No refunds will be made for residuals that 
are reserved.

9.0.7

Std - SOAV species are intended to include the entire above ground portion of the tree, 
including residuals and may be removed at the discretion of the contractor, unless 
otherwise specified. Roundwood measure is shown for bidding purposes only, and does 
not include any estimate of residuals.

9.0.8

Std - The residuals of the Scaled species will be available for purchase on this sale.  A 
contract amendment for the additional volume must be completed and additional payment 
made before any residuals may be removed.

9.0.9
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Land and Minerals 
 

Department 

   Tax Forfeited Sealed Bid Timber Auction List 

Barrier Free:  All St. Louis County Timber Auc ons are accessible to the handicapped. A empts will be made 

to accommodate any other individual needs for special services. Contact the St. Louis County Land and     

Minerals Department (218‐726‐2606) prior to the auc on, so necessary arrangements can be made. 

February 17, 2022  9:30 a.m. 

Photo Credit:  Melissa Ringger, Pike Lake ISIII 




