
May 2025 - NEW FORFEITURE EMV SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Basic Sale Price Sale Amount

1 B22250003 130774 NO BID $12,600.00 -

2 B22250004 130775 PULLED $12,200.00 -

3 B22250005 130776 NO BID $632,500.00 -

4 B22250006 130777 NO BID $8,000.00 -

5 B22250007 130778 NO BID $18,800.00 -

6 B22250008 130779 Douglas J. Nelson $12,700.00 $12,700.00

7 B22250009 130780 Steve Kenworthy $3,900.00 $4,579.36

8 B22250010 130781 NO BID $143.04 -

9 B22250011 130782 PULLED $103,300.00 -

10 B22250017 130788 NO BID $24,300.00 -

11 B22250019 130790 NO BID $41,400.00 -

12 B22250020 130791 NO BID $25,600.00 -

13 B22250021 130792 Bob M. Shykes $3,200.00 $3,200.00

14 B22250022 130793 Ashley Neenan $4,700.00 $4,700.00

15 B22250023 130794 Ashley Neenan $38,900.00 $38,900.00

16 B22250024 130795 NO BID $83,200.00 -
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17 B22250025 130796 NO BID $11,000.00 -

18 B22250026 130797 Mary C. Johnson $400.00 $400.00

19 B22250027 130798 NO BID $141,000.00 -

20 B22250028 130799 NO BID $36,700.00 -

21 B22250030 130801 Catharine L. Niemi $3,100.00 $3,100.00

22 B22250031 130803 NO BID $89,300.00 -

23 B22250032 130804 NO BID $89,300.00 -

24 B22250033 130805 NO BID $89,400.00 -

25 B22250034 130806 NO BID $89,400.00 -

26 B22250035 130807 NO BID $89,400.00 -

27 B22250036 130808 George A. Rathjen $2,600.00 $2,600.00

28 B22250037 130809 NO BID $5,300.00 -

29 B22250038 130810 Devin Ceglar $2,200.00 $2,575.00

30 B22250039 130811 NO BID $64,200.00 -

31 B22250040 130812 NO BID $14,900.00 -

32 B22250042 130814 NO BID $4,300.00 -
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33 B22250043 130815 NO BID $47,900.00 -

34 B22250044 130817 NO BID $22,500.00 -

35 B22250045 130818 NO BID $22,400.00 -

36 B22250046 130824 NO BID $60,500.00 -

37 B22250047 130825 NO BID $41,700.00 -

38 B22250048 130826 NO BID $4,004.77 -

39 B22250049 130827 Tammy Mortaloni $2,800.00 $2,800.00

40 B22250050 130828 PULLED $56,900.00 -

41 B22250051 130829 NO BID $17,818.89 -

42 B22250052 130830 NO BID $83,500.00 -

43 B22250057 130839 NO BID $14,900.00 -

44 B22250058 130843 NO BID $2,400.00 -

45 B22250059 130844 NO BID $5,601.00 -

46 B22250060 130845 NO BID $30,300.00 -

47 B22250061 130846 NO BID $48,200.00 -

48 B22250062 130848 Jeff D. Halter $7,100.00 $7,100.00
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49 B22250063 130849 NO BID $89,500.00 -

50 B22250064 130850 NO BID $351,200.00 -

51 B22250065 130851 NO BID $2,300.00 -

52 B22250066 130852 NO BID $9,000.00 -

53 B22250067 130853 NO BID $16,400.00 -

54 B22250068 130854 Sheila M. Menard $5,700.00 $6,250.00

55 B22250069 130855 NO BID $32,200.00 -

56 B22250071 130857 NO BID $57,400.00 -

57 B22250072 130858 NO BID $41,700.00 -

58 B22250073 130859 William S. Lacina $12,700.00 $12,700.00

59 B22250074 130860 NO BID $30,000.00 -

60 B22250076 130864 NO BID $7,900.00 -

61 B22250077 130865 NO BID $4,100.00 -

62 B22250078 130866 NO BID $1,400.00 -

63 B22250079 130867 NO BID $15,200.00 -

64 B22250080 130868 NO BID $1,700.00 -
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65 B22250081 130869 NO BID $5,400.00 -

66 B22250082 130870 PULLED $15,600.00 -

67 B22250083 130871 NO BID $4,700.00 -

68 B22250084 130872 NO BID $135.56 -

69 B22250085 130873 NO BID $61,100.00 -

70 B22250086 130874 Jared Kral $300.00 $4,150.00

71 B22250087 130876 PULLED $17,900.00 -

72 B22250088 130877 Ron Peterson $200.00 $504.00

73 B22250089 130878 PULLED $5,700.00 -

74 B22250090 130879 NO BID $81,600.00 -

75 B22250092 130881 NO BID $58,800.00 -

76 B22250093 130889 PULLED $138,100.00 -

77 B22250094 130890 Penny M. Scheer $1,400.00 $1,550.00

78 B22250095 130895 Anthony Pascuzzi $400.00 $820.00

79 B22250098 130898 Stream's Edge Properties, LLC $101,900.00 $101,900.00

80 B22250099 130900 NO BID $13,000.00 -
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81 B22250100 130901 PULLED $13,300.00 -

82 B22250101 130903 PULLED $134.99 -

83 B22250102 130904 PULLED $2,600.00 -

84 B22250104 130907 John Hagemeyer $21,000.00 $21,000.00

85 B22250105 130915 Glori Lundstrom $1,900.00 $6,800.00

86 B22250106 130916 Asher G. Houghton $17,900.00 $20,100.00

87 B22250110 130920 Chriatina D. Lindbeck $800.00 $8,100.00

88 B22250111 130925 NO BID $13,900.00 -

89 B22250112 130926 NO BID $15,700.00 -

90 B22250113 130927 NO BID $17,400.00 -

91 B22250114 130928 NO BID $14,500.00 -

92 B22250115 130931 Michael J. Lahti $7,700.00 $16,600.00

93 B22250116 130932 Blake A. Borgeson $34,700.00 $45,100.00

Total Tracts 93 Total Value $3,572,638.25

Pulled Tracts 10 Pulled Tracts Value $365,734.99

Net Total Tracts 83 Net Total Value $3,206,903.26 $328,228.36

Total Tracts Sold 24

Percent of Net Total Tracts Sold 28.92% Percent of Net Total Value Sold 10.24%
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