

October 2021 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
1	C22210128	9000003151	Fernando Garcia and Benjamin Richard Ree	\$5,000.00	\$6,200.00
2	C22210129	123589	Justin N Pederson	\$5,175.00	\$5,175.00
3	C22210171	125326	Tony Sorenson	\$80,300.00	\$141,400.00
4	C22210130	100703	NO BID	\$3,493.67	\$0.00
5	C22210172	117244	Lynn Alan Taipale	\$4,200.00	\$4,200.00
6	C22210131	125361	Adam Swor	\$6,000.00	\$9,700.00
7	C22210132	102024	Gregory Bruce Leone	\$4,725.00	\$4,725.00
8	C22210133	9000003152	NO BID	\$39,600.00	\$0.00
9	C22120023	9000000209	NO BID	\$7,800.00	\$0.00
10	C22190133	9000002432	Jacqueline Nacole Wells	\$6,770.27	\$13,670.27
11	C22210134	125118	Florence A Alsaker	\$3,450.00	\$15,600.00
12	C22210135	124086	Trevor James Winger	\$2,925.00	\$2,975.00
13	C22210136	124094	Randall Scott Babiracki	\$3,300.00	\$3,300.00
14	C22210137	125442	NO BID	\$38,528.68	\$0.00
15	C22190178	123186	NO BID	\$2,371.22	\$0.00
16	C22210138	124041	Great Lakes Homes LLC	\$6,375.00	\$6,375.00
17	C22210139	9000003153	David Allen Grecinger and Myranda Dinese	\$26,025.00	\$42,100.00
18	C22170265	105401	NO BID	\$700.00	\$0.00
19	C22210140	9000003154	Anthony J Serson	\$7,800.00	\$7,800.00
20	C22210141	9000003155	NO BID	\$8,695.21	\$0.00
21	C22210142	9000003156	NO BID	\$8,734.36	\$0.00
22	C22200196	122491	NO BID	\$22,200.00	\$0.00
23	C22210042	122623	NO BID	\$50,200.00	\$0.00
24	C22210049	122360	NO BID	\$93,500.00	\$0.00
25	C22210050	122357	NO BID	\$81,500.00	\$0.00
26	C22210051	122372	NO BID	\$50,000.00	\$0.00

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
27	C22210143	122440	Deborah J Ralston-Wolfe and Charles R W	\$48,750.00	\$48,750.00
28	C22210054	9000002971	NO BID	\$95,900.00	\$0.00
29	C22210173	9000003191	NO BID	\$52,725.00	\$0.00
30	C22210174	122839	Andrew John McClure	\$42,375.00	\$80,500.00
31	C22210175	122840	Andrew John McClure	\$95,700.00	\$260,900.00
32	C22150116	9000001090	NO BID	\$50,100.00	\$0.00
33	C22210144	120847	Troy Dean Emison and April Lynn Emison	\$42,300.00	\$75,200.12
34	C22210145	109291	Kurt Allen Horwath and Christine Horwath	\$15,825.00	\$27,100.00
35	C22210146	122854	NO BID	\$41,300.00	\$0.00
36	C22210147	109839	NO BID	\$69,000.00	\$0.00
37	C22210082	123265	Carlyn Attama	\$400.00	\$4,350.00
38	C22210150	123267	Dominic Joseph Del Caro and Brittany Lee	\$27,825.00	\$38,100.00
39	C22210151	111123	Michael J Jankowski	\$13,125.00	\$15,000.00
40	C22210152	111213	Dennis C Hill	\$29,400.00	\$29,400.00
41	C22210153	125500	Daniel David Christian Fife and Jennifer Lyn	\$2,700.00	\$6,000.00
42	C22210154	111616	NO BID	\$67,300.00	\$0.00
43	C22210155	125501	Eugene Kohler	\$35,850.00	\$42,701.00
44	C22210156	111692	JP Christopher LP	\$8,400.00	\$8,400.00
45	C22210157	111815	Jeffrey Allen LeDoux and Dawn Elizabeth L	\$13,000.00	\$13,400.00
46	C22210158	9000003171	JP Christopher LP	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00
47	C22200219	112343	Evan C Sheets and Rachelle R Sheets	\$157,500.00	\$157,500.00
48	C22210017	123296	NO BID	\$13,100.00	\$0.00
49	C22210018	112844	Carlyn Attama	\$525.00	\$7,100.00
50	C22210020	113002	Donnovan Ndongo Macias	\$300.00	\$355.00
51	C22200224	123791	Dana Doreen Dallum	\$21,675.00	\$21,675.00
52	C22210159	9000003172	Jeremy Adam Hester	\$22,425.00	\$30,250.00
53	C22210160	113707	NO BID	\$28,600.00	\$0.00
54	C22210161	113708	NO BID	\$41,000.00	\$0.00

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
55	C22210162	114099	NO BID	\$18,150.00	\$0.00
56	C22210163	9000003173	Todd Harlan Roswold and Debra Elizabeth	\$6,416.68	\$16,016.68
57	C22210021	124190	Carlyn Attama	\$800.00	\$1,025.00
58	C22200234	120901	Joanne M Pufahl	\$48,000.00	\$48,000.00
59	C22210164	115537	Aaron A Nelson	\$34,800.00	\$34,800.00
60	C22210165	115576	NO BID	\$27,200.00	\$0.00
61	C22210167	123815	Neil Eric Johnson and Lora Suzanne Johnso	\$33,150.00	\$47,400.00
62	C22210168	116160	Janel Marie Rutherford and James Michael P	\$128,900.00	\$205,100.00
63	C22210169	116301	NO BID	\$73,200.00	\$0.00
64	C22210170	116317	NO BID	\$51,900.00	\$0.00
Total Tracts			64	Total Value \$2,034,985.09	
Pulled Tracts			0	Pulled Tracts Value \$0.00	
Net Available Tracts			64	Net Total Value \$2,034,985.09	\$1,488,243.07
Total Tracts Sold			38		
Percent of Available Tracts Sold			59.38%	Percent of Appraised Value Sold	73.13%