

February 2021 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
1	C22200177	9000002771	NO BID	\$51,825.00	\$0.00
2	C22200267	9000002912	NO BID	\$51,825.00	\$0.00
3	C22200243	100568	NO BID	\$17,550.00	\$0.00
4	C22170171	9000001459	Samuel Vasquez	\$11,775.00	\$11,775.00
5	C22200054	124062	NO BID	\$8,850.00	\$0.00
6	C22200270	124066	Northland Homes	\$9,731.47	\$9,731.47
7	C22200164	103973	GK Sioux	\$1,150.00	\$1,150.00
8	C22200183	104236	NO BID	\$31,275.00	\$0.00
9	C22170355	105055	NO BID	\$2,775.00	\$0.00
10	C22200184	124080	Chuck Plantz	\$28,650.00	\$47,150.00
11	C22200165	123683	David N Nyaosi	\$1,812.66	\$1,812.66
12	C22200166	105210	NO BID	\$1,100.00	\$0.00
13	C22200069	117726	Benjamin R Ree	\$3,900.00	\$4,950.00
14	C22200070	117727	Benjamin R Ree	\$4,650.00	\$5,750.00
15	C22200071	117728	Benjamin R Ree	\$2,550.00	\$3,600.00
16	C22200093	117729	NO BID	\$6,450.00	\$0.00
17	C22200072	122801	NO BID	\$5,850.00	\$0.00
18	C22200261	105302	PULLED	\$2,250.00	\$0.00
19	C22180071	105566	NO BID	\$7,875.00	\$0.00
20	C22180121	106000	PULLED	\$21,450.00	\$0.00
21	C22200186	9000002791	Dave Jason Sletten and Kalie Jo Sletten	\$11,700.00	\$40,081.00
22	C22200187	106540	Jesse Stanaway	\$20,175.00	\$27,900.00
23	C22200188	106543	Gregory J Scott	\$24,300.00	\$48,988.00
24	C22200189	117722	Steven Austin	\$14,325.00	\$20,600.00
25	C22200190	9000002792	Molly Jade Ladwig	\$32,400.00	\$38,300.00
26	C22200191	106566	NO BID	\$2,400.00	\$0.00

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
27	C22200193	122487	NO BID	\$40,000.00	\$0.00
28	C22200194	122488	NO BID	\$41,300.00	\$0.00
29	C22200199	122495	NO BID	\$49,000.00	\$0.00
30	C22200200	122496	NO BID	\$43,000.00	\$0.00
31	C22200201	107834	NO BID	\$27,300.00	\$0.00
32	C22200268	123732	NO BID	\$12,750.00	\$0.00
33	C22200269	123733	NO BID	\$12,750.00	\$0.00
34	C22200205	122264	NO BID	\$133,400.00	\$0.00
35	C22200206	122269	NO BID	\$146,200.00	\$0.00
36	C22200207	122272	NO BID	\$90,800.00	\$0.00
37	C22200208	122273	David S Matychuk	\$36,200.00	\$36,200.00
38	C22200209	109322	Brandon George and Alishia George	\$18,200.00	\$18,200.00
39	C22200210	109323	PULLED	\$29,400.00	\$0.00
40	C22200211	109616	Eric A Gustafson	\$1,875.00	\$8,700.00
41	C22200212	117758	NO BID	\$23,700.00	\$0.00
42	C22200111	109785	NO BID	\$46,500.00	\$0.00
43	C22200213	121783	PULLED	\$97,500.00	\$0.00
44	C22200171	110621	Julio Medina	\$100.00	\$357.00
45	C22200172	110646	NO BID	\$19,000.00	\$0.00
46	C22200214	111217	Regina Brant	\$15,375.00	\$36,600.00
47	C22200215	111250	NO BID	\$47,500.00	\$0.00
48	C22200216	111264	David G Menter	\$18,100.00	\$18,100.00
49	C22200113	111483	Jay I Anderson	\$1,700.00	\$3,550.00
50	C22200217	124176	Harold A Maki	\$16,125.00	\$38,300.00
51	C22200220	122600	NO BID	\$136,600.00	\$0.00
52	C22200221	122583	NO BID	\$77,000.00	\$0.00
53	C22200222	122528	PULLED	\$36,000.00	\$0.00
54	C22200223	112999	Glenn A Hurd	\$3,975.00	\$6,975.00

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
55	C22200262	9000002891	Jahn Hibbs	\$5,880.00	\$8,680.00
56	C22200225	113977	Shane Belchar	\$6,600.00	\$10,100.00
57	C22200226	122900	Joseph Flake	\$27,300.00	\$151,100.00
58	C22200228	119129	NO BID	\$23,700.00	\$0.00
59	C22200233	120900	Mark K Hotchkiss and Carol D Hotchkiss	\$56,000.00	\$56,000.00
60	C22200234	120901	PULLED	\$48,000.00	\$0.00
61	C22200236	120914	Richard Joseph Heitke and Beverly M He	\$26,400.00	\$26,400.00
62	C22200237	121595	George P Norling	\$54,500.00	\$66,600.00
63	C22200239	121752	Gerritt Bangma	\$8,000.00	\$16,600.00
64	C22200240	9000002851	NO BID	\$55,000.00	\$0.00
65	C22200241	121759	NO BID	\$7,000.00	\$0.00
Total Tracts			65	Total Value \$1,918,324.13	
Pulled Tracts			6	Pulled Tracts Value \$0.00	
Net Available Tracts			59	Net Total Value \$1,918,324.13	\$764,250.13
Total Tracts Sold			29		
Percent of Available Tracts Sold			49.15%	Percent of Appraised Value Sold	39.84%