June 2020 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22200001 123591 Kiff Samuelson $7,900.00 $7,900.00
2 C22200003 123594 Kelly Maldonado $5,925.00 $5,925.00
3 C22200053 100682 NO BID $2,625.00 $0.00
4 C22200004 123602 Horizon LLC $4,700.00 $30,443.03
5 C22200044 123112 Jesse Bull $9,500.00 $56,317.00
6 C22200005 123644 Gregory G Kamp $9,500.00 $9,500.00
7 C22200008 9000002651 NO BID $8,400.00 $0.00
8 C22200056 121974 Horizon LLC $53,400.00 $79,276.84
9 C22200009 122776 David A Abrahamson $8,100.00 $8,100.00
10 C22200006 104436 Kathleen Johnson $2,325.00 $2,325.00
11 C22200007 123653 NO BID $3,675.00 $0.00
12 (22200045 123654 Dwayne R Bolander $1,875.00 $3,450.00
13 C22200010 123661 James R McLaughlin $5,600.00 $6,200.00
14 C22190214 123663 Kevin R Scaia $100.00 $490.00
15 C22190216 123665 Terry Samsa $750.00 $3,000.00
16 C22200046 124084 NO BID $38,750.00 $0.00
17 C22200048 124087 NO BID $12,600.00 $0.00
18 C22200049 120502 Amy L Ahnefeld $25,400.00 $25,400.00
19 C22190218 123183 NO BID $8,318.56 $0.00
20 C22190249 123684 Tristin N Hammons $45,440.00 $45,440.00
21 C22200069 117726 PULLED $3,900.00 $0.00
22 C22200070 117727 PULLED $4,650.00 $0.00
23 C22200071 117728 PULLED $2,550.00 $0.00
24 C22200093 117729 PULLED $6,450.00 $0.00
25 C22200072 122801 PULLED $5,850.00 $0.00
26 C22200051 124097 NO BID $8,750.00 $0.00
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27 C22200043 124098 Amy Kotajarvi $24,450.00 $24,450.00
28 C22200074 124103 David G Meineke $18,650.00 $18,650.00
29 C22200075 124104 NO BID $19,650.00 $0.00
30 C22190220 123208 NO BID $4,500.00 $0.00
31 C22190086 123703 Thomas Atkinson $16,256.00 $16,256.00
32 C22190222 105509 Joshua W Huffinan $450.00 $450.00
33 C22190078 123708 Kevin M Leino $12,800.00 $13,012.54
34 C22200076 9000002694  Tracy L Bailey $9,000.00 $31,100.00
35 C22190224 106045 NO BID $8,050.00 $0.00
36 C22200077 106080 Amanda L Klopp $4,425.00 $4,425.00
37 C22190153 123713 PULLED $18,720.00 $0.00
38 C22200057 124149 Daniel Glinski $38,300.00 $93,201.00
39 C22200058 123716 NO BID $26,700.00 $0.00
40 C22200059 120587 Raymond Stevens $14,475.00 $33,300.00
41 C22200060 106437 Justin E Stenger $1,050.00 $3,427.77
42 C22200078 118097 Daryl A Paskvan $9,750.00 $19,000.00
43 C22200079 118098 Daryl A Paskvan $16,725.00 $21,400.00
44 C22200080 122340 Kelsey Dunaiski $25,800.00 $65,600.00
45 C22190227 123724 Daron A Little $300.00 $300.00
46 C22200081 9000002695 Ember Black $37,200.00 $37,200.00
47 C22200011 9000002652 NO BID $21,975.00 $0.00
48 C22200012 122841 NO BID $22,650.00 $0.00
49 C22200082 123241 William Kaper Jr. $11,550.00 $32,908.00
50 C22200083 124165 PULLED $18,150.00 $0.00
51 C22200084 122093 Richard T Stevens $8,800.00 $8,800.00
52 C22200061 118115 Shane Turner $20,700.00 $37,100.00
53 C22200085 123255 NO BID $6,450.00 $0.00
54 C22190229 9000002551 Chad Stevens $150.00 $2,550.00
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55 C22200086 123268 Cherre Palenius $3,000.00 $25,300.00
56 C22200087 123269 George F Crawford $8,850.00 $28,100.00
57 C22190231 123270 Dimitar H Chaprashakov $100.00 $1,325.00
58 C22190234 9000002571 Julio C Canchola $150.00 $510.00
59 C22190235 123274 Laurie A McDermid $150.00 $1,000.00
60 C22200088 123286 Kathleen Caron $12,600.00 $12,600.00
61 C22200089 111500 Ryan Holman $1,350.00 $6,100.00
62 C22190238 117593 Kenneth Pritchard $240.00 $5,301.01
63 C22200090 9000002696 Mary J Wiermaa $9,200.00 $16,100.00
64 C22200062 120652 NO BID $9,975.00 $0.00
65 C22200063 123314 Christian J Proetz $7,500.00 $7,500.00
66 C22200091 123322 Laura Kanian $6,900.00 $6,900.00
67 C22200092 123323 Laura Kanian $1,875.00 $1,925.00
68 C22180357 120938 NO BID $57,400.00 $0.00
69 C22200064 9000002693 Amanda J Block $1,875.00 $8.,800.00
70 C22200065 122147 NO BID $15,150.00 $0.00
71 C22200066 122148 James D McKeever $7,200.00 $7,200.00
72 C22200067 115388 Daron A Little $20,775.00 $20,775.00
73 C22190066 123811 NO BID $59,450.00 $0.00
74 C22190295 122906 PULLED $19,440.00 $0.00

Total Tracts 74 Total Value $947,889.56

Pulled Tracts 8 Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Available Tracts 66 Net Total Value $947,889.56 $896,333.19

Total Tracts Sold 48

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 72.73% Percent of Appraised Value Sold 94.56%
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