



Timber Auction Results

August 5, 2021

Sealed Bid Auction

Tract	Contract		Bidder	Appraised Price	Bidup	Sold Price	Down Payment
1	C19210062		No Bid	\$3,547.90			
2	C19210063		No Bid	\$564.00			
3	C19210064		Springbrook Wood Products, LLC	\$10,500.00	7%	\$11,200.00	\$2,625.00
4	C19210065		Springbrook Wood Products, LLC	\$3,309.90	167%	\$8,826.40	\$827.48
5	C19210066		No Bid	\$2,002.05			
6	C19210067		No Bid	\$9,944.25			
7	C19210068		Springbrook Wood Products, LLC	\$712.80	100%	\$1,425.60	\$178.20

Total Offered: \$30,580.90

Average Bid up: 91%

Total: \$14,522.70 \$21,452.00 \$3,630.68