September 21, 2020 - ONLINE AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22180324 9000002233 NOBID $35,269.00 $0.00
2 C22160055 9000001009 NOBID $65,407.50 $0.00
3 C22190118 100326 Gregory J Newgren $9,100.00 $9,100.00
4 C22170301 9000001675 NOBID $16,254.33 $0.00
5 C22160237 118164 NO BID $6,578.56 $0.00
6 C22200053 100682 NO BID $2,362.50 $0.00
7 C22180217 9000002094 NOBID $9,552.60 $0.00
8 C22180351 9000002237 NOBID $41,243.00 $0.00
9 C22180256 101774 NO BID $3,040.00 $0.00
10 C22180337 102880 NO BID $6,115.20 $0.00
11 C22170332 9000001715 NOBID $6,248.81 $0.00
12 C22200007 123653 NO BID $3,307.50 $0.00
13 C22190137 123656 NO BID $11,542.50 $0.00
14 C22190044 9000002292 NOBID $8,856.54 $0.00
16 C22170315 9000001693  NOBID $7,266.00 $0.00
17 C22160205 105124 NO BID $2,247.75 $0.00
18 C22190249 123684 Cindy Leigh Johnson $40,374.03 $41,685.14
19 C22190179 123194 NO BID $1,350.00 $0.00
21 C22190038 105308 NO BID $10,201.11 $0.00
22 C22200051 124097 NO BID $8,155.70 $0.00
23 C22180108 105313 NO BID $1,929.03 $0.00
24 C22190275 123081 NO BID $5,625.00 $0.00
25 C22180365 9000002238 NOBID $5,086.40 $0.00
26 C22170320 105458 NO BID $2,177.47 $0.00
27 C22170327 118362 NO BID $12,232.91 $0.00
28 C22180072 105478 NO BID $4,961.45 $0.00
29 C22170024 9000001316  NOBID $7,770.00 $0.00
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Tract Contract LDKey

Bidder Name

Appraised Price

Sale Amount

30 (C22190220 123208
31 C22190148 118090
32 C22190222 105509
34 (C22180348 9000002236
36 C22160056 106230
37 C22180129 9000001996
38 C22110121 36194
39 C22190079 123821
40 C22190156 108049
41 C22200011 9000002652
42 C22200012 122841
47 (C22190285 118133
48 C22180081 110890
49 (C22190283 9000002614
51 C22190261 113563
52 (C22190268 123800

Total Tracts

Pulled Tracts

Net Available Tracts
Total Tracts Sold

Percent of Available Tracts Sold

Joshua L Aragon
NO BID

NO BID

Emeka Okenwa
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

43

43

9.30%

$4,125.00
$5,677.20
$382.50
$669.17
$878.00
$9,799.56
$998.40
$191,212.80
$76,500.00
$19,502.81
$19,932.00
$24,350.63
$85,570.45
$7,627.50
$13,961.25

$15,000.00

Total Value  $810,442.16
Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Total Value  $810,442.16

$4,125.00

$0.00

$0.00

$680.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$55,590.14

Percent of Appraised Value Sold  6.86%
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