

May 26, 2021 - CONTINUOUS ONLINE AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
1	C22200243	100568	NO BID	\$17,550.00	\$0.00
2	C22180351	9000002237	NO BID	\$37,999.00	\$0.00
3	C22180337	102880	Bong Joon Ahn	\$5,800.00	\$6,600.00
4	C22200183	104236	NO BID	\$31,275.00	\$0.00
5	C22190137	123656	NO BID	\$11,542.00	\$0.00
6	C22190044	9000002292	NO BID	\$6,375.00	\$0.00
7	C22200072	122801	PULLED	\$5,850.00	\$0.00
8	C22170327	118362	NO BID	\$8,800.00	\$0.00
9	C22180072	105478	NO BID	\$3,175.00	\$0.00
10	C22180071	105566	NO BID	\$7,875.00	\$0.00
11	C22200130	105812	NO BID	\$42,200.00	\$0.00
12	C22110121	36194	Bong Joon Ahn	\$998.00	\$1,033.00
13	C22190156	108049	NO BID	\$61,965.00	\$0.00
14	C22200011	9000002652	NO BID	\$16,675.00	\$0.00
15	C22200141	108339	NO BID	\$47,350.00	\$0.00
16	C22200268	123732	Kyle Saver	\$12,750.00	\$12,750.00
17	C22200207	122272	NO BID	\$90,800.00	\$0.00
18	C22200152	122853	NO BID	\$66,870.00	\$0.00
19	C22200111	109785	NO BID	\$46,500.00	\$0.00
20	C22200154	118132	NO BID	\$10,320.00	\$0.00
21	C22180081	110890	NO BID	\$68,456.00	\$0.00
22	C22200129	9000002753	NO BID	\$2,485.00	\$0.00

Total Tracts	22	Total Value	\$603,610.00
Pulled Tracts	1	Pulled Tracts Value	\$0.00
Net Available Tracts	21	Net Total Value	\$603,610.00
Total Tracts Sold	3		\$20,383.00
Percent of Available Tracts Sold	14.29%	Percent of Appraised Value Sold	3.38%