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Tract Contract Name Round
Offered

Round 
Sold

Bidder 
ID

Bidder Appraised 
Price

Bidup Sold Price

1 C19180053 Hawk Moth 1 1 214 Schreffler 
Logging

$55,105.79 105% $112,966.87

2 C19180054 Tom Horn 1 1 189 Mike Zauhar $51,453.71 0% $51,453.71

3 C19180055 Paining Snowshoe 1 1 110 Brandon Suonvieri 
Timber

$22,914.34 0% $22,914.34

4 C19180056 Toimi Hardwoods 1 1 131 Douglas Hustad $22,091.60 115% $47,496.94

5 C19180057 Black Ops 1 1 109  Nelson Logging $26,476.02 0% $26,476.02

6 C19180058 Script Error 1 No Bid $20,540.96

7 C19180059 Weed Whip 1 3 188 Mike Nielsen 
Logging

$9,406.01 0% $9,406.01

8 C19180060 The Slashing 1 No Bid $8,379.14

9 C19180061 Barrs 44 1 1 205 Richard Godden $5,935.47 0% $5,935.47

10 C19180062 South Twin Lake 
Sale

2 3 159 Jatco Inc. $23,170.43 0% $23,170.43

11 C19180063 Eight Eagles 2 2 139 Fjerans Forest 
Products

$55,853.47 75% $97,743.57

12 C19180064 Horseshoe Islands 2 2 215 Shermer Logging $13,395.36 0% $13,395.36

13 C19180065 Leon Pester 2 3 139 Fjerans Forest 
Products

$31,472.62 0% $31,472.62

14 C19180066 Tommy Danny 2 2 188 Mike Nielsen 
Logging

$24,166.51 111% $50,991.34

15 C19180067 Humboldt Cedar 2 No Bid $5,400.09

16 C19180068 Tracks West Sale 2 2 109  Nelson Logging $21,323.04 10% $23,455.34

17 C19180069 Pins And Needles 2 3 223 UPM Blandin 
Forestry

$18,465.77 86% $34,346.33

18 C19180070 Stress Odor 2 2 131 Douglas Hustad $14,395.76 51% $21,737.60

19 C19180071 Rickshaw Rider 3 3 139 Fjerans Forest 
Products

$48,579.55 0% $48,579.55

20 C19180072 Savage Roar 3 3 108 Boise White Paper 
Llc

$71,870.55 0% $71,870.55

21 C19180073 Grazed Sale 3 3 159 Jatco Inc. $42,357.47 31% $55,488.29

22 C19180074 Fooled Again 3 3 223 UPM Blandin 
Forestry

$24,740.05 86% $46,016.49

23 C19180075 Big Nugget 3 No Bid $2,738.00

24 C19180076 Winbow 3 3 148 Hedstrom Lumber 
Co Inc

$6,140.00 0% $6,140.00

25 C19180077 Puzzle Sale 3 3 148 Hedstrom Lumber 
Co Inc

$29,006.67 0% $29,006.67

26 C19180078 West Wolf 3 No Bid $1,732.00

27 C19180079 Last Stand Ii 3 No Bid $3,200.00

28 C19180080 Cabin Fever 3 No Bid $2,325.00

Total Offered: $662,635.38

Average Bid up: 32%

Total Sold: $618,320.19 $830,063.50
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PIKE LAKE AREA

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Apprased

Total Sold

ASH 4,495 3,144 $3.23 $3.34 $14,504.40 $10,490.40

ASPEN 12,825 12,775 $19.69 $26.83 $252,569.49 $342,745.90

BALM OF GILEAD 712 706 $18.78 $22.24 $13,373.26 $15,704.21

BALSAM FIR 3,111 3,078 $11.65 $14.58 $36,240.97 $44,884.32

BASSWOOD 1,569 1,569 $4.43 $4.43 $6,955.98 $6,955.98

BIRCH 2,922 2,922 $5.58 $7.18 $16,312.03 $20,978.03

MAPLE-RED 1,176 1,176 $3.20 $3.36 $3,758.94 $3,951.21

MAPLE-SUGAR 1,857 1,857 $3.51 $3.51 $6,519.03 $6,519.03

PINE-JACK 2 2 $16.48 $16.48 $32.96 $32.96

PINE-NORWAY 880 880 $29.92 $29.92 $26,329.60 $26,329.60

SPRUCE-BLACK 1,692 1,692 $17.65 $19.10 $29,857.29 $32,315.60

SPRUCE-WHITE 654 654 $17.53 $25.45 $11,461.35 $16,641.42

TAMARACK 334 334 $3.33 $3.34 $1,112.22 $1,114.22

Totals 32,229 30,789 $419,027.52 $528,662.88

VIRGINIA AREA

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Apprased

Total Sold

ASPEN 8,228 5,912 $15.70 $24.45 $129,181.38 $144,576.79

BALM OF GILEAD 35 5 $10.65 $40.16 $372.78 $200.81

BALSAM FIR 1,252 751 $9.07 $16.76 $11,358.15 $12,584.48

BIRCH 1,980 1,655 $5.30 $9.58 $10,497.53 $15,861.32

MAPLE-RED 1,730 1,568 $3.33 $6.12 $5,756.75 $9,600.76

PINE-JACK 281 126 $7.43 $11.77 $2,087.53 $1,482.79

SPRUCE-BLACK 3,984 3,135 $15.70 $29.90 $62,561.80 $93,743.73

SPRUCE-WHITE 717 470 $12.93 $23.01 $9,267.30 $10,813.48

TAMARACK 2,921 2,895 $3.67 $4.33 $10,707.49 $12,536.47

Totals 21,128 16,517 $241,790.71 $301,400.62
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Total County

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Apprased

Total Sold

ASH 4,642 3,144 $3.19 $3.34 $14,798.40 $10,490.40

ASPEN 21,053 18,687 $18.13 $26.08 $381,750.87 $487,322.69

BALM OF GILEAD 747 711 $18.40 $22.37 $13,746.04 $15,905.02

BALSAM FIR 4,363 3,829 $10.91 $15.01 $47,599.12 $57,468.79

BASSWOOD 1,625 1,569 $4.35 $4.43 $7,067.98 $6,955.98

BIRCH 4,902 4,577 $5.47 $8.05 $26,809.56 $36,839.35

MAPLE-RED 2,906 2,744 $3.27 $4.94 $9,515.69 $13,551.97

MAPLE-SUGAR 1,857 1,857 $3.51 $3.51 $6,519.03 $6,519.03

PINE-JACK 283 128 $7.49 $11.84 $2,120.49 $1,515.75

PINE-NORWAY 1,060 880 $25.69 $29.92 $27,229.60 $26,329.60

SPRUCE-BLACK 5,676 4,827 $16.28 $26.12 $92,419.09 $126,059.33

SPRUCE-WHITE 1,371 1,124 $15.12 $24.43 $20,728.65 $27,454.90

TAMARACK 3,255 3,229 $3.63 $4.23 $11,819.71 $13,650.69

Totals 53,740 47,306 $662,124.23 $830,063.50




