
Timber Auction Results
February 21, 2019

Sealed Bid Auction

Tract Contract Round
Offered

Round 
Sold

Bidder Appraised 
Price

Bidup Sold Price

1 C19190001 Lobb Forest 
Enterprises LLC

$63,206.81 44% $91,141.10

2 C19190002 Fjeran Forest 
Products Llc

$26,568.92 39% $36,940.00

3 C19190003 Shermer Logging $40,875.08 24% $50,689.00

4 C19190004 Mike Nielsen 
Logging

$26,741.40 108% $55,505.45

5 C19190005 Shermer Logging $13,463.80 47% $19,832.00

6 C19190006 No Bid $16,429.38

7 C19190007 Boise White 
Paper LLC

$29,319.00 69% $49,447.53

8 C19190008 UPM Blandin 
Forestry

$13,213.12 83% $24,195.00

9 C19190009 No Bid $49,547.66

10 C19190010 No Bid $3,368.18

11 C19190011 Sappi Fine Paper $62,947.02 120% $138,296.25

12 C19190012 No Bid $4,316.00

13 C19190013 Fjeran Forest 
Products Llc

$27,766.36 56% $43,245.00

14 C19190014 Hull Forest 
Products

$7,093.47 68% $11,920.00

15 C19190015 Greg Cook 
Logging

$24,961.94 107% $51,689.00

16 C19190016 UPM Blandin 
Forestry

$124,005.50 70% $211,240.00

17 C19190017 Fjeran Forest 
Products Llc

$10,450.18 23% $12,825.10

18 C19190018 Futurewood 
Corporation

$6,358.35 87% $11,898.08

19 C19190019 Richard Godden $99,445.37 41% $140,147.50

20 C19190020 Sappi Fine Paper $80,258.53 0% $113,721.35

21 C19190021 No Bid $6,595.00

22 C19190022 No Bid $33,172.10

Total Offered: $770,103.17

Average Bid up: 62%

Total Sold: $656,674.85 $1,062,732.36
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PIKE LAKE AREA

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Appraised

Total Sold

ASPEN 11,740 11,305 $20.57 $37.30 $241,497.06 $421,681.50

BALM OF GILEAD 174 139 $19.03 $34.40 $3,311.52 $4,781.00

BALSAM FIR 2,942 2,523 $11.53 $14.36 $33,922.15 $36,231.78

BASSWOOD 68 68 $4.81 $6.83 $327.19 $464.50

BIRCH 1,284 1,248 $5.71 $9.56 $7,329.03 $11,936.97

IRONWOOD 4 4 $3.75 $4.00 $15.00 $16.00

MAPLE-RED 468 462 $3.38 $12.90 $1,580.56 $5,958.73

MAPLE-SUGAR 144 139 $3.73 $14.35 $536.60 $1,994.00

PINE-JACK 2,326 975 $16.89 $21.81 $39,291.09 $21,267.00

PINE-NORWAY 1,255 444 $17.31 $34.93 $21,718.97 $15,510.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 5,570 5,287 $20.69 $33.24 $115,250.66 $175,760.10

SPRUCE-WHITE 1,384 1,118 $15.28 $28.06 $21,153.93 $31,370.70

TAMARACK 1,195 1,195 $4.00 $6.70 $4,780.00 $8,010.00

Totals 28,554 24,907 $490,713.76 $734,982.28

Feb, 21, 2019 Timber Auction Results



VIRGINIA AREA

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Appraised

Total Sold

ASH 56 9 $3.05 $5.00 $170.70 $45.00

ASPEN 9,842 7,927 $18.83 $31.07 $185,308.71 $246,274.83

BALM OF GILEAD 71 71 $18.58 $27.70 $1,319.12 $1,966.80

BALSAM FIR 1,212 888 $11.27 $12.63 $13,662.47 $11,213.74

BIRCH 1,532 602 $5.30 $7.97 $8,118.78 $4,795.31

MAPLE-RED 1,474 288 $3.15 $4.89 $4,636.75 $1,408.00

PINE-JACK 793 596 $16.88 $17.25 $13,385.44 $10,279.00

PINE-NORWAY 607 562 $23.53 $22.84 $14,283.87 $12,835.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 1,721 1,152 $18.64 $26.04 $32,080.01 $29,993.35

SPRUCE-WHITE 408 308 $13.15 $21.09 $5,366.65 $6,495.05

TAMARACK 295 295 $3.50 $8.28 $1,032.67 $2,444.00

Totals 18,011 12,698 $279,365.17 $327,750.08



Total County

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Appraised

Total Sold

ASH 63 9 $3.01 $5.00 $189.60 $45.00

ASPEN 21,582 19,232 $19.78 $34.73 $426,805.77 $667,956.33

BALM OF GILEAD 245 210 $18.90 $32.13 $4,630.64 $6,747.80

BALSAM FIR 4,154 3,411 $11.46 $13.91 $47,584.62 $47,445.52

BASSWOOD 68 68 $4.81 $6.83 $327.19 $464.50

BIRCH 2,816 1,850 $5.49 $9.04 $15,447.81 $16,732.28

IRONWOOD 4 4 $3.75 $4.00 $15.00 $16.00

MAPLE-RED 1,942 750 $3.20 $9.82 $6,217.31 $7,366.73

MAPLE-SUGAR 144 139 $3.73 $14.35 $536.60 $1,994.00

PINE-JACK 3,119 1,571 $16.89 $20.08 $52,676.53 $31,546.00

PINE-NORWAY 1,862 1,006 $19.34 $28.18 $36,002.84 $28,345.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 7,291 6,439 $20.21 $31.95 $147,330.67 $205,753.45

SPRUCE-WHITE 1,792 1,426 $14.80 $26.55 $26,520.58 $37,865.75

TAMARACK 1,490 1,490 $3.90 $7.02 $5,812.67 $10,454.00

Totals 46,572 37,605 $770,097.83 $1,062,732.36



Bidder 1 Bidder 2 Bidder 3
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Jatco Inc Hustad Logging Inc Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC
1

Aspen Pulpwood 2691 Cds                  19.44                                       23.75                                    20.00                                          28.80 
Balm Of Gilead Pulpwood 21 Cds                  18.68                                       23.75                                    20.00                                          28.80 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 387 Cds                  11.35                                       11.35                                    12.00                                          13.00 
Birch Pulpwood 53 Cds                    5.54                                         5.54                                      6.00                                          12.50 
Pine-Jack Pulpwood 58 Cds                  18.13                                       18.13                                    19.00                                          19.00 
Spruce-Black Pulpwood 248 Cds                  19.15                                       23.00                                    20.00                                          25.00 
Tamarack Pulpwood 4 Cds                    3.67                                         3.67                                      4.00                                          10.00 

63,206.81$       75,866.29$                              65,280.00$                            91,141.10$                                

Bidder 1 Bidder 2 Bidder 3 Bidder 4
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Nielsen Logging Inc Jatco Inc Fjeran Forest Products LLC Hustad Logging Inc
2

Ash Pulp & Bolts 9 Cds                    3.30                                         4.00                                      3.30                                            5.00                                           4.00 
Aspen Pulp & Bolts 847 Cds                  19.44                                       20.00                                    20.00                                          28.00                                         20.00 
Balm Of Gilead Pulp & Bolts 40 Cds                  18.68                                       18.68                                    20.00                                          28.00                                         20.00 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 338 Cds                  11.35                                       11.35                                    11.35                                          12.00                                         12.00 
Birch Pulp & Bolts 225 Cds                    4.78                                       10.00                                      4.78                                            5.00                                           5.00 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 128 Cds                    3.26                                         5.00                                      3.50                                            5.00                                           4.00 
Pine-Norway Pulp & Bolts 161 Cds                    5.00                                         5.00                                      5.00                                            5.00                                           5.00 
Spruce-Black Pulpwood 77 Cds                  19.15                                       19.15                                    20.00                                          22.00                                         20.00 
Spruce-White Pulp & Bolts 167 Cds                  10.00                                       10.00                                    10.00                                          22.00                                         10.00 
Tamarack Pulp & Bolts 13 Cds                    3.67                                         3.67                                      3.67                                            5.00                                           4.00 

27,038.92$       28,446.76$                              27,192.21$                            36,940.00$                                 27,536.00$                               

Bidder 1 Bidder 2
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Nielsen Logging Inc Shermer Logging
3

Aspen Pulpwood 732 Cds                  17.67                                       24.00                                    28.00 
Birch Pulpwood 32 Cds                    5.04                                         8.00                                      9.00 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 7 Cds                    2.97                                         3.00                                      9.00 
Pine-Jack Pulpwood 513 Cds                  16.48                                       16.48                                    17.00 
Pine-Norway Pulpwood 401 Cds                  29.92                                       29.92                                    30.00 
Spruce-Black Pulpwood 327 Cds                  17.41                                       23.77                                    20.00 
Spruce-White Pulpwood 81 Cds                  14.45                                       14.45                                    20.00 
Tamarack Pulpwood 133 Cds                    3.33                                         3.33                                      7.00 

40,875.08$       47,683.29$                              50,689.00$                           

Bidder 1 Bidder 2
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Nielsen Logging Inc Futurewood corp
4

Aspen Pulpwood 1439 Cds                  17.67                                       37.00                                    18.00 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 32 Cds                  10.32                                       10.32                                    10.33 
Birch Pulpwood 119 Cds                    5.04                                       12.99                                      5.04 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 71 Cds                    2.97                                         3.00                                      2.98 
Spruce-Black Pulpwood 3 Cds                  14.45                                       14.45                                    14.45 
Spruce-White Pulpwood 9 Cds                  14.45                                       14.45                                    14.45 

26,741.40$       55,505.45$                              27,217.30$                           

Bidder 1 Bidder 2
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Nielsen Logging Inc Shermer Logging
5

Aspen Pulpwood 549 Cds                  17.67                                       22.49                                    28.00 
Balm Of Gilead Pulpwood 6 Cds                  16.98                                       16.98                                    27.00 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 16 Cds                  10.32                                       10.32                                    14.00 
Pine-Jack Pulpwood 22 Cds                  16.48                                       16.48                                    18.00 
Spruce-Black Pulpwood 169 Cds                  17.41                                       21.77                                    20.00 
Spruce-White Pulpwood 10 Cds                  14.45                                       14.45                                    20.00 
Tamarack Pulpwood 14 Cds                    3.33                                         3.33                                      7.00 

13,463.80$       16,846.82$                              19,832.00$                           

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190001

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190002

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190003

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190004

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190005



Tract 
Number

Tract 
Number

Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

6
Ash Pulpwood 47 Cds                    3.00 
Aspen Pulpwood 681 Cds                  17.67 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 43 Cds                  10.32 
Birch Pulpwood 244 Cds                    5.04 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 503 Cds                    2.97 
Pine-Jack Pulpwood 66 Cds                  16.48 

16,429.38$       no bid

Bidder 1 Bidder 2
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Boise White Paper LLC Rutar Logging llc
7

Aspen Pulpwood 1381 Cds                  19.44                                       33.63                                    29.50 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 85 Cds                  11.35                                       12.50                                    18.00 
Birch Pulpwood 105 Cds                    5.54                                         6.00                                    10.00 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 82 Cds                    3.26                                         6.00                                      6.00 
Pine-Jack Pulpwood 3 Cds                  18.13                                       20.00                                    20.00 
Spruce-White Pulpwood 38 Cds                  15.90                                       20.00                                    25.00 

29,319.00$       49,447.53$                              44,821.50$                           

Bidder 1 Bidder 2
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

UPM Blandin Paper Boise White Paper LLC
8

Aspen Pulpwood 288 Cds                  19.44                                       33.00                                    30.01 
Balm Of Gilead Pulpwood 4 Cds                  19.44                                       20.00                                    30.01 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 30 Cds                  11.35                                       17.00                                    12.00 
Birch Pulpwood 68 Cds                    5.54                                         8.00                                      6.00 
Spruce-Black Pulp & Bolts 328 Cds                  19.15                                       37.00                                    30.01 
Spruce-White Pulp & Bolts 3 Cds                  19.15                                       37.00                                    30.01 
Tamarack Pulpwood 131 Cds                    3.67                                       10.00                                      4.50 

13,213.12$       24,195.00$                              20,053.73$                           

Tract 
Number

Tract 
Number

Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

9
Aspen Pulpwood 1234 Cds                  19.44 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 281 Cds                  11.35 
Birch Pulpwood 686 Cds                    5.54 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 683 Cds                    3.26 
Pine-Jack Pulpwood 131 Cds                  18.13 
Pine-Norway Pulpwood 45 Cds                  32.91 
Spruce-Black Pulpwood 569 Cds                  19.15 
Spruce-White Pulpwood 100 Cds                  15.90 

49,547.66$       no bid

Tract 
Number

Tract 
Number

Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

10
Ash Pulpwood 7 Cds                    2.70 
Aspen Pulpwood 16 Cds                  15.90 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 152 Cds                    9.29 
Birch Pulpwood 15 Cds                    4.54 SOAV
Maple-Red Pulpwood 5 Cds                    2.67 SOAV
Maple-Sugar Pulpwood 5 Cds                    3.07 SOAV
Spruce-White Pulp & Bolts 122 Cds                  13.00 

3,368.18$         no bid

C19190006

Sealed Bid Entry Form

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190007

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190008

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190009

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190010



Bidder 1 Bidder 2 Bidder 3 Bidder 4 Bidder 5 Bidder 6 Bidder 7 Bidder 8 Bidder 9
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Richard Godden Sappi Jatco Inc Nelson Logging Fjeran Forest Products LLC Hustad Logging Inc Greg Cook Logging Inc Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC Futurewood corp
11

Aspen Pulp & Bolts 2669 Cds                  21.21                                       37.06                                    48.30                                          44.70                                         28.00                                          42.00                                          22.00                                43.00                                          32.00                       38.00 
Balm Of Gilead Pulpwood 40 Cds                  20.38                                       37.06                                    48.30                                          44.70                                         28.00                                          42.00                                          22.00                                43.00                                          32.00                       38.00 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 343 Cds                  12.38                                       12.38                                    16.45                                          12.38                                         15.00                                          17.00                                          13.00                                17.00                                          14.00                       15.00 
Spruce-Black Pulp & Bolts 7 Cds                  20.89                                       20.89                                    25.20                                          23.00                                         25.00                                          28.00                                          21.00                                30.00                                          25.00                       24.99 
Spruce-White Pulp & Bolts 64 Cds                  17.34                                       25.00                                    25.20                                          23.00                                         25.00                                          28.00                                          18.00                                30.00                                          25.00                       24.99 
Tamarack Pulpwood 5 Cds                    4.00                                         4.00                                      4.00                                            4.00                                           5.00                                            5.00                                            4.00                                 4.00                                            4.50                         4.49 

62,947.02$       106,408.11$                            138,296.25$                          126,991.64$                               82,797.00$                                121,622.00$                               65,376.00$                                   124,468.00$                     93,287.50$                                   109,883.74$          

Tract 
Number

Tract 
Number

Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

12
Pine-Jack Pulp & Bolts 188 Cds                    5.00 
Pine-Norway Pulp & Bolts 422 Cds                    8.00 

4,316.00$         no bid

Bidder 1 Bidder 2 Bidder 3 Bidder 4
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units  Unit Price SOE

Jatco Inc Hull Forest Products, LLC Fjeran Forest Products LLC Waste Wood Recyclers LLC
13

Aspen Pulpwood 971 Cds                  19.44                                       25.50                                    25.00                                          32.00                                         23.10 
Balm Of Gilead Pulpwood 18 Cds                  18.68                                       25.50                                    21.00                                          32.00                                         23.10 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 478 Cds                  11.35                                       11.35                                    11.35                                          15.00                                         11.50 
Birch Pulpwood 136 Cds                    5.54 SOAV                                         5.54                                      6.00                                            8.00                                           6.00 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 111 Cds                    3.26 SOAV                                         3.26                                      5.00                                            8.00                                           3.50 
Maple-Sugar Pulpwood 13 Cds                    3.75 SOAV                                         3.75                                      5.00                                            8.00                                           4.00 
Pine-Jack Pulp & Bolts 61 Cds                  18.13                                       18.13                                    20.00                                          19.00                                         18.13 
Spruce-White Pulp & Bolts 54 Cds                  15.90                                       19.00                                    20.00                                          22.00                                         16.00 

27,766.36$       33,940.78$                              33,814.30$                            43,245.00$                                 31,569.33$                               

Bidder 1 Bidder 2
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units  Unit Price SOE

Hull Forest Products, LLC UPM Blandin Paper
14

Pine-Norway Pulp & Bolts 79 Cds                  26.93                                       30.00                                    35.00 
Spruce-White Pulp & Bolts 382 Cds                  13.00                                       25.00                                    18.11 

7,093.47$         11,920.00$                              9,683.02$                               

Bidder 1 Bidder 2 Bidder 3 Bidder 4 Bidder 5
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units  Unit Price SOE

Richard Godden Sappi UPM Blandin Paper Nelson Logging Greg Cook Logging Inc
15

Aspen Pulpwood 1123 Cds                  19.44                                       37.00                                    34.50                                          30.00                                         26.00                                          39.00 
Balm Of Gilead Pulpwood 4 Cds                  18.68                                       37.00                                    34.50                                          20.00                                         26.00                                          39.00 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 76 Cds                  11.35                                       11.35                                    16.45                                          16.00                                         12.00                                          15.00 
Basswood Pulpwood 63 Cds                    4.78 SOAV                                         8.00                                    15.00                                            7.00                                           6.00                                            5.00 
Birch Pulpwood 167 Cds                    5.54 SOAV                                       10.00                                    15.00                                          10.00                                           6.00                                          15.00 
Ironwood Pulpwood 4 Cds                    3.75 SOAV                                         3.75                                    15.00                                            4.00                                           4.00                                            4.00 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 113 Cds                    3.26 SOAV                                       10.00                                    15.00                                          15.00                                           4.00                                          15.00 
Maple-Sugar Pulpwood 126 Cds                    3.75 SOAV                                       10.00                                    15.00                                          15.00                                           4.00                                          15.00 
Spruce-White Pulpwood 7 Cds                  15.90                                       25.00                                    25.20                                          33.00                                         16.00                                          25.00 

24,961.94$       47,315.60                                47,403.10$                            40,929.00$                                 32,678.00$                                51,689.00$                                

C19190012

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190011

Sealed Bid Entry Form

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190013

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190014

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190015



Bidder 1 Bidder 2 Bidder 3 Bidder 4 Bidder 5 Bidder 6 Bidder 7
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Richard Godden Jatco Inc UPM Blandin Paper Fjeran Forest Products LLC Hustad Logging Inc Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC Futurewood corp
16

Aspen Pulpwood 1278 Cds                  21.21                                       37.00                                    34.00                                          39.00                                         38.00                                          22.00                                          32.00                                35.01 
Balm Of Gilead Pulpwood 30 Cds                  20.38                                       37.00                                    34.00                                          21.00                                         38.00                                          22.00                                          32.00                                35.01 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 567 Cds                  12.38                                       12.38                                    12.38                                          16.00                                         16.00                                          13.00                                          14.00                                14.00 
Birch Pulpwood 717 Cds                    6.05 SOAV                                       12.00                                      6.05                                          10.00                                         12.00                                            7.00                                          10.00                                30.00 
Pine-Norway Pulpwood 365 Cds                  35.90                                       42.00                                    35.90                                          36.00                                         36.00                                          36.00                                          40.00                                36.00 
Spruce-Black Pulpwood 3089 Cds                  20.89                                       27.00                                    28.50                                          38.00                                         24.00                                          21.00                                          28.50                                31.50 
Spruce-White Pulpwood 255 Cds                  17.34                                       27.00                                    28.50                                          38.00                                         24.00                                          18.00                                          25.00                                31.50 
Tamarack Pulpwood 719 Cds                    4.00 SOAV                                       10.00                                      4.00                                            6.00                                           4.00                                            4.00                                          10.00                                 4.51 

124,005.50$      176,827.46$                            167,112.81$                          211,240.00$                               163,652.00$                              126,641.00$                               173,165.50$                                 196,959.77$                    

Bidder 1
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Fjeran Forest Products LLC
17

Aspen Pulpwood 271 Cds                  17.67                                       25.00 
Balm Of Gilead Pulpwood 21 Cds                  16.98                                       25.00 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 281 Cds                  10.32                                       10.50 
Birch Pulpwood 223 Cds                    5.04 SOAV                                         5.04 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 17 Cds                    2.97 SOAV                                         5.04 
Spruce-Black Pulpwood 35 Cds                  17.41                                       17.50 
Spruce-White Pulpwood 43 Cds                  14.45                                       17.50 

10,450.18$       12,825.10$                             

Bidder 1 Bidder 2 Bidder 3 Bidder 4 Bidder 5 Bidder 6
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Richard Godden Jatco Inc Nelson Logging Fjeran Forest Products LLC Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC Futurewood corp
18

Aspen Pulpwood 298 Cds                  17.67                                       25.00                                    18.00                                          28.00                                         28.00                                          28.50                                          36.00 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 102 Cds                  10.32                                       10.32                                    10.32                                          12.00                                         15.00                                          15.00                                          10.49 
Birch Pulpwood 5 Cds                    5.04 SOAV                                         5.04                                      5.04                                            6.00                                           5.50                                          10.00                                          10.01 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 5 Cds                    2.97 SOAV                                         2.97                                      2.97                                            6.00                                           5.50                                          10.00                                          10.01 

FALSE 8,542.69$                                 6,456.69$                                9,628.00$                                   9,929.00$                                  10,123.00$                                 11,898.08$                                  

Bidder 1 Bidder 2 Bidder 3
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Richard Godden Jatco Inc Fjeran Forest Products LLC
19

Aspen Pulpwood 1433 Cds                  21.21                                       37.00                                    23.00                                          32.00 
Balm Of Gilead Pulpwood 26 Cds                  20.38                                       37.00                                    23.00                                          32.00 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 475 Cds                  12.38                                       12.38                                    12.38                                          15.00 
Pine-Jack Pulpwood 914 Cds                  19.78                                       22.00                                    19.78                                          20.00 
Spruce-Black Pulpwood 1810 Cds                  20.89                                       27.00                                    21.00                                          22.00 
Spruce-White Pulp & Bolts 286 Cds                  17.34                                       27.00                                    21.00                                          22.00 
Tamarack Pulpwood 448 Cds                    4.00                                         8.00                                      4.00                                            4.00 

99,445.37$       140,147.50$                            103,324.42$                          119,997.00$                              

Bidder 1 Bidder 2 Bidder 3 Bidder 4
Tract 

Number
Tract 

Number
Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

Richard Godden Sappi Jatco Inc Greg Cook Logging Inc
20

Aspen Pulpwood 3262 Cds                  21.21                                       37.00                                    29.90                                          25.25                                         30.00 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 201 Cds                  12.38                                       12.38                                    16.45                                          12.38                                         13.00 
Basswood Pulpwood 5 Cds                    5.21                                         5.21                                    29.90                                            5.21                                           6.00 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 216 Cds                    3.56 SOAV                                       10.00                                    15.00                                            3.56                                         10.00 
Spruce-Black Pulpwood 346 Cds                  20.89                                       27.00                                    25.20                                          21.00                                         21.00 
Spruce-White Pulpwood 27 Cds                  17.34                                       27.00                                    25.20                                          21.00                                         21.00 
Tamarack Pulpwood 23 Cds                    4.00                                       10.00                                      4.00                                            4.00                                           4.00 

80,166.53$       135,669.43$                            113,721.35$                          93,573.89$                                 110,588.00$                             
Forfeited

C19190018

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190016

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190017

Sealed Bid Entry Form

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190019

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190020



Tract 
Number

Tract 
Number

Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

21
Aspen Pulp & Bolts 124 Cds                  15.90 
Balm Of Gilead Pulpwood 4 Cds                  15.28 
Balsam Fir Pulpwood 117 Cds                    9.29 
Birch Pulpwood 21 Cds                    4.54 
Maple-Red Pulpwood 1 Cds                    2.67 
Oak-Red Pulpwood 2 Cds                    2.67 
Pine-Norway Pulp & Bolts 389 Cds                    8.00 
Spruce-White Pulpwood 20 Cds                  13.00 

6,595.00$         no bid

Tract 
Number

Tract 
Number

Item Volume Units Unit Price SOE

22
Aspen Pulp & Bolts 295 Cds                  17.67 
Balm Of Gilead Pulp & Bolts 31 Cds                  16.98 
Balsam Fir Pulp & Bolts 150 Cds                  10.32 
Pine-Jack Pulp & Bolts 1163 Cds                  16.48 
Spruce-Black Pulp & Bolts 283 Cds                  17.41 
Spruce-White Pulp & Bolts 124 Cds                  14.45 

33,172.10$       no bid

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190022

Sealed Bid Entry Form

C19190021




