November 2025 - REGULAR - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Basic Sale Price  Sale Amount
1 C22250063 100008 NO BID $18,000.00 -
2 C22250064 100011 NO BID $24,000.00 -
3 (22250065 100012 NO BID $35,300.00 -
4 C22250066 100064 NO BID $32,600.00 -
5 (C22220527 117675 NO BID $18,300.00 -
6 (22250067 100188 NO BID $45,300.00 -
7 C22250068 100234;100235 NO BID $13,700.00 -
8 (22250123 125542 NO BID $10,100.00 -
9 (22250069 100322 Dennis S Dagger $16,000.00 $16,000.00
10 C22250070 100323 Allison Fischer $10,800.00 $25,100.00
11 C22240041 100445 NO BID $2,475.00 -
12 C22250071 100537 NO BID $48,300.00 -
13 C22250072 100625 NO BID $13,000.00 -
14 C22250073 100627 NO BID $16,000.00 -
15 C22240053 100667;121869 Dennis S Dagger $31,932.90 $31,932.90
16 C22240054 100668 Dennis S Dagger $3,500.00 $3,500.00
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17 C22250074 100669 Dennis S Dagger $9,000.00 $9,000.00
18  C22250075 100670 Dennis S Dagger $15,719.71 $15,719.71
19  C22250076 100671 Dennis S Dagger $5,600.00 $5,600.00
20 C22250077 100716 Sandra Thornton $15,500.00 $15,500.00
21 C22240058 100803 NO BID $65,600.00 -
22 C22250078 1010065101007 NO BID $29,875.57 -
23 (22250079 102044 April M Howard $9,450.00 $11,100.00
24 (22250080 102045;102046;102047  April M Howard $10,140.00 $25,100.00
25 (22250081 102847;102848 NO BID $60,300.00 -
26 22240066 102859;102865 NO BID $34,800.00 -
27 22250122 égégg?];égézjl 102862:1 1, ey Tack $8,650.00 $8,650.00
28 (22250082 117620;117621 Todd P. Fedora $9,200.00 $15,000.00
29 (22250083 120468 NO BID $27,575.00 -
30 C22250084 103739 John Zimmerman $29,900.00 $29,900.00
31 C22250085 104428 Jeffrey P VanDell $3,900.00 $3,900.00
32 C22250086 104435 Denny J Stolp $8,500.00 $14,050.00
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33 C22250087 104438 Jeffrey Graves $8,900.00 $9,300.00
34 (C22250088 104439 Ramsey IV - Kenneth R Talle $8,000.00 $8,000.00
35  C22240071 118190 Raymond T Lydon $5,200.00 $5,200.00
36  C22220719 104993 NO BID $150.00 -
37  C22250089 105017 NO BID $4,800.00 -
38  C22250090 105027;105028;117264 NO BID $37,200.00 -
39 C22250091 105115;105118 NO BID $29,900.00 -
40 (22250092 120502 NO BID $28,650.00 -
41 C22250093 117729 Benjamin R Ree $10,200.00 $10,200.00
42 C22250094 105397 NO BID $12,800.00 -
43 22250095 120529 NO BID $4,000.00 -
44 (C22250096 105410;120534;120535 NO BID $8,100.00 -
45 (C22250097 105411;105412 Watering Can Garden Shop - Gina Nukala $9,900.00 $11,200.00
46  C22220621 130268;130269 NO BID $21,200.00 -
47  C22250098 117746 NO BID $6,600.00 -
48 22250099 117748;122035 NO BID $59,293.08 -
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49 (22250100 105657 NO BID $5,700.00 -
50  C22240042 118065 NO BID $32,600.00 -
51 C22250101 106042 NO BID $10,200.00 -
52 C22250102 120580 NO BID $12,800.00 -
53 C22250103 106412 NO BID $8,700.00 -
54 C22230046 122567 William Richardson $9,700.00 $37,100.00
55 C22250104 122083 PULLED $221,200.00 -
56  (C22220549 108512;108515 Reid Clark $15,000.00 $26,100.00
57  C22250105 122096 NO BID $32,800.00 -
58  (C22250106 117698 Scott B Graden $30,200.00 $30,200.00
59  C22250107 117337 NO BID $36,000.00 -
60 C22250108 117339 NO BID $36,200.00 -
61 (C22210222 110154 NO BID $34,695.00 -
62  C22250109 110279 NO BID $207,400.00 -
63 (22250110 120614 Mark W Christopherson $29,900.00 $77,300.00
64 (C22250111 110355 NO BID $12,500.00 -
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65 (C22250112 110364 Jean M Pekkala $11,400.00 $11,400.00
66 (22250113 110475 Jenny Gustavson $3,400.00 $5,150.00
67 (22250114 % (1)2‘7‘;6;1 10477110478:1 1 picr Holdings LLC - Trista L LePier $12,400.00 $33,200.00
68 (22230057 111939 Neal H Baker $1,275.00 $1,325.00
69 (22250115 112374;117601;117602 NO BID $113,900.00 -
70 C22250116 120636 Rodney Knutson $1,900.00 $1,900.00
71  C22250117 112844 Steve Amundson Enterprises LLC $3,200.00 $3,200.00
72 C22230081 113531 Arati Sharma $600.00 $600.00
73 (C22250118 122232 Peter W Tryon $35,100.00 $38,100.00
74  C22250119 122144;122145 NO BID $21,700.00 -
75  C22250120 115358;122146 NO BID $6,400.00 -
76  C22250121 115479 NO BID $3,100.00 -

Total Tracts 76 Total Value $1,887,881.26

Pulled Tracts 1 Pulled Tracts Value $221,200.00

Net Total Tracts 75 Net Total Value $1,666,681.26 $539,527.61

Total Tracts Sold 32

Percent of Net Total Tracts Sold 42.67% Percent of Net Total Value Sold 32.37%
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