June 2026 - NEW FORFEITURE MINIMUM BID SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Basic Sale Price  Sale Amount
3 B22260005 130978 Bill Hall $23,874.24 $35,500.00

4 B22260006 130979 Bill Hall $868.54 $7,600.00

5 B22260008 130981 Ed Pyke $5,216.12 $5,216.12

6  B22260009 130982 Ed Pyke $3,315.01 $3,365.01

9  B22260015 130988 John I. Carline $6,000.65 $6,100.65

15 B22260023 130996 ]S;jrvger;sRObm Burgess and Kathy Jane §3.684.64 $4,150.00

17 B22260025 130998 Connor Riedel $15,824.74 $24,600.00

18 B22260026 130999 NO BID $1,329.18 -

19 B22260028 131001 NO BID $1,006.65 -
21 B22260031 131004 NO BID $404.51 -
22 B22260032 131005 Michael J. Sinko $8,014.32 $35,100.00
23 B22260035 131008 Sherry Battle $197.92 $2,125.00
24 B22260036 131009 Birch Group $7,383.82 $18,700.00
25  B22260037 131010 Caden T. Croft $205.89 $205.89
26 B22260038 131011 Birch Group $4,269.70 $38,200.00
27  B22260039 131012 Birch Group $7,114.66 $8,200.00
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28  B22260040 131013 Birch Group $8,409.13 $12,300.00
29  B22260041 131014 Ebbelisa M. Laulunen $3,345.01 $6,200.00
30 B22260042 131015 Kurt Wirtzfeld $7,334.88 $30,100.00
31  B22260043 131016 Aaron Zika $9,306.65 $9,406.65
34 B22260048 131021 Esthervincia Bobo-Medozard $290.38 $290.38
35  B22260049 131022 Dolal Dayib $3,921.33 $12,100.00
36 B22260050 131023 Birch Group $1,073.37 $1,073.37
37 B22260051 131024 Birch Group $1,166.28 $1,225.00
38  B22260054 131027 Birch Group $1,280.15 $7,100.00
39  B22260056 131029 Carlos A. Guevara $306.55 $504.00
41 B22260058 131031 Gary D. Chernugal $13,714.28 $62,100.00
42 B22260059 131032 Ayshia Husmann $8,849.18 $30,100.00
43 B22260063 131036 Suzanne Roberts $4,490.39 $38,900.00
44 B22260064 131037 Birch Group $727.21 $3,100.00
45 B22260066 131039 NO BID $829.38 -
48  B22260069 131042 Jessica Martin $464.95 $3,900.00
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50 B22260072 131045 Daniel James Patnode and Cynthia Jean $3,675.94  $35,100.00
Patnode
52 B22260074 131047 Hugo Lopez $562.91 $1,150.00
56 B22260080 131053 Phuc Phan $3,145.36 $20,100.00
59 B22260085 131058 John I. Carline $726.96 $5,100.00
60 B22260086 131059 Kyle L. Johnson $331.28 $1,100.00
63 B22260089 131062 Amanda Aro $5,253.48 $85,100.00
64  B22260090 131063 L. M. Hanks $2,417.67 $7,100.00
68 B22260095 131068 Austin Bruckelmyer $211.19 $1,080.00
Total Tracts 40 Total Value $170,544.50
Pulled Tracts 0 Pulled Tracts Value
Net Total Tracts 40 Net Total Value $170,544.50 $563,292.07
Total Tracts Sold 36
Percent of Net Total Tracts Sold 90.00% Percent of Net Total Value Sold 330.29%
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