June 2020 - ONLINE AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22160055 9000001009 NO BID $72,675.00 $0.00
2 C22160237 118164 NO BID $7,329.20 $0.00
3 C22200053 100682 NO BID $2,625.00 $0.00
4 C22200007 123653 NO BID $3,675.00 $0.00
5 C22190137 123656 NO BID $12,825.00 $0.00
6 C22190044 9000002292 NO BID $9,979.20 $0.00
7 C22190038 105308 NO BID $11,234.70 $0.00
8 C22200051 124097 NO BID $8,750.00 $0.00
9 C22170327 118362 NO BID $13,442.76 $0.00
10 C22190220 123208 NO BID $4,500.00 $0.00
11 C22180124 9000001994 NO BID $9,097.92 $0.00
12 C22180129 9000001996 NO BID $9,799.56 $0.00
13 C22190154 123225 Amanda Jean Block $9,652.50 $9,652.50
14 C22190079 123821 NO BID $207,840.00 $0.00
15 C22200011 9000002652 NO BID $21,975.00 $0.00
16 C22200012 122841 NO BID $22,650.00 $0.00
17 C22200085 123255 NO BID $6,450.00 $0.00
18 C22160044 109790 NO BID $16,949.25 $0.00
19 C22180081 110890 NO BID $97,239.15 $0.00
20 C22200065 122147 Eric Isaacson $15,150.00 $32,800.00
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Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
Total Tracts 20 Total Value $563,839.24

Pulled Tracts 0 Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Available Tracts 20 Net Total Value $563,839.24 $42,452.50
Total Tracts Sold 2

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 10.00% Percent of Appraised Value Sold 7.53%
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