September 2025 - FIRE SALE - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Basic SalePrice  Sale Amount
1 D22250010 122739 NO BID $28,200.00 -
2 D22250011 123585;130408 Jodi R Short $55,400.00 $123,100.00
3  D22250012 130052;130062 NOBID $53,600.00 -
4  D22250225 123586;130587;130588 NO BID $137,200.00 -
5 D22250015 123096 NOBID $46,500.00 -
6 D22250016 123098 NOBID $7,300.00 -
7  D22250017 125322;130409 NO BID $11,700.00 -
8 D22250018 130077 NO BID $7,300.00 -
9 D22250019 130099 NOBID $7,300.00 -
10 D22250020 130097 Tyler D Bystedt $6,600.00 $6,600.00
11 D22250021 123100 NO BID $7,500.00 -
12 D22250022 123593 Grace Nelson $9,400.00 $9,400.00
13 D22250023 130590;130591 NOBID $14,900.00 -
14 D22250024 130094 NO BID $18,300.00 -
15 D22250025 123104 NO BID $27,600.00 -
16 D22250026 130410 NOBID $18,000.00 -
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17  D22250027 123105 Duluth Building, LLC $11,900.00 $30,101.00
18 D22250028 130412 NO BID $64,100.00 -
19 D22250029 125327 NO BID $34,200.00 -
20 D22250030 130413 NOBID $74,300.00 -
21 D22250031 130414 NO BID $141,600.00 -
22 D22250032 130091 NO BID $3,900.00 -
23 D22250033 123601 Redemption Ministry Fellowship $10,900.00 $10,900.00
24 D22250034 130415 NO BID $57,300.00 -
25 D22240226 130416 NO BID $13,000.00 -
26 D22240228 130089 NO BID $9,800.00 -
27 D22250035 123604 NO BID $30,000.00 -
28 D22250036 123605;123606 NOBID $99,900.00 -
29 D22250037 123607 NO BID $19,200.00 -
30 D22250038 123608 NOBID $77,000.00 -
31 D22250039 123609 NO BID $92,200.00 -
32 D22250040 123610 NO BID $44,000.00 -
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33 D22250041 123115 NO BID $50,300.00 -
34 D22250042 123116 NO BID $52,800.00 -
35 D22240230 130596 NOBID $7,500.00 -
36 D22250043 130084 NOBID $23,900.00 -
37 D22250044 125341 NO BID $22,500.00 -
38 D22250045 125342 NOBID $29,700.00 -
39 D22250046 125343 NOBID $10,600.00 -
40 D22250047 125344 NO BID $12,600.00 -
41 D22250186 130083 Steve Kenworthy $6,700.00 $6,700.00
42  D22250048 130082 Frank Bucar Jr. $7,100.00 $7,100.00
43 D22250049 124060 NO BID $7,000.00 -
44 D22250050 125345 NOBID $16,800.00 -
45 D22250051 125346 NOBID $20,800.00 -
46 D22250052 123614;123615 NO BID $11,400.00 -
47 D22250053 123616 NO BID $7,500.00 -
48 D22250054 130081 NOBID $14,400.00 -
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49 D22250055 125354 NOBID $17,800.00 -
50 D22250056 130598 NOBID $19,500.00 -
51 D22250057 130599 NO BID $57,400.00 -
52  D22250058 125356 NO BID $74,400.00 -
53  D22250059 125357 Dean Fox $33,300.00 $33,300.00
54 D22250060 125358 NOBID $33,300.00 -
55 D22250061 130078 NOBID $7,000.00 -
56 D22250062 130424 Sonny L Lopez $3,100.00 $3,100.00
57 D22250063 123619 John D Martin $20,300.00 $20,300.00
58 D22250064 125362 NOBID $8,400.00 -
59  D22250065 125363 NOBID $8,500.00 -
60 D22250066 130026 Justin J Boucher $6,800.00 $6,800.00
61 D22250067 130004 NO BID $41,200.00 -
62 D22250068 123119 NO BID $13,800.00 -
63 D22250069 125364 NOBID $55,800.00 -
64 D22240231 130020 NO BID $13,700.00 -
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65 D22250070 130017 Lori Lukovsky $3,600.00 $3,600.00
66 D22250071 125369 Paul Morinville $14,400.00 $14,400.00
67 D22250072 130015 NO BID $3,600.00 -
68 D22250073 125372 NO BID $16,200.00 -
69 D22250074 125373 NO BID $7,400.00 -
70 D22250075 125374 NO BID $15,900.00 -
71  D22250076 130014 NO BID $6,200.00 -
72  D22250077 125375 NO BID $16,600.00 -
73 D22250078 130013 NO BID $5,000.00 -
74 D22250079 125378 NO BID $9,800.00 -
75 D22250080 130425 Danny J Merritt $7,700.00 $17,100.00
76  D22250081 123621 NO BID $3,600.00 -
77 D22250082 123622 NO BID $3,600.00 -
78 D22250083 123623 NO BID $3,600.00 -
79 D22250084 123624 NO BID $3,600.00 -
80 D22250085 123625 NOBID $3,600.00 -
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81 D22250086 130022 NO BID $19,800.00 -
82 D22250087 130601 NOBID $275,100.00 -
83 D22250088 130755 NOBID $87,700.00 -
84  D22250089 130426 NOBID $13,900.00 -
85 D22250090 123627 NOBID $65,200.00 -
86 D22250091 123628 NOBID $67,300.00 -
87 D22250092 130002 NO BID $4,200.00 -
88 D22250093 130003 Mike Hendrickson $4,300.00 $4,300.00
89 D22250094 130001 NOBID $2,000.00 -
90 D22250095 125381 NOBID $22,300.00 -
91 D22250096 125382 NO BID $9,300.00 -
92 D22240232 130006 Mary C Johnson $500.00 $700.00
93 D22250097 123630 NOBID $39,500.00 -
94 D22250098 123631 NO BID $40,200.00 -
95 D22250099 123632 NOBID $47,800.00 -
96 D22250100 123633 NOBID $47,800.00 -
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97 D22250101 123634 NO BID $62,700.00 -
98 D22250102 123635 NOBID $47,700.00 -
99 D22250103 123636 NOBID $47,700.00 -
100 D22250104 123637 NOBID $57,000.00 -
101 D22250105 123638 NO BID $47,700.00 -
102 D22250106 123639 NO BID $56,800.00 -
103 D22250107 130604 NOBID $42,000.00 -
104 D22250108 125394 NOBID $13,000.00 -
105 D22250109 125395 NOBID $12,900.00 -
106 D22250110 130605 NOBID $89,400.00 -
107 D22250111 125401 NO BID $14,200.00 -
108 D22250112 130045 NO BID $8,700.00 -
109 D22250113 130044 NO BID $2,800.00 -
110 D22250114 123136 NO BID $164,800.00 -
111 D22250115 124064;124065 NOBID $25,000.00 -
112 D22250227 125403 NO BID $88,300.00 -
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113 D22250116 130607 NO BID $58,700.00 -
114 D22250117 130029 Jon Y ang $500.00 $530.00
115 D22250118 130027 NO BID $17,800.00 -
116 D22250119 130028 NO BID $28,100.00 -
117 D22250120 130073 NO BID $13,600.00 -
118 D22250121 130101 NO BID $21,600.00 -
119 D22240233 130103 NO BID $4,600.00 -
120 D22250122 130177 NO BID $8,200.00 -
121 D22250123 125410 NO BID $7,800.00 -
122 D22250124 123150 NO BID $142,700.00 -
123 D22250125 130176 NO BID $7,200.00 -
124 D22250126 130174;130175 NO BID $15,300.00 -
125 D22250127 123645 NO BID $13,500.00 -
126 D22250128 130173 NO BID $17,600.00 -
127 D22250129 130172 NO BID $31,600.00 -
128 D22250130 125413 NO BID $16,000.00 -
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129 D22250131 130428 NO BID $66,200.00 -
130 D22250132 123154 NO BID $17,500.00 -
131 D22250133 123155 NO BID $11,200.00 -
132 D22250134 125417;125418 NO BID $8,100.00 -
133 D22250135 130429 NOBID $104,800.00 -
134 D22250136 123156 NO BID $9,100.00 -
135 D22250137 130430 NOBID $54,000.00 -
136 D22250138 125420 NO BID $4,600.00 -
137 D22250139 125421 NO BID $15,800.00 -
138 D22250140 124072 NO BID $23,200.00 -
139 D22250141 124073 NO BID $23,600.00 -
140 D22250142 125422 Jeremiah Day $53,800.00 $53,800.00
141 D22250143 130178 NO BID $49,300.00 -
142 D22250144 130617 NO BID $3,700.00 -
143 D22250145 130618 NO BID $4,300.00 -
144 D22250146 130620;130621 NOBID $6,600.00 -

2025-09-25 Page 9 of 12



September 2025 - FIRE SALE - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Basic SalePrice  Sale Amount
145 D22250147 130441 NO BID $6,600.00 -
146 D22250148 124082 NO BID $65,000.00 -
147 D22250149 124085 NO BID $26,800.00 -
148 D22250150 130159 NOBID $15,600.00 -
149 D22250152 130634 NO BID $8,800.00 -
150 D22250153 130456 NOBID $42,500.00 -
151 D22250154 130057 NO BID $54,600.00 -
152 D22250155 130639 NOBID $32,600.00 -
153 D22250156 130476 NOBID $36,400.00 -
154 D22250158 125467 NO BID $113,600.00 -
155 D22250159 130480 NOBID $38,600.00 -
156 D22240195 125469 NO BID $12,900.00 -
157 D22240197 125473;125474 NO BID $24,000.00 -
158 D22250160 122823 NO BID $10,300.00 -
159 D22250161 130659 NOBID $50,900.00 -
160 D22250162 130120 NO BID $3,000.00 -
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161 D22250226 130118;130119 NO BID $57,000.00 -
162 D22250164 123223 Darin Malvick $7,400.00 $7,400.00
163 D22250165 130494 NOBID $60,200.00 -
164 D22250166 124150 NO BID $57,000.00 -
165 D22250210 123719 NO BID $6,300.00 -
166 D22250007 124151 Darin T Gressman $300.00 $5,350.00
167 D22250167 130495 NO BID $42,700.00 -
168 D22250168 130496 NOBID $35,600.00 -
169 D22250169 130661 NOBID $58,600.00 -
170 D22250170 130501 Jay D. Gray and Kyle Ervin Gray $66,700.00 $66,700.00
171 D22250008 130069 Stephanie Ramel $7,600.00 $16,400.00
172 D22250171 130663 NO BID $47,000.00 -
173 D22250006 122847;123247 NO BID $136,200.00 -
174 D22240200 122852 David P Cook $1,200.00 $4,049.00
175 D22250172 130671 NO BID $154,400.00 -
176 D22250173 130673 PULLED $46,100.00 -
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177 D22250004 123265 Karen Heater $2,800.00 $2,800.00
178 D22240236 130685 NOBID $156,700.00 -
179 D22240237 130149 NO BID $41,000.00 -
180 D22240238 123765 NO BID $1,100.00 -
181 D22250002 125661 Eric Isaacson $16,100.00 $18,900.00
182 D22250003 125662 NO BID $16,100.00 -
183 D22250224 130693 NO BID $164,700.00 -
184 D22240241 122876 NO BID $6,800.00 -
185 D22250176 122738 PULLED $500.00 -
186 D22250177 130702 NO BID $95,600.00 -
187 D22250223 122880 NO BID $42,900.00 -
188 D22250178 130709 NO BID $36,700.00 -
189 D22250179 130724 NO BID $32,900.00 -

Total Tracts 189 Total Value  $6,409,000.00

Pulled Tracts 2 Pulled TractsValue $46,600.00

Net Total Tracts 187 Net Total Value  $6,362,400.00 $473,430.00

Total Tracts Sold 25

Percent of Net Total Tracts Sold 13.37% Percent of Net Total Value Sold 7.44%
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