February 2022 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22210208 9000003292 Charles D Otto $12,675.00 $26,000.00
2 C22210209 100313 Cherri Johnson $12,675.00 $22,564.00
3 C22210182 125325 Scott J Filipovich $40,950.00 $46,400.00
4 C22210210 122751 Christopher G Soares $40,575.00 $40,575.00
5 C22210211 122754 Sabir Telingun $2,625.00 $12,100.00
6 C22210183 9000003251 NO BID $44,250.00 $0.00
7 C22210213 9000003312 Darin Malvick $13,800.00 $13,800.00
8 C22210214 9000003313 Allison Fischer $11,850.00 $11,950.00
9 C22210111 103461 NO BID $6,800.00 $0.00
10 C22210226 117253 Sabir Telingun $1,500.00 $1,500.00
11 C22210215 123161 Sabir Telingun $1,500.00 $1,500.00
12 C22210216 125426 Ethan L Humphreys $2,078.09 $20,578.09
13 C22210228 123668 Sabir Telingun $2,320.43 $12,920.43
14 C22210185 105121 Heavy Metal Hockey $4,950.00 $5,000.00
15 C22210229 125438 Sabir Telingun $2,452.40 $2,452.40
16 C22210186 122793 Mustafa Alhakim $37,100.00 $60,200.00
17 C22210230 124095 Sabir Telingun $2,569.10 $6,319.10
18 C22210187 117290 Benjamin R Ree $3,825.00 $9,100.00
19 C22210217 105294 NO BID $17,025.00 $0.00
20 C22210188 9000003271 NO BID $13,875.00 $0.00
21 C22210218 118079 Sabir Telingun $2,550.00 $2,550.00
22 C22210219 9000003314 Paul Bontems $15,600.00 $15,600.00
23 C22210220 106294 Sabir Telingun $5,550.00 $5,550.00
24 C22210189 125482 NO BID $44,000.00 $0.00
25 C22210190 124158 Richard M Erickson $58,100.00 $58,100.00
26 (C22210191 125483 Lynnea Emerson $82,400.00 $82,400.00
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27 C22200195 122490 NO BID $42,200.00 $0.00
28 22210044 122627 NO BID $30,300.00 $0.00
29 C22210192 122435 Paul M Romslo $55,500.00 $55,500.00
30 22210194 122431 NO BID $43,000.00 $0.00
31 C22210196 122510 NO BID $30,000.00 $0.00
32 22210198 124167 Thomas J Niesen $13,425.00 $25,700.00
33 C22210199 109289 NO BID $140,100.00 $0.00
34 C22210200 109612 Lyle G Sunne $750.00 $4,650.00
35 C22210201 109614 Jeffrey Fisher $10,725.00 $10,725.00
36 22210222 110154 NO BID $38,550.00 $0.00
37 C22210202 124282 Heidi Sue Trimble Zierden and Troy Joseph $114,700.00 $175,100.00
38 (C22210224 110294 Jeffrey P Hall and Paula J Hall $59,625.00 $59,625.00
39 C22210203 124175 Adam Lipe $20,625.00 $59,300.00
40 C22210204 123772 Loren P Johnston $78,675.00 $336,250.00
41 C22210205 111499 Aaron Lindberg $21,975.00 $30,300.00
42 C22210124 125506 Daryn R Luukkonen $1,300.00 $3,000.00
43 C22210125 125515 NO BID $4,450.00 $0.00
44 C22210206 9000003291 Amanda J Block $14,100.00 $14,100.00
45 C22210207 115978 Thomas J Goldsmith $17,400.00 $17,400.00
46 (22210223 116368 NO BID $10,125.00 $0.00

Total Tracts 46 Total Value $1,231,120.02

Pulled Tracts 0 Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Available Tracts 46 Net Total Value $1,231,120.02 $1,248,809.02

Total Tracts Sold 33

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 71.74% Percent of Appraised Value Sold 101.44%
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