ONLINE AUCTION SUMMARY - 05/25/2020

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22160055 9000001009 NO BID $90,843.75 $0.00
2 C22160237 118164 NO BID $7,329.20 $0.00
4 C22190137 123656 NO BID $14,250.00 $0.00
5 C22190044 9000002292 NO BID $12,474.00 $0.00
8 C22190038 105308 NO BID $14,043.38 $0.00
10 C22170327 118362 NO BID $14,936.40 $0.00
11 C22180124 9000001994 NO BID $10,108.00 $0.00
12 C22180129 9000001996  NO BID $9,799.56 $0.00
13 C22190154 123225 NO BID $10,725.00 $0.00
14 (22180342 107726 Leonard J Huotari $60,928.00 $60,928.00
15 C22190079 123821 NO BID $259,800.00 $0.00
16 C22160044 109790 NO BID $18,832.50 $0.00
17 C22180081 110890 NO BID $114,399.00 $0.00

Total Tracts 13 Total Value $638,468.80

Pulled Tracts 0 Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Available Tracts 13 Net Total Value $638,468.80 $60,928.00

Total Tracts Sold 1

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 7.69% Percent of Appraised Value Sold  9.54%
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