

September 2021 - ONLINE AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
1	C22190167	123584	NO BID	\$2,525.00	\$0.00
2	C22200267	9000002912	NO BID	\$51,825.00	\$0.00
3	C22200243	100568	NO BID	\$12,650.00	\$0.00
4	C22180351	9000002237	Miguel Martinez	\$36,100.00	\$36,100.00
5	C22200247	9000002852	NO BID	\$18,100.00	\$0.00
6	C22170243	103884	NO BID	\$1,400.00	\$0.00
7	C22200183	104236	NO BID	\$25,350.00	\$0.00
8	C22170246	104377	NO BID	\$2,000.00	\$0.00
9	C22190137	123656	NO BID	\$9,800.00	\$0.00
10	C22160084	105290	Carlyn Attama	\$150.00	\$360.00
11	C22160083	105291	Kareem Elbakkal	\$150.00	\$158.50
12	C22170260	105295	Carlyn Attama	\$400.00	\$400.00
13	C22150017	105420	Carlyn Attama	\$136.00	\$153.50
14	C22180366	105450	NO BID	\$780.00	\$0.00
15	C22190180	123697	NO BID	\$2,120.00	\$0.00
16	C22170327	118362	NO BID	\$7,920.00	\$0.00
17	C22180289	105479	Carlyn Attama	\$705.00	\$705.00
18	C22190181	105481	Kareem Elbakkal	\$50.00	\$50.00
19	C22210038	125467	NO BID	\$67,600.00	\$0.00
20	C22180290	105497	Carlyn Attama	\$1,260.00	\$1,285.00
21	C22180291	105498	NO BID	\$1,125.00	\$0.00
22	C22180285	105504	Carlyn Attama	\$130.00	\$202.50
23	C22200130	105812	NO BID	\$27,050.00	\$0.00
24	C22190224	106045	NO BID	\$3,300.00	\$0.00
25	C22200193	122487	NO BID	\$40,000.00	\$0.00
26	C22210045	122628	NO BID	\$41,100.00	\$0.00

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
27	C22210059	9000002975	NO BID	\$15,375.00	\$0.00
28	C22190156	108049	NO BID	\$55,750.00	\$0.00
29	C22200011	9000002652	NO BID	\$14,250.00	\$0.00
30	C22200141	108339	NO BID	\$34,100.00	\$0.00
31	C22200152	122853	NO BID	\$60,200.00	\$0.00
32	C22210148	109408	NO BID	\$8,704.00	\$0.00
33	C22200111	109785	NO BID	\$33,500.00	\$0.00
34	C22210068	110503	NO BID	\$40,500.00	\$0.00
35	C22180081	110890	NO BID	\$54,800.00	\$0.00
36	C22160024	110892	NO BID	\$2,000.00	\$0.00
37	C22210079	115909	NO BID	\$8,700.00	\$0.00
Total Tracts			37	Total Value	\$681,605.00
Pulled Tracts			0	Pulled Tracts Value	\$0.00
Net Available Tracts			37	Net Total Value	\$681,605.00
Total Tracts Sold			9		\$39,414.50
Percent of Available Tracts Sold			24.32%	Percent of Appraised Value Sold	5.78%