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NOTICE OF ST. LOUIS COUNTY PUBLIC ORAL TIMBER AUCTION 
 

Notice is hereby given that the St. Louis County Auditor shall sell to the highest bidder the designated 
timber located on the following described parcels of land forfeited to the state for the nonpayment of 
taxes, which have been classified and appraised as provided by Minnesota Statutes 282.04, Subd. 1
(1982) subject, in part, to the following conditions: 
 
1. To be eligible to bid at a St. Louis County Timber auction, a Responsible Operator Application 

Form must be on file at the St. Louis County Land and Minerals Department, 320 West 2nd 
Street, Suite 302, Duluth, MN 55802, at least 2 (two) working days prior to the auction. An    
application can be obtained at any Land and Minerals Department Office. 

2. A minimum of fifteen percent (15%) of the appraised value shall be paid at time of sale. The 
remaining balance shall be paid prior to entry. REQUIRED DOWN PAYMENT IS SPECIFIED 
ON THE LIST. 

3. Minimum bid shall be the appraised value of the sale. Bids shall be at one (1) or more percent 
over and above the appraised prices. The final percent bid is to be added to the price of each 
kind of timber advertised, unless otherwise stipulated in individual contract regulations. Species 
denoted with an NBS or NBE are non-bid species and will not be subject to the percent bid   
increase. 

4. Many of the tracts have special requirements. The St. Louis County Land and Minerals         
Department offers sales of various sizes, species and products to meet the needs of a wide  
variety of purchasers. There are some sales offered on this auction that allow the purchaser to 
decide if they want to purchase the sale as offered, either all species scaled or a mix of scaled 
and SOAV species, or choose to have all the species sold as SOAV. These are identified with 
the following sentence in the comments of each tract: “The purchaser has the option to        
purchase this sale as advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised Volume 
(SOAV)”. If there is any conflict between the Timber Sale Package and this                     
advertisement, the Timber Sale Package is the controlling document. The Timber Sale     
Package contains maps, volume and values, contract information and harvest provisions, and 
is available at the applicable AREA OFFICE listed below or on the St. Louis County website: 

STLOUISCOUNTYMN.GOV 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
Sale will be held at: 

Cotton Town Hall 

Hwy 53, Cotton, MN 

11:00 a.m. - May 9, 2019 

 
The St. Louis County Land and Minerals Department does not accept cash payments.  

Payment must be made by Check or Money Order. 

 
Pike Lake Area 

Mark Pannkuk, Area Land Manager 
5713 Old Miller Trunk Highway 

Duluth, MN 55811 
 

218-625-3700 

 
Virginia Area 

Mark Kailanen, Area Land Manager 
7820 Highway 135 
Virginia, MN 55792 

 
218-742-9898 



Please Note: 

Successful bidders of sales with the option of choosing Sold On Appraised Volume (SOAV) will have 
ten (10) business days to choose the option for the sale(s). A $300 bid bond, i.e. personal check, 
payable to the St. Louis County Auditor is required and must be paid the day of the auction. One bid 
bond will cover all purchased tracts that have an SOAV option. 

Successful bidders using a Letter of Credit to secure the purchase of a sale will have ten (10)  
business days to provide the Letter of Credit to the Land and Minerals Department. A $300 bid bond, 
i.e. personal check, payable to the St. Louis County Auditor is required and must be paid the day of 
the auction. One bid bond will cover all purchased tracts that will be secured by Letter of Credit. 

Timber Sale Operators must have the following minimum training for at least the owner of the firm 
and the foreman who will supervise the logging on St. Louis County Lands: 

 Master Logging Certification; or 

 Minnesota Logger Education (MLEP) Member in Good Standing; or SFI Training 
FISTA member: or 

 Training equivalent to the Minnesota SFI Implementation Committee Training        
Standard for a trained Professional Logger.                 

All field employees must have training in best management practices. 

Published as follows is the list of timber to be offered at public auction sale as announced and  

advertised in the official newspaper within this county. 



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 1 C19-621730 Sale Administrator: Casey Anderson
Virginia Area
C19190026

Total Appraised: $5,945.82
Down Payment Required: $891.87

Twp. 62N Rge. 17W  Sec. 30

Total Acres: 21.6 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 49.558' N  92° 33.328' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.6 14.4 9.2
Spruce-Black 3.7 7.6 3.1
Balsam Fir 2.7 5.4 2.5
Birch 3.0 10.0 1.4
Pine-Jack 4.6 12.5 1.3
Maple-Red 3.3 12.4 1.3

Comments:
All species will be scaled.

This sale does not meet the Land and Mineral 
Department's cruising error standards. Please talk to the 
sale administrator for more information.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 213 Cords @ $15.90 = $3,386.70
Balsam Fir pulpwood 53 Cords @ $9.29 = $492.37
Birch pulpwood 29 Cords @ $4.54 = $131.66
Red Maple pulpwood 27 Cords @ $2.67 = $72.09
Jack Pine pulpwood 29 Cords @ $14.83 = $430.07
Black Spruce pulpwood 79 Cords @ $15.67 = $1,237.93
White Spruce pulpwood 15 Cords @ $13.00 = $195.00

Total Appraised Value: $5,945.82



C19190026



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 2 C19-631928 Sale Administrator: Shontel Adam
Virginia Area
C19190027

Total Appraised: $2,739.24
Down Payment Required: $410.89

Twp. 63N Rge. 19W  Sec. 28

Total Acres: 40.3 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 55.166' N  92° 46.911' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Maple-Red 3.0 8.6 7.5
Aspen 5.3 12.6 5.8
Birch 4.1 8.7 2.8
Balsam Fir 2.0 6.3 0.4
Spruce-Black 5.0 9.5 0.4
Pine-Jack 5.5 14.5 0.2

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or as Sold on Appraised Volume (SOAV).  

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 233 Cords @ $7.95 = $1,852.35
Balsam Fir pulpwood 14 Cords @ $4.64 = $64.96
Birch pulpwood 114 Cords @ $2.27 = $258.78
Red Maple pulpwood 302 Cords @ $1.33 = $401.66
Jack Pine pulpwood 7 Cords @ $7.41 = $51.87
Black Spruce pulpwood 14 Cords @ $7.83 = $109.62

Total Appraised Value: $2,739.24



C19190027



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 3 C19-641801 Sale Administrator: Christopher Lintula
Virginia Area
C19190028

Total Appraised: $25,057.00
Down Payment Required: $3,758.55

Twp. 65N Rge. 17W  Sec. 31 and Twp. 64N Rge. 18W  
Sec. 1, 12

Total Acres: 232.2 Expires: 4/15/2022 48° 3.536' N  92° 34.546' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.2 12.9 5.4
Birch 3.4 8.6 3.0
Maple-Red 2.6 8.3 2.9
Spruce-Black 4.1 9.0 2.4
Balsam Fir 2.4 6.8 1.2
Pine-Jack 4.4 9.4 0.5

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as scaled option.

A minimum of $1,000 of the down payment will be 
retained and will be held until satisfactory completion of 
the contract.

REOFFERED AT A REDUCED PRICE !

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 1234 Cords @ $10.00 = $12,340.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 281 Cords @ $5.50 = $1,545.50
Birch pulpwood 686 Cords @ $2.75 = $1,886.50
Red Maple pulpwood 683 Cords @ $1.50 = $1,024.50
Jack Pine pulpwood 131 Cords @ $9.00 = $1,179.00
Norway Pine pulpwood 44 Cords @ $16.50 = $726.00
Black Spruce pulpwood 569 Cords @ $9.50 = $5,405.50
White Spruce pulpwood 100 Cords @ $9.50 = $950.00

Total Appraised Value: $25,057.00



C19190028



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 4 C19-651903 Sale Administrator: Christopher Lintula
Virginia Area
C19190029

Total Appraised: $63,632.04
Down Payment Required: $9,544.81

Twp. 65N Rge. 19W  Sec. 3, 4

Total Acres: 107 Expires: 4/15/2022 48° 8.433' N  92° 46.424' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.9 11.4 24.1
Balsam Fir 2.9 8.1 4.4
Ash 3.4 11.8 0.7
Balm Of Gilead 4.1 9.7 0.6
Birch 3.3 9.0 0.6
Spruce-White 4.6 10.3 0.4

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or as Sold on Appraised Volume (SOAV).  

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Block Operational Periods
1 and 2 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Ash pulp & bolts 74 Cords @ $3.60 = $266.40
Aspen pulpwood 2564 Cords @ $21.21 = $54,382.44
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 71 Cords @ $21.21 = $1,505.91
Balsam Fir pulpwood 487 Cords @ $12.38 = $6,029.06
Birch pulpwood 67 Cords @ $6.05 = $405.35
Red Maple pulpwood 17 Cords @ $3.56 = $60.52
Jack Pine pulpwood 3 Cords @ $19.78 = $59.34
Black Spruce pulpwood 7 Cords @ $17.34 = $121.38
White Spruce pulp & bolts 46 Cords @ $17.34 = $797.64
Tamarack pulpwood 1 Cords @ $4.00 = $4.00

Total Appraised Value: $63,632.04

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Ash pulp & bolts 23 51
Aspen pulpwood 752 1812
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 67 4
Balsam Fir pulpwood 234 253
Birch pulpwood 28 39
Red Maple pulpwood 14 3
Jack Pine pulpwood 3
Black Spruce pulpwood 4 3
White Spruce pulp & bolts 26 20
Tamarack pulpwood 1



C19190029



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 5 C19-662020 Sale Administrator: Christopher Lintula
Virginia Area
C19190030

Total Appraised: $16,429.38
Down Payment Required: $2,464.41

Twp. 66N Rge. 20W  Sec. 20, 29

Total Acres: 81.9 Expires: 4/15/2022 48° 10.990' N  92° 55.940' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.4 13.5 8.4
Maple-Red 2.6 8.8 6.1
Birch 3.7 10.0 3.0
Pine-Jack 5.8 16.3 0.8
Ash 3.3 11.5 0.6
Balsam Fir 2.7 6.8 0.5

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).
  
Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.
 
Culverts will be provided and must be installed as 
approved by seller.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Ash pulpwood 47 Cords @ $3.00 = $141.00
Aspen pulpwood 681 Cords @ $17.67 = $12,033.27
Balsam Fir pulpwood 43 Cords @ $10.32 = $443.76
Birch pulpwood 244 Cords @ $5.04 = $1,229.76
Red Maple pulpwood 503 Cords @ $2.97 = $1,493.91
Jack Pine pulpwood 66 Cords @ $16.48 = $1,087.68

Total Appraised Value: $16,429.38



C19190030



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 6 C19-662035 Sale Administrator: Mark Kailanen
Virginia Area
C19190031

Total Appraised: $23,914.60
Down Payment Required: $3,587.19

Twp. 66N Rge. 20W  Sec. 34, 35

Total Acres: 51.3 Expires: 4/15/2022 48° 9.525' N  92° 52.621' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 6.0 12.4 19.0
Balsam Fir 3.7 8.1 9.6
Balm Of Gilead 5.1 11.4 0.7
Spruce-White 7.8 12.4 0.6
Spruce-Black 5.7 9.3 0.4
Birch 3.4 7.9 0.3

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Block Operational Periods
1 &2 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Ash pulpwood 1 Cords @ $3.00 = $3.00
Aspen pulpwood 985 Cords @ $17.67 = $17,404.95
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 38 Cords @ $17.67 = $671.46
Balsam Fir pulpwood 483 Cords @ $10.32 = $4,984.56
Birch pulpwood 12 Cords @ $5.04 = $60.48
Red Maple pulpwood 9 Cords @ $2.97 = $26.73
Black Spruce pulpwood 18 Cords @ $15.58 = $280.44
White Spruce pulpwood 31 Cords @ $15.58 = $482.98

Total Appraised Value: $23,914.60

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Ash pulpwood 1
Aspen pulpwood 349 636
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 2 36
Balsam Fir pulpwood 219 264
Birch pulpwood 12
Red Maple pulpwood 3 6
Black Spruce pulpwood 7 11
White Spruce pulpwood 14 17



C19190031



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 7 E19-611333 Sale Administrator: Robert Cozzo
Virginia Area
C19190032

Total Appraised: $9,457.67
Down Payment Required: $1,418.65

Twp. 61N Rge. 13W  Sec. 33

Total Acres: 48 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 43.143' N  91° 59.756' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Spruce-Black 2.7 5.5 6.2
Tamarack 4.2 8.6 5.1
Pine-Jack 3.1 5.8 2.6
Aspen 3.7 8.0 0.9
Balsam Fir 2.6 4.6 0.6
Birch 2.0 4.3 0.2

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold on Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as scaled option.

A minimum of $1,000 of the down payment will be 
retained and will be held until satisfactory completion of 
the contract.

Access:
Hwy 21 using the Taconite Snowmobile Trail

Block Operational Periods
1,2 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 38 Cords @ $17.67 = $671.46
Balsam Fir pulpwood 27 Cords @ $10.32 = $278.64
Birch pulpwood 8 Cords @ $5.04 = $40.32
Jack Pine pulpwood 122 Cords @ $16.48 = $2,010.56
Black Spruce pulpwood 324 Cords @ $17.41 = $5,640.84
Tamarack pulpwood 245 Cords @ $3.33 = $815.85

Total Appraised Value: $9,457.67

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Aspen pulpwood 38
Balsam Fir pulpwood 5 22
Birch pulpwood 5 3
Jack Pine pulpwood 13 109
Black Spruce pulpwood 90 234
Tamarack pulpwood 222 23



C19190032



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 8 E19-611512 Sale Administrator: Tom Salzer
Virginia Area
C19190033

Total Appraised: $7,225.26
Down Payment Required: $1,083.79

Twp. 61N Rge. 15W  Sec. 12

Total Acres: 33.8 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 47.100' N  92° 11.821' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.1 10.4 9.2
Pine-Jack 4.9 12.6 1.9
Spruce-Black 3.4 7.7 1.4
Birch 3.4 9.6 1.3
Spruce-White 3.5 8.7 0.8
Balsam Fir 2.3 7.3 0.5

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).  

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as scaled option.

Access:
Frozen Ground conditions due to the condition of the existing access. Operations during Dry Soil conditions may be allowed at 
Sellers discretion but would require significant road work and new road construction for 1400 feet along with 3 culverts installed.  
Talk to Sale administrator for more information.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 299 Cords @ $15.90 = $4,754.10
Balsam Fir pulpwood 16 Cords @ $9.29 = $148.64
Birch pulpwood 47 Cords @ $4.54 = $213.38
Red Maple pulpwood 9 Cords @ $2.67 = $24.03
Jack Pine pulpwood 67 Cords @ $14.83 = $993.61
Black Spruce pulpwood 48 Cords @ $14.75 = $708.00
White Spruce pulpwood 26 Cords @ $14.75 = $383.50

Total Appraised Value: $7,225.26



C19190033



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 9 E19-621405 Sale Administrator: James Simons
Virginia Area
C19190034

Total Appraised: $58,166.96
Down Payment Required: $8,725.04

Twp. 62N Rge. 14W  Sec. 3, 4, 5 and Twp. 63N Rge. 14W  
Sec. 33, 34

Total Acres: 228.5 Expires: 4/15/2022
Blocks: 8

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.9 11.8 10.2
Birch 4.4 8.9 2.4
Pine-Norway 6.3 12.6 1.0
Pine-White 5.4 14.6 0.1
Pine-Jack 5.7 11.3 0.8
Spruce-Black 4.1 7.8 0.8

Comments:

-The Purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as advertised or to
purchase all species as Sold on Appraised Volume (SOAV) except red
and white pine must be scaled.
-Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree chipping/grinding will not
be allowed if the sale is purchased as scaled option.
-The Sale Package has an additional designated access map that will be
part of the contract. Sale Packages can be found online, at Land and 
Minerals Dept. offices, or by contacting the Sale Administrator.

Access:

Block Operational Periods

1,2,4,6 Frozen ground or Dry soil after road restrictions are lifted

7,8 Frozen ground

-Purchaser must use the route to the harvest area as depicted on the designated access map.
-70% of the sale can be harvested during dry soil conditions but would require significant road work, including approximately 1/2 mile of wetlands,
across the 1 mile of designated access. Talk to sale administrator for more information.
-The USFS Special Use Permit and its requirements become part of this contract. This includes construction of a berm.
Operational Periods: Blocks 3&5  Dry soil conditions August 1 to March 10.

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Ash pulpwood 19 Cords @ $3.00 = $57.00
Aspen pulpwood 2366 Cords @ $17.67 = $41,807.22
Balsam Fir pulpwood 152 Cords @ $10.32 = $1,568.64
Birch pulpwood 553 Cords @ $5.04 = $2,787.12
Red Maple pulpwood 107 Cords @ $2.97 = $317.79
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 179 Cords @ $16.48 = $2,949.92
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 130 Cords @ $29.92 = $3,889.60
White Pine pulp & bolts 13 Cords @ $21.63 = $281.19
Black Spruce pulpwood 151 Cords @ $17.41 = $2,628.91
White Spruce pulp & bolts 128 Cords @ $14.45 = $1,849.60
Tamarack pulpwood 9 Cords @ $3.33 = $29.97

Total Appraised Value: $58,166.96

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3 Block 4 Block 5 Block 6 Block 7
Ash pulpwood 6 13
Aspen pulpwood 590 391 303 375 61 219 326
Balsam Fir pulpwood 23 5 12 8 3 11 62
Birch pulpwood 84 59 5 34 36 88 196
Red Maple pulpwood 20 11 16 7 18 7
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 20 6 13 11 7 85
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 2 7 30 7 78 6
White Pine pulp & bolts 1 6 1 2 3
Black Spruce pulpwood 94
White Spruce pulp & bolts 6 40 11 14 18 25
Tamarack pulpwood 5

Block 8

101
28
51
28
37

57
14

4



C19190034
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St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 10 V19-561318 Sale Administrator: Nick Hoff
Virginia Area
C19190035

Total Appraised: $12,395.84
Down Payment Required: $1,859.38

Twp. 56N Rge. 13W  Sec. 7, 18

Total Acres: 42 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 20.526' N  92° 2.189' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.6 12.0 10.5
Birch 4.1 12.4 3.3
Balsam Fir 3.7 9.9 2.7
Spruce-Black 3.6 8.3 2.5
Spruce-White 6.2 16.5 1.1

Comments:
Purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or as Sold on Appraised Volume (SOAV)

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Access:
The Purchaser will be required to secure a Road Use Permit from the USFS Laurentian Ranger District in Aurora, MN.  The road use 
permit will involve road toll fees or a maintenance agreement.

Block Operational Periods
1,2 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 435 Cords @ $17.67 = $7,686.45
Balsam Fir pulpwood 120 Cords @ $10.32 = $1,238.40
Birch pulpwood 140 Cords @ $5.04 = $705.60
Black Spruce pulpwood 119 Cords @ $17.41 = $2,071.79
White Spruce pulpwood 48 Cords @ $14.45 = $693.60

Total Appraised Value: $12,395.84

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Aspen pulpwood 285 150
Balsam Fir pulpwood 77 43
Birch pulpwood 43 97
Black Spruce pulpwood 119
White Spruce pulpwood 17 31



C19190035
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St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 11 V19-571931 Sale Administrator: Kyle Andrews
Virginia Area
C19190036

Total Appraised: $33,562.02
Down Payment Required: $5,034.30

Twp. 57N Rge. 19W  Sec. 30, 31, 32

Total Acres: 81.7 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 22.864' N  92° 47.799' W
Blocks: 3

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Spruce-Black 4.8 8.6 12.7
Aspen 5.4 11.2 8.9
Balsam Fir 4.2 9.3 2.3
Tamarack 4.4 9.6 0.5
Pine-Jack 5.6 13.2 0.3

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or as sold on appraised volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Access:
Access off of county road #16. All county access.

Block Operational Periods
1-3 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 747 Cords @ $17.67 = $13,199.49
Balsam Fir pulpwood 187 Cords @ $10.32 = $1,929.84
Jack Pine pulpwood 25 Cords @ $16.48 = $412.00
Black Spruce pulpwood 1028 Cords @ $17.41 = $17,897.48
Tamarack pulpwood 37 Cords @ $3.33 = $123.21

Total Appraised Value: $33,562.02

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3
Aspen pulpwood 186 242 319
Balsam Fir pulpwood 100 25 62
Jack Pine pulpwood 14 8 3
Black Spruce pulpwood 189 343 496
Tamarack pulpwood 31 6



C19190036
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St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 12 V19-581315 Sale Administrator: Nick Hoff
Virginia Area
C19190037

Total Appraised: $15,842.15
Down Payment Required: $2,376.32

Twp. 58N Rge. 13W  Sec. 15

Total Acres: 40 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 30.406' N  91° 58.407' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Spruce-Black 3.8 8.8 21.2
Tamarack 4.0 9.6 4.4
Pine-Jack 4.6 12.4 0.4
Birch 3.3 9.3 0.2
Balsam Fir 2.6 8.4 0.2
Aspen 5.0 11.0 0.2

Comments:
Purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or as sold on appraised volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Access:
The Purchaser will be required to secure a Road Use Permit from the USFS Laurentian Ranger District in Aurora, MN. The road use 
permit will involve road toll fees or a maintenance agreement.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 6 Cords @ $17.67 = $106.02
Balsam Fir pulpwood 9 Cords @ $10.32 = $92.88
Birch pulpwood 9 Cords @ $5.04 = $45.36
Jack Pine pulpwood 14 Cords @ $16.48 = $230.72
Black Spruce pulpwood 849 Cords @ $17.41 = $14,781.09
Tamarack pulpwood 176 Cords @ $3.33 = $586.08

Total Appraised Value: $15,842.15



C19190037
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St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 13 V19-581525 Sale Administrator: John Muhich
Virginia Area
C19190038

Total Appraised: $7,837.41
Down Payment Required: $1,175.61

Twp. 58N Rge. 15W  Sec. 25

Total Acres: 27.4 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 28.521' N  92° 11.560' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.0 10.7 14.0
Balsam Fir 3.0 6.2 1.8
Maple-Red 3.1 9.0 1.7
Birch 4.5 10.3 1.2
Spruce-Black 3.0 7.0 0.1
Ash 2.5 6.5 0.1

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.  

Winter access permit on existing winter trail on state 
permit 144-18-2390.

Access:
We plan on using an existing winter trail from south used by Blandin contractor in 1-2019, as this has less topography than private 
access from the west.  However, we have both access routes authorized.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Ash pulpwood 4 Cords @ $3.00 = $12.00
Aspen pulp & bolts 394 Cords @ $17.67 = $6,961.98
Balsam Fir pulpwood 49 Cords @ $10.32 = $505.68
Birch pulpwood 33 Cords @ $5.04 = $166.32
Red Maple pulpwood 43 Cords @ $2.97 = $127.71
Black Spruce pulpwood 2 Cords @ $17.41 = $34.82
White Spruce pulp & bolts 2 Cords @ $14.45 = $28.90

Total Appraised Value: $7,837.41



C19190038



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 14 V19-592125 Sale Administrator: Dave Skurla
Virginia Area
C19190039

Total Appraised: $21,250.48
Down Payment Required: $3,187.57

Twp. 59N Rge. 21W  Sec. 23, 24, 25

Total Acres: 62.7 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 34.210' N  92° 57.199' W
Blocks: 3

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.1 11.2 13.6
Pine-Jack 4.7 12.0 4.0
Balsam Fir 3.0 7.6 1.2
Spruce-Black 3.4 7.1 0.7
Tamarack 4.5 11.2 0.6
Spruce-White 4.5 12.1 0.3

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option. 

A minimum of $1,000.00 of the down payment will be 
retained and will be held until satisfactory completion of 
the contract.

Access:
Existing entrances for all 3 Blocks. The ArcelorMittal Hibbing Land Corporation, a Delaware Corporation, Road Access Permit and its 
requirements will become part of this contract. Contact Sale Adminstrator for additional insurance requirements for this Road Access 
Permit. Berms will need to be reinstalled on access roads to Blocks 2 and 3.

Block Operational Periods
1,2,3 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 889 Cords @ $17.67 = $15,708.63
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 12 Cords @ $16.80 = $201.60
Balsam Fir pulpwood 71 Cords @ $10.32 = $732.72
Jack Pine pulpwood 224 Cords @ $16.48 = $3,691.52
Black Spruce pulpwood 35 Cords @ $17.41 = $609.35
White Spruce pulpwood 15 Cords @ $14.45 = $216.75
Tamarack pulpwood 27 Cords @ $3.33 = $89.91

Total Appraised Value: $21,250.48

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3
Aspen pulpwood 235 471 183
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 12
Balsam Fir pulpwood 8 63
Jack Pine pulpwood 224
Black Spruce pulpwood 35
White Spruce pulpwood 15
Tamarack pulpwood 27



C19190039



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 15 F19-512030 Sale Administrator: Erik Anton
Pike Lake Area
C19190040

Total Appraised: $24,519.59
Down Payment Required: $3,677.94

Twp. 51N Rge. 20W  Sec. 19, 30

Total Acres: 66.4 Expires: 4/15/2022 46° 52.750' N  92° 55.548' W
Blocks: 3

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Spruce-Black 4.3 8.0 10.2
Aspen 5.0 10.5 5.4
Tamarack 4.8 10.3 4.4
Maple-Red 3.2 10.5 3.3
Ash 3.9 9.2 1.4
Balsam Fir 3.4 8.7 1.3

Comments:
If pipeline construction is occurring during harvest, seller 
will remove block 1a.

Access:
Access for the sale will be off the Savanna Rd. If required, the St. Louis County Public Works Access Driveway Permit and its 
requirements become part of this contract.  This includes traffic control requirements for culvert installations. A pre-existing winter 
road runs 1.5 miles to the sale area. The last 0.38 miles are pre-existing road but will require more preparation. A more upland pre-
existing route may be available through Blandin and Minnesota DNR land.

Block Operational Periods
all Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
SOAV Ash pulpwood 103 Cords @ $3.30 = $339.90

Aspen pulpwood 382 Cords @ $19.44 = $7,426.08
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 21 Cords @ $18.68 = $392.28
Balsam Fir pulpwood 81 Cords @ $11.35 = $919.35

SOAV Birch pulpwood 30 Cords @ $5.54 = $166.20
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 216 Cords @ $3.26 = $704.16

Black Spruce pulpwood 701 Cords @ $19.15 = $13,424.15
White Spruce pulp & bolts 5 Cords @ $15.90 = $79.50
Tamarack pulpwood 291 Cords @ $3.67 = $1,067.97

Total Appraised Value: $24,519.59

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3
Ash pulpwood 101 2
Aspen pulpwood 315 56 11
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 21
Balsam Fir pulpwood 31 36 14
Birch pulpwood 13 17
Red Maple pulpwood 157 31 28
Black Spruce pulpwood 423 278
White Spruce pulp & bolts 5
Tamarack pulpwood 201 90



C19190040



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 16 F19-521910 Sale Administrator: Steven Boberg
Pike Lake Area
C19190041

Total Appraised: $34,206.87
Down Payment Required: $5,131.03

Twp. 52N Rge. 19W  Sec. 3, 10

Total Acres: 92 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 0.831' N  92° 43.953' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.7 11.1 18.5
Maple-Red 2.1 8.1 2.2
Spruce-Black 3.3 7.0 1.2
Ash 2.6 7.2 0.4
Spruce-White 4.7 12.4 0.4
Tamarack 3.0 5.8 0.4

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV). 

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Access:
From CSAH 5 in Ness Township travel .25 miles east on minimum maintenance forest road.

Block Operational Periods
1-2 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
SOAV Ash pulpwood 38 Cords @ $3.00 = $114.00

Aspen pulpwood 1670 Cords @ $17.67 = $29,508.90
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 29 Cords @ $16.98 = $492.42
Balsam Fir pulpwood 25 Cords @ $10.32 = $258.00

SOAV Birch pulpwood 11 Cords @ $5.04 = $55.44
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 201 Cords @ $2.97 = $596.97

Black Spruce pulpwood 148 Cords @ $17.41 = $2,576.68
White Spruce pulpwood 31 Cords @ $14.45 = $447.95
Tamarack pulpwood 47 Cords @ $3.33 = $156.51

Total Appraised Value: $34,206.87

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Ash pulpwood 23 15
Aspen pulpwood 1331 339
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 3 26
Balsam Fir pulpwood 3 22
Birch pulpwood 9 2
Red Maple pulpwood 199 2
Black Spruce pulpwood 148
White Spruce pulpwood 6 25
Tamarack pulpwood 47



C19190041



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 17 F19-522126 Sale Administrator: Nate Anderson
Pike Lake Area
C19190042

Total Appraised: $23,326.67
Down Payment Required: $3,499.00

Twp. 52N Rge. 21W  Sec. 26

Total Acres: 37.5 Expires: 4/15/2022 46° 57.798' N  92° 57.640' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Spruce-Black 4.3 5.9 30.6
Tamarack 4.0 6.3 6.6

Comments:
Timber height, diameter and density all increase to the 
west and south through the sale.
There is additional timber available on adjacent private 
land. Contact sale administrator for more information.
A minimum of $1000 of the downpayment will be retained 
and will be held until satisfactory completion of the 
contract.

Access:
Sale access is off the Savanna Road approximately 1 mile north of the St. Vincent Road. The ditch will need to be packed with snow 
or bridged with dragline mats.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Black Spruce pulpwood 1170 Cords @ $19.15 = $22,405.50
Tamarack pulpwood 251 Cords @ $3.67 = $921.17

Total Appraised Value: $23,326.67



C19190042



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 18 F19-531705 Sale Administrator: Nate Anderson
Pike Lake Area
C19190043

Total Appraised: $63,586.75
Down Payment Required: $9,538.01

Twp. 53N Rge. 17W  Sec. 4, 5, 9 and Twp. 54N Rge. 17W  
Sec. 33, 34

Total Acres: 104.1 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 6.388' N  92° 30.514' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 6.5 12.2 23.1
Balsam Fir 3.6 7.5 4.4
Maple-Red 3.3 8.1 2.4
Spruce-Black 4.6 6.1 1.6
Birch 4.3 9.0 0.6
Spruce-White 6.5 16.3 0.4

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Access:
Access will be from  Lake Nichols Road on an existing winter road that extends to block 2A.

Block Operational Periods
1,2 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 2476 Cords @ $21.21 = $52,515.96
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 29 Cords @ $20.38 = $591.02
Balsam Fir pulpwood 470 Cords @ $12.38 = $5,818.60

SOAV Birch pulpwood 46 Cords @ $6.05 = $278.30
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 249 Cords @ $3.56 = $886.44

Black Spruce pulpwood 129 Cords @ $20.89 = $2,694.81
White Spruce pulpwood 43 Cords @ $17.34 = $745.62
Tamarack pulpwood 14 Cords @ $4.00 = $56.00

Total Appraised Value: $63,586.75

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Aspen pulpwood 1602 874
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 4 25
Balsam Fir pulpwood 185 285
Birch pulpwood 18 28
Red Maple pulpwood 75 174
Black Spruce pulpwood 129
White Spruce pulpwood 43
Tamarack pulpwood 14



C19190043



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 19 K19-531426 Sale Administrator: Tim Rutka
Pike Lake Area
C19190044

Total Appraised: $177,729.60
Down Payment Required: $26,659.44

Twp. 53N Rge. 14W  Sec. 23, 25, 26, 27

Total Acres: 374.2 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 2.901' N  92° 4.668' W
Blocks: 9

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.7 11.1 17.5
Maple-Sugar 3.2 9.4 3.7
Balsam Fir 3.2 8.2 1.5
Birch 3.8 10.7 1.4
Spruce-White 4.4 9.8 0.9
Spruce-Black 3.0 6.8 0.0

Comments:
The majority of the stand is uniform with smaller pockets 
of younger aspen inter-mixed with the mature overstory.  
Large white spruce scattered throughout the sale.

Access:
From Hwy 4, then east on the Thompson Lake Road, then to either the North Alden Lake Road or the Cannonball Lake Road.

Block Operational Periods
1,2,3,4,5,6,7,8,9 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 6725 Cords @ $22.97 = $154,473.25
Balsam Fir pulpwood 566 Cords @ $13.41 = $7,590.06

SOAV Birch pulpwood 492 Cords @ $6.55 = $3,222.60
SOAV Sugar Maple pulpwood 1280 Cords @ $4.43 = $5,670.40

Black Spruce pulpwood 13 Cords @ $22.63 = $294.19
White Spruce pulp & bolts 345 Cords @ $18.78 = $6,479.10

Total Appraised Value: $177,729.60

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3 Block 4 Block 5 Block 6 Block 7
Aspen pulpwood 682 825 1072 697 950 608 665
Balsam Fir pulpwood 69 62 50 72 25 23 240
Birch pulpwood 25 26 16 26 21 2 25
Sugar Maple pulpwood 70 65 38 73 31 29 8
Black Spruce pulpwood 1 1 10 1
White Spruce pulp & bolts 59 63 71 60 55 9 19

Volume Per Block Block 8 Block 9
Aspen pulpwood 688 538
Balsam Fir pulpwood 20 5
Birch pulpwood 297 54
Sugar Maple pulpwood 882 84
White Spruce pulp & bolts 9



C19190044



Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 20 K19-531508 Sale Administrator: Josh Carlson
Pike Lake Area
C19190045

Total Appraised: $1,610.00
Down Payment Required: $241.50

Twp. 53N Rge. 15W  Sec. 7, 8

Total Acres: 26 Expires: 4/15/2021 47° 5.242' N  92° 16.419' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Spruce-White 3.3 8.6 17.1
Balsam Fir 2.7 7.6 5.7
Birch 2.2 8.5 0.6
Aspen 3.5 8.2 0.6
Maple-Sugar 1.7 5.5 0.2
Maple-Red 3.5 9.0 0.2

Comments:
REDUCED PRICES

No skidding allowed. Forwarding only.

Equipment must be less than 12 feet wide.

Equipment travel swath is 15 feet maximum with 40 feet 
between swaths.

No extensions allowed.
Access:
Access is via the North Radio Forest Management Road and woods roads as shown on the sale map.

Block Operational Periods
1, 2 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
SOAV Ash pulpwood 7 Cords @ $5.00 = $35.00

Aspen pulpwood 16 Cords @ $5.00 = $80.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 152 Cords @ $5.00 = $760.00

SOAV Birch pulpwood 15 Cords @ $5.00 = $75.00
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 5 Cords @ $5.00 = $25.00
SOAV Sugar Maple pulpwood 5 Cords @ $5.00 = $25.00

White Spruce pulp & bolts 122 Cords @ $5.00 = $610.00
Total Appraised Value: $1,610.00

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Ash pulpwood 7
Aspen pulpwood 8 8
Balsam Fir pulpwood 101 51
Birch pulpwood 6 9
Red Maple pulpwood 5
Sugar Maple pulpwood 5
White Spruce pulp & bolts 73 49
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Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 21 K19-531632 Sale Administrator: Josh Carlson
Pike Lake Area
C19190046

Total Appraised: $3,390.00
Down Payment Required: $508.50

Twp. 53N Rge. 16W  Sec. 32

Total Acres: 36.5 Expires: 4/15/2021 47° 2.020' N  92° 24.289' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Pine-Norway 3.7 9.6 6.4
Aspen 3.4 8.3 3.4
Balsam Fir 2.7 6.9 3.2
Spruce-White 2.8 6.8 2.1
Birch 1.9 7.4 0.6
Oak-Red 2.2 8.3 0.3

Comments:
REDUCED PRICES

No Extensions will be allowed. 

No skidding allowed, forwarding only.

Equipment must be less than 12 feet wide.

There will be a 15 foot wide travel swath allowed between  
40 foot wide strips which will be thinned.

Access:
Acces is via a woods road running south from the Harris Forest Management Road 3 miles east of Hwy 53, as shown on the sale map.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

Operational Periods:
No extensions allowed.

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulp & bolts 124 Cords @ $5.00 = $620.00
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 4 Cords @ $5.00 = $20.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 117 Cords @ $5.00 = $585.00
Birch pulpwood 21 Cords @ $5.00 = $105.00
Red Maple pulpwood 1 Cords @ $5.00 = $5.00
Red Oak pulpwood 2 Cords @ $5.00 = $10.00
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 389 Cords @ $5.00 = $1,945.00
White Spruce pulpwood 20 Cords @ $5.00 = $100.00

Total Appraised Value: $3,390.00
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Sales Map

St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 22 K19-551407 Sale Administrator: Josh Carlson
Pike Lake Area
C19190047

Total Appraised: $3,050.00
Down Payment Required: $457.50

Twp. 55N Rge. 14W  Sec. 7 and Twp. 55N Rge. 15W  Sec. 
12

Total Acres: 40.3 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 16.038' N  92° 10.622' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Pine-Jack 2.5 7.0 5.2
Pine-Norway 3.4 9.2 4.3

Comments:
REDUCED PRICES

No skidding allowed. Forwarding only.

Equipment must be less than 12 feet wide.

No extensions.

Norway Pine bolts = 51% to 6 inch top.
Jack Pine bolts = 20% to a 6 inch top.

Access:
Access is via woods roads running south from Hwy 4 as shown on the sale map.

Block Operational Periods
1, 2 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 188 Cords @ $5.00 = $940.00
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 422 Cords @ $5.00 = $2,110.00

Total Appraised Value: $3,050.00

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 188
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 342 80
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Tract #: 23 B19-531333 Sale Administrator: Thomas Robertson
Pike Lake Area
C19190048

Total Appraised: $1,160.00
Down Payment Required: $174.00

Twp. 53N Rge. 13W  Sec. 33, 34

Total Acres: 13 Expires: 4/15/2021 47° 1.815' N  91° 59.144' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Pine-Norway 3.6 8.6 29.9
Balsam Fir 2.3 5.6 2.5
Spruce-White 3.2 6.8 1.3
Aspen 4.0 9.0 0.3

Comments:
No skidding will be allowed. Forwarding only.

Access:
We are using an existing access that is located approximately one half mile south west of the Fox Farm Road.
There may be an access developed through this sale to access the Timber Fox Sale; if this happens, the access may have to be shared.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground or Dry soil after road restrictions are lifted

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 3 Cords @ $5.00 = $15.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 33 Cords @ $5.00 = $165.00
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 180 Cords @ $5.00 = $900.00
White Spruce pulp & bolts 16 Cords @ $5.00 = $80.00

Total Appraised Value: $1,160.00
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St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction

Sales Package

Tract #: 24 B19-541222 Sale Administrator: Erik Anton
Pike Lake Area
C19190049

Total Appraised: $76,643.52
Down Payment Required: $11,496.53

Twp. 53N Rge. 12W  Sec. 14, 15, 23 and Twp. 54N Rge. 
12W  Sec. 21, 22, 23, 27

Total Acres: 218.6 Expires: 4/15/2022
Blocks: 5

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.9 10.5 14.1

Balsam Fir 2.7 5.4 4.3

Birch 4.1 5.4 2.0

Spruce-White 5.3 14.9 1.4

Spruce-Black 4.5 10.3 0.5

Maple-Red 2.8 (32.2) 0.2

Comments:
-Gopher State One must be contacted by purchaser prior to any work in Blocks 1 - 4. The underground powerline line as indicated on the map will
require a locate. Harvest activities may have restrictions around located lines. Locate is the responsibility of the purchaser.
-Balsam Fir is experiencing spruce budworm defoliation and some mortality in most of the sale area, contact seller for further details.
-A minimum of $1000 of the down payment will be retained and will be held until satisfactory completion of the contract.
-Access to Block 5 is through a locked gate, contact the Sale Administrator for access.
-Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is purchased as a scaled option.
-The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as advertised or to purchase all species Sold On Appraised Volume (SOAV).

Access:
Sale access will be off the Rossini Road and pre-existing woods roads. Block 1a will require some summer roading even if frozen ground harvested. 
The powerline right-of-way will be used for access as well. The St. Louis County Public Works Access Driveway Permit and its requirements become 
part of this contract.  This includes traffic control requirements for culvert installations. At the intersection of the Carr Road and the Rossini Road, 
head west through a locked gate onto the woods road. After a 1/2 mile turn right and continue on the woods road. Please contact the Sale 
Administrator for access through the gate.

Block Operational Periods

1 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

2, 3, 4 and 5 Frozen ground

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
SOAV Ash pulpwood 110 Cords @ $3.30 = $363.00

Aspen pulpwood 2964 Cords @ $19.44 = $57,620.16
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 58 Cords @ $18.68 = $1,083.44
Balsam Fir pulpwood 824 Cords @ $11.35 = $9,352.40

SOAV Birch pulpwood 380 Cords @ $5.54 = $2,105.20
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 42 Cords @ $3.26 = $136.92
SOAV Sugar Maple pulpwood 10 Cords @ $3.75 = $37.50

Black Spruce pulpwood 112 Cords @ $19.15 = $2,144.80
White Spruce pulp & bolts 239 Cords @ $15.90 = $3,800.10

Total Appraised Value: $76,643.52

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3 Block 4 Block 5
Ash pulpwood 110
Aspen pulpwood 725 609 615 654 361
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 3 16 39
Balsam Fir pulpwood 172 163 209 226 54
Birch pulpwood 179 49 81 12 59
Red Maple pulpwood 42
Sugar Maple pulpwood 10
Black Spruce pulpwood 9 76 27
White Spruce pulp & bolts 48 29 93 69
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St. Louis County May 09, 2019 Timber Auction
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Tract #: 25 B19-541305 Sale Administrator: Thomas Robertson
Pike Lake Area
C19190050

Total Appraised: $36,686.66
Down Payment Required: $5,503.00

Twp. 54N Rge. 13W  Sec. 5 and Twp. 55N Rge. 13W  Sec. 
32

Total Acres: 119 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 11.677' N  92° 1.091' W
Blocks: 3

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.4 12.9 9.6
Birch 4.6 10.6 8.7
Balsam Fir 3.2 7.7 2.9
Spruce-White 6.3 14.4 2.0
Spruce-Black 4.5 9.2 0.4
Balm Of Gilead 5.0 9.0 0.1

Comments:
The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 
purchased as a scaled option.

Access:
From Hwy 4 go east 4.25 miles to the woods road heading north towards the sale area.

Block Operational Periods
1,2,3 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulp & bolts 1136 Cords @ $19.44 = $22,083.84
Balm Of Gilead pulp & bolts 9 Cords @ $18.68 = $168.12
Balsam Fir pulp & bolts 344 Cords @ $11.35 = $3,904.40

SOAV Birch pulpwood 1030 Cords @ $5.54 = $5,706.20
Black Spruce pulp & bolts 46 Cords @ $19.15 = $880.90
White Spruce pulp & bolts 248 Cords @ $15.90 = $3,943.20

Total Appraised Value: $36,686.66

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3
Aspen pulp & bolts 274 580 282
Balm Of Gilead pulp & bolts 9
Balsam Fir pulp & bolts 74 177 93
Birch pulpwood 243 444 343
Black Spruce pulp & bolts 29 13 4
White Spruce pulp & bolts 132 89 27
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Tract #: 26 B19-541325 Sale Administrator: Daniel Preiner
Pike Lake Area
C19190051

Total Appraised: $87,415.90
Down Payment Required: $13,112.39

Twp. 54N Rge. 12W  Sec. 30 and Twp. 54N Rge. 13W  
Sec. 25, 26, 35

Total Acres: 250.2 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 7.846' N  91° 55.944' W
Blocks: 5

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 4.9 10.9 11.2
Spruce-Black 4.4 9.4 3.4
Birch 3.4 8.6 2.0
Balsam Fir 2.1 6.5 1.5
Pine-White 6.1 19.6 0.8
Pine-Norway 6.5 21.5 0.7

Comments:
-The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).
-Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if sale is purchased 
as a scaled option.
-A minimum of $1,000.00 of the downpayment will be 
retained and will be held until satisfactory completion of 
the contract.

Access:
Sale is accessed off of Hwy 44 on the Frontier Trail just north of the Pequaywan Lake Inn.

Block Operational Periods
1,2,3 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st
4,5 Frozen ground

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 2793 Cords @ $19.44 = $54,295.92
Balsam Fir pulpwood 360 Cords @ $11.35 = $4,086.00
Birch pulpwood 513 Cords @ $5.54 = $2,842.02
Norway Pine pulpwood 176 Cords @ $32.91 = $5,792.16
White Pine pulpwood 207 Cords @ $23.80 = $4,926.60
Black Spruce pulpwood 808 Cords @ $19.15 = $15,473.20

Total Appraised Value: $87,415.90

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3 Block 4 Block 5
Aspen pulpwood 457 499 534 370 933
Balsam Fir pulpwood 88 68 27 47 130
Birch pulpwood 156 103 102 85 67
Norway Pine pulpwood 28 136 12
White Pine pulpwood 141 60 6
Black Spruce pulpwood 157 106 154 198 193
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Tract #: 27 B19-541330 Sale Administrator: Josh Carlson
Pike Lake Area
C19190052

Total Appraised: $34,440.14
Down Payment Required: $5,166.02

Twp. 53N Rge. 13W  Sec. 6, 30 and Twp. 54N Rge. 13W  
Sec. 30, 31 and Twp. 54N Rge. 14W  Sec. 25

Total Acres: 156 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 7.338' N  92° 2.504' W
Blocks: 5

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.0 10.8 7.8
Birch 3.8 9.3 3.7
Balsam Fir 3.0 7.6 3.4
Maple-Red 2.9 10.3 0.5
Spruce-White 4.8 14.5 0.5
Balm Of Gilead 6.7 11.7 0.1

Comments:
All sale blocks have good summer access with no road 
work needed to get to sale.

Access:
Sale is accessed from Hwy 4 then east on the Carrol Trail, the road will split.  Half the sale is accessed from the north branch Carrol 
Trail, the south half of the sale will be accessed from the southern branch of the Carrol Trail.  The sale blocks are both 4.5 miles from  
Hwy 4.

Block Operational Periods
1,2,3,4 and 5 Frozen ground or dry soil after July 1st.

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulp & bolts 1182 Cords @ $19.44 = $22,978.08
Balm Of Gilead pulp & bolts 14 Cords @ $18.68 = $261.52
Balsam Fir pulp & bolts 516 Cords @ $11.35 = $5,856.60

SOAV Birch pulpwood 614 Cords @ $5.54 = $3,401.56
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 89 Cords @ $3.26 = $290.14

Norway Pine pulp & bolts 4 Cords @ $32.91 = $131.64
Black Spruce pulpwood 8 Cords @ $19.15 = $153.20
White Spruce pulp & bolts 86 Cords @ $15.90 = $1,367.40

Total Appraised Value: $34,440.14

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3 Block 4 Block 5
Aspen pulp & bolts 477 148 135 84 338
Balm Of Gilead pulp & bolts 7 7
Balsam Fir pulp & bolts 66 86 78 53 233
Birch pulpwood 29 227 207 88 63
Red Maple pulpwood 7 34 31 17
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 4
Black Spruce pulpwood 8
White Spruce pulp & bolts 26 24 36
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Tract #: 28 B19-551312 Sale Administrator: Thomas Robertson
Pike Lake Area
C19190053

Total Appraised: $75,810.03
Down Payment Required: $11,371.50

Twp. 55N Rge. 13W  Sec. 1, 11, 12

Total Acres: 168 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 15.892' N  91° 55.885' W
Blocks: 4

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 5.1 10.7 10.1
Pine-Jack 4.3 8.8 7.3
Balsam Fir 3.4 8.6 3.1
Spruce-Black 4.5 9.6 1.5
Birch 4.3 11.1 1.3
Spruce-White 5.1 11.1 1.1

Access:
Access is from the Brimson Road.
Block 1 will need approximately 500 feet of new road constrution to access this block. 
Block 2 , 3 and 4 have established access into them already that will need some upgrading to be useable.

Block Operational Periods
4 Frozen ground
1and 2 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

Operational Periods:
Operation must occur in Block 3 during FROZEN GROUND conditions, or during  DRY SOIL conditions from September 15th to frozen 
ground.

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulp & bolts 1622 Cords @ $21.21 = $34,402.62
Balm Of Gilead pulp & bolts 47 Cords @ $20.38 = $957.86
Balsam Fir pulp & bolts 505 Cords @ $12.38 = $6,251.90

SOAV Birch pulpwood 160 Cords @ $6.05 = $968.00
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 6 Cords @ $3.56 = $21.36

Jack Pine pulp & bolts 1196 Cords @ $19.78 = $23,656.88
Black Spruce pulp & bolts 293 Cords @ $20.89 = $6,120.77
White Spruce pulp & bolts 196 Cords @ $17.34 = $3,398.64
Tamarack pulp & bolts 8 Cords @ $4.00 = $32.00

Total Appraised Value: $75,810.03

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3 Block 4
Aspen pulp & bolts 734 599 97 192
Balm Of Gilead pulp & bolts 15 3 29
Balsam Fir pulp & bolts 228 124 91 62
Birch pulpwood 114 46
Red Maple pulpwood 5 1
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 11 1166 19
Black Spruce pulp & bolts 5 3 36 249
White Spruce pulp & bolts 58 11 61 66
Tamarack pulp & bolts 8
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Tract #: 29 B19-551322 Sale Administrator: Daniel Preiner
Pike Lake Area
C19190054

Total Appraised: $62,840.82
Down Payment Required: $9,426.12

Twp. 55N Rge. 13W  Sec. 14, 15, 22, 23

Total Acres: 156.5 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 14.113' N  91° 57.771' W
Blocks: 4

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Spruce-Black 4.0 9.6 11.9
Aspen 5.4 13.6 5.2
Tamarack 4.5 11.2 2.5
Balsam Fir 1.8 5.8 2.1
Pine-Jack 5.6 13.2 1.1
Birch 3.8 10.1 1.0

Comments:
Birch will be sold as Sold On Appraised Volume (SOAV).

The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 
advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree 
chipping/grinding will not be allowed if sale is purchased 
as a scaled option.

Access:
This sale is off of a spur road on the Berry Creek Mgt Rd.  It is 2.2 miles from the Brimson Rd.

Block Operational Periods
1,3,4 Frozen ground
2 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 836 Cords @ $19.44 = $16,251.84
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 9 Cords @ $18.68 = $168.12
Balsam Fir pulpwood 325 Cords @ $11.35 = $3,688.75

SOAV Birch pulpwood 161 Cords @ $5.54 = $891.94
Jack Pine pulpwood 153 Cords @ $18.13 = $2,773.89
Black Spruce pulpwood 1938 Cords @ $19.15 = $37,112.70
White Spruce pulpwood 25 Cords @ $15.90 = $397.50
Tamarack pulpwood 424 Cords @ $3.67 = $1,556.08

Total Appraised Value: $62,840.82

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2 Block 3 Block 4
Aspen pulpwood 154 199 360 123
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 9
Balsam Fir pulpwood 117 135 38 35
Birch pulpwood 39 86 24 12
Jack Pine pulpwood 140 13
Black Spruce pulpwood 496 57 433 952
White Spruce pulpwood 9 6 10
Tamarack pulpwood 62 45 317
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Tract #: 30 B19-551331 Sale Administrator: Erik Anton
Pike Lake Area
C19190055

Total Appraised: $16,542.26
Down Payment Required: $2,481.34

Twp. 55N Rge. 13W  Sec. 30, 31 and Twp. 54N Rge. 14W  
Sec. 25

Total Acres: 35 Expires: 4/15/2022 47° 12.743' N  92° 2.702' W
Blocks: 1

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Pine-Norway 6.9 18.3 10.5
Pine-White 6.9 20.9 7.1
Balsam Fir 2.3 6.2 2.4
Aspen 5.3 12.4 2.1
Birch 4.0 10.3 1.8
Spruce-White 4.9 11.6 1.0

Comments:
A portion of this sale is a red pine/white pine overstory 
removal and will be clearcut with the rest of the sale.

Access:
Access will be the Marshall Trail off Hwy 4. A DNR upland woods road will be used to access sale area. 0.3 miles of new road will 
need to be constructed once on county land.

Block Operational Periods
1 Frozen ground or dry soil after July 1st or dry soil after road restrictions are lifted.

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
Aspen pulpwood 72 Cords @ $17.67 = $1,272.24
Balsam Fir pulpwood 86 Cords @ $10.32 = $887.52

SOAV Birch pulpwood 68 Cords @ $5.04 = $342.72
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 18 Cords @ $16.48 = $296.64
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 359 Cords @ $29.92 = $10,741.28
White Pine pulp & bolts 93 Cords @ $21.63 = $2,011.59
Black Spruce pulpwood 27 Cords @ $17.41 = $470.07
White Spruce pulp & bolts 36 Cords @ $14.45 = $520.20

Total Appraised Value: $16,542.26
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Tract #: 31 K19-531431 Sale Administrator: Tim Rutka
Pike Lake Area
C19190056

Total Appraised: $10,234.05
Down Payment Required: $1,535.11

Twp. 53N Rge. 14W  Sec. 31, 32

Total Acres: 27.6 Expires: 4/15/2020 47° 2.297' N  92° 9.283' W
Blocks: 2

Species Sticks Dia. Cords/ac
Aspen 3.8 9.8 9.6
Pine-White 6.2 21.0 4.8
Balsam Fir 2.2 6.6 1.8
Ash 3.0 7.4 1.7
Balm Of Gilead 3.5 7.9 1.2
Maple-Red 2.6 8.4 0.9

Comments:
Block 1 must be harvested by July 1, 2019 and Block 2 by 
April 15, 2020. No Extensions will be allowed.

Access:
Sale must be accessed through the Boulder Lake Pit.

Block Operational Periods
1 All season, any time
2 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st

SOAV Product No Bid Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Total For All Blocks
SOAV Ash pulpwood 50 Cords @ $3.30 = $165.00

Aspen pulpwood 263 Cords @ $19.44 = $5,112.72
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 36 Cords @ $18.68 = $672.48

SOAV Balsam Fir pulpwood 48 Cords @ $11.35 = $544.80
SOAV Birch pulpwood 3 Cords @ $5.54 = $16.62
SOAV Elm pulpwood 1 Cords @ $3.30 = $3.30
SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 26 Cords @ $3.26 = $84.76

Norway Pine pulp & bolts 7 Cords @ $32.91 = $230.37
White Pine pulp & bolts 131 Cords @ $23.80 = $3,117.80
White Spruce pulp & bolts 18 Cords @ $15.90 = $286.20

Total Appraised Value: $10,234.05

Volume Per Block Block 1 Block 2
Ash pulpwood 41 9
Aspen pulpwood 65 198
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 34 2
Balsam Fir pulpwood 2 46
Birch pulpwood 3
Elm pulpwood 1
Red Maple pulpwood 9 17
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 7
White Pine pulp & bolts 29 102
White Spruce pulp & bolts 9 9
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