
March 2026 - FIRE SALE - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Basic Sale Price Sale Amount

1 D22250182 130098 NO BID $2,600.00 -

2 D22240110 130096 NO BID $4,300.00 -

3 D22250183 130095 NO BID $1,300.00 -

4 D22240004 122746 Dennis S. Dagger $3,600.00 $3,600.00

5 D22240009 123597 Dennis S. Dagger $3,100.00 $3,100.00

6 D22240113 123598 NO BID $12,700.00 -

7 D22240005 125331 NO BID $37,700.00 -

8 D22250036 123605;123606 NO BID $28,000.00 -

9 D22250185 123114 NO BID $28,000.00 -

10 D22250037 123607 NO BID $10,600.00 -

11 D22250187 130080 NO BID $400.00 -

12 D22250188 130079 NO BID $200.00 -

13 D22250189 125360 NO BID $2,400.00 -

14 D22250190 130049 NO BID $900.00 -

15 D22240123 124061 NO BID $3,000.00 -

16 D22240124 122755 Chad M. Binsfield $300.00 $7,500.00

Page 1 of 72026-03-04



March 2026 - FIRE SALE - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Basic Sale Price Sale Amount

17 D22250191 125366 NO BID $500.00 -

18 D22250192 130016 Nick Harambasic $100.00 $100.00

19 D22250193 125370 NO BID $600.00 -

20 D22250194 125371 Richard C. Johnson $200.00 $200.00

21 D22250195 130010 NO BID $13,100.00 -

22 D22250087 130601 NO BID $99,500.00 -

23 D22250088 130755 NO BID $83,300.00 -

24 D22250196 130000 NO BID $19,100.00 -

25 D22250091 123628 NO BID $18,200.00 -

26 D22240011 122763 Nick Harambasic $13,900.00 $13,900.00

27 D22240131 125386 John I. Carline $700.00 $710.00

28 D22240132 125387 John I. Carline $700.00 $710.00

29 D22240133 125388 Kjell Peterson $3,800.00 $3,800.00

30 D22240134 125389 Kjell Peterson $4,800.00 $4,800.00

31 D22240135 125390 NO BID $6,800.00 -

32 D22240136 125391 NO BID $6,900.00 -
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33 D22240012 125392 NO BID $7,400.00 -

34 D22240013 125393;130009 NO BID $13,900.00 -

35 D22250198 130008 Shelle A. Stewart $300.00 $300.00

36 D22250199 130021 NO BID $1,700.00 -

38 D22250201 130036 NO BID $1,100.00 -

39 D22250110 130605 NO BID $40,500.00 -

41 D22250203 130047 Jon Yang $100.00 $107.50

42 D22250204 130046 NO BID $600.00 -

43 D22250228 125399;125400 NO BID $15,400.00 -

44 D22250229 130606 NO BID $7,700.00 -

45 D22250230 130042 NO BID $7,400.00 -

46 D22250231 130040;130041 NO BID $11,800.00 -

47 D22250232 130039 NO BID $4,900.00 -

48 D22250205 130038 NO BID $4,100.00 -

49 D22250227 125403 NO BID $52,900.00 -

50 D22240141 130035 Adam Trujillo $3,300.00 $3,300.00
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51 D22250233 125406 NO BID $17,600.00 -

52 D22250207 124068 NO BID $33,600.00 -

53 D22250234 125407 Rodney C. Knutson $100.00 $290.50

54 D22240148 130153 NO BID $17,400.00 -

55 D22240149 123147 NO BID $8,500.00 -

56 D22240150 123148 NO BID $8,500.00 -

57 D22240151 123149 NO BID $9,100.00 -

58 D22240233 130103 NO BID $2,300.00 -

59 D22240154 125409 NO BID $20,500.00 -

60 D22240157 123153 NO BID $5,600.00 -

62 D22240159 123652 NO BID $8,000.00 -

63 D22250235 130433 NO BID $31,300.00 -

64 D22250236 130437 NO BID $26,900.00 -

65 D22250237 122786 NO BID $51,500.00 -

66 D22250238 130448 NO BID $56,100.00 -

67 D22240180 125437 NO BID $51,000.00 -
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68 D22240181 123686 NO BID $46,000.00 -

69 D22250209 130056 Nick Harambasic $2,000.00 $2,000.00

70 D22250239 130195 NO BID $8,300.00 -

71 D22250240 130470 NO BID $123,600.00 -

72 D22250241 124104 NO BID $2,800.00 -

73 D22240044 130643 NO BID $53,700.00 -

74 D22240046 130644 NO BID $2,500.00 -

75 D22250242 123206 NO BID $26,600.00 -

76 D22250243 130645 NO BID $37,400.00 -

77 D22250244 125468 NO BID $14,700.00 -

78 D22240055 130646 NO BID $97,300.00 -

79 D22250245 130479 NO BID $17,500.00 -

80 D22240062 123216 Nick Harambasic $1,900.00 $1,900.00

81 D22250161 130659 NO BID $38,600.00 -

82 D22250166 124150 NO BID $55,400.00 -

83 D22250246 130126 Linda Lee Iverson and Daniel William 
Iverson $9,100.00 $15,101.00
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84 D22250167 130495 NO BID $39,500.00 -

85 D22240064 123225 NO BID $18,200.00 -

86 D22250247 123226 Alyvia Follett $13,600.00 $13,600.00

87 D22250211 130497 NO BID $900.00 -

88 D22250248 124165 Cassidy M. Koski $37,400.00 $46,401.00

89 D22250005 122842;122843 Friends of Sax-Zim Bog $55,000.00 $55,000.00

90 D22250212 130665 NO BID $2,100.00 -

91 D22240097 130114 NO BID $10,400.00 -

92 D22250214 123266 NO BID $3,100.00 -

93 D22240205 123763 NO BID $6,700.00 -

94 D22240206 122866 NO BID $56,500.00 -

95 D22240236 130685 NO BID $32,400.00 -

96 D22240237 130149 Nick Harambasic $35,000.00 $35,000.00

97 D22240076 123764 NO BID $51,400.00 -

98 D22250217 125497 Nick Harambasic $16,200.00 $16,200.00

99 D22250224 130693 Dean E. Townley and Trent Townley $84,000.00 $84,000.00
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100 D22240100 123287 NO BID $12,200.00 -

101 D22240101 130695;130696 NO BID $28,600.00 -

102 D22250219 123302 Great Plains Oil Co. $100.00 $100.00

104 D22240083 130710 NO BID $45,900.00 -

105 D22240086 123809 Paul Bryant Fisher $21,400.00 $31,100.00

106 D22250249 130967 NO BID $44,000.00 -

Total Tracts 106

Pulled Tracts 4

Total Value $2,126,400.00 

Pulled Tracts Value           $42,000.00

Net Total Tracts 102 Net Total Value $2,084,400.00 $342,820.00

Total Tracts Sold 25

Percent of Net Total Tracts Sold 24.51% Percent of Net Total Value Sold 16.45%
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