February 2020 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22190167 123584 NO BID $4,125.00 $0.00
2 C22190288 9000002616  Matthew Gerald Dodd $40,500.00 $40,500.00
3 C22190287 123588 NO BID $8,825.00 $0.00
4 C22190290 100432 Brandon Victor Saarela $8,250.00 $8,250.00
5 C22190168 100467 NO BID $4,600.00 $0.00
6 C22190293 121876 Rare-Rock Investments, LLC $33,200.00 $50,000.00
7 C22190258 123611 Hazelnut Investment $44,300.00 $65,000.00
8 C22190255 101531 Steven Jess Kenworthy and Dorthea Anna $4,500.00 $4,500.00
9 C22190259 101591 NO BID $27,450.00 $0.00
10 C22190260 101595 Alex Lee Havron $3,300.00 $3,300.00
11 C22190254 101606 Floyd Patrick Ralph, Jr $1,425.00 $1,425.00
12 C22190170 101660 NO BID $24,250.00 $0.00
13 C22190276 9000002611 Sara Jo Oliver and Ladondray D. Moore $12,000.00 $16,000.00
14 C22190242 104412 John Alan Paaso $5,250.00 $5,250.00
15 C22190277 123662 NO BID $3,450.00 $0.00
16 C22190174 105008 Todd Anthony Scaia $1,525.00 $2,700.00
17 C22190247 123670 Roger J. Nyquist and Deborah N. Nyquist $11,400.00 $11,400.00
18 C22190251 123671 Charles Cavour Lenich $2,550.00 $2,550.00
19 C22190278 123571 Frank Malich $4,500.00 $4,500.00
20 C22190249 123684 NO BID $56,800.00 $0.00
21 C22190178 123186 NO BID $4,053.14 $0.00
22 C22190179 123194 NO BID $1,350.00 $0.00
23 C22190245 122205 NO BID $7,575.00 $0.00
24 C22190211 122804 Eric Thomas Burckhardt $2,850.00 $2,850.00
25 C22190275 123081 NO BID $5,625.00 $0.00
26 C22190180 123697 NO BID $5,150.00 $0.00
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27 C22190207 9000002511  NO BID $7,800.00 $0.00
28 C22190212 123204 NO BID $6,450.00 $0.00
29 C22190213 9000002531  NO BID $13,425.00 $0.00
30 C22190182 120970 NO BID $5,150.00 $0.00
31 C22190086 123703 NO BID $20,320.00 $0.00
32 C22190183 123211 NO BID $4,700.00 $0.00
33 C22190078 123708 NO BID $16,000.00 $0.00
34 C22190184 117699 NO BID $7,100.00 $0.00
35 C22190208 106042 NO BID $6,600.00 $0.00
36 C22190209 106043 NO BID $9,750.00 $0.00
37 C22180295 106081 Diane Rose Martinek $200.00 $200.00
38 C22190186 106094 NO BID $1,500.00 $0.00
39 C22190187 106111 Bradlee Allan Elno Koski $550.00 $550.00
40 C22190188 106112 Bradlee Allan Elno Koski $550.00 $550.00
41 C22190153 123713 NO BID $23,400.00 $0.00
42 C22170277 122070 NO BID $425.00 $0.00
43 C22190210 9000002512  Andrea Rae Aubin $6,900.00 $6,900.00
44 C22190264 122831 NO BID $17,050.00 $0.00
45 C22190250 122832 Timothy Scott-Allan Davich $55,800.00 $55,300.00
46 C22190246 107833 NO BID $156,900.00 $0.00
47 C22190252 123234 Michael James Carpentier and Paula Jean $3,300.00 $5,500.00
48 (22190243 123723 Michael James Carpentier and Paula Jean $5,475.00 $5,475.00
49 C22190244 123725 Victoria Anne Ranua $4,725.00 $4,725.00
50 C22190274 123239 Kevin Scott Amendola $14,700.00 $28,500.00
51 C22190257 123730 NO BID $14,450.00 $0.00
52 C22190265 123731 NO BID $27,825.00 $0.00
53 C22190191 9000002452 Steven B. Pearson Rovocable Trust u/d/t J $630.00 $10,000.00
54 C22190193 109408 NO BID $13,600.00 $0.00
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55 C22190289 109509 David Douglas Horvath $17,175.00 $17,175.00
56 C22190281 110533 NO BID $9,750.00 $0.00
57 22190285 118133 NO BID $26,325.00 $0.00
58 C22190253 110902 NO BID $25,350.00 $0.00
59 C22190282 9000002613 NO BID $2,250.00 $0.00
60 C22190283 9000002614 NO BID $8,475.00 $0.00
61 C22190261 113563 NO BID $15,300.00 $0.00
62 C22190267 123799 Christopher Timothy Whiting and Michel $34,875.00 $40,000.00
63 C22190268 123800 NO BID $15,000.00 $0.00
64 C22190284 123812 Terry Alan Kamunen $3,975.00 $3,975.00
65 C22190295 122906 NO BID $24,300.00 $0.00

Total Tracts 65 Total Value $956,853.14

Pulled Tracts 0 Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Available Tracts 65 Net Total Value $956,853.14 $397,575.00

Total Tracts Sold 27

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 41.54%

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 41.55%
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