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Sealed Bid Auction 
 

  

    
 

Tract Contract Round 
Offered 

Round 
Sold 

Bidder Appraised 
Price 

Bidup Sold Price Down 
Payment

1 C19200001   Mike Nielsen 
Logging

$8,176.71 9% $8,894.03 $1,226.51

2 C19200002   Lone Pine 
Logging

$23,399.23 58% $36,951.99 $3,509.88

3 C19200003   Bud Strandberg $24,864.07 61% $39,939.80 $3,729.61

4 C19200004   Rutar Logging Llc $12,575.08 2% $12,769.35 $1,886.26

5 C19200005   No Bid $46,783.00    

6 C19200006   Truaxe Forest 
Harvesting LLC 

$13,862.59 40% $19,409.14 $2,079.39

7 C19200007   L. Murphy 
Construct. Inc.

$31,323.22 48% $46,354.74 $4,698.48

8 C19200008   Verso Paper Corp. $17,213.98 39% $23,872.42 $2,582.10

9 C19200009   Truaxe Forest 
Harvesting LLC 

$22,591.74 30% $29,367.54 $3,388.76

10 C19200010   Lone Pine 
Logging

$32,148.07 64% $52,734.00 $4,822.21

11 C19200011   UPM Blandin 
Forestry

$47,212.32 49% $70,536.50 $7,081.85

12 C19200012   Futurewood 
Corporation

$33,912.00 55% $52,468.20 $5,086.80

13 C19200013   Jatco Inc. $23,242.02 53% $35,487.10 $3,486.30

14 C19200014   Island Lake 
Logging

$39,800.43 49% $59,342.56 $5,970.06

15 C19200015   Fjeran Forest 
Products Llc

$40,060.84 12% $44,749.88 $6,009.13

16 C19200016   Futurewood 
Corporation

$101,245.33 66% $168,145.21 $15,186.80

17 C19200017   Sappi Fine Paper $56,227.44 100% $112,186.40 $8,434.12

18 C19200018   Island Lake 
Logging

$1,193.61 329% $5,119.65 $179.04

19 C19200019   Carlson Timber 
Products

$12,416.01 157% $31,920.00 $1,862.40

20 C19200020   Hull Forest 
Products

$17,683.66 73% $30,626.36 $2,652.55

21 C19200021   Hull Forest 
Products

$3,895.00 0% $3,902.79 $584.25

22 C19200022   No Bid $920.00    

23 C19200023   Carlson Timber 
Products

$17,504.31 139% $41,760.00 $2,625.65

24 C19200024   No Bid $59,875.30    

25 C19200025   No Bid $21,418.69    

26 C19200026   Hull Forest 
Products

$10,398.90 17% $12,115.00 $1,559.84

 

 



Total Offered: $719,943.55   

Average Bid up:  66%   

Total: $590,946.56  $938,652.66 $88,641.98
 

 

  

 

 



PIKE LAKE AREA

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Appraised

Total Sold

ASH 1,438 1,438 $3.30 $3.68 $4,745.40 $5,285.89

ASPEN 11,873 11,873 $19.18 $32.14 $227,741.68 $381,641.62

BALM OF GILEAD 259 259 $18.68 $27.46 $4,838.12 $7,111.65

BALSAM FIR 2,004 2,000 $11.05 $17.22 $22,139.38 $34,442.14

BASSWOOD 15 15 $4.34 $5.00 $65.10 $75.00

BIRCH 3,820 3,820 $5.53 $11.15 $21,125.26 $42,593.36

MAPLE-RED 1,649 1,649 $3.26 $9.25 $5,371.39 $15,253.44

MAPLE-SUGAR 567 567 $3.57 $12.84 $2,024.25 $7,280.92

PINE-NORWAY 1,215 1,037 $16.35 $20.70 $19,865.65 $21,469.63

PINE-WHITE 28 26 $19.77 $20.92 $553.60 $543.86

SPRUCE-BLACK 6,160 1,726 $18.40 $30.89 $113,328.64 $53,316.43

SPRUCE-WHITE 1,060 1,060 $15.77 $26.93 $16,716.25 $28,548.64

TAMARACK 2,728 71 $0.47 $3.67 $1,278.82 $260.57

Totals 32,816 25,541 $439,793.54 $597,823.15

Feb, 27, 2020 Timber Auction Results



VIRGINIA AREA

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Appraised

Total Sold

ASH 255 219 $3.08 $3.04 $784.50 $665.70

ASPEN 8,766 7,291 $18.82 $28.53 $164,973.60 $208,047.56

BALM OF GILEAD 90 87 $18.06 $29.72 $1,625.65 $2,585.76

BALSAM FIR 1,494 1,448 $11.50 $15.90 $17,181.44 $23,017.46

BIRCH 1,192 1,133 $5.21 $7.54 $6,215.52 $8,537.60

MAPLE-RED 675 609 $3.03 $4.74 $2,047.21 $2,888.77

PINE-JACK 154 103 $17.03 $19.35 $2,622.07 $1,992.85

PINE-NORWAY 819 698 $31.69 $35.68 $25,957.62 $24,907.03

SPRUCE-BLACK 1,629 1,613 $18.43 $25.93 $30,019.11 $41,825.28

SPRUCE-WHITE 1,054 969 $16.41 $25.07 $17,295.10 $24,297.25

TAMARACK 310 310 $3.62 $6.66 $1,122.79 $2,064.25

Totals 16,438 14,480 $269,844.61 $340,829.51



Total County

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Appraised

Total Sold

ASH 1,693 1,657 $3.27 $3.59 $5,529.90 $5,951.59

ASPEN 20,639 19,164 $19.03 $30.77 $392,715.28 $589,689.18

BALM OF GILEAD 349 346 $18.52 $28.03 $6,463.77 $9,697.41

BALSAM FIR 3,498 3,448 $11.24 $16.66 $39,320.82 $57,459.60

BASSWOOD 15 15 $4.34 $5.00 $65.10 $75.00

BIRCH 5,012 4,953 $5.46 $10.32 $27,340.78 $51,130.96

MAPLE-RED 2,324 2,258 $3.19 $8.03 $7,418.60 $18,142.21

MAPLE-SUGAR 567 567 $3.57 $12.84 $2,024.25 $7,280.92

PINE-JACK 154 103 $17.03 $19.35 $2,622.07 $1,992.85

PINE-NORWAY 2,034 1,735 $22.53 $26.73 $45,823.27 $46,376.66

PINE-WHITE 461 26 $23.56 $20.92 $10,859.00 $543.86

SPRUCE-BLACK 7,789 3,339 $18.40 $28.49 $143,347.75 $95,141.71

SPRUCE-WHITE 2,114 2,029 $16.09 $26.05 $34,011.35 $52,845.89

TAMARACK 3,038 381 $0.79 $6.10 $2,401.61 $2,324.82

Totals 49,687 40,021 $719,943.55 $938,652.66



Sealed Bid Results Detail
February 27, 2020

Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 1 C19200001

Mike Nielsen Logging

ASPEN 17.67 17.67 17.00 Cds $300.39

BIRCH 5.04 6.00 12.00 Cds $72.00

PINE-NORWAY 29.92 32.77 244.00 Cds $7,995.88

PINE-JACK 16.48 17.00 20.00 Cds $340.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 10.32 18.00 Cds $185.76

$8,894.03 *Winner*

Tract 2 C19200002

Lone Pine Logging

ASH 3.00 3.00 190.00 Cds $570.00

ASPEN 17.67 28.00 897.00 Cds $25,116.00

BIRCH 5.04 8.00 307.00 Cds $2,456.00

BALM OF GILEAD 17.67 28.00 55.00 Cds $1,540.00

MAPLE-RED 2.97 5.00 296.00 Cds $1,480.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 22.00 140.00 Cds $3,080.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 18.00 150.00 Cds $2,700.00

TAMARACK 3.33 3.33 3.00 Cds $9.99

$36,951.99 *Winner*

Boise White Paper LLC

ASH 3.00 4.12 190.00 Cds $782.80

ASPEN 17.67 18.79 897.00 Cds $16,854.63

BIRCH 5.04 6.16 307.00 Cds $1,891.12

BALM OF GILEAD 17.67 18.79 55.00 Cds $1,033.45

MAPLE-RED 2.97 4.09 296.00 Cds $1,210.64

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 15.57 140.00 Cds $2,179.80

BALSAM FIR 10.32 11.44 150.00 Cds $1,716.00

TAMARACK 3.33 4.45 3.00 Cds $13.35

$25,681.79  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 3 C19200003

Bud Strandberg

ASPEN 19.44 32.68 1053.00 Cds $34,412.04

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 4.00 Cds $40.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 32.68 32.00 Cds $1,045.76

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 2.00 Cds $20.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 24.00 23.00 Cds $552.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.00 184.00 Cds $2,208.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 24.00 68.00 Cds $1,632.00

TAMARACK 3.67 10.00 3.00 Cds $30.00

$39,939.80 *Winner*

Boise White Paper LLC

ASPEN 19.44 32.15 1053.00 Cds $33,853.95

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 4.00 Cds $24.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 32.15 32.00 Cds $1,028.80

MAPLE-RED 3.26 6.00 2.00 Cds $12.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.00 23.00 Cds $460.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.05 184.00 Cds $2,217.20

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 20.00 68.00 Cds $1,360.00

TAMARACK 3.67 4.00 3.00 Cds $12.00

$38,967.95  

Futurewood Corporation

ASPEN 19.44 19.44 1053.00 Cds $20,470.32

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 4.00 Cds $22.16

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 19.44 32.00 Cds $622.08

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 2.00 Cds $6.52

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 19.15 23.00 Cds $440.45

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.86 184.00 Cds $2,182.24

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 19.15 68.00 Cds $1,302.20

TAMARACK 3.67 3.67 3.00 Cds $11.01

$25,056.98  

Lone Pine Logging

ASPEN 19.44 28.00 1053.00 Cds $29,484.00

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 4.00 Cds $22.16

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 28.00 32.00 Cds $896.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 2.00 Cds $6.52

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 22.00 23.00 Cds $506.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALSAM FIR 11.35 18.00 184.00 Cds $3,312.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 22.00 68.00 Cds $1,496.00

TAMARACK 3.67 3.67 3.00 Cds $11.01

$35,733.69  

Shermer Logging

ASPEN 19.44 27.60 1053.00 Cds $29,062.80

BIRCH 5.54 8.00 4.00 Cds $32.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 25.00 32.00 Cds $800.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 8.00 2.00 Cds $16.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 21.00 23.00 Cds $483.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 14.00 184.00 Cds $2,576.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 21.00 68.00 Cds $1,428.00

TAMARACK 3.67 5.00 3.00 Cds $15.00

$34,412.80  

Wagner Construction Inc.

ASPEN 19.44 25.00 1053.00 Cds $26,325.00

BIRCH 5.54 5.75 4.00 Cds $23.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 23.00 32.00 Cds $736.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.50 2.00 Cds $7.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 16.00 23.00 Cds $368.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.50 184.00 Cds $2,116.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 19.25 68.00 Cds $1,309.00

TAMARACK 3.67 3.75 3.00 Cds $11.25

$30,895.25  

Tract 4 C19200004

Rutar Logging Llc

ASH 3.30 3.30 29.00 Cds $95.70

ASPEN 19.44 20.00 202.00 Cds $4,040.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 35.00 Cds $210.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 54.00 Cds $176.04

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 32.91 171.00 Cds $5,627.61

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 16.00 101.00 Cds $1,616.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.00 82.00 Cds $984.00

TAMARACK 3.67 4.00 5.00 Cds $20.00

$12,769.35 *Winner*

Boise White Paper LLC

ASH 3.30 3.50 29.00 Cds $101.50



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

ASPEN 19.44 19.65 202.00 Cds $3,969.30

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 35.00 Cds $210.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.50 54.00 Cds $189.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 33.00 171.00 Cds $5,643.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 16.00 101.00 Cds $1,616.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.50 82.00 Cds $943.00

TAMARACK 3.67 4.00 5.00 Cds $20.00

$12,691.80  

Tract 6 C19200006

Truaxe Forest Harvesting LLC 

ASPEN 17.67 24.74 441.00 Cds $10,910.34

BIRCH 5.04 7.06 68.00 Cds $480.08

MAPLE-RED 2.97 4.16 2.00 Cds $8.32

PINE-NORWAY 29.92 41.89 186.00 Cds $7,791.54

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 20.23 6.00 Cds $121.38

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 24.37 4.00 Cds $97.48

$19,409.14 *Winner*

Mike Nielsen Logging

ASPEN 17.67 17.67 441.00 Cds $7,792.47

BIRCH 5.04 5.04 68.00 Cds $342.72

MAPLE-RED 2.97 3.00 2.00 Cds $6.00

PINE-NORWAY 29.92 30.00 186.00 Cds $5,580.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 15.50 6.00 Cds $93.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 18.50 4.00 Cds $74.00

$13,888.19  

Shermer Logging

ASPEN 17.67 21.00 441.00 Cds $9,261.00

BIRCH 5.04 9.00 68.00 Cds $612.00

MAPLE-RED 2.97 9.00 2.00 Cds $18.00

PINE-NORWAY 29.92 33.00 186.00 Cds $6,138.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 18.00 6.00 Cds $108.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 18.00 4.00 Cds $72.00

$16,209.00  

Tract 7 C19200007

L. Murphy Construct. Inc.

ASPEN 17.67 26.15 1393.00 Cds $36,426.95



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BIRCH 5.04 7.46 297.00 Cds $2,215.62

MAPLE-RED 2.97 4.39 231.00 Cds $1,014.09

PINE-JACK 16.48 24.39 29.00 Cds $707.31

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 21.38 33.00 Cds $705.54

BALSAM FIR 10.32 15.27 144.00 Cds $2,198.88

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 25.77 119.00 Cds $3,066.63

TAMARACK 3.33 4.93 4.00 Cds $19.72

$46,354.74 *Winner*

Mike Nielsen Logging

ASPEN 17.67 21.51 1393.00 Cds $29,963.43

BIRCH 5.04 8.08 297.00 Cds $2,399.76

MAPLE-RED 2.97 3.19 231.00 Cds $736.89

PINE-JACK 16.48 16.48 29.00 Cds $477.92

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 15.00 33.00 Cds $495.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 11.00 144.00 Cds $1,584.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 18.00 119.00 Cds $2,142.00

TAMARACK 3.33 3.33 4.00 Cds $13.32

$37,812.32  

Shermer Logging

ASPEN 17.67 21.00 1393.00 Cds $29,253.00

BIRCH 5.04 8.00 297.00 Cds $2,376.00

MAPLE-RED 2.97 8.00 231.00 Cds $1,848.00

PINE-JACK 16.48 17.00 29.00 Cds $493.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 21.00 33.00 Cds $693.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 14.00 144.00 Cds $2,016.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 21.00 119.00 Cds $2,499.00

TAMARACK 3.33 5.00 4.00 Cds $20.00

$39,198.00  

Truaxe Forest Harvesting LLC 

ASPEN 17.67 24.74 1393.00 Cds $34,462.82

BIRCH 5.04 7.06 297.00 Cds $2,096.82

MAPLE-RED 2.97 4.16 231.00 Cds $960.96

PINE-JACK 16.48 23.07 29.00 Cds $669.03

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 20.23 33.00 Cds $667.59

BALSAM FIR 10.32 14.45 144.00 Cds $2,080.80

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 24.37 119.00 Cds $2,900.03

TAMARACK 3.33 4.66 4.00 Cds $18.64

$43,856.69  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 8 C19200008

Verso Paper Corp.

ASPEN 17.67 18.76 278.00 Cds $5,215.28

BIRCH 5.04 8.05 28.00 Cds $225.40

PINE-JACK 16.48 17.51 54.00 Cds $945.54

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 26.76 616.00 Cds $16,484.16

TAMARACK 3.33 6.11 164.00 Cds $1,002.04

$23,872.42 *Winner*

Mike Nielsen Logging

ASPEN 17.67 18.00 278.00 Cds $5,004.00

BIRCH 5.04 6.00 28.00 Cds $168.00

PINE-JACK 16.48 17.50 54.00 Cds $945.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 22.00 616.00 Cds $13,552.00

TAMARACK 3.33 3.33 164.00 Cds $546.12

$20,215.12  

Tract 9 C19200009

Truaxe Forest Harvesting LLC 

ASPEN 17.67 22.97 848.00 Cds $19,478.56

BIRCH 5.04 6.55 150.00 Cds $982.50

MAPLE-RED 2.97 3.86 12.00 Cds $46.32

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 18.79 27.00 Cds $507.33

BALSAM FIR 10.32 13.42 71.00 Cds $952.82

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 22.63 327.00 Cds $7,400.01

$29,367.54 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation

ASPEN 17.67 17.69 848.00 Cds $15,001.12

BIRCH 5.04 5.04 150.00 Cds $756.00

MAPLE-RED 2.97 2.98 12.00 Cds $35.76

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 17.41 27.00 Cds $470.07

BALSAM FIR 10.32 10.33 71.00 Cds $733.43

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 17.41 327.00 Cds $5,693.07

$22,689.45  

Mike Nielsen Logging

ASPEN 17.67 20.00 848.00 Cds $16,960.00

BIRCH 5.04 6.00 150.00 Cds $900.00

MAPLE-RED 2.97 8.00 12.00 Cds $96.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 15.00 27.00 Cds $405.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 10.50 71.00 Cds $745.50

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 18.00 327.00 Cds $5,886.00

$24,992.50  

Tract 
10

C19200010

Lone Pine Logging

ASPEN 19.44 33.00 1360.00 Cds $44,880.00

BIRCH 5.54 8.00 148.00 Cds $1,184.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 25.00 59.00 Cds $1,475.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 198.00 Cds $2,970.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 25.00 89.00 Cds $2,225.00

$52,734.00 *Winner*

Douglas Hustad

ASPEN 19.44 25.00 1360.00 Cds $34,000.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 148.00 Cds $888.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 25.00 59.00 Cds $1,475.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 198.00 Cds $2,970.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 25.00 89.00 Cds $2,225.00

$41,558.00  

Futurewood Corporation

ASPEN 19.44 31.63 1360.00 Cds $43,016.80

BIRCH 5.54 7.20 148.00 Cds $1,065.60

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 26.46 59.00 Cds $1,561.14

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.12 198.00 Cds $2,399.76

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 26.46 89.00 Cds $2,354.94

$50,398.24  

Hull Forest Products

ASPEN 19.44 30.00 1360.00 Cds $40,800.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 148.00 Cds $888.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.00 59.00 Cds $1,180.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 198.00 Cds $2,247.30

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 20.00 89.00 Cds $1,780.00

$46,895.30  

Jatco Inc.

ASPEN 19.44 28.50 1360.00 Cds $38,760.00

BIRCH 5.54 7.00 148.00 Cds $1,036.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 23.00 59.00 Cds $1,357.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 198.00 Cds $2,247.30

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 23.00 89.00 Cds $2,047.00

$45,447.30  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

ASPEN 19.44 25.00 1360.00 Cds $34,000.00

BIRCH 5.54 8.00 148.00 Cds $1,184.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 22.00 59.00 Cds $1,298.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 13.00 198.00 Cds $2,574.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 22.00 89.00 Cds $1,958.00

$41,014.00  

Truaxe Forest Harvesting LLC 

ASPEN 19.44 31.30 1360.00 Cds $42,568.00

BIRCH 5.54 8.92 148.00 Cds $1,320.16

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 25.60 59.00 Cds $1,510.40

BALSAM FIR 11.35 18.27 198.00 Cds $3,617.46

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 30.83 89.00 Cds $2,743.87

$51,759.89  

Tract 
11

C19200011

UPM Blandin Forestry

ASPEN 21.21 34.00 802.00 Cds $27,268.00

BIRCH 6.05 8.00 84.00 Cds $672.00

MAPLE-RED 3.56 12.00 12.00 Cds $144.00

PINE-NORWAY 35.90 36.00 97.00 Cds $3,492.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 28.00 580.00 Cds $16,240.00

BALSAM FIR 12.38 18.00 601.00 Cds $10,818.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 28.00 390.00 Cds $10,920.00

TAMARACK 4.00 7.50 131.00 Cds $982.50

$70,536.50 *Winner*

Douglas Hustad

ASPEN 21.21 25.00 802.00 Cds $20,050.00

BIRCH 6.05 7.00 84.00 Cds $588.00

MAPLE-RED 3.56 4.00 12.00 Cds $48.00

PINE-NORWAY 35.90 36.00 97.00 Cds $3,492.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 25.00 580.00 Cds $14,500.00

BALSAM FIR 12.38 13.00 601.00 Cds $7,813.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 25.00 390.00 Cds $9,750.00

TAMARACK 4.00 5.00 131.00 Cds $655.00

$56,896.00  

Futurewood Corporation

ASPEN 21.21 33.35 802.00 Cds $26,746.70

BIRCH 6.05 10.51 84.00 Cds $882.84

MAPLE-RED 3.56 10.51 12.00 Cds $126.12

PINE-NORWAY 35.90 35.90 97.00 Cds $3,482.30

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 29.00 580.00 Cds $16,820.00

BALSAM FIR 12.38 12.40 601.00 Cds $7,452.40

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 29.00 390.00 Cds $11,310.00

TAMARACK 4.00 5.75 131.00 Cds $753.25

$67,573.61  

Jatco Inc.

ASPEN 21.21 23.00 802.00 Cds $18,446.00

BIRCH 6.05 6.05 84.00 Cds $508.20

MAPLE-RED 3.56 3.56 12.00 Cds $42.72

PINE-NORWAY 35.90 35.90 97.00 Cds $3,482.30

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 24.00 580.00 Cds $13,920.00

BALSAM FIR 12.38 12.38 601.00 Cds $7,440.38

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 24.00 390.00 Cds $9,360.00

TAMARACK 4.00 4.00 131.00 Cds $524.00

$53,723.60  

Lone Pine Logging

ASPEN 21.21 34.00 802.00 Cds $27,268.00

BIRCH 6.05 8.00 84.00 Cds $672.00

MAPLE-RED 3.56 5.00 12.00 Cds $60.00

PINE-NORWAY 35.90 35.90 97.00 Cds $3,482.30

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 25.00 580.00 Cds $14,500.00

BALSAM FIR 12.38 20.00 601.00 Cds $12,020.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 30.00 390.00 Cds $11,700.00

TAMARACK 4.00 4.00 131.00 Cds $524.00

$70,226.30  

Tract 
12

C19200012

Futurewood Corporation

ASH 3.30 6.24 95.00 Cds $592.80



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

ASPEN 19.44 31.99 1191.00 Cds $38,100.09

BIRCH 5.54 6.24 357.00 Cds $2,227.68

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 31.99 38.00 Cds $1,215.62

MAPLE-RED 3.26 6.24 58.00 Cds $361.92

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 6.24 43.00 Cds $268.32

PINE-WHITE 23.80 23.81 22.00 Cds $523.82

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 32.93 6.00 Cds $197.58

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 26.99 60.00 Cds $1,619.40

BALSAM FIR 11.35 14.56 500.00 Cds $7,280.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 26.99 3.00 Cds $80.97

$52,468.20 *Winner*

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

ASH 3.30 3.30 95.00 Cds $313.50

ASPEN 19.44 20.00 1191.00 Cds $23,820.00

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 357.00 Cds $1,977.78

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 20.00 38.00 Cds $760.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 5.54 58.00 Cds $321.32

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 5.54 43.00 Cds $238.22

PINE-WHITE 23.80 23.80 22.00 Cds $523.60

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 32.91 6.00 Cds $197.46

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 15.90 60.00 Cds $954.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 500.00 Cds $5,675.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 19.15 3.00 Cds $57.45

$34,838.33  

Jatco Inc.

ASH 3.30 3.30 95.00 Cds $313.50

ASPEN 19.44 30.00 1191.00 Cds $35,730.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 357.00 Cds $2,142.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 30.00 38.00 Cds $1,140.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 4.00 58.00 Cds $232.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 4.00 43.00 Cds $172.00

PINE-WHITE 23.80 24.00 22.00 Cds $528.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 33.00 6.00 Cds $198.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 25.00 60.00 Cds $1,500.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 500.00 Cds $5,675.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 25.00 3.00 Cds $75.00

$47,705.50  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 
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C19200013

Jatco Inc.

ASPEN 19.44 31.00 943.00 Cds $29,233.00

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 190.00 Cds $1,052.60

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 31.00 20.00 Cds $620.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 8.00 Cds $26.08

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 32.91 3.00 Cds $98.73

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 24.00 90.00 Cds $2,160.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 41.00 Cds $465.35

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 24.00 76.00 Cds $1,824.00

TAMARACK 3.67 3.67 2.00 Cds $7.34

$35,487.10 *Winner*

Douglas Hustad

ASPEN 19.44 25.00 943.00 Cds $23,575.00

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 190.00 Cds $1,900.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 25.00 20.00 Cds $500.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 8.00 Cds $80.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 33.00 3.00 Cds $99.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 25.00 90.00 Cds $2,250.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 41.00 Cds $615.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 25.00 76.00 Cds $1,900.00

TAMARACK 3.67 5.00 2.00 Cds $10.00

$30,929.00  

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

ASPEN 19.44 20.00 943.00 Cds $18,860.00

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 190.00 Cds $1,052.60

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 20.00 20.00 Cds $400.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 5.54 8.00 Cds $44.32

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 32.91 3.00 Cds $98.73

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 15.90 90.00 Cds $1,431.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 41.00 Cds $465.35

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 19.15 76.00 Cds $1,455.40

TAMARACK 3.67 3.67 2.00 Cds $7.34

$23,814.74  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

ASPEN 19.44 23.00 943.00 Cds $21,689.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BIRCH 5.54 8.00 190.00 Cds $1,520.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 23.00 20.00 Cds $460.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 8.00 8.00 Cds $64.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 33.00 3.00 Cds $99.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 22.00 90.00 Cds $1,980.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.00 41.00 Cds $492.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 22.00 76.00 Cds $1,672.00

TAMARACK 3.67 5.00 2.00 Cds $10.00

$27,986.00  

Tract 
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C19200014

Island Lake Logging

ASPEN 19.44 25.01 1103.00 Cds $27,586.03

BIRCH 5.54 10.01 1293.00 Cds $12,942.93

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 25.01 89.00 Cds $2,225.89

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.01 737.00 Cds $7,377.37

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 10.01 200.00 Cds $2,002.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.01 197.00 Cds $3,941.97

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 249.00 Cds $2,826.15

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 20.01 22.00 Cds $440.22

$59,342.56 *Winner*

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

ASPEN 19.44 28.00 1103.00 Cds $30,884.00

BIRCH 5.54 8.00 1293.00 Cds $10,344.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 28.00 89.00 Cds $2,492.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 5.00 737.00 Cds $3,685.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 5.00 200.00 Cds $1,000.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 19.15 197.00 Cds $3,772.55

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 249.00 Cds $3,735.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 19.15 22.00 Cds $421.30

$56,333.85  

Jatco Inc.

ASPEN 19.44 31.50 1103.00 Cds $34,744.50

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 1293.00 Cds $7,758.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 31.50 89.00 Cds $2,803.50

MAPLE-RED 3.26 6.00 737.00 Cds $4,422.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 6.00 200.00 Cds $1,200.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 24.00 197.00 Cds $4,728.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 249.00 Cds $2,826.15

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 24.00 22.00 Cds $528.00

$59,010.15  

Tract 
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C19200015

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

ASH 3.30 3.50 1304.00 Cds $4,564.00

ASPEN 19.44 22.00 1031.00 Cds $22,682.00

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 636.00 Cds $3,523.44

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 22.00 63.00 Cds $1,386.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 5.54 499.00 Cds $2,764.46

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 19.15 136.00 Cds $2,604.40

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 308.00 Cds $3,495.80

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 19.15 194.00 Cds $3,715.10

TAMARACK 3.67 3.67 4.00 Cds $14.68

$44,749.88 *Winner*

Tract 
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C19200016

Futurewood Corporation

ASH 3.30 3.31 39.00 Cds $129.09

ASPEN 19.44 30.48 2815.00 Cds $85,801.20

BIRCH 5.54 14.45 928.00 Cds $13,409.60

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 30.48 21.00 Cds $640.08

MAPLE-RED 3.26 8.52 23.00 Cds $195.96

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 32.91 75.00 Cds $2,468.25

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 33.01 387.00 Cds $12,774.87

BALSAM FIR 11.35 13.61 427.00 Cds $5,811.47

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 33.01 1414.00 Cds $46,676.14

TAMARACK 3.67 3.67 65.00 Cds $238.55

$168,145.21 *Winner*

Douglas Hustad

ASH 3.30 5.00 39.00 Cds $195.00

ASPEN 19.44 30.00 2815.00 Cds $84,450.00

BIRCH 5.54 12.00 928.00 Cds $11,136.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 30.00 21.00 Cds $630.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 23.00 Cds $230.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 40.00 75.00 Cds $3,000.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 30.00 387.00 Cds $11,610.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 427.00 Cds $6,405.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 30.00 1414.00 Cds $42,420.00

TAMARACK 3.67 5.00 65.00 Cds $325.00

$160,401.00  

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

ASH 3.30 6.00 39.00 Cds $234.00

ASPEN 19.44 25.00 2815.00 Cds $70,375.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 928.00 Cds $5,568.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 25.00 21.00 Cds $525.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 6.00 23.00 Cds $138.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 33.00 75.00 Cds $2,475.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.00 387.00 Cds $7,740.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 427.00 Cds $6,405.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 20.00 1414.00 Cds $28,280.00

TAMARACK 3.67 5.00 65.00 Cds $325.00

$122,065.00  

Jatco Inc.

ASH 3.30 3.30 39.00 Cds $128.70

ASPEN 19.44 31.50 2815.00 Cds $88,672.50

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 928.00 Cds $5,141.12

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 31.50 21.00 Cds $661.50

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 23.00 Cds $74.98

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 32.91 75.00 Cds $2,468.25

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 24.00 387.00 Cds $9,288.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 427.00 Cds $4,846.45

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 24.00 1414.00 Cds $33,936.00

TAMARACK 3.67 3.67 65.00 Cds $238.55

$145,456.05  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

ASH 3.30 5.00 39.00 Cds $195.00

ASPEN 19.44 34.00 2815.00 Cds $95,710.00

BIRCH 5.54 8.00 928.00 Cds $7,424.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 34.00 21.00 Cds $714.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 5.00 23.00 Cds $115.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 40.00 75.00 Cds $3,000.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 28.00 387.00 Cds $10,836.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALSAM FIR 11.35 14.00 427.00 Cds $5,978.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 28.00 1414.00 Cds $39,592.00

TAMARACK 3.67 5.00 65.00 Cds $325.00

$163,889.00  

Tract 
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C19200017

Sappi Fine Paper

ASPEN 19.44 37.95 2742.00 Cds $104,058.90

BIRCH 5.54 14.40 193.00 Cds $2,779.20

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 37.95 26.00 Cds $986.70

MAPLE-RED 3.26 14.40 211.00 Cds $3,038.40

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 14.40 24.00 Cds $345.60

BALSAM FIR 11.35 18.80 52.00 Cds $977.60

$112,186.40 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation

ASPEN 19.44 30.20 2742.00 Cds $82,808.40

BIRCH 5.54 11.40 193.00 Cds $2,200.20

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 30.20 26.00 Cds $785.20

MAPLE-RED 3.26 11.40 211.00 Cds $2,405.40

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 11.40 24.00 Cds $273.60

BALSAM FIR 11.35 13.80 52.00 Cds $717.60

$89,190.40  

Hull Forest Products

ASPEN 19.44 35.00 2742.00 Cds $95,970.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 193.00 Cds $1,158.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 25.00 26.00 Cds $650.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 4.00 211.00 Cds $844.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 4.00 24.00 Cds $96.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.00 52.00 Cds $624.00

$99,342.00  

Island Lake Logging

ASPEN 19.44 25.00 2742.00 Cds $68,550.00

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 193.00 Cds $1,930.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 25.00 26.00 Cds $650.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 211.00 Cds $2,110.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 10.00 24.00 Cds $240.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 52.00 Cds $780.00

$74,260.00  

Jatco Inc.

ASPEN 19.44 21.00 2742.00 Cds $57,582.00

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 193.00 Cds $1,069.22

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 21.00 26.00 Cds $546.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 211.00 Cds $687.86

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 3.75 24.00 Cds $90.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 52.00 Cds $590.20

$60,565.28  

Sandstrom Logging

ASPEN 19.44 24.10 2742.00 Cds $66,082.20

BIRCH 5.54 8.10 193.00 Cds $1,563.30

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 24.10 26.00 Cds $626.60

MAPLE-RED 3.26 8.10 211.00 Cds $1,709.10

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 8.10 24.00 Cds $194.40

BALSAM FIR 11.35 14.10 52.00 Cds $733.20

$70,908.80  

Tract 
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C19200018

Island Lake Logging

BIRCH 5.04 15.55 8.00 Cds $124.40

MAPLE-RED 2.97 15.55 15.00 Cds $233.25

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.41 15.55 300.00 Cds $4,665.00

BASSWOOD 4.34 5.00 15.00 Cds $75.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 11.00 2.00 Cds $22.00

$5,119.65 *Winner*

Hull Forest Products

BIRCH 5.04 5.04 8.00 Cds $40.32

MAPLE-RED 2.97 2.97 15.00 Cds $44.55

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.41 3.41 300.00 Cds $1,023.00

BASSWOOD 4.34 4.34 15.00 Cds $65.10

BALSAM FIR 10.32 10.32 2.00 Cds $20.64

$1,193.61  

Jatco Inc.

BIRCH 5.04 5.04 8.00 Cds $40.32



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

MAPLE-RED 2.97 7.00 15.00 Cds $105.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.41 7.00 300.00 Cds $2,100.00

BASSWOOD 4.34 4.34 15.00 Cds $65.10

BALSAM FIR 10.32 10.32 2.00 Cds $20.64

$2,331.06  

Tract 
19

C19200019

Carlson Timber Products

ASPEN 17.67 42.00 592.00 Cds $24,864.00

BIRCH 5.04 42.00 12.00 Cds $504.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 42.00 69.00 Cds $2,898.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 42.00 87.00 Cds $3,654.00

$31,920.00 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation

ASPEN 17.67 36.80 592.00 Cds $21,785.60

BIRCH 5.04 10.49 12.00 Cds $125.88

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 27.30 69.00 Cds $1,883.70

BALSAM FIR 10.32 14.38 87.00 Cds $1,251.06

$25,046.24  

Hull Forest Products

ASPEN 17.67 25.00 592.00 Cds $14,800.00

BIRCH 5.04 6.00 12.00 Cds $72.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 20.00 69.00 Cds $1,380.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 11.00 87.00 Cds $957.00

$17,209.00  

Jatco Inc.

ASPEN 17.67 32.00 592.00 Cds $18,944.00

BIRCH 5.04 5.04 12.00 Cds $60.48

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 19.00 69.00 Cds $1,311.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 10.32 87.00 Cds $897.84

$21,213.32  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

ASPEN 17.67 32.50 592.00 Cds $19,240.00

BIRCH 5.04 8.00 12.00 Cds $96.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 18.00 69.00 Cds $1,242.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 12.00 87.00 Cds $1,044.00

$21,622.00  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Sappi Fine Paper

ASPEN 17.67 41.40 592.00 Cds $24,508.80

BIRCH 5.04 5.04 12.00 Cds $60.48

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 23.10 69.00 Cds $1,593.90

BALSAM FIR 10.32 11.75 87.00 Cds $1,022.25

$27,185.43  

Tract 
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C19200020

Hull Forest Products

ASPEN 19.44 35.00 805.00 Cds $28,175.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 9.00 Cds $54.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 18.68 2.00 Cds $37.36

MAPLE-RED 3.26 4.00 74.00 Cds $296.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.00 82.00 Cds $1,640.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.00 27.00 Cds $324.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 20.00 5.00 Cds $100.00

$30,626.36 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation

ASPEN 19.44 31.05 805.00 Cds $24,995.25

BIRCH 5.54 10.49 9.00 Cds $94.41

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 31.05 2.00 Cds $62.10

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.49 74.00 Cds $776.26

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 29.01 82.00 Cds $2,378.82

BALSAM FIR 11.35 14.38 27.00 Cds $388.26

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 29.01 5.00 Cds $145.05

$28,840.15  

Jatco Inc.

ASPEN 19.44 29.00 805.00 Cds $23,345.00

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 9.00 Cds $49.86

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 29.00 2.00 Cds $58.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 4.00 74.00 Cds $296.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 24.00 82.00 Cds $1,968.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 27.00 Cds $306.45

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 24.00 5.00 Cds $120.00

$26,143.31  

Sappi Fine Paper

ASPEN 19.44 29.90 805.00 Cds $24,069.50



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 9.00 Cds $49.86

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 29.90 2.00 Cds $59.80

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 74.00 Cds $241.24

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 25.20 82.00 Cds $2,066.40

BALSAM FIR 11.35 16.45 27.00 Cds $444.15

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 25.20 5.00 Cds $126.00

$27,056.95  

Tract 
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C19200021

Hull Forest Products

ASPEN 5.00 5.01 140.00 Cds $701.40

BIRCH 5.00 5.01 51.00 Cds $255.51

PINE-WHITE 5.00 5.01 4.00 Cds $20.04

PINE-NORWAY 5.00 5.01 507.00 Cds $2,540.07

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.01 77.00 Cds $385.77

$3,902.79 *Winner*

Tract 
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C19200023

Carlson Timber Products

ASPEN 19.44 40.00 511.00 Cds $20,440.00

BIRCH 5.54 40.00 143.00 Cds $5,720.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 40.00 24.00 Cds $960.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 40.00 111.00 Cds $4,440.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 40.00 13.00 Cds $520.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 40.00 230.00 Cds $9,200.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 40.00 12.00 Cds $480.00

$41,760.00 *Winner*

Douglas Hustad

ASPEN 19.44 25.00 511.00 Cds $12,775.00

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 143.00 Cds $1,430.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 24.00 Cds $240.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 40.00 111.00 Cds $4,440.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 25.00 13.00 Cds $325.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 230.00 Cds $3,450.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 25.00 12.00 Cds $300.00

$22,960.00  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

ASPEN 19.44 28.00 511.00 Cds $14,308.00

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 143.00 Cds $1,430.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 24.00 Cds $240.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 33.00 111.00 Cds $3,663.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.00 13.00 Cds $260.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 230.00 Cds $3,450.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 20.00 12.00 Cds $240.00

$23,591.00  

Futurewood Corporation

ASPEN 19.44 39.68 511.00 Cds $20,276.48

BIRCH 5.54 10.49 143.00 Cds $1,500.07

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.49 24.00 Cds $251.76

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 32.93 111.00 Cds $3,655.23

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 29.40 13.00 Cds $382.20

BALSAM FIR 11.35 14.38 230.00 Cds $3,307.40

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 29.40 12.00 Cds $352.80

$29,725.94  

Greg Cook Logging

ASPEN 19.44 44.00 511.00 Cds $22,484.00

BIRCH 5.54 20.00 143.00 Cds $2,860.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 20.00 24.00 Cds $480.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 53.50 111.00 Cds $5,938.50

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 30.00 13.00 Cds $390.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 230.00 Cds $3,450.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 30.00 12.00 Cds $360.00

$35,962.50  

Hull Forest Products

ASPEN 19.44 35.00 511.00 Cds $17,885.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 143.00 Cds $858.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 4.00 24.00 Cds $96.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 35.00 111.00 Cds $3,885.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.00 13.00 Cds $260.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 230.00 Cds $2,610.50

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 20.00 12.00 Cds $240.00

$25,834.50  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Jatco Inc.

ASPEN 19.44 40.00 511.00 Cds $20,440.00

BIRCH 5.54 7.00 143.00 Cds $1,001.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 5.00 24.00 Cds $120.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 40.00 111.00 Cds $4,440.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 24.00 13.00 Cds $312.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 230.00 Cds $2,610.50

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 24.00 12.00 Cds $288.00

$29,211.50  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

ASPEN 19.44 35.00 511.00 Cds $17,885.00

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 143.00 Cds $1,430.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 24.00 Cds $240.00

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 40.00 111.00 Cds $4,440.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 22.00 13.00 Cds $286.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 14.00 230.00 Cds $3,220.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 22.00 12.00 Cds $264.00

$27,765.00  

Sappi Fine Paper

ASPEN 19.44 45.31 511.00 Cds $23,153.41

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 143.00 Cds $792.22

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 24.00 Cds $78.24

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 40.00 111.00 Cds $4,440.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 25.20 13.00 Cds $327.60

BALSAM FIR 11.35 16.45 230.00 Cds $3,783.50

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 25.20 12.00 Cds $302.40

$32,877.37  

Tract 
26

C19200026

Hull Forest Products

PINE-NORWAY 29.92 35.00 335.00 Cds $11,725.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 15.00 26.00 Cds $390.00

$12,115.00 *Winner*

Douglas Hustad

PINE-NORWAY 29.92 30.00 335.00 Cds $10,050.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 20.00 26.00 Cds $520.00

$10,570.00  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Hedstrom Lumber Co Inc

PINE-NORWAY 29.92 31.50 335.00 Cds $10,552.50

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 15.20 26.00 Cds $395.20

$10,947.70  

Island Lake Logging

PINE-NORWAY 29.92 31.00 335.00 Cds $10,385.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 16.00 26.00 Cds $416.00

$10,801.00  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

PINE-NORWAY 29.92 32.00 335.00 Cds $10,720.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 15.00 26.00 Cds $390.00

$11,110.00  
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1 C19200001

Mike Nielsen Logging - 17.67 - 10.32 - 6.00 - - 17.00 32.77 - - - -

2 C19200002

Boise White Paper LLC 4.12 18.79 18.79 11.44 - 6.16 4.09 - - - - - 15.57 4.45

Lone Pine Logging 3.00 28.00 28.00 18.00 - 8.00 5.00 - - - - - 22.00 3.33

3 C19200003

Boise White Paper LLC - 32.15 32.15 12.05 - 6.00 6.00 - - - - 20.00 20.00 4.00

Bud Strandberg - 32.68 32.68 12.00 - 10.00 10.00 - - - - 24.00 24.00 10.00

Futurewood Corporation - 19.44 19.44 11.86 - 5.54 3.26 - - - - 19.15 19.15 3.67

Lone Pine Logging - 28.00 28.00 18.00 - 5.54 3.26 - - - - 22.00 22.00 3.67

Shermer Logging - 27.60 25.00 14.00 - 8.00 8.00 - - - - 21.00 21.00 5.00

Wagner Construction Inc. - 25.00 23.00 11.50 - 5.75 3.50 - - - - 19.25 16.00 3.75

4 C19200004

Boise White Paper LLC 3.50 19.65 - 11.50 - 6.00 3.50 - - 33.00 - - 16.00 4.00

Rutar Logging Llc 3.30 20.00 - 12.00 - 6.00 3.26 - - 32.91 - - 16.00 4.00

6 C19200006

Mike Nielsen Logging - 17.67 - - - 5.04 3.00 - - 30.00 - 18.50 15.50 -

Shermer Logging - 21.00 - - - 9.00 9.00 - - 33.00 - 18.00 18.00 -

For Auction held on 2/27/2020
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6 Truaxe Forest Harvesting 
LLC - 24.74 - - - 7.06 4.16 - - 41.89 - 24.37 20.23 -

7 C19200007

L. Murphy Construct. Inc. - 26.15 - 15.27 - 7.46 4.39 - 24.39 - - 25.77 21.38 4.93

Mike Nielsen Logging - 21.51 - 11.00 - 8.08 3.19 - 16.48 - - 18.00 15.00 3.33

Shermer Logging - 21.00 - 14.00 - 8.00 8.00 - 17.00 - - 21.00 21.00 5.00

Truaxe Forest Harvesting 
LLC - 24.74 - 14.45 - 7.06 4.16 - 23.07 - - 24.37 20.23 4.66

8 C19200008

Mike Nielsen Logging - 18.00 - - - 6.00 - - 17.50 - - 22.00 - 3.33

Verso Paper Corp. - 18.76 - - - 8.05 - - 17.51 - - 26.76 - 6.11

9 C19200009

Futurewood Corporation - 17.69 - 10.33 - 5.04 2.98 - - - - 17.41 17.41 -

Mike Nielsen Logging - 20.00 - 10.50 - 6.00 8.00 - - - - 18.00 15.00 -

Truaxe Forest Harvesting 
LLC - 22.97 - 13.42 - 6.55 3.86 - - - - 22.63 18.79 -

10 C19200010

Douglas Hustad - 25.00 - 15.00 - 6.00 - - - - - 25.00 25.00 -

Futurewood Corporation - 31.63 - 12.12 - 7.20 - - - - - 26.46 26.46 -

Hull Forest Products - 30.00 - 11.35 - 6.00 - - - - - 20.00 20.00 -

Jatco Inc. - 28.50 - 11.35 - 7.00 - - - - - 23.00 23.00 -

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC - 25.00 - 13.00 - 8.00 - - - - - 22.00 22.00 -
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10 Lone Pine Logging - 33.00 - 15.00 - 8.00 - - - - - 25.00 25.00 -

Truaxe Forest Harvesting 
LLC - 31.30 - 18.27 - 8.92 - - - - - 30.83 25.60 -

11 C19200011

Douglas Hustad - 25.00 - 13.00 - 7.00 4.00 - - 36.00 - 25.00 25.00 5.00

Futurewood Corporation - 33.35 - 12.40 - 10.51 10.51 - - 35.90 - 29.00 29.00 5.75

Jatco Inc. - 23.00 - 12.38 - 6.05 3.56 - - 35.90 - 24.00 24.00 4.00

Lone Pine Logging - 34.00 - 20.00 - 8.00 5.00 - - 35.90 - 30.00 25.00 4.00

UPM Blandin Forestry - 34.00 - 18.00 - 8.00 12.00 - - 36.00 - 28.00 28.00 7.50

12 C19200012

Fjeran Forest Products Llc 3.30 20.00 20.00 11.35 - 5.54 5.54 5.54 - 32.91 23.80 19.15 15.90 -

Futurewood Corporation 6.24 31.99 31.99 14.56 - 6.24 6.24 6.24 - 32.93 23.81 26.99 26.99 -

Jatco Inc. 3.30 30.00 30.00 11.35 - 6.00 4.00 4.00 - 33.00 24.00 25.00 25.00 -

13 C19200013

Douglas Hustad - 25.00 25.00 15.00 - 10.00 10.00 - - 33.00 - 25.00 25.00 5.00

Fjeran Forest Products Llc - 20.00 20.00 11.35 - 5.54 5.54 - - 32.91 - 19.15 15.90 3.67

Jatco Inc. - 31.00 31.00 11.35 - 5.54 3.26 - - 32.91 - 24.00 24.00 3.67

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC - 23.00 23.00 12.00 - 8.00 8.00 - - 33.00 - 22.00 22.00 5.00

14 C19200014

Fjeran Forest Products Llc - 28.00 28.00 15.00 - 8.00 5.00 5.00 - - - 19.15 19.15 -

Island Lake Logging - 25.01 25.01 11.35 - 10.01 10.01 10.01 - - - 20.01 20.01 -
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14 Jatco Inc. - 31.50 31.50 11.35 - 6.00 6.00 6.00 - - - 24.00 24.00 -

15 C19200015

Fjeran Forest Products Llc 3.50 22.00 22.00 11.35 - 5.54 5.54 - - - - 19.15 19.15 3.67

16 C19200016

Douglas Hustad 5.00 30.00 30.00 15.00 - 12.00 10.00 - - 40.00 - 30.00 30.00 5.00

Fjeran Forest Products Llc 6.00 25.00 25.00 15.00 - 6.00 6.00 - - 33.00 - 20.00 20.00 5.00

Futurewood Corporation 3.31 30.48 30.48 13.61 - 14.45 8.52 - - 32.91 - 33.01 33.01 3.67

Jatco Inc. 3.30 31.50 31.50 11.35 - 5.54 3.26 - - 32.91 - 24.00 24.00 3.67

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC 5.00 34.00 34.00 14.00 - 8.00 5.00 - - 40.00 - 28.00 28.00 5.00

17 C19200017

Futurewood Corporation - 30.20 30.20 13.80 - 11.40 11.40 11.40 - - - - - -

Hull Forest Products - 35.00 25.00 12.00 - 6.00 4.00 4.00 - - - - - -

Island Lake Logging - 25.00 25.00 15.00 - 10.00 10.00 10.00 - - - - - -

Jatco Inc. - 21.00 21.00 11.35 - 5.54 3.26 3.75 - - - - - -

Sandstrom Logging - 24.10 24.10 14.10 - 8.10 8.10 8.10 - - - - - -

Sappi Fine Paper - 37.95 37.95 18.80 - 14.40 14.40 14.40 - - - - - -

18 C19200018

Hull Forest Products - - - 10.32 4.34 5.04 2.97 3.41 - - - - - -

Island Lake Logging - - - 11.00 5.00 15.55 15.55 15.55 - - - - - -

Jatco Inc. - - - 10.32 4.34 5.04 7.00 7.00 - - - - - -



Tract 
Nbr AS

H

AS
PE

N

BA
LM

 O
F 

G
IL

EA
D

BA
LS

AM
 F

IR

BA
SS

W
O

O
D

BI
RC

H

M
AP

LE
-R

ED

M
AP

LE
-S

U
G

AR

PI
N

E-
JA

CK

PI
N

E-
N

O
RW

AY

PI
N

E-
W

H
IT

E

SP
RU

CE
-B

LA
CK

SP
RU

CE
-W

H
IT

E

TA
M

AR
AC

K

19 C19200019

Carlson Timber Products - 42.00 - 42.00 - 42.00 - - - - - - 42.00 -

Futurewood Corporation - 36.80 - 14.38 - 10.49 - - - - - - 27.30 -

Hull Forest Products - 25.00 - 11.00 - 6.00 - - - - - - 20.00 -

Jatco Inc. - 32.00 - 10.32 - 5.04 - - - - - - 19.00 -

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC - 32.50 - 12.00 - 8.00 - - - - - - 18.00 -

Sappi Fine Paper - 41.40 - 11.75 - 5.04 - - - - - - 23.10 -

20 C19200020

Futurewood Corporation - 31.05 31.05 14.38 - 10.49 10.49 - - - - 29.01 29.01 -

Hull Forest Products - 35.00 18.68 12.00 - 6.00 4.00 - - - - 20.00 20.00 -

Jatco Inc. - 29.00 29.00 11.35 - 5.54 4.00 - - - - 24.00 24.00 -

Sappi Fine Paper - 29.90 29.90 16.45 - 5.54 3.26 - - - - 25.20 25.20 -

21 C19200021

Hull Forest Products - 5.01 - 5.01 - 5.01 - - - 5.01 5.01 - - -

23 C19200023

Carlson Timber Products - 40.00 - 40.00 - 40.00 40.00 - - 40.00 - 40.00 40.00 -

Douglas Hustad - 25.00 - 15.00 - 10.00 10.00 - - 40.00 - 25.00 25.00 -

Fjeran Forest Products Llc - 28.00 - 15.00 - 10.00 10.00 - - 33.00 - 20.00 20.00 -

Futurewood Corporation - 39.68 - 14.38 - 10.49 10.49 - - 32.93 - 29.40 29.40 -

Greg Cook Logging - 44.00 - 15.00 - 20.00 20.00 - - 53.50 - 30.00 30.00 -
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23 Hull Forest Products - 35.00 - 11.35 - 6.00 4.00 - - 35.00 - 20.00 20.00 -

Jatco Inc. - 40.00 - 11.35 - 7.00 5.00 - - 40.00 - 24.00 24.00 -

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC - 35.00 - 14.00 - 10.00 10.00 - - 40.00 - 22.00 22.00 -

Sappi Fine Paper - 45.31 - 16.45 - 5.54 3.26 - - 40.00 - 25.20 25.20 -

26 C19200026

Douglas Hustad - - - - - - - - - 30.00 - - 20.00 -

Hedstrom Lumber Co Inc - - - - - - - - - 31.50 - - 15.20 -

Hull Forest Products - - - - - - - - - 35.00 - - 15.00 -

Island Lake Logging - - - - - - - - - 31.00 - - 16.00 -

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC - - - - - - - - - 32.00 - - 15.00 -


