October 2019 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22190121 Cindy J Luke Bates and Kris D Bates $36,850.00 $66,000.00
2 C22190122 Sherri Lee Irving $7,875.00 $15,000.00
3 C22190118 NO BID $10,000.00 $0.00
4 C22190123 Paul Carl Wrazidlo and Kathleen Heide Wrazidlo $3,450.00 $3,450.00
5 C22190117 NO BID $2,650.00 $0.00
6 C22190124 NO BID $58,500.00 $0.00
7 C22190116 NO BID $9,850.00 $0.00
8 C22190125 Dennis James Mahai and Mary Louise Mahai $7,650.00 $7,650.00
9 C22190127 Paul M. Bachinski and Susan Bachinski $12,800.00 $12,800.00
10 C22190169 NO BID $4,350.00 $0.00
11 C22190157 Lydia Jane Black $42,400.00 $66,000.00
12 C22170340 Sherri Lee Irving $9,150.00 $18,500.00
13 C22190129 PULLED $17,850.00 $0.00
14 C22190130 Sherri Lee Irving $16,200.00 $16,200.00
15 C22190131 Alissa Jeanne Bilden Camps and Scott Allen Camps $10,275.00 $10,275.00
16 C22190132 NO BID $8,900.00 $0.00
17 C22190133 NO BID $12,000.00 $0.00
18 C22190134 NO BID $6,075.00 $0.00
19 C22190135 Joshua Brian Anderson $5,175.00 $5,175.00
20 C22190136 NO BID $16,500.00 $0.00
21 C22190137 NO BID $15,000.00 $0.00
22 C22170021 NO BID $2,800.00 $0.00
23 C22190138 Albert John Miller $5,325.00 $6,500.00
24 22160004 Nicholas Adam Kenjalo $2,590.00 $2,590.00
25 C22190013 NO BID $10.00 $0.00
26 C22190139 Paul Eugene Muhich and Shari Lu Muhich $5,700.00 $5,700.00
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27 C22190061 NO BID $25,920.00 $0.00
28 C22180350 Michele Louise Rolandson $3,750.00 $3,750.00
29 C22190065 NO BID $41,300.00 $0.00
30 C22170375 NO BID $5,175.00 $0.00
31 22190140 Jeffrey James Wright $4,500.00 $4,500.00
32 C22190141 NO BID $37,125.00 $0.00
33 C22190143 Matthew William Lange and Nicole Danielle Lange $3,525.00 $3,525.00
34 C22190144 Matthew William Lange and Nicole Danielle Lange $3,525.00 $3,525.00
35 C22190145 NO BID $5,100.00 $0.00
36 C22190146 NO BID $18,900.00 $0.00
37 C22190147 NO BID $1,875.00 $0.00
38 C22190082 PULLED $16,400.00 $0.00
39 C22170023 NO BID $7,840.00 $0.00
40 C22170024 NO BID $8,400.00 $0.00
41 C22170297 NO BID $4,575.00 $0.00
42 C22170296 NO BID $6,930.00 $0.00
43 C22190148 NO BID $8,550.00 $0.00
44 C22190085 PULLED $22,280.00 $0.00
45 C22190086 NO BID $25,400.00 $0.00
46 C22190149 NO BID $17,200.00 $0.00
47 C22190077 PULLED $26,440.00 $0.00
48 C22190078 NO BID $19,960.00 $0.00
49 22190150 Chad Jerald Daniels and Stephanie Daniels $2,400.00 $2,400.00
50 C22190151 Shain and Sons, Inc. $14,800.00 $14,800.00
51 C22190152 NO BID $31,150.00 $0.00
52 C22190153 NO BID $27,900.00 $0.00
53 C22190017 Anthony Lee Neari $210.00 $400.00
54 22190018 Anthony Lee Neari $2,400.00 $2,400.00
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55 C22190154 NO BID $10,725.00 $0.00
56 22190155 Dominic Michael Ludwig $1,200.00 $3,400.00
57 C22190079 NO BID $259,800.00 $0.00
58 C22190045 NO BID $67,300.00 $0.00
59 22180131 Amy Louise Berglund and Charles Don Crayne $15,265.00 $15,265.00
60 C22190156 NO BID $85,000.00 $0.00
61 C22190158 NO BID $8,850.00 $0.00
62 C22190159 James Earl Bonicatto $16,950.00 $16,950.00
63 22190160 Michael Robert Nelson Debra Lea Nelson $12,150.00 $12,150.00
64 C22190161 James Albert Sage and Nanette Jane Corbett $21,900.00 $21,900.00
65 C22190197 BTMB2 LLC $180,000.00 $180,000.00
66 C22170194 NO BID $13,440.00 $0.00
67 22190162 Anthony Lee Neari $450.00 $2,000.00
68 C22190163 Hazlenut Investment Group $7,800.00 $15,000.00
69 C22190019 Darrick Renard Weaver $30.00 $30.00
70 C22190164 Joel Eric Urban $16,425.00 $16,425.00
71 C22190165 NO BID $17,175.00 $0.00
72 22190166 Jerry Leo Matteson and Mary Christine Matteson $2,700.00 $4,500.00
73 C22190088 Minnesota Cherry Trust $10,720.00 $10,720.00
74 C22190196 Matthew Daniel Jugovich $10,425.00 $27,000.00
Total Tracts 74 Total Value $1:481,760.00

Pulled Tracts 4 Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Available Tracts 70 Net Total Value $1.481,760.00 $596,480.00
Total Tracts Sold 34

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 48.57%

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 40.25%
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