
Timber Auction Results
May 14, 2020

Sealed Bid Auction

Tract Contract Round
Offered

Round 
Sold

Bidder Appraised 
Price

Bidup Sold Price Down 
Payment

1 C19200032 Shermer Logging $29,591.85 73% $51,212.40 $4,438.78

2 C19200033 Boise White Paper 
LLC

$4,576.59 43% $6,554.00 $686.49

3 C19200034 Boise White Paper 
LLC

$10,844.72 87% $20,227.30 $1,626.71

4 C19200035 Boise White Paper 
LLC

$43,044.25 79% $77,076.25 $6,456.64

5 C19200036 Rutar Logging Llc $13,048.33 39% $18,096.76 $1,957.25

6 C19200037 No Bid $25,352.57

7 C19200038 UPM Blandin 
Forestry

$22,956.26 32% $30,369.50 $3,443.44

8 C19200039 No Bid $10,577.51

9 C19200040 No Bid $16,955.72

10 C19200041 Heesaker Forest 
Products

$5,647.40 27% $7,145.14 $847.11

11 C19200042 Truaxe Forest 
Harvesting LLC 

$33,381.11 70% $56,749.56 $5,007.17

12 C19200043 UPM Blandin 
Forestry

$23,077.29 76% $40,577.50 $3,461.59

13 C19200044 Watters 
Excavating 

$17,787.77 41% $25,136.42 $2,668.17

14 C19200045 Watters 
Excavating 

$53,163.92 42% $75,231.10 $7,974.59

15 C19200046 Watters 
Excavating 

$19,954.72 46% $29,207.38 $2,993.21

16 C19200047 Watters 
Excavating 

$34,193.22 56% $53,443.52 $5,128.98

17 C19200048 Fjeran Forest 
Products Llc

$3,161.39 1% $3,180.00 $474.21

18 C19200049 Fjeran Forest 
Products Llc

$1,830.00 5% $1,912.50 $274.50

19 C19200050 Sappi Fine Paper $36,934.05 77% $65,330.58 $5,540.11

20 C19200051 Sappi Fine Paper $24,720.83 75% $43,150.00 $3,708.12

21 C19200052 UPM Blandin 
Forestry

$17,263.45 45% $25,068.00 $2,589.52

22 C19200053 No Bid $24,222.33

23 C19200054 Sappi Fine Paper $92,594.33 40% $129,699.37 $13,889.15

24 C19200055 No Bid $36,883.16

25 C19200056 No Bid $13,351.29

26 C19200057 Watters 
Excavating 

$47,673.67 60% $76,113.24 $7,151.05

27 C19200058 Jatco Inc. $22,248.96 48% $32,959.12 $3,337.34

28 C19200059 No Bid $5,429.57



Tract Contract Round
Offered

Round 
Sold

Bidder Appraised 
Price

Bidup Sold Price Down 
Payment

29 C19200060 Lobb Forest 
Enterprises LLC

$18,713.38 69% $31,581.00 $2,807.01

30 C19200061 No Bid $920.00

31 C19200062 Hedstrom Lumber 
Co Inc

$46,783.00 1% $47,294.35 $7,017.45

Total Offered: $756,882.64

Average Bid up: 49%

Total: $623,190.49 $947,314.99 $93,478.57



PIKE LAKE AREA

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Appraised

Total Sold

ASH 1,758 1,681 $3.28 $4.22 $5,763.90 $7,093.90

ASPEN 15,163 13,952 $19.48 $29.87 $295,417.97 $416,735.10

ASPEN-
LARGETOOTH

84 84 $18.74 $29.65 $1,574.55 $2,490.60

BALM OF GILEAD 763 645 $18.98 $28.03 $14,483.42 $18,082.50

BALSAM FIR 3,070 2,713 $11.12 $11.57 $34,145.61 $31,387.60

BASSWOOD 548 248 $4.68 $9.62 $2,566.03 $2,385.67

BIRCH 3,655 3,356 $5.44 $9.99 $19,894.69 $33,529.00

BIRCH-YELLOW 3 2 $5.21 $10.00 $15.62 $20.00

CEDAR-N.WHITE 3 2 $3.85 $5.00 $11.55 $10.00

MAPLE-RED 1,420 1,121 $3.21 $10.93 $4,560.73 $12,253.24

MAPLE-SUGAR 2,194 1,746 $3.68 $11.57 $8,067.70 $20,200.74

OAK-RED 1 1 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00

PINE-JACK 9 9 $10.84 $10.84 $97.52 $97.52

PINE-NORWAY 517 339 $5.00 $5.24 $2,585.00 $1,777.50

SPRUCE-BLACK 3,814 1,125 $17.12 $23.71 $65,309.02 $26,675.41

SPRUCE-WHITE 1,205 1,194 $12.81 $15.65 $15,439.96 $18,682.45

TAMARACK 376 175 $2.84 $3.32 $1,068.97 $581.00

Totals 34,583 28,393 $471,012.24 $592,012.23
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VIRGINIA AREA

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Appraised

Total Sold

ASH 323 138 $3.20 $4.68 $1,034.40 $646.40

ASPEN 10,074 8,765 $18.29 $29.08 $184,209.14 $254,878.03

BALM OF GILEAD 225 225 $16.60 $27.13 $3,734.54 $6,103.14

BALSAM FIR 945 739 $10.21 $14.27 $9,652.49 $10,544.90

BASSWOOD 172 170 $3.92 $4.00 $674.26 $680.00

BIRCH 846 571 $4.90 $6.78 $4,144.11 $3,873.00

MAPLE-RED 655 373 $3.05 $4.38 $1,995.18 $1,634.10

MAPLE-SUGAR 63 63 $2.67 $3.00 $168.21 $189.00

PINE-JACK 355 51 $18.10 $18.35 $6,424.60 $935.85

PINE-NORWAY 149 124 $32.79 $33.41 $4,885.65 $4,143.25

PINE-WHITE 433 433 $23.80 $24.00 $10,305.40 $10,392.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 2,904 2,095 $17.35 $25.03 $50,384.64 $52,444.86

SPRUCE-WHITE 286 165 $15.98 $16.98 $4,569.52 $2,801.22

TAMARACK 1,140 915 $3.21 $6.60 $3,654.46 $6,037.01

Totals 18,570 14,827 $285,836.60 $355,302.76



Total County

Appraised
Volume

Sold Volume
Average 

Appraised 
Value

Average Sold 
Value

Total 
Appraised

Total Sold

ASH 2,081 1,819 $3.27 $4.26 $6,798.30 $7,740.30

ASPEN 25,237 22,717 $19.00 $29.56 $479,627.11 $671,613.13

ASPEN-
LARGETOOTH

84 84 $18.74 $29.65 $1,574.55 $2,490.60

BALM OF GILEAD 988 870 $18.44 $27.80 $18,217.96 $24,185.64

BALSAM FIR 4,015 3,452 $10.91 $12.15 $43,798.10 $41,932.50

BASSWOOD 720 418 $4.50 $7.33 $3,240.29 $3,065.67

BIRCH 4,501 3,927 $5.34 $9.52 $24,038.80 $37,402.00

BIRCH-YELLOW 3 2 $5.21 $10.00 $15.62 $20.00

CEDAR-N.WHITE 3 2 $3.85 $5.00 $11.55 $10.00

MAPLE-RED 2,075 1,494 $3.16 $9.30 $6,555.91 $13,887.34

MAPLE-SUGAR 2,257 1,809 $3.65 $11.27 $8,235.91 $20,389.74

OAK-RED 1 1 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00

PINE-JACK 364 60 $17.92 $17.22 $6,522.12 $1,033.37

PINE-NORWAY 666 463 $11.22 $12.79 $7,470.65 $5,920.75

PINE-WHITE 436 433 $23.71 $24.00 $10,339.20 $10,392.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 6,718 3,220 $17.22 $24.57 $115,693.66 $79,120.27

SPRUCE-WHITE 1,491 1,359 $13.42 $15.81 $20,009.48 $21,483.67

TAMARACK 1,516 1,090 $3.12 $6.07 $4,723.43 $6,618.01

Totals 53,156 43,220 $756,882.64 $947,314.99



Sealed Bid Results Detail
May 14, 2020

Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 1 C19200032

Shermer Logging

ASH 3.30 5.00 17.00 Cds $85.00

ASPEN 19.44 34.10 1434.00 Cds $48,899.40

BALM OF GILEAD 19.44 20.00 3.00 Cds $60.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 14.00 43.00 Cds $602.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 22.00 Cds $132.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 6.00 99.00 Cds $594.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.00 42.00 Cds $840.00

$51,212.40 *Winner*

Boise White Paper LLC

ASH 3.30 5.00 17.00 Cds $85.00

ASPEN 19.44 33.10 1434.00 Cds $47,465.40

BALM OF GILEAD 19.44 33.10 3.00 Cds $99.30

BALSAM FIR 11.35 13.00 43.00 Cds $559.00

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 22.00 Cds $220.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 99.00 Cds $990.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 19.00 42.00 Cds $798.00

$50,216.70  

Brad Horsmann Logging, LLC

ASH 3.30 3.30 17.00 Cds $56.10

ASPEN 19.44 25.00 1434.00 Cds $35,850.00

BALM OF GILEAD 19.44 20.00 3.00 Cds $60.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.50 43.00 Cds $537.50

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 22.00 Cds $132.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 99.00 Cds $322.74

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 16.00 42.00 Cds $672.00

$37,630.34  

Rutar Logging Llc

ASH 3.30 4.00 17.00 Cds $68.00

ASPEN 19.44 24.00 1434.00 Cds $34,416.00

BALM OF GILEAD 19.44 24.00 3.00 Cds $72.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 43.00 Cds $645.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 22.00 Cds $220.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 99.00 Cds $990.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 25.00 42.00 Cds $1,050.00

$37,461.00  

Tract 2 C19200033

Boise White Paper LLC

ASH 3.00 10.00 7.00 Cds $70.00

ASPEN 17.67 24.00 242.00 Cds $5,808.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 24.00 24.00 Cds $576.00

BIRCH 5.04 10.00 1.00 Cds $10.00

MAPLE-RED 2.97 10.00 9.00 Cds $90.00

$6,554.00 *Winner*

Arvila Logging

ASH 3.00 3.00 7.00 Cds $21.00

ASPEN 17.67 18.00 242.00 Cds $4,356.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 10.32 24.00 Cds $247.68

BIRCH 5.04 5.09 1.00 Cds $5.09

MAPLE-RED 2.97 3.00 9.00 Cds $27.00

$4,656.77  

Tract 3 C19200034

Boise White Paper LLC

ASPEN 17.67 33.90 529.00 Cds $17,933.10

BALM OF GILEAD 17.67 33.90 18.00 Cds $610.20

BALSAM FIR 10.32 15.00 103.00 Cds $1,545.00

BIRCH 5.04 9.00 3.00 Cds $27.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 16.00 7.00 Cds $112.00

$20,227.30 *Winner*

Arvila Logging

ASPEN 17.67 18.00 529.00 Cds $9,522.00

BALM OF GILEAD 17.67 18.00 18.00 Cds $324.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 15.00 103.00 Cds $1,545.00

BIRCH 5.04 5.10 3.00 Cds $15.30

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 15.00 7.00 Cds $105.00

$11,511.30  

Brad Horsmann Logging, LLC

ASPEN 17.67 32.50 529.00 Cds $17,192.50



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALM OF GILEAD 17.67 18.50 18.00 Cds $333.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 11.00 103.00 Cds $1,133.00

BIRCH 5.04 5.50 3.00 Cds $16.50

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 15.00 7.00 Cds $105.00

$18,780.00  

Bud Strandberg

ASPEN 17.67 32.76 529.00 Cds $17,330.04

BALM OF GILEAD 17.67 32.76 18.00 Cds $589.68

BALSAM FIR 10.32 11.20 103.00 Cds $1,153.60

BIRCH 5.04 9.04 3.00 Cds $27.12

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 20.00 7.00 Cds $140.00

$19,240.44  

Imhof Logging and Chipping

ASPEN 17.67 32.05 529.00 Cds $16,954.45

BALM OF GILEAD 17.67 32.05 18.00 Cds $576.90

BALSAM FIR 10.32 10.32 103.00 Cds $1,062.96

BIRCH 5.04 5.04 3.00 Cds $15.12

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 14.45 7.00 Cds $101.15

$18,710.58  

John Rolle Logging

ASPEN 17.67 29.51 529.00 Cds $15,610.79

BALM OF GILEAD 17.67 29.51 18.00 Cds $531.18

BALSAM FIR 10.32 18.03 103.00 Cds $1,857.09

BIRCH 5.04 8.00 3.00 Cds $24.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 20.45 7.00 Cds $143.15

$18,166.21  

Shermer Logging

ASPEN 17.67 26.30 529.00 Cds $13,912.70

BALM OF GILEAD 17.67 20.00 18.00 Cds $360.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 14.00 103.00 Cds $1,442.00

BIRCH 5.04 6.00 3.00 Cds $18.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 15.00 7.00 Cds $105.00

$15,837.70  

Tract 4 C19200035

Boise White Paper LLC

ASPEN 19.44 37.00 1819.00 Cds $67,303.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 29.00 Cds $435.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 24.15 375.00 Cds $9,056.25

TAMARACK 3.67 6.00 47.00 Cds $282.00

$77,076.25 *Winner*

Arvila Logging

ASPEN 19.44 19.44 1819.00 Cds $35,361.36

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 29.00 Cds $329.15

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 19.15 375.00 Cds $7,181.25

TAMARACK 3.67 3.67 47.00 Cds $172.49

$43,044.25  

Brad Horsmann Logging, LLC

ASPEN 19.44 31.50 1819.00 Cds $57,298.50

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.50 29.00 Cds $362.50

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 24.50 375.00 Cds $9,187.50

TAMARACK 3.67 4.00 47.00 Cds $188.00

$67,036.50  

Imhof Logging and Chipping

ASPEN 19.44 32.55 1819.00 Cds $59,208.45

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 29.00 Cds $329.15

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 19.15 375.00 Cds $7,181.25

TAMARACK 3.67 3.67 47.00 Cds $172.49

$66,891.34  

John Rolle Logging

ASPEN 19.44 29.51 1819.00 Cds $53,678.69

BALSAM FIR 11.35 18.35 29.00 Cds $532.15

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 29.51 375.00 Cds $11,066.25

TAMARACK 3.67 6.00 47.00 Cds $282.00

$65,559.09  

Shermer Logging

ASPEN 19.44 33.20 1819.00 Cds $60,390.80

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.00 29.00 Cds $348.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 24.00 375.00 Cds $9,000.00

TAMARACK 3.67 4.00 47.00 Cds $188.00

$69,926.80  

UPM Blandin Forestry

ASPEN 19.44 30.25 1819.00 Cds $55,024.75

BALSAM FIR 11.35 13.50 29.00 Cds $391.50

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 27.50 375.00 Cds $10,312.50



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

TAMARACK 3.67 6.00 47.00 Cds $282.00

$66,010.75  

Tract 5 C19200036

Rutar Logging Llc

ASPEN 15.90 23.01 576.00 Cds $13,253.76

BALM OF GILEAD 15.90 25.00 16.00 Cds $400.00

BALSAM FIR 9.29 10.00 97.00 Cds $970.00

BASSWOOD 3.91 4.00 170.00 Cds $680.00

BIRCH 4.54 6.00 269.00 Cds $1,614.00

MAPLE-RED 2.67 4.00 132.00 Cds $528.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 2.67 3.00 63.00 Cds $189.00

PINE-NORWAY 26.93 40.00 3.00 Cds $120.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 13.00 18.00 19.00 Cds $342.00

$18,096.76 *Winner*

Sokoloski Logging

ASPEN 15.90 20.00 576.00 Cds $11,520.00

BALM OF GILEAD 15.90 20.00 16.00 Cds $320.00

BALSAM FIR 9.29 12.00 97.00 Cds $1,164.00

BASSWOOD 3.91 3.91 170.00 Cds $664.70

BIRCH 4.54 10.00 269.00 Cds $2,690.00

MAPLE-RED 2.67 6.00 132.00 Cds $792.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 2.67 6.00 63.00 Cds $378.00

PINE-NORWAY 26.93 26.93 3.00 Cds $80.79

SPRUCE-WHITE 13.00 18.00 19.00 Cds $342.00

$17,951.49  

Tract 7 C19200038

UPM Blandin Forestry

ASPEN 17.67 26.50 89.00 Cds $2,358.50

BALSAM FIR 10.32 14.00 46.00 Cds $644.00

BIRCH 5.04 8.00 49.00 Cds $392.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 22.50 1112.00 Cds $25,020.00

TAMARACK 3.33 5.00 391.00 Cds $1,955.00

$30,369.50 *Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 
10

C19200041

Heesaker Forest Products

ASH 2.40 2.40 10.00 Cds $24.00

ASPEN 14.14 18.00 302.00 Cds $5,436.00

BALM OF GILEAD 14.14 14.14 12.00 Cds $169.68

BALSAM FIR 8.26 8.26 42.00 Cds $346.92

BIRCH 4.03 8.00 73.00 Cds $584.00

MAPLE-RED 2.37 3.00 67.00 Cds $201.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 13.93 13.93 17.00 Cds $236.81

SPRUCE-WHITE 11.56 11.56 12.00 Cds $138.72

TAMARACK 2.67 2.67 3.00 Cds $8.01

$7,145.14 *Winner*

Tract 
11

C19200042

Truaxe Forest Harvesting LLC 

ASH 3.00 5.10 68.00 Cds $346.80

ASPEN 17.67 30.04 1663.00 Cds $49,956.52

BALM OF GILEAD 16.98 28.87 138.00 Cds $3,984.06

BALSAM FIR 10.32 17.54 137.00 Cds $2,402.98

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 29.60 2.00 Cds $59.20

$56,749.56 *Winner*

Tract 
12

C19200043

UPM Blandin Forestry

ASPEN 15.90 23.50 636.00 Cds $14,946.00

BALM OF GILEAD 15.28 23.50 35.00 Cds $822.50

BALSAM FIR 9.29 14.50 172.00 Cds $2,494.00

BIRCH 4.54 8.00 95.00 Cds $760.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 15.67 31.00 573.00 Cds $17,763.00

TAMARACK 3.00 8.00 474.00 Cds $3,792.00

$40,577.50 *Winner*

Truaxe Forest Harvesting LLC 

ASPEN 15.90 17.81 636.00 Cds $11,327.16

BALM OF GILEAD 15.28 17.11 35.00 Cds $598.85

BALSAM FIR 9.29 10.40 172.00 Cds $1,788.80



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BIRCH 4.54 5.08 95.00 Cds $482.60

SPRUCE-BLACK 15.67 17.55 573.00 Cds $10,056.15

TAMARACK 3.00 3.36 474.00 Cds $1,592.64

$25,846.20  

Tract 
13

C19200044

Watters Excavating 

ASH 3.00 3.00 149.00 Cds $447.00

ASPEN 17.67 22.00 734.00 Cds $16,148.00

BALM OF GILEAD 16.98 22.00 85.00 Cds $1,870.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 10.32 2.00 Cds $20.64

BASSWOOD 4.34 4.34 138.00 Cds $598.92

BIRCH 5.04 10.00 127.00 Cds $1,270.00

BIRCH-YELLOW 5.04 10.00 2.00 Cds $20.00

CEDAR-N.WHITE 5.00 5.00 2.00 Cds $10.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.41 10.00 471.00 Cds $4,710.00

OAK-RED 10.00 10.00 1.00 Cds $10.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 17.41 1.00 Cds $17.41

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 14.45 1.00 Cds $14.45

$25,136.42 *Winner*

Tract 
14

C19200045

Watters Excavating 

ASH 3.30 3.30 287.00 Cds $947.10

ASPEN 19.44 22.50 431.00 Cds $9,697.50

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 22.50 193.00 Cds $4,342.50

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.00 1282.00 Cds $15,384.00

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 2083.00 Cds $20,830.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 332.00 Cds $3,320.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 10.00 833.00 Cds $8,330.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 20.00 29.00 Cds $580.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.00 590.00 Cds $11,800.00

$75,231.10 *Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 
15

C19200046

Watters Excavating 

ASH 3.30 3.30 526.00 Cds $1,735.80

ASPEN 19.44 28.00 502.00 Cds $14,056.00

ASPEN-LARGETOOTH 19.44 28.00 51.00 Cds $1,428.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 28.00 34.00 Cds $952.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 124.00 Cds $1,407.40

BASSWOOD 4.78 4.78 31.00 Cds $148.18

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 262.00 Cds $2,620.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 192.00 Cds $1,920.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 10.00 204.00 Cds $2,040.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 20.00 40.00 Cds $800.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.00 105.00 Cds $2,100.00

$29,207.38 *Winner*

Tract 
16

C19200047

Watters Excavating 

ASPEN 17.67 28.00 1582.00 Cds $44,296.00

BALM OF GILEAD 16.98 28.00 7.00 Cds $196.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 10.32 161.00 Cds $1,661.52

BIRCH 5.04 10.00 485.00 Cds $4,850.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 20.00 85.00 Cds $1,700.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 20.00 37.00 Cds $740.00

$53,443.52 *Winner*

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

ASPEN 17.67 22.00 1582.00 Cds $34,804.00

BALM OF GILEAD 16.98 22.00 7.00 Cds $154.00

BALSAM FIR 10.32 11.00 161.00 Cds $1,771.00

BIRCH 5.04 7.00 485.00 Cds $3,395.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 17.50 85.00 Cds $1,487.50

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 17.50 37.00 Cds $647.50

$42,259.00  

Futurewood Corporation

ASPEN 17.67 21.00 1582.00 Cds $33,222.00

BALM OF GILEAD 16.98 21.00 7.00 Cds $147.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BALSAM FIR 10.32 13.00 161.00 Cds $2,093.00

BIRCH 5.04 7.00 485.00 Cds $3,395.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 18.00 85.00 Cds $1,530.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 18.00 37.00 Cds $666.00

$41,053.00  

Jatco Inc.

ASPEN 17.67 29.50 1582.00 Cds $46,669.00

BALM OF GILEAD 16.98 29.50 7.00 Cds $206.50

BALSAM FIR 10.32 10.32 161.00 Cds $1,661.52

BIRCH 5.04 5.04 485.00 Cds $2,444.40

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 18.00 85.00 Cds $1,530.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 14.45 18.00 37.00 Cds $666.00

$53,177.42  

Tract 
17

C19200048

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

ASPEN 5.00 5.00 115.00 Cds $575.00

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 160.00 Cds $800.00

BIRCH 4.54 5.00 5.00 Cds $25.00

MAPLE-RED 2.67 5.00 7.00 Cds $35.00

PINE-NORWAY 5.00 5.00 9.00 Cds $45.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 5.00 340.00 Cds $1,700.00

$3,180.00 *Winner*

Tract 
18

C19200049

Fjeran Forest Products Llc

BALSAM FIR 5.00 5.00 21.00 Cds $105.00

BIRCH 5.00 5.00 3.00 Cds $15.00

PINE-JACK 5.00 5.00 5.00 Cds $25.00

PINE-NORWAY 5.00 5.25 330.00 Cds $1,732.50

SPRUCE-WHITE 5.00 5.00 2.00 Cds $10.00

TAMARACK 5.00 5.00 5.00 Cds $25.00

$1,912.50 *Winner*



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 
19

C19200050

Sappi Fine Paper

ASH 3.00 3.00 311.00 Cds $933.00

ASPEN 17.67 32.20 1844.00 Cds $59,376.80

ASPEN-LARGETOOTH 17.67 32.20 33.00 Cds $1,062.60

BALM OF GILEAD 16.98 32.20 66.00 Cds $2,125.20

MAPLE-RED 2.97 2.97 92.00 Cds $273.24

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.41 3.41 14.00 Cds $47.74

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 18.90 80.00 Cds $1,512.00

$65,330.58 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation

ASH 3.00 8.00 311.00 Cds $2,488.00

ASPEN 17.67 29.00 1844.00 Cds $53,476.00

ASPEN-LARGETOOTH 17.67 29.00 33.00 Cds $957.00

BALM OF GILEAD 16.98 29.00 66.00 Cds $1,914.00

MAPLE-RED 2.97 12.00 92.00 Cds $1,104.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.41 12.00 14.00 Cds $168.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 18.50 80.00 Cds $1,480.00

$61,587.00  

UPM Blandin Forestry

ASH 3.00 3.00 311.00 Cds $933.00

ASPEN 17.67 23.50 1844.00 Cds $43,334.00

ASPEN-LARGETOOTH 17.67 23.50 33.00 Cds $775.50

BALM OF GILEAD 16.98 23.50 66.00 Cds $1,551.00

MAPLE-RED 2.97 4.00 92.00 Cds $368.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.41 4.00 14.00 Cds $56.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 17.41 25.00 80.00 Cds $2,000.00

$49,017.50  

Tract 
20

C19200051

Sappi Fine Paper

ASH 3.30 25.00 73.00 Cds $1,825.00

ASPEN 19.44 25.00 1160.00 Cds $29,000.00

BASSWOOD 4.78 25.00 62.00 Cds $1,550.00

BIRCH 5.54 25.00 59.00 Cds $1,475.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

MAPLE-RED 3.26 25.00 181.00 Cds $4,525.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 25.00 191.00 Cds $4,775.00

$43,150.00 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation

ASH 3.30 5.00 73.00 Cds $365.00

ASPEN 19.44 31.00 1160.00 Cds $35,960.00

BASSWOOD 4.78 5.00 62.00 Cds $310.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 59.00 Cds $354.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 12.00 181.00 Cds $2,172.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 12.00 191.00 Cds $2,292.00

$41,453.00  

Tract 
21

C19200052

UPM Blandin Forestry

ASPEN 19.44 26.00 342.00 Cds $8,892.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 26.00 7.00 Cds $182.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 14.00 49.00 Cds $686.00

BIRCH 5.54 8.00 18.00 Cds $144.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 8.00 174.00 Cds $1,392.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 8.00 16.00 Cds $128.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 28.00 474.00 Cds $13,272.00

TAMARACK 1.00 3.00 124.00 Cds $372.00

$25,068.00 *Winner*

Mike Zauhar Logging

ASPEN 19.44 24.10 342.00 Cds $8,242.20

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 21.15 7.00 Cds $148.05

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.00 49.00 Cds $588.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.21 18.00 Cds $111.78

MAPLE-RED 3.26 4.51 174.00 Cds $784.74

MAPLE-SUGAR 3.75 4.52 16.00 Cds $72.32

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 21.05 474.00 Cds $9,977.70

TAMARACK 1.00 2.00 124.00 Cds $248.00

$20,172.79  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Tract 
23

C19200054

Sappi Fine Paper

ASH 3.60 3.60 326.00 Cds $1,173.60

ASPEN 21.21 31.05 3646.00 Cds $113,208.30

BALM OF GILEAD 21.21 31.05 116.00 Cds $3,601.80

BALSAM FIR 12.38 12.38 295.00 Cds $3,652.10

BASSWOOD 5.21 5.21 17.00 Cds $88.57

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 21.00 358.00 Cds $7,518.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 21.00 13.00 Cds $273.00

TAMARACK 4.00 4.00 46.00 Cds $184.00

$129,699.37 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation

ASH 3.60 4.00 326.00 Cds $1,304.00

ASPEN 21.21 22.50 3646.00 Cds $82,035.00

BALM OF GILEAD 21.21 22.50 116.00 Cds $2,610.00

BALSAM FIR 12.38 14.00 295.00 Cds $4,130.00

BASSWOOD 5.21 6.00 17.00 Cds $102.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 22.00 358.00 Cds $7,876.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 22.00 13.00 Cds $286.00

TAMARACK 4.00 4.00 46.00 Cds $184.00

$98,527.00  

Jatco Inc.

ASH 3.60 3.60 326.00 Cds $1,173.60

ASPEN 21.21 28.75 3646.00 Cds $104,822.50

BALM OF GILEAD 21.21 28.75 116.00 Cds $3,335.00

BALSAM FIR 12.38 12.38 295.00 Cds $3,652.10

BASSWOOD 5.21 5.21 17.00 Cds $88.57

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 22.00 358.00 Cds $7,876.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 22.00 13.00 Cds $286.00

TAMARACK 4.00 4.00 46.00 Cds $184.00

$121,417.77  

Tract 
26

C19200057

Watters Excavating 

ASH 3.60 3.60 9.00 Cds $32.40



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

ASPEN 21.21 35.50 1823.00 Cds $64,716.50

BALM OF GILEAD 20.38 35.50 124.00 Cds $4,402.00

BALSAM FIR 12.38 12.38 343.00 Cds $4,246.34

BIRCH 6.05 10.00 61.00 Cds $610.00

MAPLE-RED 3.56 10.00 4.00 Cds $40.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 4.09 10.00 17.00 Cds $170.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 22.00 58.00 Cds $1,276.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 20.00 31.00 Cds $620.00

$76,113.24 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation

ASH 3.60 4.00 9.00 Cds $36.00

ASPEN 21.21 24.00 1823.00 Cds $43,752.00

BALM OF GILEAD 20.38 24.00 124.00 Cds $2,976.00

BALSAM FIR 12.38 14.00 343.00 Cds $4,802.00

BIRCH 6.05 7.00 61.00 Cds $427.00

MAPLE-RED 3.56 10.00 4.00 Cds $40.00

MAPLE-SUGAR 4.09 10.00 17.00 Cds $170.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 21.00 58.00 Cds $1,218.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 21.00 31.00 Cds $651.00

$54,072.00  

Jatco Inc.

ASH 3.60 3.60 9.00 Cds $32.40

ASPEN 21.21 29.25 1823.00 Cds $53,322.75

BALM OF GILEAD 20.38 29.25 124.00 Cds $3,627.00

BALSAM FIR 12.38 12.38 343.00 Cds $4,246.34

BIRCH 6.05 6.05 61.00 Cds $369.05

MAPLE-RED 3.56 3.56 4.00 Cds $14.24

MAPLE-SUGAR 4.09 4.09 17.00 Cds $69.53

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 22.00 58.00 Cds $1,276.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 22.00 31.00 Cds $682.00

$63,639.31  

Wood Timber Enterprises, Inc.

ASH 3.60 4.00 9.00 Cds $36.00

ASPEN 21.21 23.50 1823.00 Cds $42,840.50

BALM OF GILEAD 20.38 21.00 124.00 Cds $2,604.00

BALSAM FIR 12.38 12.38 343.00 Cds $4,246.34

BIRCH 6.05 7.00 61.00 Cds $427.00

MAPLE-RED 3.56 4.00 4.00 Cds $16.00



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

MAPLE-SUGAR 4.09 4.09 17.00 Cds $69.53

SPRUCE-BLACK 20.89 20.89 58.00 Cds $1,211.62

SPRUCE-WHITE 17.34 17.34 31.00 Cds $537.54

$51,988.53  

Tract 
27

C19200058

Jatco Inc.

ASPEN 19.44 31.00 870.00 Cds $26,970.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 31.00 9.00 Cds $279.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 196.00 Cds $2,224.60

BIRCH 5.54 6.50 240.00 Cds $1,560.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 4.00 107.00 Cds $428.00

PINE-JACK 18.13 18.13 4.00 Cds $72.52

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 19.00 75.00 Cds $1,425.00

$32,959.12 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation

ASPEN 19.44 27.00 870.00 Cds $23,490.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 27.00 9.00 Cds $243.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 14.60 196.00 Cds $2,861.60

BIRCH 5.54 8.00 240.00 Cds $1,920.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 8.00 107.00 Cds $856.00

PINE-JACK 18.13 19.00 4.00 Cds $76.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.00 75.00 Cds $1,500.00

$30,946.60  

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

ASPEN 19.44 28.00 870.00 Cds $24,360.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 28.00 9.00 Cds $252.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 196.00 Cds $2,940.00

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 240.00 Cds $2,400.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 8.00 107.00 Cds $856.00

PINE-JACK 18.13 20.00 4.00 Cds $80.00

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 22.00 75.00 Cds $1,650.00

$32,538.00  

Sappi Fine Paper

ASPEN 19.44 20.70 870.00 Cds $18,009.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 20.70 9.00 Cds $186.30

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 196.00 Cds $2,224.60



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 240.00 Cds $1,329.60

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 107.00 Cds $348.82

PINE-JACK 18.13 18.13 4.00 Cds $72.52

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 16.80 75.00 Cds $1,260.00

$23,430.84  

Watters Excavating 

ASPEN 19.44 28.00 870.00 Cds $24,360.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 28.00 9.00 Cds $252.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 196.00 Cds $2,224.60

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 240.00 Cds $2,400.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 107.00 Cds $1,070.00

PINE-JACK 18.13 18.13 4.00 Cds $72.52

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 20.00 75.00 Cds $1,500.00

$31,879.12  

Tract 
29

C19200060

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC

ASPEN 19.44 33.00 903.00 Cds $29,799.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 33.00 4.00 Cds $132.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 15.00 80.00 Cds $1,200.00

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 13.00 Cds $130.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 32.00 Cds $320.00

$31,581.00 *Winner*

Futurewood Corporation

ASPEN 19.44 23.00 903.00 Cds $20,769.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 23.00 4.00 Cds $92.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 12.00 80.00 Cds $960.00

BIRCH 5.54 7.00 13.00 Cds $91.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 7.00 32.00 Cds $224.00

$22,136.00  

Jatco Inc.

ASPEN 19.44 23.00 903.00 Cds $20,769.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 23.00 4.00 Cds $92.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 80.00 Cds $908.00

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 13.00 Cds $72.02

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 32.00 Cds $104.32

$21,945.34  



Tract Contract Contractor Name App. Bid Volume     Value Winning 
Bid

Bid 
Error

Sappi Fine Paper

ASPEN 19.44 20.70 903.00 Cds $18,692.10

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 20.70 4.00 Cds $82.80

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 80.00 Cds $908.00

BIRCH 5.54 5.54 13.00 Cds $72.02

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.26 32.00 Cds $104.32

$19,859.24  

Watters Excavating 

ASPEN 19.44 28.00 903.00 Cds $25,284.00

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 28.00 4.00 Cds $112.00

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.35 80.00 Cds $908.00

BIRCH 5.54 10.00 13.00 Cds $130.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 10.00 32.00 Cds $320.00

$26,754.00  

Tract 
31

C19200062

Hedstrom Lumber Co Inc

ASH 3.30 3.35 36.00 Cds $120.60

ASPEN 19.44 19.65 1475.00 Cds $28,983.75

BALM OF GILEAD 18.68 18.90 3.00 Cds $56.70

BALSAM FIR 11.35 11.50 46.00 Cds $529.00

BIRCH 5.54 6.00 59.00 Cds $354.00

MAPLE-RED 3.26 3.35 66.00 Cds $221.10

PINE-JACK 18.13 18.35 51.00 Cds $935.85

PINE-NORWAY 32.91 33.25 121.00 Cds $4,023.25

PINE-WHITE 23.80 24.00 433.00 Cds $10,392.00

SPRUCE-BLACK 19.15 19.35 16.00 Cds $309.60

SPRUCE-WHITE 15.90 16.10 85.00 Cds $1,368.50

$47,294.35 *Winner*
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1 C19200032

Boise White Paper LLC 5.00 33.10 - 33.10 13.00 - 10.00 - - 10.00 - - - - - - 19.00 -

Brad Horsmann Logging, 
LLC 3.30 25.00 - 20.00 12.50 - 6.00 - - 3.26 - - - - - - 16.00 -

Rutar Logging Llc 4.00 24.00 - 24.00 15.00 - 10.00 - - 10.00 - - - - - - 25.00 -

Shermer Logging 5.00 34.10 - 20.00 14.00 - 6.00 - - 6.00 - - - - - - 20.00 -

2 C19200033

Arvila Logging 3.00 18.00 - - 10.32 - 5.09 - - 3.00 - - - - - - - -

Boise White Paper LLC 10.00 24.00 - - 24.00 - 10.00 - - 10.00 - - - - - - - -

3 C19200034

Arvila Logging - 18.00 - 18.00 15.00 - 5.10 - - - - - - - - - 15.00 -

Boise White Paper LLC - 33.90 - 33.90 15.00 - 9.00 - - - - - - - - - 16.00 -

Brad Horsmann Logging, 
LLC - 32.50 - 18.50 11.00 - 5.50 - - - - - - - - - 15.00 -

Bud Strandberg - 32.76 - 32.76 11.20 - 9.04 - - - - - - - - - 20.00 -

Imhof Logging and 
Chipping - 32.05 - 32.05 10.32 - 5.04 - - - - - - - - - 14.45 -

John Rolle Logging - 29.51 - 29.51 18.03 - 8.00 - - - - - - - - - 20.45 -

Shermer Logging - 26.30 - 20.00 14.00 - 6.00 - - - - - - - - - 15.00 -

For Auction held on 5/14/2020
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4 C19200035

Arvila Logging - 19.44 - - 11.35 - - - - - - - - - - 19.15 - 3.67

Boise White Paper LLC - 37.00 - - 15.00 - - - - - - - - - - 24.15 - 6.00

Brad Horsmann Logging, 
LLC - 31.50 - - 12.50 - - - - - - - - - - 24.50 - 4.00

Imhof Logging and 
Chipping - 32.55 - - 11.35 - - - - - - - - - - 19.15 - 3.67

John Rolle Logging - 29.51 - - 18.35 - - - - - - - - - - 29.51 - 6.00

Shermer Logging - 33.20 - - 12.00 - - - - - - - - - - 24.00 - 4.00

UPM Blandin Forestry - 30.25 - - 13.50 - - - - - - - - - - 27.50 - 6.00

5 C19200036

Rutar Logging Llc - 23.01 - 25.00 10.00 4.00 6.00 - - 4.00 3.00 - - 40.00 - - 18.00 -

Sokoloski Logging - 20.00 - 20.00 12.00 3.91 10.00 - - 6.00 6.00 - - 26.93 - - 18.00 -

7 C19200038

UPM Blandin Forestry - 26.50 - - 14.00 - 8.00 - - - - - - - - 22.50 - 5.00

10 C19200041

Heesaker Forest Products 2.40 18.00 - 14.14 8.26 - 8.00 - - 3.00 - - - - - 13.93 11.56 2.67

11 C19200042

Truaxe Forest Harvesting 
LLC 5.10 30.04 - 28.87 17.54 - - - - - - - - - - 29.60 - -

12 C19200043

Truaxe Forest Harvesting 
LLC - 17.81 - 17.11 10.40 - 5.08 - - - - - - - - 17.55 - 3.36
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12 UPM Blandin Forestry - 23.50 - 23.50 14.50 - 8.00 - - - - - - - - 31.00 - 8.00

13 C19200044

Watters Excavating 3.00 22.00 - 22.00 10.32 4.34 10.00 10.00 5.00 - 10.00 10.00 - - - 17.41 14.45 -

14 C19200045

Watters Excavating 3.30 22.50 - 22.50 12.00 - 10.00 - - 10.00 10.00 - - - - 20.00 20.00 -

15 C19200046

Watters Excavating 3.30 28.00 28.00 28.00 11.35 4.78 10.00 - - 10.00 10.00 - - - - 20.00 20.00 -

16 C19200047

Fjeran Forest Products Llc - 22.00 - 22.00 11.00 - 7.00 - - - - - - - - 17.50 17.50 -

Futurewood Corporation - 21.00 - 21.00 13.00 - 7.00 - - - - - - - - 18.00 18.00 -

Jatco Inc. - 29.50 - 29.50 10.32 - 5.04 - - - - - - - - 18.00 18.00 -

Watters Excavating - 28.00 - 28.00 10.32 - 10.00 - - - - - - - - 20.00 20.00 -

17 C19200048

Fjeran Forest Products Llc - 5.00 - - 5.00 - 5.00 - - 5.00 - - - 5.00 - - 5.00 -

18 C19200049

Fjeran Forest Products Llc - - - - 5.00 - 5.00 - - - - - 5.00 5.25 - - 5.00 5.00

19 C19200050

Futurewood Corporation 8.00 29.00 29.00 29.00 - - - - - 12.00 12.00 - - - - 18.50 - -

Sappi Fine Paper 3.00 32.20 32.20 32.20 - - - - - 2.97 3.41 - - - - 18.90 - -

UPM Blandin Forestry 3.00 23.50 23.50 23.50 - - - - - 4.00 4.00 - - - - 25.00 - -
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20 C19200051

Futurewood Corporation 5.00 31.00 - - - 5.00 6.00 - - 12.00 12.00 - - - - - - -

Sappi Fine Paper 25.00 25.00 - - - 25.00 25.00 - - 25.00 25.00 - - - - - - -

21 C19200052

Mike Zauhar Logging - 24.10 - 21.15 12.00 - 6.21 - - 4.51 4.52 - - - - 21.05 - 2.00

UPM Blandin Forestry - 26.00 - 26.00 14.00 - 8.00 - - 8.00 8.00 - - - - 28.00 - 3.00

23 C19200054

Futurewood Corporation 4.00 22.50 - 22.50 14.00 6.00 - - - - - - - - - 22.00 22.00 4.00

Jatco Inc. 3.60 28.75 - 28.75 12.38 5.21 - - - - - - - - - 22.00 22.00 4.00

Sappi Fine Paper 3.60 31.05 - 31.05 12.38 5.21 - - - - - - - - - 21.00 21.00 4.00

26 C19200057

Futurewood Corporation 4.00 24.00 - 24.00 14.00 - 7.00 - - 10.00 10.00 - - - - 21.00 21.00 -

Jatco Inc. 3.60 29.25 - 29.25 12.38 - 6.05 - - 3.56 4.09 - - - - 22.00 22.00 -

Watters Excavating 3.60 35.50 - 35.50 12.38 - 10.00 - - 10.00 10.00 - - - - 22.00 20.00 -

Wood Timber Enterprises, 
Inc. 4.00 23.50 - 21.00 12.38 - 7.00 - - 4.00 4.09 - - - - 20.89 17.34 -

27 C19200058

Futurewood Corporation - 27.00 - 27.00 14.60 - 8.00 - - 8.00 - - 19.00 - - - 20.00 -

Jatco Inc. - 31.00 - 31.00 11.35 - 6.50 - - 4.00 - - 18.13 - - - 19.00 -

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC - 28.00 - 28.00 15.00 - 10.00 - - 8.00 - - 20.00 - - - 22.00 -

Sappi Fine Paper - 20.70 - 20.70 11.35 - 5.54 - - 3.26 - - 18.13 - - - 16.80 -
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27 Watters Excavating - 28.00 - 28.00 11.35 - 10.00 - - 10.00 - - 18.13 - - - 20.00 -

29 C19200060

Futurewood Corporation - 23.00 - 23.00 12.00 - 7.00 - - 7.00 - - - - - - - -

Jatco Inc. - 23.00 - 23.00 11.35 - 5.54 - - 3.26 - - - - - - - -

Lobb Forest Enterprises LLC - 33.00 - 33.00 15.00 - 10.00 - - 10.00 - - - - - - - -

Sappi Fine Paper - 20.70 - 20.70 11.35 - 5.54 - - 3.26 - - - - - - - -

Watters Excavating - 28.00 - 28.00 11.35 - 10.00 - - 10.00 - - - - - - - -

31 C19200062

Hedstrom Lumber Co Inc 3.35 19.65 - 18.90 11.50 - 6.00 - - 3.35 - - 18.35 33.25 24.00 19.35 16.10 -


