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NOTICE OF ST. LOUIS COUNTY PUBLIC ORAL TIMBER AUCTION 

Notice is hereby given that the St. Louis County Auditor shall sell to the highest bidder the designated timber 
located on the following described parcels of land forfeited to the state for the nonpayment of taxes, which have 
been classified and appraised as provided by Minnesota Statutes 282.04, Subd. 1(1982), subject, in part, to the 
following conditions: 

1. To be eligible to bid at a St. Louis County Timber Auction, a Responsible Operator Application Form must be 
on file at the St. Louis County Land and Minerals Department, 320 West 2nd Street, Suite 302, Duluth, MN 
55802, at least two (2) working days prior to the auction. An application can be obtained at any Land and 
Minerals Department Office. 

2. A minimum of fifteen (15) percent of the appraised value shall be paid at time of contract signing.  Contract 
signing and billing for the down payment will occur after the auction through the mail. The remaining balance 
shall be paid prior to entry. REQUIRED DOWN PAYMENT IS SPECIFIED ON LIST. 

3. Minimum bid shall be the appraised value of the sale. Bids shall be at one (1) or more percent over and 
above the appraised prices. The final percent bid is to be added to the price of each kind of timber 
advertised, unless otherwise stipulated in individual contract regulations. Species denoted as No Bid will not 
be subject to the percent bid increase. 

4. Many of the tracts have special requirements. The St. Louis County Land and Minerals Department offers 
sales of various sizes, species and products to meet the needs of a wide variety of purchasers. There are 
some sales offered on this auction that allow the purchaser to decide if they want to purchase the sale as 
offered, either all species scaled or a mix of scaled and SOAV species, or choose to have all the species 
sold as SOAV. These are identified with the following sentence in the comments of each tract: “The 
purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On 
Appraised Volume (SOAV)”. If there is any conflict between the Timber Sale Package and this 
advertisement, the Timber Sale Package is the controlling document. The Timber Sale Package 
contains maps, volume and values, contract information and harvest provisions, and is available at the 
applicable AREA OFFICE listed below or on the county website: 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

STLOUISCOUNTYMN.GOV 
 

 

Sale will be held at: 

MN Discovery Center Pavilion 

1005 Discovery Drive, Chisholm, MN 

11:00 A.M. - September 30, 2020 

 

 

Published as follows is the list of timber to be offered at public auction sale as announced and  

advertised in the official newspaper within this county. 

Virginia Area 
Dave Skurla, Area Land Manager 

7820 Highway 135 
Virginia, MN 55792 

 
218-742-9898 

Pike Lake Area 
Mark Pannkuk, Area Land Manager 

5713 Old Miller Trunk Highway 
Duluth, MN 55811 

 
218-625-3700 



Please Note: 

Successful bidders will be mailed a contract for signing and invoiced for the down payment.  Ten 
(10) business days will be given upon receipt of the mailing to return the down payment and signed 
contract, and for choosing Sold on Appraised Volume (SOAV) for those sales offering this option.  
St. Louis County recognizes the challenges which are occurring with the postal service and reserves 
the right to be flexible on this deadline.   

 
Timber Sale Operators must have the following minimum training for at least the owner of the firm 
and the foreman who will supervise the logging on St. Louis County Lands: 

 Master Logging Certification; or 

 Minnesota Logger Education (MLEP) Member in Good Standing; or SFI Training 
FISTA member: or 

 Training equivalent to the Minnesota SFI Implementation Committee Training        
Standard for a trained Professional Logger.                 

All field employees must have training in best management practices. 



Special  COVID‐19 AucƟon Procedures 

*Please read the following requirements* 

 

Prior RegistraƟon InstrucƟons  

RegistraƟon is encouraged before the aucƟon. Bidders should contact the Virginia or Pike Lake offices before 

the aucƟon to register and receive their bidder number through the mail. Bidder numbers can also be re-

ceived by arranging to pick them up at one of the area offices.  

 

 

Covid PrecauƟons 

The AucƟon will be held in compliance with the Governor’s ExecuƟve Order 20-81 

        

             *Any person who is sick or experiencing any symptom of Covid-19 should not aƩend the aucƟon. 

 

*Bidders are asked to maintain physical distancing when entering the Pavilion, go directly to a seat  

  and leave the Pavilion aŌer aucƟon is concluded. 

 

*Face coverings shall be worn by all inside the Pavilion except those who are exempted under the  

  Governor’s order. Please bring your own face covering otherwise one will be provided at the door. 

 

*Face covering may be temporarily removed by the aucƟoneer and those acƟvely bidding to ensure         

               bidding informaƟon is heard correctly. 

 

 *Chairs will be spaced to maintain physical distancing. 

 

*Companies are encouraged to send only one individual to minimize number of people in aƩendance 

 

 *Refreshments will not be provided. 

 

 *AucƟon registraƟon will be performed before the aucƟon as described above. 

 

* Winning bidders will be recorded at the aucƟon. Down payments and contract signing by successful  

   bidders will not occur at the aucƟon but by mail aŌer the aucƟon.   

 

 

IMPORTANT  

INFORMATION 

PLEASE READ 
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I species I sticks loia. lcords/ac Comments: 

Aspen 6.1 11.7 14.3 -Balsam fir and white and black spruce may be left on site
Spruce-Black 3.9 6.0 5.3 and will not be charged for if it is not utilized. The

Maple-Red 3.3 8.8 3.5 unutilized wood from these species will remain standing or
--- be felled and piled, scattered or skidded as determined by

Birch 3.4 8.3 1.1 the Sale Administrator.
Ash 4.2 9.1 1.0 -Harvesting the residual tree tops or whole tree
Balsam Fir 3.4 8.6 0.8 chipping/grinding will not be allowed.

Access: 

Block 1 sale access will be new winter road construction on county land from Block 2 ( + /- 0.45 miles) or the Purchaser may be able 
to secure access from the King Road through private property. 

Block 2 sale access will be a current established road approach on county land from County Hwy 23 (Orr Buyck Road). 

Block 
____ 

Operational Periods 

1 and 2 Frozen ground 

SOAV Product 

Total For All Blocks 

Ash pulpwood 

Aspen pulpwood 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Birch pulpwood 

Red Maple pulpwood 

Black Spruce pulpwood 

White Spruce pulpwood 

Tamarack pulpwood 

Volume Per Block 
Ash pulpwood 

Aspen pulpwood 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Birch pulpwood 

Red Maple pulpwood 

Black Spruce pulpwood 

White Spruce pulpwood 

Tamarack pulpwood 

Block 1 

108 

14 

10 

26 

324 

1 

36 

No Bid 

Block 2 

X 

X 

X 

X 

X 

56 

569 

19 

33 

146 

1 

5 

Total Volume Appraised Value 

56 Cords @ $3.30 =

677 Cords @ $19.44 =

33 Cords @ $5.00 =

43 Cords @ $5.54 =

172 Cords @ $3.26 =

324 Cords @ $15.00 =

2 Cords @ $15.00 =

41 Cords @ $3.67 =

Total Appraised Value: 

Total Value 

$184.80 

$13,160.88 

$165.00 

$238.22 

$560.72 

$4,860.00 

$30.00 

$150.47 

$19,350.09 
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I species I sticks loia. lcords/ac 
Aspen 4.4 8.8 11.4 

Maple-Red 2.5 8.1 1.3 

Birch 3.7 8.8 1.0 

Balsam Fir 2.6 7.3 0.9 

Spruce-White 4.9 11.7 0.6 

Pine-Jack 5.6 11.5 0.3 

Access: 

Block 1: Private access secured off Murray Road 

Block 2: New entrance Highway 169 

Operational Periods: 

Block 2: November 1 to April 15 

Operational Periods Block 

1 Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st 

SOAV Product 

Total For All Blocks 

Aspen pulpwood 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Birch pulpwood 

Red Maple pulpwood 

Jack Pine pulpwood 

Black Spruce pulpwood 

White Spruce pulpwood 

Volume Per Block 
Aspen pulpwood 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Birch pulpwood 

Red Maple pulpwood 

Jack Pine pulpwood 

Black Spruce pulpwood 

White Spruce pulpwood 

Block 1 
336 

29 

19 

27 

7 

9 

18 

No Bid 

Block 2 

X 

X 

X 

X 

227 

18 

34 

37 

7 

12 

� 
• •• • I 

Comments: 

-Balsam fir and white and black spruce may be left on site 

and will not be charged for if it is not utilized. The 

unutilized wood from these species will remain standing or 

be felled and piled, scattered or skidded as determined by 

the Sale Administrator.

-The Purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 

advertised, or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 

Volume (SOAV).

-Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree

chipping/grinding will not be allowed if the sale is 

purchased as a scaled option.

-$1,000 of the down      payment will be retained and will be 

held until satisfactory completion of the contract.

Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value 

563 Cords @ $17.67 = $9,948.21 

47 Cords @ $5.00 = $235.00 

53 Cords @ $5.04 = $267.12 

64 Cords @ $2.97 = $190.08 

14 Cords @ $16.48 = $230.72 

9 Cords @ $13.93 = $125.37 

30 Cords @ $11.56 = $346.80 

Total Appraised Value: $11,343.30 
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I species I sticks 
Aspen 5.4 

Balsam Fir 3.8 

Spruce-Black 5.2 

Birch 3.9 

Balm Of Gilead 3.5 

Spruce-White 5.3 

loia. lcords/ac 
11.0 12.7 

9.7 2.8 

8.5 1.5 

8.6 1.0 

9.4 0.5 

13.5 0.3 

� 
• •• • I 

Comments: 

-Balsam fir and white and black spruce may be left on site 

and will not be charged for if it is not utilized. The 

unutilized wood from these species will remain standing or 

be felled and piled, scattered or skidded as determined by 

the Sale Administrator.

-The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as 

advertised or to purchase all species as Sold On Appraised 

Volume (SOAV).

-Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree chipping will 

not be allowed if this sale is purchased as a scaled option.

-A minimum of $1,000 of the down payment will be 

retained and held until satisfactory completion of the 

contract.

Access: 

Lock private and county gates at all times when not in use (see harvest provisions). 

Operational Periods: 

Access to Blocks 1 and 2 is through private ownership on an existing winter road. This restricts the operational period to winter. 

Block 

1, 2 &3 

Operational Periods 

Frozen ground 

SOAV Product 

Total For All Blocks 

Aspen pulp & bolts 

Balm Of Gilead pulp & bolts 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Birch pulpwood 

Norway Pine pulp & bolts 

Black Spruce pulp & bolts 

White Spruce pulp & bolts 

Tamarack pulp & bolts 

Volume Per Block 
Aspen pulp & bolts 

Balm Of Gilead pulp & bolts 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Birch pulpwood 

Norway Pine pulp & bolts 

Black Spruce pulp & bolts 

White Spruce pulp & bolts 

Tamarack pulp & bolts 

Block 1
453 

25 

180 

20 

3 

138 

21 

30 

No Bid 

X 

X 

X 

X 

X 

Block 2 
659 

3 

112 

45 

3 

Total Volume Appraised Value 

1279 Cords @ $17.67 =

56 Cords @ $16.98 =

293 Cords @ $5.00 =

103 Cords @ $5.04 =

3 Cords @ $29.92 =

138 Cords @ $13.93 =

29 Cords @ $11.56 =

30 Cords @ $3.33 =

Total Appraised Value: 

Block 3 
167 

28 

1 

38 

5 

Total Value 

$22,599.93 

$950.88 

$1,465.00 

$519.12 

$89.76 

$1,922.34 

$335.24 

$99.90 

$27,982.17 
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St. Louis County September 30, 2020 Timber Auction 

I species I sticks loia. lcords/ac 
Aspen 4.7 11.1 10.3 

Birch 3.3 8.0 2.8 

Maple-Red 2.6 7.3 1.5 

Balsam Fir 3.1 7.4 1.3 

Spruce-White 4.4 10.1 1.2 

Access: 

See Administrator about Hibbing Taconite access requirements. 

Operational Periods: 

No extensions allowed on this sale. 

Block 

1-7

Operational Periods 

Frozen ground 

SOAV Product 

Total For All Blocks 

Aspen pulpwood 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Birch pulpwood 

Red Maple pulpwood 

White Spruce pulpwood 

Volume Per Block 
Aspen pulpwood 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Birch pulpwood 

Red Maple pulpwood 

White Spruce pulpwood 

Block 1 
239 

36 

48 

16 

30 

No Bid 

Block 2 

X 

X 

X 

328 

40 

128 

71 

38 

Comments: 

-Balsam fir and white spruce may be left on site and will 

not be charged for if it is not utilized. The unutilized wood 

from these species will remain standing or be felled and 

piled, scattered or skidded as determined by the Sale 

Administrator.

-Harvesting the residual tops or whole tree

chipping/grinding will not be allowed.

-A minimum $1,000 down payment will be retained and 

will be held until satisfactory completion of the contract.

-No extensions will be allowed.

Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value 

567 Cords @ $17.67 = $10,018.89 

76 Cords @ $5.00 = $380.00 

176 Cords @ $5.04 = $887.04 

87 Cords @ $2.97 = $258.39 

68 Cords @ $11.56 = $786.08 

Total Appraised Value: $12,330.40 
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I species I sticks loia. lcords/ac Comments: 
Pine-Norway 3.9 10.8 21.5 -Balsam fir may be left on site and will not be charged for

Pine-White 5.3 15.5 9.0 if it is not utilized. The unutilized wood will remain

Aspen 5.1 11.2 1.6 
standing or be felled and piled, scattered or skidded as

Spruce-White 3.3 9.2 0.7 
determined by the Sale Administrator.

-Pine species and products generated from the individual
Spruce-Black 2.3 6.1 0.2 payment cutting blocks will not be combined with other

Pine-Jack 3.8 11.0 0.2 cutting blocks when consumer scaled.

-No skidding permitted in Block 2 - Self Directed Thinning

(SDT). All timber must be removed with a forwarder.

Access: 
There is an existing approach off of Hwy 44 that will be utilized for the sale access. 

Block 
1,2 

Operational Periods 
Dry soil after July 1st 

SOAV Product 
Total For All Blocks 

Aspen pulpwood 
Balsam Fir pulpwood 
Mixed Pine pulpwood 
Jack Pine pulpwood 
Norway Pine pulpwood 
White Pine pulpwood 
Black Spruce pulpwood 
White Spruce pulpwood 
Tamarack pulpwood 

ck Volume Per Bio 
Aspen pulpwood 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Mixed Pine pulpwood 

Jack Pine pulpwood 

Norway Pine pulpwood 

White Pine pulpwood 

Black Spruce pulpwood 

White Spruce pulpwood 

Tamarack pulpwood 

Bloc 

No Bid 

k 1 Block 2 

X 

X 
X 
X 

118 7 

8 10 

385 

10 

661 

645 

2 9 

27 21 

2 

Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value 

125 Cords @ $21.21 = $2,651.25 
18 Cords @ $5.00 = $90.00 

385 Cords @ $5.00 = $1,925.00 
10 Cords @ $19.78 = $197.80 

661 Cords @ $35.90 = $23,729.90 
645 Cords @ $25.96 = $16,744.20 

11 Cords @ $16.00 = $176.00 
48 Cords @ $16.00 = $768.00 

2 Cords @ $4.00 = $8.00 
Total Appraised Value: $46,290.15 





Sales Map Sales Package 

St. Louis County September 30, 2020 Timber Auction 

I species I sticks loia. lcords/ac Comments: 
Aspen 5.8 11.2 14.4 Balsam fir and white and black spruce may be left on site 

Birch 5.7 11.4 7.2 and will not be charged for if it is not utilized. The 

Spruce-Black 4.8 7.0 3.2 
unutilized wood from these species will remain standing or 

Maple-Red 4.5 9.3 2.8 
be felled and piled, scattered or skidded as determined by 

the Sale Administrator. 
Maple-Sugar 3.9 7.7 2.4 

Tamarack 5.6 7.5 1.0 

Access: 
Access to the sale is via an existing woods road originating at Hwy 8. A complex of fairly steep hills run along most of the 

western side of the sale. The powerline (see map) can be used to access the eastern side of the sale and beyond. 

Potential buyers are encouraged to visit the site. 

Block 
1,2 

Operational Periods 
Frozen ground 

SOAV Product 
Total For All Blocks 

Aspen pulpwood 
Balsam Fir pulpwood 

SOAV 
SOAV 

Basswood pulpwood 
Birch pulpwood 

SOAV Red Maple pulpwood 
SOAV Sugar Maple pulpwood 

Black Spruce pulpwood 
White Spruce pulpwood 
Tamarack pulpwood 

Volume Per Bio 
Aspen pulpwood 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Basswood pulpwood 

Birch pulpwood 

ck 

Red Maple pulpwood 

Sugar Maple pulpwood 

Black Spruce pulpwood 

White Spruce pulpwood 

Tamarack pulpwood 

Bio ck 1 
470 

21 

92 

640 

178 

211 
65 

10 

No Bid 

X 

X 

X 
X 
X 

Block 2 
991 

5 

21 

224 

142 

81 

95 

11 
38 

Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value 

1461 Cords @ $21.21 = $30,987.81 
26 Cords @ $5.00 = $130.00 

113 Cords @ $5.21 = $588.73 
864Cords @ $6.05 = $5,227.20 
320 Cords @ $3.56 = $1,139.20 
292 Cords @ $4.09 = $1,194.28 
160 Cords @ $17.00 = $2,720.00 

11 Cords @ $17.00 = $187.00 
48 Cords @ $4.00 = $192.00 

Total Appraised Value: $42,366.22 
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I species

Spruce-Black 

Tamarack 

4.4 

3.6 

6.9 

7.0 

26.5 

3.9 

Comments: 

-This sale is being REOFFERED.

-Tamarack may be left on site and will not be charged for if

it is not utilized. The unutilized wood will remain standing

or be felled and piled, scattered or skidded as determined

by the Sale Administrator.

-There is a larch beetle infestation around the sale area.

Only live tamarack were tallied during the cruise.

Additional tamarack mortality is expected. The longer the

sale is held the more tamarack is lost.

-There is some flooding in Block 3 causing mortality in the

black spruce.

-Three drag line mat or ice bridge ditch crossings will be

required to access all areas of this sale.

Access: 

The winter road access for this sale will use an existing approach off County Road 832. 

Block 

1,2,3 

Operational Periods 

Frozen ground 

SOAV Product 

Total For All Blocks 

Black Spruce pulpwood 

Tamarack pulpwood 

Volume Per Block 

Black Spruce pulpwood 

Tamarack pulpwood l 

Block 1 

257 

88 

No Bid 

X 

Block 2 

1059 

67 

Total Volume Appraised Value 

Block 3 

1786 

317 

3102 Cords @ $10.00 

472 Cords @ $1.00 

=

=

Total Appraised Value: 

Total Value 

$31,020.00 

$472.00 

$31,492.00 
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I species

Pine-Norway 

Balsam Fir 

Pine-White 

Access: 

I sticks

3.5 7.8 

2.8 6.2 

3.0 9.3 

I 
29.1 

� 

1.1 

0.5 

Comments: 

THIS SALE IS BEING REOFFERED 

-Balsam fir may be left on site and will not be charged for
if it is not utilized. The unutilized wood from these species
will remain standing or be felled and piled, scattered or
skidded as determined by the Sale Administrator.
-No Skidding allowed. Forwarding only.
-Equipment travel swath is 15 feet maximum with 40 feet 
between swaths, equipment must be less than 12 ft wide. 
-See harvest provisions for Self Directed Thinning 
requirements.

Timber is located 1/2 mile from Hwy 4 on woods road that runs east 1/2 mile north of Three Lakes Road. Landing is in place. 

Block 

1 

SOAV Product 

Operational Periods 

Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st 

No Bid 

Total For All Blocks 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Norway Pine pulp & bolts 

White Pine pulpwood 

Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value 

4 Cords @ $5.00 = $20.00 

178 Cords @ $5.00 = $890.00 

2 Cords @ $5.00 = $10.00 

Total Appraised Value: $920.00 
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I species
Balsam Fir 

Aspen 

Birch 

2.0 

4.7 

3.7 

6.7 

9.4 

10.7 

I 
6.2 

� 

5.8 

3.0 

Comments: 

-Balsam fir may be left on site and will not be charged for 

if it is not utilized. The unutilized wood from these species 

will remain standing or be felled and piled, scattered or 

skidded as determined by the Sale Administrator.

-This sale does not meet our cruising error standards, 

please talk to the sale administrator for more information.

-No use of the Private Rush Lake Grade is allowed. The 

road segment off Hwy 4 leading to the designated access 

is public.

Access: 

Both blocks will be accessed off Hwy 4. Block 1 will be accessed using a public road off Hwy 4 that intersects with the Rush lake 

Grade. Block 2 will be accessed using a pre-existing woods roads. 

Operational Periods Block 

All Frozen ground or Dry soil after July 1st 

SOAV Product 

Total For All Blocks 

SOAV 

Aspen pulpwood 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 

Birch pulpwood 

Volume Per Bloc

�

Block 1 
Aspen pulpwood 94 

Balsam Fir pulpwood 103 

Birch pulpwood 38 

No Bid 

X 

X 

Block 2 
134 

101 

50 

Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value 

228 Cords @ $19.44 = $4,432.32 

204 Cords @ $1.00 = $204.00 

88 Cords @ $5.54 = $487.52 

Total Appraised Value: $5,123.84 







Exhibit B1.  Harvesting Provisions

Standard Contract Provisions
1.  Access, Landings and Skid Trails

1.1.  Location

Std - The location and construction of roads, skid trails, and landings must be approved by 
the Seller.

1.1.1

Std - Place fueling and maintenance areas outside of filter strips, riparian management 
zones and wetlands, where possible. Locations must be approved by the Seller.

1.1.2

1.2.  Specifications

Std - No leaning, hanging or bent trees will be left, nor will stumps or debris be pushed 
against standing timber.

1.2.1

Std - Placement of earthen material or corduroy may be required to prevent excessive 
rutting on roads or skid trails, as determined by the Seller.

1.2.2

Std - All borrow pits, ditches and other exposed soil areas must be sloped to 2:1 or flatter 
unless approved by the Seller.

1.2.3

Std - All logging roads and skid trails must be shaped so as to allow for proper drainage 
and erosion control at all times.

1.2.4

Std - Water control structures, such as water bars, slash mats, diversion channels, hay 
bales or other appropriate measures must be constructed and maintained as needed or as 
determined by the seller.

1.2.5

1.3.  Maintenance

Std - Purchaser must maintain or immediately repair any access that is located on an 
established road or trail. If damage occurs to a public road, purchaser will immediately 
contact the Seller and the road authority for direction and repair requirements.

1.3.1

1.4.  Gating and Signing

Std - A sign, provided by the Seller, with the Timber Harvesting Contract number will be 
posted and maintained by Purchaser on the access to the sale area.

1.4.1

2.  Slash

Std - No slash may be left within 50 feet of any road, trail, stream, red painted harvest 
boundary or structure unless otherwise agreed upon.

2.0.1

3.  Harvest Practices

Std - Cutting must proceed in a manner which will protect site productivity and ensure 
regeneration.

3.0.1

Std - Painted boundary trees must not be cut.3.0.2

Std - Exposure of mineral soil must be minimized in filter strips.  Equipment movement 
in the filter strip should generally be perpendicular to the wetland and not parallel to it.

3.0.3
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Exhibit B1.  Harvesting Provisions

Standard Contract Provisions
Std - Skidding of timber within the right-of-way or across any road must be approved by 
the Seller.

3.0.4

Std - Stump heights must be no more than the stem diameter or 10" whichever is less.3.0.5

4.  Reserves

Std - Reserve and limit damage to pre-existing coarse woody debris.4.0.1

5.  Operational Periods

5.1.  Harvest and Skidding

Std - Purchaser is responsible for monitoring conditions and postponing, shutting down or 
modifying operations to prevent site damage.

5.1.1

Std -If this contract was purchased under restricted bidding conditions, the contract is 
deemed non-transferable and cannot be reassigned.

5.1.16

7.  Other

Std - If an unsafe condition is identified, the purchaser is required to take immediate steps 
to mitigate the hazard and notify the Seller.

7.0.1

8.  Scaling of Timber

Std - Products to be ground scaled must be piled so that an accurate scale can be made.8.0.1

Std - Consumer Scaling 
           (1)     The instructions in the load ticket booklet are part of this agreement.
           (2)     A scale ticket must accompany each load of scaled species delivered.
           (3)     Any penalties assessed against the Purchaser will be charged to
                     the contract and subtracted from any block credit, downpayment
                     balance or will be billed for each penalty assessed.    
           (4)    Consumer Scaling is not allowed after the contract completion date unless a 
Consumer Scaling extension has been authorized by the Seller. Therefore, with the 
exception of SOAV wood and wood under a Consumer Scaling extension, all cut products 
that remain on the landings must be scaled by the seller.

8.0.2

Std - Purchaser must give the Seller three days notice before on-site scales will be made.  
The Seller's costs may be billed to the Purchaser for all scaling involving less than 30 
cords per scaling trip.

8.0.3

9.  Timber Utilization

Std - No snags or coarse woody debris may be utilized.9.0.1
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Exhibit B1.  Harvesting Provisions

Standard Contract Provisions
Std - All bole material in the main stem of trees of the species listed in the Contract as 
harvest trees which contain one 100-inch cordwood sticks with a top diameter of at least 3 
inches for spruce and tamarack and 4 inches for all other species are included in the sale 
volume.All other material will be defined as residual (tops, limbs and undersized).

9.0.2

 Std - Purchaser will be billed for any timber that is sold and not utilized.9.0.3

Std - Some or all of the down payment may be held to ensure removal of bio-fuels piles.9.0.4

Std - Piles left on site beyond one year from  completion of a Block may be disposed of 
by the Seller at the Purchaser's expense.

9.0.5

Std - The Purchaser will notify the Seller of their intention to store cut products, including 
residues to be chipped, prior to placing any piles. The location of piles and their size will 
be at the Seller's discretion.

9.0.6

Std - No less than 20% of the harvested tops on the sale must be reserved and evenly 
distributed on the site. The Seller and Purchaser will determine which species or 
combination of species will have tops reserved. No refunds will be made for residuals that 
are reserved.

9.0.7

Std - SOAV species are intended to include the entire above ground portion of the tree, 
including residuals and may be removed at the discretion of the contractor, unless 
otherwise specified. Roundwood measure is shown for bidding purposes only, and does 
not include any estimate of residuals.

9.0.8

Std - The residuals of the Scaled species will be available for purchase on this sale.  A 
contract amendment for the additional volume must be completed and additional payment 
made before any residuals may be removed.

9.0.9

Exhibit B1 - Page 3 of 3Standard Contract Provisions





!

!

!

!!

!

!!

!

!

!!

!

!

!

!

!

!
!

!

!

!
!

!

!

!

!

!
!

!

!

!

!

!

§̈¦535

£¤53

")73

")169

")135

")1

")73

")1

")37

")33
")61

£¤53

£¤35

£¤2

6

4

9

8 7

5

3 2

1

34
33

32

31

27

30
29

28

26

25

23

12
10

18 17

16

15

24

22
21

14
1311

20

19

Tract Locations

!( Tracts

Commissioner Districts
1

2

3

4

5

6

7

:Emerald Ash Borer Quarantine Area



Land and Minerals  
Department 

 
Oral 

Timber Auction 
 
 
 

11:00 A.M. 
September 30, 2020 
MN Discovery Center 

Chisholm, MN 

 

Barrier Free:   

All St. Louis County Timber AucƟons are accessible to the handicapped. AƩempts will be made to accommodate any other individual needs for 

special services. Contact the St. Louis County Land and Minerals Department (218‐726‐2606) prior to the aucƟon,  

so necessary arrangements can be made. 
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