October 2022 - REGULAR - AUCTION SUMMARY

Basic Sale

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Price Sale Amount
1 C22220602 100107 David R Yurek $2,800.00 $5,405.00
2 (22220603 100594 Vincent Nelson $44,550.00 $44,550.00
3 C22220604 124361 Paul Evavold $17,475.00 $34,111.00
4 (C22220605 123600 NO BID $10,637.65 -
5 C22220606 100708 Williams Spiff $7,275.00 $12,100.00
6 22220607 125347 Jeremy J Cash $7,587.49 $7,587.49
7  C22220578 117687 PULLED $320.00 -
8 (22220608 125379 Joyce Orlowski $12,600.00 $13,100.00
9 (22220609 130024 NO BID $66,850.00 -
10  C22220610 118242 Christopher Malecha $9,375.00 $9,375.00
11 C22220611 125412 Dan McClelland $3,900.00 $3,900.00
12 C22220612 130167 Brandon A Fajardo $38,000.00 $38,000.00
13 (22220613 130264 NO BID $1,125.00 -
14 (C22220614 130165 Jessica Roy $22,450.00 $23,100.00
15 (C22220615 130163 Jason Abrahamson $5,175.00 $13,100.00
16 C22220570 105097 Megan G Wognum $150.00 $153.50
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130158
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34  (C22220634 108502 Larry and Theresa Slygh $700.00 $9,300.00
35 (C22220635 122097 Steven A Luiten $39,700.00 $41,100.00
36 C22220636 108532 NO BID $19,200.00 -
37 (C22220637 110368;110375;110376;110377;110378 Burke Hancock $49,050.00 $87,301.00
38 (22220574 110541 NO BID $46,800.00 -
39  C22180084 123401;123402 NO BID $5,550.00 -
40 C22220638 123061 NO BID $26,175.00 -
41 C22220639 111658 Heather Parenteau $23,625.00 $23,625.00
42 (C22220640 130145 Tyler Nelson $2,475.00 $3,550.00
43 (C22220641 112504 NO BID $107,600.00 -
44 (C22220642 112505 NO BID $64,200.00 -
45 (C22220643 112506 NO BID $53,500.00 -
46 (C22220644 130136 Phouratsaphone P Littana $11,850.00 $18,850.00
47 C22220645 130131 Timothy Mattimore $8,175.00 $18,400.00
48 (C22220576 115873 NO BID $7,200.00 -
49 (C22220577 115995 NO BID $5,100.00 -
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Total Tracts
Pulled Tracts

Net Total Tracts
Total Tracts Sold
Percent of Net Total Tracts Sold

49
1

48
24
50.00%

Total Value  $933,533.80

Pulled Tracts
Value

Net Total Value  $933,213.80

$320.00

Percent of Net Total Value Sold

$464,396.65

49.76%
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