

January 2022 - ONLINE AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
1	C22190167	123584	NO BID	\$2,150.00	\$0.00
2	C22200267	9000002912	NO BID	\$46,650.00	\$0.00
3	C22200243	100568	NO BID	\$10,750.00	\$0.00
4	C22190116	122748	NO BID	\$5,280.19	\$0.00
5	C22180216	100743	Kewei Shen	\$1,440.00	\$1,825.00
6	C22180351	9000002237	NO BID	\$36,100.00	\$0.00
7	C22180325	9000002234	NO BID	\$2,760.00	\$0.00
8	C22170239	102998	NO BID	\$1,970.00	\$0.00
9	C22170333	120454	NO BID	\$2,280.00	\$0.00
10	C22170243	103884	NO BID	\$1,400.00	\$0.00
11	C22200183	104236	NO BID	\$22,825.00	\$0.00
12	C22170246	104377	Jasmin Gomez	\$2,000.00	\$2,000.00
13	C22180249	105016	Lina Xie	\$999.00	\$999.00
14	C22210036	125437	Tyler Carlson	\$22,058.59	\$47,008.59
15	C22180366	105450	Arslan M Raja	\$780.00	\$810.00
16	C22210141	9000003155	NO BID	\$8,695.21	\$0.00
17	C22210038	125467	NO BID	\$67,600.00	\$0.00
18	C22180116	9000001993	Lina Xie	\$999.00	\$999.00
19	C22180291	105498	NO BID	\$999.00	\$0.00
20	C22200130	105812	NO BID	\$25,699.00	\$0.00
21	C22190224	106045	NO BID	\$2,970.00	\$0.00
22	C22200193	122487	NO BID	\$40,000.00	\$0.00
23	C22210045	122628	NO BID	\$41,100.00	\$0.00
24	C22210059	9000002975	NO BID	\$13,850.00	\$0.00
25	C22190156	108049	NO BID	\$50,175.00	\$0.00
26	C22200141	108339	NO BID	\$30,700.00	\$0.00

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
27	C22200152	122853	NO BID	\$54,200.00	\$0.00
28	C22200111	109785	NO BID	\$26,800.00	\$0.00
29	C22210068	110503	NO BID	\$36,450.00	\$0.00
30	C22180081	110890	NO BID	\$54,800.00	\$0.00
31	C22210017	123296	NO BID	\$13,100.00	\$0.00
32	C22210160	113707	NO BID	\$28,600.00	\$0.00
33	C22210162	114099	NO BID	\$18,150.00	\$0.00
34	C22210079	115909	NO BID	\$7,830.00	\$0.00
35	C22210170	116317	NO BID	\$51,900.00	\$0.00
Total Tracts			35	Total Value	\$734,059.99
Pulled Tracts			0	Pulled Tracts Value	\$0.00
Net Available Tracts			35	Net Total Value	\$734,059.99
Total Tracts Sold			6		\$53,641.59
Percent of Available Tracts Sold			17.14%	Percent of Appraised Value Sold	7.31%