February 2019 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 C22180201 Scott P. Johnson $54,800.00 $54,800.00
2 C22180324 NO BID $41,250.00 $0.00
3 C22180321 Alex Larson $4,500.00 $4,500.00
4 C22180320 NO BID $4,500.00 $0.00
5 C22170236 NO BID $2,200.00 $0.00
6 C22170237 NO BID $3,100.00 $0.00
7 C22180351 NO BID $45,825.00 $0.00
8 C22170325 NO BID $10,000.00 $0.00
9 C22180202 NO BID $27,450.00 $0.00
10 C22140078 NO BID $70.00 $0.00
11 C22180271 NO BID $850.00 $0.00
12 C22180325 NO BID $7,425.00 $0.00
13 C22180336 NO BID $8,400.00 $0.00
14 C22180337 NO BID $8,400.00 $0.00
15 C22180332 NO BID $25,200.00 $0.00
16 C22170185 NO BID $3,050.00 $0.00
17 C22170239 NO BID $3,750.00 $0.00
18 C22180345 Joseph H. Keiman and Rose A. Kleiman $25,700.00 $25,700.00
19 C22180323 PULLED $33,600.00 $0.00
20 C22170240 NO BID $1,250.00 $0.00
21 C22170244 NO BID $5,300.00 $0.00
22 C22170245 NO BID $5,350.00 $0.00
23 C22170246 NO BID $5,250.00 $0.00
24 C22170250 Rickey Olsen $2,000.00 $2,000.00
25 C22180276 NO BID $200.00 $0.00
26 C22180250 NO BID $2,625.00 $0.00
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27 C22180249 NO BID $2,625.00 $0.00
28 C22180205 NO BID $4,425.00 $0.00
29 C22160014 NO BID $1,700.00 $0.00
30 C22180346 Samuel Brezee $12,350.00 $12,350.00
31 C22170354 Michael John Sinko $2,400.00 $2,400.00
32 C22180347 Wayne Kraabel $13,850.00 $22,250.00
33 C22180232 NO BID $2,900.00 $0.00
34 C22180231 NO BID $12,100.00 $0.00
35 C22180196 NO BID $2,200.00 $0.00
36 C22180197  NO BID $2,200.00 $0.00
37 C22180198 NO BID $2,200.00 $0.00
38 C22180199 NO BID $2,200.00 $0.00
39 C22180200  NO BID $2,200.00 $0.00
40 C22160084 NO BID $300.00 $0.00
41 C22160083  NO BID $300.00 $0.00
42 C22180108  NO BID $2,900.00 $0.00
43 C22170119 NO BID $250.00 $0.00
44 C22150017  NO BID $300.00 $0.00
45 C22170310 PULLED $5,025.00 $0.00
46 C22170338 NO BID $6,150.00 $0.00
47 C22180070 Gregory Jarmer $11,550.00 $11,550.00
48 C22180287 NO BID $330.00 $0.00
49 C22170328  NO BID $8,475.00 $0.00
50 22180288  NO BID $3,300.00 $0.00
51 C22180072 NO BID $11,400.00 $0.00
52 C22180289  NO BID $3,350.00 $0.00
53 C22180284 NO BID $830.00 $0.00
54 C22180327 NO BID $25,650.00 $0.00
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55 C22180115 NO BID $5,625.00 $0.00
56 C22180117 NO BID $900.00 $0.00
57 C22180290 NO BID $4,250.00 $0.00
58 C22180291 NO BID $3,800.00 $0.00
59 C22180118 NO BID $7,200.00 $0.00
60 C22180349 NO BID $30,100.00 $0.00
61 C22180285 NO BID $350.00 $0.00
62 C22180348 NO BID $1,425.00 $0.00
63 C22180331 NO BID $2,250.00 $0.00
64 C22180294 Jeffrey Krueger $200.00 $200.00
65 C22180296 NO BID $150.00 $0.00
66 C22180297 Diane R. Martinek $200.00 $200.00
67 C22180298 Diane R. Martinek $200.00 $200.00
68 C22180299 NO BID $100.00 $0.00
69 C22180300 NO BID $100.00 $0.00
70 C22180123 NO BID $1,275.00 $0.00
71 C22070047 Forrest Semmler $140.00 $140.00
72 C22180330 NO BID $56,400.00 $0.00
73 C22170092 NO BID $70.00 $0.00
74 C22180342 NO BID $95,200.00 $0.00
75 C22180343 Jon M. Gruhlke $55,100.00 $55,100.00
76 C22180326 Marc Neumayer and Mike Neumayer $20,900.00 $20,900.00
77 C22160044 NO BID $23,250.00 $0.00
78 C22180329 Laura Bordelon $102,375.00 $143,500.00
79 C22170106 Alex Pitneon Weselenak $70.00 $300.00
80 C22180303 NO BID $1,700.00 $0.00
81 C22070060 Jeffrey Krueger $2,400.00 $3,000.00
82 C22070061 Patrick Myers $1,950.00 $1,950.00
Thursday, February 14, 2019 Page 3 of 4



Tract Contract Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount

83 C22180333 NO BID $38,400.00 $0.00
84 22180335  NO BID $26,500.00 $0.00
85 C22180338 NO BID $39,500.00 $0.00
86 C22180341 NO BID $25,000.00 $0.00
87 22180339  NO BID $20,000.00 $0.00
88 C22180340 NO BID $42,600.00 $0.00
89 22180355  NO BID $94,700.00 $0.00
90 22180379  NO BID $105,700.00 $0.00
91 C22180356 NO BID $59,400.00 $0.00
92 22180353  NO BID $55,000.00 $0.00
93 C22180352 NO BID $60,000.00 $0.00
94 C22150143 NO BID $62,000.00 $0.00
95 C22150145  NO BID $50,000.00 $0.00
96 C22180380 NO BID $47,000.00 $0.00
97 22180381  NO BID $61,000.00 $0.00

Total Tracts 97 Total Value $1,679,985.00

Pulled Tracts 2 Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Available Tracts 95 Net Total Value $1,679,985.00 $361,040.00

Total Tracts Sold 18

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 18.95% Percent of Appraised Value Sold 21.49%
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