May 2026 - NEW FORFEITURE EMV SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Basic Sale Price  Sale Amount
1 B22260002 130975 PULLED $69,400.00 -

2 B22260004 130977 PULLED $157,700.00 -

3 B22260005 130978 NO BID $28,400.00 -

4 B22260006 130979 NO BID $11,300.00 -

5  B22260008 130981 NO BID $57,800.00 -

6  B22260009 130982 NO BID $27,000.00 -

7 B22260010 130983 Dennis Campbell $1,700.00 $1,700.00

8  B22260014 130987 NO BID $10,200.00 -

9  B22260015 130988 NO BID $16,700.00 -
70  B22260016 130989 PULLED $448,500.00 -

10 B22260018 130991 Rodney Knutson $125.34 $485.00

11 B22260019 130992 Rodney Knutson $100.00 $470.00

12 B22260020 130993 Sherri L. Irving $17,500.00 $27,100.00

13 B22260021 130994 Sherri L. Irving $5,800.00 $18,100.00

14 B22260022 130995 Tim E. Tim $5,800.00 $23,300.00

15 B22260023 130996 NO BID $34,100.00 -
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16 B22260024 130997 Amy M. Hunter $400.00 $450.00
17  B22260025 130998 NO BID $72,900.00 -
18  B22260026 130999 NO BID $10,400.00 -
19  B22260028 131001 NO BID $5,600.00 -
20 B22260029 131002 PULLED $172,500.00 -
21 B22260031 131004 NO BID $1,700.00 -
22 B22260032 131005 NO BID $83,100.00 -
23 B22260035 131008 Martelli Adeka $600.00 $1,025.00
24 B22260036 131009 NO BID $60,000.00 -
25  B22260037 131010 NO BID $700.00 -
26 B22260038 131011 NO BID $47,500.00 -
27  B22260039 131012 NO BID $46,700.00 -
28 B22260040 131013 NO BID $69,700.00 -
29  B22260041 131014 NO BID $20,700.00 -
30 B22260042 131015 NO BID $84,200.00 -
31  B22260043 131016 NO BID $36,500.00 -
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32 B22260044 131017 Gabriel T. Zika $8,800.00 $10,200.00
33 B22260047 131020 PULLED $15,800.00 -
34 B22260048 131021 NO BID $1,500.00 -
35  B22260049 131022 NO BID $38,900.00 -
36 B22260050 131023 NO BID $6,600.00 -
37 B22260051 131024 NO BID $6,800.00 -
38  B22260054 131027 NO BID $23,700.00 -
39  B22260056 131029 Martelli Adeka $2,200.00 $2,200.00
40 B22260057 131030 Frank Michael Modich $45,100.00 $70,900.00
41 B22260058 131031 NO BID $162,000.00 -
42 B22260059 131032 NO BID $102,600.00 -
43 B22260063 131036 NO BID $115,500.00 -
44 B22260064 131037 NO BID $5,500.00 -
45 B22260066 131039 NO BID $2,000.00 -
46  B22260067 131040 NO BID $27,200.00 -
47  B22260068 131041 Martelli Adeka $125.37 $1,000.00
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48  B22260069 131042 NO BID $6,900.00 -
49  B22260070 131043 Betsy Karkinen $1,500.00 $2,065.00
50 B22260072 131045 NO BID $88,100.00 -
51 B22260073 131046 PULLED $17,200.00 -
52 B22260074 131047 NO BID $9,600.00 -
53 B22260075 131048 NO BID $17,200.00 -
54 B22260077 131050 PULLED $65,700.00 -
55  B22260079 131052 Denny J. Stolp $125.37 $10,201.00
56  B22260080 131053 NO BID $82,300.00 -
57 B22260081 131054 Ryan C. Rewertz $900.00 $5,002.00
58 B22260084 131057 ZDI Construction, LLC $13,400.00 OTC
59 B22260085 131058 NO BID $13,500.00 -
60 B22260086 131059 NO BID $4,700.00 -
61 B22260087 131060 Lance Leroy Johnson $6,400.00 $6,700.00
62  B22260088 131061 PULLED $72,800.00 -
63 B22260089 131062 NO BID $159,100.00 -
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64  B22260090 131063 NO BID $35,800.00 -
65 B22260091 131064 }’gham Howard Taylor and Michelle Marie $5,800.00 $5,800.00
66 B22260092 131065 PULLED $11,700.00 -
67 B22260094 131067 PULLED $258,200.00 -
68 B22260095 131068 Martelli Adeka $1,400.00 $1,400.00
69 B22260098 131073 PULLED $27,900.00 -

Total Tracts 70 Total Value $3,069,876.08

Pulled Tracts 11 Pulled Tracts Value $1,317,400.00

Net Total Tracts 59 Net Total Value $1,752,476.08 $188,098.00

Total Tracts Sold 18

Percent of Net Total Tracts Sold 30.51% Percent of Net Total Value Sold 10.73%
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