December 2022 - REGULAR - ONLINE (CONTINUOUS) SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Basic SalePrice  Sale Amount
1 C22200243 100568 NO BID $8,710.00 -
2 C22220606 100708 NO BID $7,275.00 -
3 C22210111 103461 NO BID $4,900.00 -
4  C22200183 104236 NOBID $20,550.00 -
5 C22220536 104372 NOBID $13,500.00 -
6 C22220570 105097 NOBID $150.00 -
7 C22220616 130158 NO BID $16,725.00 -
8 C22210217 105294 NO BID $14,475.00 -
9 (C22220619 130217;130218 NO BID $4,500.00 -
10 C22220621 130268;130269 NOBID $26,500.00 -
11 C22210141 125146;125147,125148 NOBID $5,030.21 -
12 C22200130 105812 NO BID $19,670.00 -
13 C22180160 117261 NO BID $6,901.35 -
14  C22220627 106410 NO BID $2,475.00 -
15 C22200193 122963 NO BID $34,200.00 -
16 C22210045 122628 NO BID $35,150.00 -
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17 C22210196 122510 NO BID $28,500.00 -
18 C22210059 107977;107978 NO BID $11,250.00 -
19 C22200141 108339 NOBID $19,930.00 -
20 (22220636 108532 NOBID $19,200.00 -
21 C22200205 122264 Ashley Anderson $92,440.00 $92,440.00
22 C22200152 122853 NO BID $48,800.00 -
23 C22200111 109785 NO BID $15,440.00 -
24 C22210222 110154 NO BID $38,550.00 -
25 (22210068 110503 NOBID $23,600.00 -
26 C22220574 110541 NO BID $46,800.00 -
27 C22180084 123401;123402 NO BID $5,550.00 -
28  C22200220 122600 NOBID $110,650.00 -
29 (C22220643 112506 NOBID $53,500.00 -
30 C22210162 114099 NO BID $11,760.00 -
31 C22210125 125515 NO BID $4,450.00 -
32 C22220576 115873 NO BID $7,200.00 -
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33 C22210170 116317 NO BID $29,880.00 -
Total Tracts 33 Total Value $788,211.56
Pulled Tracts 0 Pulled Tracts Value
Net Total Tracts 33 Net Total Value $788,211.56 $92,440.00
Total Tracts Sold 1
Per cent of Net Total Tracts Sold 3.03% Per cent of Net Total Value Sold 11.73%
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