

## August 2021 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract	Contract	LDKey	Bidder Name	Appraised Price	Sale Amount
1	C22190167	123584	NO BID	\$2,970.00	\$0.00
2	C22170237	101559	Steven Colich	\$1,800.00	\$1,850.00
3	C22170239	102998	Gregory Brown	\$1,970.00	\$1,970.00
4	C22170242	103883	PULLED	\$2,015.00	\$0.00
5	C22170243	103884	NO BID	\$1,480.00	\$0.00
6	C22170245	104375	PULLED	\$2,800.00	\$0.00
7	C22170246	104377	NO BID	\$2,500.00	\$0.00
8	C22180276	105010	Josh McGirt	\$135.00	\$499.99
9	C22190014	105020	Patrick Donaue	\$25.00	\$57.00
10	C22190013	105043	Brittany Taumanupepe	\$10.00	\$15.50
11	C22160084	105290	NO BID	\$180.00	\$0.00
12	C22160083	105291	NO BID	\$180.00	\$0.00
13	C22170260	105295	NO BID	\$500.00	\$0.00
14	C22150017	105420	NO BID	\$160.00	\$0.00
15	C22170268	105440	Josh McGirt	\$250.00	\$260.00
16	C22180366	105450	NO BID	\$866.00	\$0.00
17	C22180364	105453	Zachary J Hubner	\$1,325.00	\$1,325.00
18	C22190180	123697	NO BID	\$2,650.00	\$0.00
19	C22170269	120548	Phuc Phan	\$1,100.00	\$1,100.00
20	C22170143	105472	Phuc Phan	\$1,110.00	\$1,110.00
21	C22180288	105477	Phuc Phan	\$1,220.00	\$1,220.00
22	C22180289	105479	NO BID	\$878.00	\$0.00
23	C22190181	105481	NO BID	\$50.00	\$0.00
24	C22180290	105497	NO BID	\$1,575.00	\$0.00
25	C22180291	105498	NO BID	\$1,405.00	\$0.00
26	C22190183	123211	Angel B Guzman	\$2,410.00	\$5,000.00

<b>Tract</b>	<b>Contract</b>	<b>LDKey</b>	<b>Bidder Name</b>	<b>Appraised Price</b>	<b>Sale Amount</b>
27	C22180285	105504	NO BID	\$160.00	\$0.00
28	C22190221	105507	Brittany Taumanupepe	\$50.00	\$53.00
29	C22200027	105562	Bonnie A Mann	\$25.00	\$28.00
30	C22170277	122070	PULLED	\$275.00	\$0.00
31	C22200035	108244	Bonnie A Mann	\$50.00	\$127.50
32	C22210148	109408	NO BID	\$8,704.00	\$0.00
33	C22180166	122109	Zachary J Hubner	\$25.00	\$710.00
34	C22200020	123760	Zachary J Hubner	\$75.00	\$610.00
35	C22180167	122110	Ash Mikkelson	\$75.00	\$1,890.00
36	C22180168	122111	Zachary J Hubner	\$10.00	\$610.00
37	C22200022	122864	Zachary J Hubner	\$50.00	\$710.00
38	C22160024	110892	NO BID	\$2,280.00	\$0.00
<b>Total Tracts</b>			38	<b>Total Value</b>	\$43,343.00
<b>Pulled Tracts</b>			3	<b>Pulled Tracts Value</b>	\$0.00
<b>Net Available Tracts</b>			35	<b>Net Total Value</b>	\$43,343.00
<b>Total Tracts Sold</b>			19		\$19,145.99
<b>Percent of Available Tracts Sold</b>			54.29%	<b>Percent of Appraised Value Sold</b>	44.17%