
February 2023 - REGULAR - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Contract LDKey Bidder Name Basic Sale Price Sale Amount

1 C22220662 100008 Jesse Anthony Hakala $10,200.00 $23,100.00

2 C22220663 100010 Steve Ojard $5,000.00 $6,404.00

3 C22220664 100011 Jesse Anthony Hakala $15,300.00 $55,100.00

4 C22220665 100012 Jesse Hakala $17,850.00 $60,200.00

5 C22220666 100117;100118;100119 Benjamin R Ree $2,900.00 $10,100.00

6 C22220667 Benjamin R Ree $3,550.00 $19,100.00

7 C22220668 NO BID $15,700.00 -

8 C22220669 NO BID $17,965.00 -

9 C22220670 Dawna Carlberg $43,875.00 $43,875.00

10 C22220671 NO BID $29,250.00 -

11 C22220672 Heidi L Kelly $9,600.00 $10,600.00

12 C22220673 Jodi Broadwell $10,500.00 $11,600.00

13 C22220674 NO BID $129,350.00 -

14 C22220675 NO BID $16,700.00 -

15 C22220676 Tricia J Kroening $4,575.00 $5,100.00

16 C22220677

100127;100128

100222;100223;100229; 
100230

100224;100225;100226;  
100227;100228

125323

125324

100699

100702

123603

117822

130270

101668 NO BID $22,950.00 -
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17 C22220678 102332 Robert P Anderson $10,425.00 $10,425.00

18 C22220679 102333 Maren Warren $10,425.00 $10,425.00

19 C22220680 122760 Tonya M Connor $13,875.00 $13,875.00

20 C22220681 118174;120461 Kimyeng Norton $5,400.00 $5,400.00

21 C22220682 105021;118199 NO BID $4,725.00 -

22 C22220683 105094 NO BID $5,400.00 -

23 C22220684 124089 Robert Butler $3,900.00 $4,050.00

24 C22220685 124090 PULLED $525.00 -

25 C22220686 123192 Lutasha Mott $2,925.00 $3,150.00

26 C22220687 117729 PULLED $7,425.00 -

27 C22220688 122205 Petrina Rhines $9,075.00 $20,405.00

28 C22220572 130215 NO BID $1,350.00 -

29 C22220689 105445;105448 NO BID $3,975.00 -

30 C22220573 106047 NO BID $5,300.00 -

31 C22220690 122066;122067 NO BID $13,275.00 -

32 C22220691 117258;122069 NO BID $14,175.00 -
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33 C22220692 122068 NO BID $18,900.00 -

34 C22220596 130117 Christian J Proetz $250.00 $311.00

35 C22220693 122081 NO BID $4,950.00 -

36 C22220694 123226 Britt A Lee $5,175.00 $5,175.00

37 C22220695 106771 Karen Sunne $1,800.00 $3,700.00

38 C22220696 107641 Kyle Colbert $32,800.00 $92,600.00

39 C22220697 120599 Maxwell M Omdahl $179,900.00 $180,500.00

40 C22220698 125484 Frank Zuber $125,650.00 $230,000.00

41 C22220699 109740 Lonny R Stavig $66,200.00 $66,200.00

42 C22210149 110226 NO BID $6,700.00 -

43 C22220700 130140 Kristin Renskers $24,600.00 $37,300.00

44 C22220701 130129 Pamela Angen $5,600.00 $30,200.00

45 C22220702 110531 NO BID $21,100.00 -

46 C22220704 123758 Colin D Ulmer $225.00 $4,000.00

47 C22220705 111027 PULLED $8,800.00 -

48 C22220706 125499 Heather Nelson $15,375.00 $39,400.00
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49 C22220707 112651 NO BID $28,350.00 -

50 C22220708 112884 NO BID $36,400.00 -

51 C22220709 113726 Zachary Mazurkiewicz $525.00 $1,350.00

52 C22220710 113965 David P Cook $1,425.00 $4,200.00

53 C22220711 123311 Dean W Mineheine $8,550.00 $19,600.00

54 C22210166 115594 NO BID $55,600.00 -

55 C22220601 130130 Jennifer Pechtold $100.00 $660.00

56 C22220712 116168;116177 Dirk VerSteeg II $42,400.00 $50,100.00

57 C22220713 125517 Karl A Anderson $1,500.00 $14,600.00

Total Tracts 57

Pulled Tracts 3

Total Value $1,160,315.00 

Pulled Tracts Value $16,750.00

Net Total Tracts 54 Net Total Value $1,143,565.00 $1,092,805.00

Total Tracts Sold 34

Percent of Net Total Tracts Sold 62.96% Percent of Net Total Value Sold 95.56%
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