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NOTICE OF ST. LOUIS COUNTY SEALED BID PUBLIC TIMBER AUCTION

Notice is hereby given that the St. Louis County Auditor shall sell to the highest bidder the designated timber
located on the following described parcels of land forfeited to the State for the nonpayment of taxes which have
been classified and appraised as provided by Minnesota Statutes 282.04, Sub. 1 (1982) subject, in part, to the
following conditions:

1.

To be eligible to bid at a St. Louis County Timber auction, a Responsible Operator Application Form must
be on file at the St. Louis County Land and Minerals Department, 320 West 2" Street, Duluth, MN
55802 at least 2 working days prior to the auction and ALL PAST DUE ACCOUNTS must be made
current. Responsible Operator Applications can be obtained at any Land and Minerals
Department Office or on the department’s Web site.

The timber will be sold to the highest bidder but for not less than the total appraised Tract Value. A bid
value per unit must be indicated for each species listed. This bid value will be applied to each specie.
Bid value per unit must meet or exceed the appraised bid value per unit. St. Louis County reserves the
right to accept or reject any or all bids.

All bid forms must be received in the Land Commissioner’s Office by 4:30 PM on February 18", All bids
must be on the official bid form.

A $300 bid bond, i.e. personal check, payable to the St. Louis County Auditor is required and must be
included with the bid form. One bid bond will cover all tract bids and will be returned if the bids are not
the successful bidder. For a successful bidder, the bid bond will be applied to the down payment on the
first tract awarded.

Successful bidders will have 10 business days to submit a check, payable to the County Auditor, for
15% of the appraised tract value for each tract awarded. Failure to make any or all of these down
payments on time will result in the forfeiture of the bid bond. Successful bidders will be notified by mail.

Should the successful bidder not submit the down payment on time, the sale may be awarded to the next
highest bidder. In the case of tie bids, the successful bidder will be decided by the toss of a coin by the
Auditor.

St. Louis County has developed an Environmental Management System to assist it in meeting the
Sustainable Forestry Initiative (SFI) standard and is certified to this standard.

Some of the tracts may have special requirements. The St. Louis County Land and Minerals Department
offers sales of various sizes, species and products to meet the needs of a wide variety of purchasers.
There are some sales offered on this auction that allow the purchaser to decide if they want to purchase
the sale as offered, either all species scaled or a mix of scaled and SOE species, or choose to have all
the species sold as SOE. These are identified with the following sentence in the comments of each tract.
“The purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as advertised or to purchase all species as Sold on
Appraised Volume (SOAV)”. Prospective bidders should get maps, cutting regulations, contract
information and special regulations at the applicable Area Office.

Tracts 1 through 13 Contact: Tracts 14 through 26 Contact:
Virginia Area Pike Lake Area
Mark Kailanen, Area Land Manager Mark Pannkuk, Area Land Manager
7820 Highway #135 5713 OId Miller Trunk Highway
Virginia, MN 55792 Duluth, MN 55811
(218) 742-9898 (218) 625-3700

Sealed Bid Timber Auction will be held at:
St. Louis County Land and Minerals
Arvig Building
325 W 1°! Street, Room 300
Duluth, MN 55802

9:30 a.m. — February 19, 2015



Please Note:

Successful bidders of sales with the option of choosing “Sold on Appraised Volume” (SOAV) will have
10 business days to choose the option for the sale(s). A $300 bid bond, i.e. personal check, payable to
the St. Louis County Auditor is required and must be paid the day of the auction. One bid bond will
cover all purchased tracts that have an SOAV option.

Successful bidders using a “Letter of Credit” to secure the purchase of a sale will have 10 business
days to provide the Letter of Credit to the Land and Minerals Department. A $300 bid bond, i.e.
personal check, payable to the St. Louis County Auditor is required and must be paid the day of the
auction. One bid bond will cover all purchased tracts that will be secured by Letter of Credit.

Timber Sale Operators must have the following minimum training for at least the owner of the firm and
the foreman who will supervise the logging on St. Louis County Lands:

Master Logger Certification; or

Minnesota Logger Education (MLEP) Member in Good Standing; or

“SFI Trained” FISTA member; or

Training equivalent to the Minnesota SFI Implementation Committee Training Standard for a
trained Professional Logger.

All field employees must have training in best management practices.

PLEASE NOTE:

The Downtown Duluth Land Commissioners Office is temporarily located in the
Arvig Building at 325 W 1°! Street, Room 300, Duluth, MN 55802. Our mailing

address remains as:

St. Louis County Land and Minerals
Government Services Building
320 W 2™ Street
Duluth, MN 55802
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TACONITE PINE Sale Administrator: Nick Hoff
Number of Blocks: 1 NE1/4 SE1/4, W 1/2 SE1/4, Sec. 9, Twp. 60N Rge. 21W
Total Acres: 44.5

Tract# 1
French Township
Virginia Area

C19150001 Season of Operation: August 1 - March 10 47°41'44.611" N 93° 0' 20.574" W Expires: 4/15/2018
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Aspen pulpwood 61 61Cords @ $5.00 = $305.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 9 9Cords @ $5.00 = $45.00
Birch pulpwood 9 9Cords @ $5.00 = $45.00
Jack Pine pulpwood 29 29 Cords @ $5.00 = $145.00
Norway Pine pulpwood 595 595 Cords @ $10.00 = $5,950.00
White Pine pulpwood 19 19 Cords @ $5.00 = $95.00
White Spruce pulpwood 2 2Cords @ $5.00 = $10.00
Down Payment Required (15%): $989.25 Total Appraised Value:  $6,595.00
Comments:
Either cut-to-length or St. Louis County
maximum width of 12 feet
must be used. * ALL SKID TRAILS WILL BE CUT 15" WIDE WITH LEAVE STRIPS 40" WIDE.

Designated thinning width's have spatial marks for a width guide,
they are referenced with paint located on trees 55 apart.

*TOACHIEVE DESIRED SPACING:

In block 1A & 1B, harvest all contract s pecies in the skid trails only.

In the leave strips, harvest ONLY RED PINE with a desired 11" X 11" spacing,

Remove red pine with smaller diameters and

poor form first (forks, crooks, double tops, sweep, etc.) to meet the spacing requirements.
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Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to BLOCK#1C
maps, cutting regulations, 12AC. 9 10

contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

BLOCK 1C LEAVE STRIPS,

First- Remove non-pine s pecies

Second- Remove s mall diameter and
poor form (forks, crooks, double tops, sweep, etc.)
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to a desired s pacing of 14" x14
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Tract # 2
Bassett Township
Virginia Area

MARCO POLO Sale Administrator: Kelly Anderson

Number of Blocks: 2 SW1/4 NW1/4, NW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 29, SE1/4 NE1/4, NE1/4 SE1/4,
Total Acres: 96.4 Sec. 30, Twp. 57N Rge. 13W

C19150002 Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd 47° 23'41.183" N 92° 1' 41.529" W Expires: 4/15/2018
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Aspen pulpwood 410 485 895 Cords @ $1767 = $15,814.65
Balsam Fir pulpwood 130 140 270 Cords @ $5.00 = $1,350.00
Birch pulpwood 45 40 85Cords @ $5.04 = $428.40
Black Spruce pulpwood 35 160 195 Cords @ $17.41 = $3,394.95
Jack Pine pulpwood 70 290 360 Cords @ $16.48 = $5,932.80
Tamarack pulpwood 10 35 45 Cords @ $3.33 = $149.85
White Spruce pulpwood 160 185 345 Cords @ $1445 = $4,985.25
Down Payment Required (15%):  $4,808.39 Total Appraised Value:  $32,055.90
Comments:
The Purchaser has the option St Louis Cou nty
to purchase this sale as
advertised or to purchase all MARCO POLO

species as Sold On Appraised
Volume (SOAV).

19 20
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RD

BLOCK #1

Tract 02

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

BLOCK #2
48.5 ACRES

96.4 TOTALACRES

RESERVE:
RED PINE
SNAGS

Prepared By: KELLY ANDERSON 7 HARVEST AREA- CCT
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MAGPIE Sale Administrator: John Muhich
Number of Blocks: 4 NE1/4, NW1/4 SE1/4, E 1/2 SW1/4, E 1/2 NW1/4, Sec. 27, Twp.
Total Acres: 111.5 55N Rge. 19W

Tract # 3
Lavell Township
Virginia Area

C19150003 Season of Operation: FrozenGround 47°12' 55.115" N 92° 44' 13.421" W Expires: 4/15/2018
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Ash pulpwood 32 46 2 3 83 Cords @ $3.30 = $273.90
Aspen pulpwood 213 66 59 49 387 Cords @ $19.44 = $7,523.28
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 96 48 7 22 173 Cords @ $1864 = $3,224.72
Balsam Fir pulpwood 159 36 22 14 231 Cords @ $5.00 = $1,155.00
Birch pulpwood 29 2 2 33Cords @ $5.54 = $182.82
Black Spruce pulpwood 103 192 245 540 Cords @ $19.15 = $10,341.00
Red Maple pulpwood 2 4 6Cords @ $3.26 = $19.56
Tamarack pulp & bolts 314 104 132 550 Cords @ $3.67 = $2,018.50
White Spruce pulp & bolts 7 7Cords @ $1590 = $111.30
Down Payment Required (15%): $3,727.51 Total Appraised Value:  $24,850.08
Comments:
The Purchaser has the option St Louis Cou nty
to purchase this sale as
advertised or to purchase all MAGPIE SALE
species as Sold On Appraised il L 7
Volume (SOAV). L%(-/-l i

RE SERVES: Cedar, Elm and Snags
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Tract # 4

Portage Township
Virginia Area
Product

Ash pulpwood

Aspen pulpwood
Balsam Fir pulpwood
Birch pulpwood

Black Spruce pulpwood
Jack Pine pulpwood

N White Cedar optional timber

Norway Pine pulp & bolts
Red Maple pulpwood
Tamarack pulpwood
White Spruce pulpwood

Comments:

The Purchaser has the option
to purchase this sale as
advertised or to purchase all
species as Sold On Appraised
Volume (SOAV), except Red
Pine must be scaled. The
purchaser will be required to
secure a Road Use Permit
from the LaCroix Ranger
District. The permit will require
road toll fees or a
maintenance agreement.

Tract 04

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

LOCAL ATTRACTION
Number of Blocks: 3
Total Acres: 70

Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Randy Grahn

S 1/2 SE1/4, NE1/4 SW1/4, NW1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 13, Twp. 66N Rge.
17W

48° 11' 40.250" N 92° 27' 32.099" W Expires: 4/15/2018

No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
50 50 Cords @ $3.00 = $150.00

360 105 120 585 Cords @ $17.67 = $10,336.95
50 35 25 110 Cords @ $5.00 = $550.00
35 55 30 120 Cords @ $5.04 = $604.80
65 50 30 145 Cords @ $17.41 = $2,524.45
5 5 10 Cords @ $16.48 = $164.80

10 5 15 Cords @ $1.41 = $21.15
30 75 50 155 Cords @ $29.92 = $4,637.60
50 55 70 175 Cords @ $297 = $519.75
5 5Cords @ $333 = $16.65
35 10 30 75 Cords @ $14.45 = $1,083.75
Down Payment Required (15%): $3,091.49 Total Appraised Value: $20,609.90

St. Louis County
Local Attraction

BLOCK 3 = 20 ACRES

et &

+/-1.0 MILE
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This is a compilation of records ppea Sain D i - SECTION CORNER
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Tract#5
Portage Township
Virginia Area

C19150005

Product

Aspen pulpwood
Balsam Fir pulpwood
Birch pulpwood

Black Spruce pulpwood
Jack Pine pulp & bolts

Norway Pine pulp & bolts

Red Maple pulpwood
Tamarack pulpwood

White Spruce pulp & bolts

Comments:

The Purchaser has the option
to purchase this sale as
advertised or to purchase all
species as Sold On Appraised
Volume (SOAV), except Red
Pine must be scaled.

Tract 05

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

JACKED UP
Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 132

Season of Operation: FrozenGround or Dry Soil

No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6

665 525
75 80
445 75
10 585
75 225
95
220 230
20
30 10

Down Payment Required (15%):

St. Louis County February 19, 2015 Timber Auction Listing

Sale Administrator: Sho|
NW1/4 SW1/4, NW1/4, Sec. 24, Twp. 65N

48° 6' 9.372" N 92° 35' 54.486" W Expires:

ntel Adam
Rge. 18W

4/15/2018

Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

1190 Cords @ $17.67 =  $21,027.30

155 Cords @ $5.00 = $775.00

520 Cords @ $5.04 = $2,620.80

595 Cords @ $17.41 = $10,358.95

300 Cords @ $16.48 = $4,944.00

95 Cords @ $29.92 = $2,842.40

450 Cords @ $2.97 = $1,336.50

20 Cords @ $3.33 = $66.60

40 Cords @ $14.45 = $578.00

$6,682.43 Total Appraised Value:  $44,549.55

St. Louis County
JACKED UP
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el 14413
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Tract # 6
Unorganized Township

CELINA PIT Sale Administrator: Christophr Lintula
Number of Blocks: 2 SE1/4 NE1/4, NE1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 7, Twp. 62N Rge. 21W

Virginia Area Total Acres: 61
C19150006 Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd 47°52'16.601" N 93° 3' 52.935" W Expires: 4/15/2018
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Aspen pulpwood 525 765 1290 Cords @ $19.44 = $25,077.60
Balsam Fir pulpwood 55 80 135Cords @ $5.00 = $675.00
Birch pulpwood 125 180 305 Cords @ $5.54 = $1,689.70
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 45 50 95 Cords @ $3291 = $3,126.45
Red Maple pulpwood 100 145 245 Cords @ $3.26 = $798.70
White Spruce pulp & bolts 5 5 ﬂCordj @ @5.907 = $159.00
Down Payment Required (15%): $4,728.97 Total Appraised Value:  $31,526.45
Comments:
Block 1 expiration June 15,
2016. Block 2 expiration April
15, 2018. The Purchaser has .
the option to purchase this St. LOU_IS Cqunty
sale as advertised or to Celina Pit
purchase all species as Sold
On Appraised Volume —_
(SOAV), except Red Pine J -
must be scaled. A/
&
78
Tract D6
Use your smartphone to scan ' Highway #1 ™
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and -
special regulations, or visit our =
website. E:
=
Reserve: i
All Ash, Basswood and s
White Pine 8
Balsam Fir Under
1 Stick in Clumps
Prepared By: Chris Lintula (B1) (RD) (0G) _ .orange Painted
Map Created: 11/10/2014 [ -Harvest Area-CCT-Boundary (0G) Block Line
TRS: Twp. 62N. Age. 21W. Sec. 7 I? A Painted Blue or Red
mc:aumc:: 5 - = . B
L Couety Ofcas allacig th e Swm This Grawing] e -Pved Road e o

|is for relerence purposes and the County is
lor any inaccuracies hentin contained —_  -Gravel Road

1in = 0.25 miles ale
el
o ! 0.5 Miss

-Gravel Pit

R
$ -Section Comer
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LiNE Sale Administrator: Michael Stubbs
Number of Blocks: 1 NE1/4NE1/4,Sec. 20,W1/2NW1/4,Sec. 21,Twp. 61NRge13
Total Acres: 25

Tract # 7
Unorganized Township
Virginia Area

C19150007 Season of Operation: August 1 - March 10 47° 45' 27.645" N 92° 0' 34.112" W Expires: 4/15/2018
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Aspen pulpwood 5 5Cords @ $5.00 = $25.00
Birch pulpwood 5 5Cords @ $5.00 = $25.00
Jack Pine pulpwood 5 5Cords @ $5.00 = $25.00
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 410 410 Cords @ $10.00 = $4,100.00
White Spruce pulpwood 1 1Cords @ $5.00 = $5.00
Down Payment Required (15%): $627.00 Total Appraised Value:  $4,180.00
Comments:
There is an equipment St. Louis County
requirement of a cut to LiNE

length system or
equipment with a maximum
of 12 feet.

7

MW corner
of section 21

.$.

¥

Block 1
225 acres

21
Use your smartphone to scan

the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

Starting points of designated
harvest rows are painted orange
along block boundary:

Harvest rows 15 feet wide
Leave strips 40 feet wide

Thin leave strips to approximately
13ft X 13ft spacing

t1L§,\‘3~ To achieve desired spacing:
\N-Be First - remove non-Red pine
4 Second - Remove poor formed (forks,

crooks, double tops, sweep. etc) Red pine
Sy Third - remove Red pine with smaller diameter.

Prepared By:  Michael Stubbs é i
MEID Created: 242074 Harvest Area (SDT} Woods road

TRS: FT-T320.21 | s—
Disclaimer. = =——— Paved surface
This isa compiltion ofrecords as theyappear n the Saint BLJRD Harvest BDUHdEI’y EHLIB, Red \\.

Lowe County Offices afecting the sres shown. This drawing s 3
& o be used onyfor reerance puposes and the Countyis Recreation Trail
not msponsible for any inscouracss harein contained. L

Designated Landing .= = Designated skid trail

Red Pine Covertype ¢ Monumented Corner
(blue paint)

1in=0.125 miles .".
a N 025 Mies RP




Tract # 8
Unorganized Township
Virginia Area

C19150008

Product

Aspen pulpwood
Balsam Fir pulpwood
Birch pulpwood

Black Spruce pulpwood

Jack Pine pulp & bolts
Red Maple pulpwood

White Spruce pulp & bolts

Comments:

Purchaser must supply and
install a temporary bridge for a
stream crossing. Refer to the
Harvest Provisions or
prospectus for the DNR
requirements for bridge
placement over protected
waters. The Purchaser has
the option to purchase this
sale as advertised or to
purchase all species as Sold

On Appraised Volume (SOAV).

Tract 02

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

PALE TEXAN
Number of Blocks: 2

Total Acres: 85.1

Season of Operation: Dry Soil or Frozen Ground

No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6

St. Louis County February 19, 2015 Timber Auction Listing

47° 46' 25.611" N 92° 9' 7.094" W

240 715 955 Cords @ $17.67
5 10 15 Cords @ $5.00

105 210 315Cords @ $5.04
15 15 30Cords @ $17.41
15 15Cords @ $16.48

115 115Cords @ $2.97

10 55 65 Cords @ $14.45

Down Payment Required (15%): $3,088.16

St. Louis County

Total Appraised Value:

Sale Administrator: James Simons
SW1/4 NE1/4, SW1/4, NW1/4 SE1/4, SE1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 8, GL 1,
Sec. 17, Twp. 61N Rge. 14W

Expires:

4/15/2018

Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

$16,874.85
= $75.00
= $1,587.60
= $522.30
= $247.20
= $341.55
= $939.25

$20,587.75

PALE TEXAN
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E 10 be used onhyfor rerance puposes and the Countyis.
not msponsible for any inscouracss harein contained.
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SUNNYBROOK
Number of Blocks: 4
Total Acres: 61.5

Tract # 9
Breitung Township
Virginia Area

C19150009 Season of Operation: Dry Soil or Frozen Ground 47° 50' 39.031" N 92° 9' 51.074" W Expires: 4/15/2018

Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Aspen pulpwood 255 65 15 335Cords @ $5.00 = $1,675.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 5 15 20 Cords @ $5.00 = $100.00
Birch pulpwood 40 85 5 130 Cords @ $5.00 = $650.00
Black Spruce pulpwood 130 130 Cords @ $10.00 = $1,300.00
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 104 104 Cords @ $29.92 = $3,111.68
Red Maple pulpwood 115 20 135Cords @ $2.97 = $400.95
Tamarack pulpwood 30 30 Cords @ $3.33 = $99.90
White Pine pulp & bolts 5 5Cords @ $2163 = $108.15
White Spruce pulp & bolts 5 5Cords @ $1445 = $72.25
Down Payment Required (15%): $1,127.69 Total Appraised Value: $7,517.93

Comments:

Purchaser must contact USS
to obtain the access permit.
The Access/Use License

Sale Administrator: James Simons

E 1/2 SE1/4, Sec. 17, S 1/2 SE1/4, NE1/4 SE1/4, , SE1/4 NE1/4, GL 7,
S.18, NE1/4 NE1/4,Sec. 19,Twp. 62N Rge. 14

St. Louis County
SUNNYBROOK

Agreement to permit access
across United States Steel
Corporation property, and its
requirements, shall become
part of this contract. This will
include providing USS with a
Certificate of Insurance
meeting the requirements
described in the License.
USS requires $5 million
insurance. The License also
includes a $500 fee.

-
co

b

[==]
P,
=)

ANIMTHIMOL

%

BLOCK 2

6AC

BLOCK 4a
= E 14AC
Tract 09 @
Verm iion Lske \1/1_ 1 '?“ '.\--\\
i . ¢ v % » BLOCK
- - e 8AC

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our

BLOCK 3b

Ja

44AC
website.
o s
RESERVE: ,_g
TOWER LEASE UNMARKED WHITE PINE & w
TOWER LEASE Sham ile Lake
P
UNMARKED RED PINE 2 .
TOTALAC: 615 CEDAR q
SNAGS
ﬁ
-b@ Needle Boy Laks]
Prepared By:  J. SIMONS ,
WMap Created: TMZA4 m HARVEST AREA (CCT) MOMNUMENTED CORMNER
TRS: TeZ R4 Secs. 17, 18,19 //A $
Disclaimer. MHAR\JE ST AREA (MKD)
This i=a compilsfon ofrecorts & theyappear n the Saint HARVEST RED PINE MARKED ORANGE AND OTHER CONTRACT SPECIES]
Lowe County Offices afecting the sres shown. This drawing
E 10 be used onhyfor rerance puposes and the Countyis. - WOoO0DS ROAD

not msponsible for any inscouracss harein contained.

PROPOSED ACCESS- NEW COMSTRUCTION

1in=0.25 miles L\
1 N 045 Mies

(BL) (RD) HARVEST BOUNDARIES PAINTED BLUE OR RED
COVER TYPE: A-ASPEN BS-BLACK SPRUCE BI-BIRCH RP-RED PINE
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ZIBEIFFERSKI Sale Administrator: Tom Salzer
Number of Blocks: 2 S 1/2 SW1/4, Sec. 14, N 1/2 NW1/4, Sec. 23, Twp. 61N Rge. 17W
Total Acres: 32.3

Tract # 10
Unorganized Township
Virginia Area

C19150010 Season of Operation: Dry Soil 47° 45' 34.521" N 92° 28' 35.241" W Expires: 4/15/2018
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Aspen pulpwood 45 125 170 Cords @ $1590 = $2,703.00
Balsam Fir pulpwood 10 5 15Cords @ $5.00 = $75.00
Birch pulpwood 30 230 260 Cords @ $4.54 = $1,180.40
Black Spruce pulpwood 5 5 10 Cords @ $1567 = $156.70
Jack Pine pulpwood 15 15Cords @ $14.83 = $222.45
Norway Pine pulpwood 15 15Cords @ $26.93 = $403.95
White Spruce pulpwood 5 5 10 Cords @ $13.00 = $130.00
Down Payment Required (15%): $730.73 Total Appraised Value: $4,871.50
Comments:

The purchaser will be required
to secure a Road Use Permit

from the Laurentian Ranger St. Louis COUH’Iy
District. The purchaser will be Zibeifferski
required to construct

approximately 300 feet of

summer road through non- |

open water wetland to reach i S:‘?g'ﬁ':es

block 2a.The Purchaser has
the option to purchase this

sale as advertised or to Reserve Species
purchase all species as Sold s White Cedar
On Appraised Volume BL White Pine

(SOAV), except Red Pine

must be scaled. BL Red Maple

Non Marked Red Pine
Snags

m—

Tract 10

. a 5 +\“—-Pmposed new construction

BL \
Block 2a

1.5 Acres

’ 1._____‘_'BI0L‘I-( 1

10.0 Acres

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to 2 2
maps, cutting regulations, 3 . it
contract information and 4
special regulations, or visit our
website.

h - \ 32.5 Total Acres

Prepared By: SALZE
Map Created: 12/1/2014 W/ /;4 Harvest area or CCT painted  B| Birch
TAS: 611714 red (AD) and blue (BL).
Discl r £
Trﬁﬁ i‘gfriuum of rocords us they appoar in tha Saint RP Red Pine
Louts County Oifices nfipcting the anoa shown. Thes drawing|
s %o be wsed ondy fof reference puposes and the County ks Marked timber ar MKD x
ot responsitio for any inaccuracies horein containgd harvest trees marked with 6@ Gravel Pit

0 i \ 2%t % %
1in=0125mies _\ Eelelelelelelel oranage paint and other
o N 25
: el colract species. ® Campground
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Tract # 11 PULK Sale Administrator: Robert Cozzo
Waasa Township Number of Blocks: 8 N 1/2 SW1/4, SE1/4 SW1/4, GL 1, SW1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 3, SE1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 4,
s NE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 9, NE1/4, Sec. 10, Twp. 60N Rge. 14W
Virginia Area Total Acres: 71
C19150011 Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd Expires: 4/15/2017
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6é Block7 Block8 Block9 Block10 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Ash pulpwood 24 24 Cords @ $3.00 = $72.00
Aspen pulpwood 223 214 71 50 93 76 169 205 1101 Cords @  $17.67 = $19,454.67
Balsam Fir pulpwood 14 36 23 7 58 19 37 16 210 Cords @ $5.00 = $1,050.00
Birch pulpwood 12 5 63 46 83 209 Cords @ $5.04 = $1,053.36
Black Spruce pulpwood 61 15 65 115 35 291Cords @ $1741 =  $5,066.31
Jack Pine pulpwood 56 56 Cords @ $16.48 = $922.88
Red Maple pulpwood 17 43 60 Cords @ $297 = $178.20
White Spruce pulpwood 12 6 14 51 15 11 38 147 Cords @ $14.45 = $2,124.15
Down Payment Required (15%): $4,488.24 Total Appraised Value:  $29,921.57
Comments:
The Purchaser has the option 5t Louis Cou nty
to purchase this sale as Pulk
advertised or to purchase all u
species as Sold On Appraised Total Acreage: 71 acres
Volume (SOAV). B
Reserves: BL
White Pine RD
Cedar 1
Block
Snags JockB/RD 13 ac ﬁjﬁ
gy o
G/ BL Do
/"4
4 LY
S~
\\%-..
E A,
Block B i "\}
B ac 7 '!
Block 7BL / | 3 iy
Tract 11 Bk 4 g 1|]$11
T
% Block 4
5 ac
BL BL Block 5a
Block & &
oc =) =a
4 ac = RD
Block 5d Block &
acl
e, Bl 17 ac Block 5h
2 acW Z.::@ Han
Use your smartphone to scan RD Block 5c RD
the QR Code for access to 2 2ac
maps, cutting regulations, E
contract information and e
special regulations, or visit our
website.
. "
T
al
——@ Freey 21 Hwy2‘1w_ i Huwy 21 Huy 2] T Hope
Frepared By: Bob Cozzo l:/ % Harvest Area {CCT) A - Aspen
Map Crested: 1142002014 L s
TRS: TE0 14 5e03,4, 9810 |==m=mm== ExistingWoods Road
%'.'ﬁ?ﬁ'gr?&hﬁonofrew.dsasmeyappeamhe sat mooo= New Construction or Meeds Improvement
Louis County Offices afecting the area shown. Thisdrawing
i to be used onlyfir referance puposesandthe Convis | @ Monumented Corner (Not within Sale Boundary)
ot esporsible for any in@couracies henein contained .
1in=0.25 miles A
AL N {EL){RD) Harvest Area Painted Blue or Red




Tract # 12 DOGBONE

Beatty Township
C19140102

Product

Total Acres:

Aspen pulpwood

Birch pulpwood

Black Spruce pulpwood
Jack Pine pulpwood

Red Maple pulpwood
White Spruce pulp & bolts

Comments:

The purchaser has the option
to purchase this sale as
advertised or to purchase all
species as Sold on Appraised
Volume (SOAV).

Tract 12

St. Louis County February 19, 2015 Timber Auction Listing

Number of Blocks: 1

21

225
10
15
30
35
20

Season of Operation: SummerOrFrznGrnd
No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6

Down Payment Required (15%):

48° 1'40.153" N 92° 35' 57.060" W

$621.09

St. Louis County
DogBone

225 Cords
10 Cords
15 Cords
30 Cords
35 Cords
20 Cords

@

CECNCONCNC)

Expires:

$14.14
$4.03
$13.93
$13.19
$2.37
$11.56

Sale Administrator: Christophr Lintula
NW1/4 SE1/4, SW1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 14, Twp. 64N Rge. 18W

Total Volume Appraised Value

Total Appraised Value:

4/15/2018
Total Value

$3,181.50
$40.30
$208.95
$395.70
$82.95
$231.20

$4,140.60

Block 1-21 Acres

(=18

BL)

(RD)

} Osprey Drive

M

To County Road #24
+-45 Miles ==

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations, 29 | 24
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

14 413

Reserve:

Red Oak

Red Pine

White Pine
Conifers Under 1
Snags

tick in Clumps

Prepared By:  Chris Lintula
Map Created: &/25/2074

TRS: Twp. 64M. Rge 18W Sec 14

Disclaimer:

This isa compiltion ofrecords as theyappear n the Saint
Lowe County Offices afecting the sres shown. This drawing
E 10 be used onhyfor rerance puposes and the Countyis.
not msponsible for any inscouracss harein contained.

@’ -$- -Section Corner

BL) (RD)
7 Harvest Area-CCT-Boundary A-Aspen Covertype
A Painted Blue or Red -

-Gravel Road

1in=0.25 miles

1320 Fest
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STUCK BORE

Tract # 13 Sale Administrator: Christophr Lintula

Unorganized Township | Number of Blocks: 1 SE1/4 NW1/4, NW1/4 SW1/4, NE1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 18, Twp. 66N Rge.
Virginia Area Total Acres: 56 20W
C19140104 Season of Operation: FrozenGround 48° 12' 24.044" N 92° 57' 33.856" W Expires: 4/15/2018
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Ash pulpwood 5 5Cords @ $2.70 = $13.50
Aspen pulpwood 440 440 Cords @ $1590 = $6,996.00
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 10 10 Cords @ $1528 = $152.80
Balsam Fir pulpwood 55 55 Cords @ $5.00 = $275.00
Birch pulpwood 55 55 Cords @ $9.29 = $510.95
Black Spruce pulpwood 135 135Cords @ $15.67 = $2,115.45
Tamarack pulpwood 25 25Cords @ $3.00 = $75.00
White Spruce pulp & bolts 45 ) - 45Cords @ $13.00 = $585.00
Down Payment Required (15%): $1,608.56 Total Appraised Value:  $10,723.70
Comments:
Purchaser is required to obtain St Louis County
a Road Use Permit from the
LaCroix Ranger District.The Stuck Bore

Purchaser has the option to
purchase this sale as

adve]'tised or to purchase .aII \TO Cllurty Road #518
species as Sold On Appraised A 1 Mile
Volume (SOAV).
12 4 7
i
1 18

j Block 156 Acres !

Tract 13
o
=
#®
=
3
o
W
(I
w
=
Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and Tag, (,,,«/f’
special regulations, or visit our b
website.
Q Reserve:
Red Pine
Cedar

Ash Less Than 8 Inches in Diameter
Conifer Under 1 Stick in Clumps
sSnags

\-\‘\‘_‘—\——

Twvp. GEMN. Rage. 21W.

[~ TWP. GG, Rge. 2077

Prepared By:  Chris Lintula o
Map Created: &/28/2014 BL) FD)

s — :
TRS. Twp. 66N Rge. 20W. Sec. 18 m el al ol “Section Comer &
Disclaimer. 4

This isa compiltion ofrecords as theyappear n the Saint
Lowe County Offices afecting the sres shown. This drawing

A-Aspen Covertype

E 10 be used onhyfor rerance puposes and the Countyis. e _EXiSting Winter Road
not responsible ©r amy insccuradies hersin contsined. BS-Black Spruce Cove e
- . - ====—===: Proposed New Winter B P
1in=0.25 miles N H | Road Construction
="

1320 Feet B
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Tract # 14 CRA Sale Administrator: Erik Anton

Fine Lakes Township Number of Blocks: 2 SE1/4 SW1/4, NE1/4 SW1/4, NE1/4 SE1/4, SW1/4 NE1/4, SE1/4
Pike Lake Area Total Acres: 52.4 NE1/4, NW1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 22, Twp. 50N Rge. 20W

C19150012 Season of Operation: FrozenGround 46° 48' 5.417" N 92° 51' 27.499" W Expires: 4/15/2018
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
SOE Ash pulpwood 5 20 25Cords @ $3.30 = $82.50
Aspen pulpwood 510 485 995 Cords @ $19.44 = $19,342.80
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 5 5 10 Cords @ $18.68 = $186.80
SOE Birch pulpwood 20 15 35Cords @ $5.54 = $193.90
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 35 25 60 Cords @ $3.26 = $195.60
SOE Sugar Maple pulpwood 15 B ) 15Cords @ $3.75 = $56.25
Down Payment Required (15%):  $3,008.68 Total Appraised Value:  $20,057.85

Comments:

St. Louis County

CRA Sale Map
BLK 1b
8.8 ac.
21 BL
Tract 14
i
=
= <
Z =
E x
£ o
BLK 1c
24 ac. »
'0
*
Use your smartphone to scan % BL
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and -
special regulations, or visit our i
website. - :EIENSE rve:
—
T PN _F z BASSWOOD
Little Fox Forest Road ELM
SPRUCE
SNAGS
Prepargdily: ANION CLEARCUT WITH RESERVE AREA
Map Created” 1211172074 RESERVES (double blue paint) Tl
TRS: S02022
%s;lmme Siton ofrecort they: thez Saint
S 153 D0 l N Ofre0oKRs 35 i 3 nth i
Lous fointy Offcasafirti te ares afonn Trisdmary  BL DbUE PAINT = === PROPOSED STAND ACCESS
& o be used onlyfor rerence purposes and the Countyid (SE|B bDLII"IdEI'Y} ROUTES
not msponsible for any inscouracss harein contained.
1in = 0.125 miles T :IE—_ EXISTING CULVERTS ﬂ
¢ Ran M Sale Acres: 52.4
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Sale Administrator: Gene Becker

Tract # 15 INDIAN SUMMER
Gnesen Township Number of Blocks: 1 NE1/4 SW1/4, E 1/2 NW1/4, W 1/2 NE1/4, Sec. 23, Twp. 53N Rge.
Pike Lake Area Total Acres: 23 14W
C19150013 Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd 47°3'49.230" N 92° 4'49.775" W Expires: 4/15/2017
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
SOE Aspen pulpwood 34 34 Cords @ $1237 = $420.58
SOE Balsam Fir pulpwood 3 3Cords @ $5.00 = $15.00
SOE Birch pulpwood 2 2Cords @ $3.53 = $7.06
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 182 182 Cords @ $20.00 = $3,640.00
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 1 1Cords @ $2.08 = $2.08
Down Payment Required (15%): $612.71 Total Appraised Value: $4,084.72
Comments:
No skidding allowed. All St Louis County
wood must be forwarded. INDIAN SUMMER SALE
LTS 15, ﬂ;— s
5 I
2 22
- ;;?/}.
Reserve species: i
unmarked Norway pine 7
i . o
white pine F
3 i
white spruce e Block 1
snags I
ﬂJ’
i
vy = i
I
T
a |l
|
2|
: |
Tract 15 = =
ract g # 7~
Ef rd
21 ;
|—.|¢. i Q‘E‘@g
|f 4 c}\}\
i i o
:: 7 &
.'::'r /';’Y N
/ P Block 1a = 7.3 acres
Y N
7~ Block 1b = 15.7 acres
A
F g~
Use your smartphone to scan {,95’! Total slae = 23 acres
the QR Code for access to i
maps, cutting regulations, %
contract information and 1
special regulations, or visit our A 2
website. )
I g 77
L a
v
|
/g
I =
#
0
i
Prepared By: Gene Becker
MARKED TIMBER harvest area
Naptaeded: 115201 @ (yellow marked pine only and other harvest species)
TRS: 531423
Disclaimer:
This isa compilston ofrecords & theyappear nthe Saint (Bl blue painted harvest boundary
Lows County Cfices afecting lheareﬂshﬂm:.Tthrra'n\'_rn;
;?S;ﬁfgﬁﬁﬁiﬂﬁtﬁoﬁiﬁw ————___. forest managementroad (gravel)
lin=025mies [\ |eeeeswen woods roads (dirt)
o N 045 Mies




Pike Lake Area
C19150014

Product

Aspen pulpwood
Balsam Fir pulpwood

SOE Birch pulpwood
Black Spruce pulpwood
SOE Red Maple pulpwood
White Spruce pulpwood
Comments:

The Purchaser has the option
to purchase this sale as
advertised or to purchase all
species as Sold On Appraised
Volume (SOAV). A minimum
of $2,000 of the downpayment
will be retained and will

be held until satisfactory
completion of the contract.

Tract 16

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

STUMPY SCARECROW
Number of Blocks: 5
Total Acres: 121.2

Season of Operation: FrozenGround

St. Louis County February 19, 2015 Timber Auction Listing

SE1/4, E 1/2 NE1/4, Sec. 23, W 1/2 NW1/4, Sec. 24, E 1/2
1/2 NE1/4, SW1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 26, Twp. 55N

47°13' 36.392" N 91° 49' 19.414" W Expires:

Sale Administrator: William Hakala

NW1/4, N
Rge. 12W

4/15/2018

No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6

Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

245 245 240 475 180 1385 Cords @ $19.44 = $26,924.40
75 145 50 125 75 470 Cords @ $5.00 = $2,350.00
95 30 10 10 145 Cords @ $5.54 = $803.30
20 10 5 35Cords @ $19.15 = $670.25

35 25 140 10 210 Cords @ $3.26 = $684.60

20 15 130 115 280 Cords @ $15.90 = $4,452.00
Down Payment Required (15%):  $5,382.68 Total Appraised Value:  $35,884.55

St. Louis County
STUMPY SCARECROW

J

Acres
1=244
2=209
3=169
4=418
=174
Total = 1212

Reseme all white pine_ ash, and snags.

frpadly  ER bk Clearcut with reserves

WMap Created. 12/8/2014 m * Gate

TRS: TH5NR12W Sec. 23,24 26 — Btk niiihars

Disclaimer. l 1 Sy i

This isa compiltion ofrecords as theyappear n the Saint ; r ey pin

LouE County Offioes afecting the anes shown. This drawing Lease cahin

& o be used onlyfor reiren =and the County: i

rot rcporcble b any imaccuracic herein coniinal, | _ M Eectrical box
BL Painted blue sale boundary — o

1in=025miks |\ L) Euisting culverts

L " 45 s RD Painted red property boundary




Tract # 17
Unorganized Township

St. Louis County February 19, 2015 Timber Auction Listing

VIRTUAL SKYSCRAPERS
Number of Blocks: 1
Total Acres: 28

Pike Lake Area
C19150015

Product

SOE Aspen pulpwood

SOE Balm Of Gilead pulpwood

SOE Balsam Fir pulpwood

SOE Birch pulpwood

SOE Black Spruce pulpwood

SOE Red Maple pulpwood

SOE Sugar Maple pulpwood

SOE White Spruce pulpwood
Comments:

Tract 17

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

Season of Operation: FrozenGround
No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6

Sale Administrator: Rebecca Szajna
SW1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 4, NW1/4 NE1/4, S 1/2 NW1/4, NE1/4 NW1/4,
Sec. 9, Twp. 53N Rge. 15W

47°5'41.548" N 92° 15' 3.741" W

Total Volume

Expires: 4/15/2018

Appraised Value Total Value

758 758 Cords @ $19.44 =  $14,73552
2 2Cords @ $18.68 = $37.36
48 48 Cords @ $5.00 = $240.00
33 33Cords @ $5.54 = $182.82
16 16 Cords @ $19.15 = $306.40
8 8 Cords @ $3.26 = $26.08
46 46 Cords @ $3.75 = $172.50
6 ) - 6 Cords @ $15.90 = $95.40

Down Payment Required (15%): $2,369.41 Total Appraised Value: $15,796.08
St. Louis County
Virtual Skyscrapers
RESERVE
snags
white spruce =<1 stick
i ash
(///)) basswood
cedar
A \ yellow birch
Three /Lakes Road Laie white pine
4 ; ¥-_,f/ tamarack
b
R\
(\
2 b
e I8
B it
1 Block \\
28 Acres ET—

Map Created: November 11, 2074

TRS: T53NR15W Secd

Disclaimer:

This isa compiltion ofrecords as theyappear n the Saint
Lowe County Offices afecting the sres shown. This drawing
E 10 be used onhyfor rerance puposes and the Countyis.
not msponsible for amyi ies harsin contsined.

1in=0.25 miles %
]

e
i
e /_,_/—/\
Stroud )
Lake
III /
'S @ -

Prepared By: RLSzajna

Clearcut Harvest Area
Boundary Painted Blue (BL)

Woods Road

=======  Proposed Access
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Tract # 18
Unorganized Township

Pike Lake Area

HOGSBACK SALE
Number of Blocks: 5
Total Acres: 186

Sale Administrator: Rebecca Szajna
SW1/4 NW1/4, NW1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 29, S 1/2 NE1/4, S 1/2, Sec. 30,
NE1/4 NW1/4, NE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 31, Twp. 53N Rge. 15W

C19150016

Season of Operation: DrySummerOrFrznGrnd

47°2'31.121" N 92° 17' 25.330" W

Expires: 4/15/2018

Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 15 2 17 Cords @ $18.13 = $308.21
Norway Pine pulp & bolts 790 345 640 500 365 2640 Cords @ $32.91 = $86,882.40
Scotch Pine pulp & bolts 16 16 Cords @ $18.13 = $290.08
White Spruce pulp & bolts 10 2 7 2 21 Cords @ $1590 = $333.90

Comments:

No skidding allowed, all
wood must be forwarded.
NO EXTENSIONS will be
allowed.

Down Payment Required (15%): $13,172.19

St. Louis County

HOGSBACK SALE

Total Appraised Value:

$87,814.59

at

Block 1: 49.0 acres ¢ RESSHER;"E s

Block 2: 22.5acres % i e @

Block 3: 41.0 acres all other species, except white spruce !

Block 4: 37.5 acres :

Block 5: 36.0 acres i ] \J
Total: 186.0 acres /

ImEeEIEEIEE IR R Ei R R EEEEEEE

Tract 12

"

e "’.tl
TSRS
etele%006 %% %
RERIELD

SO0
et letete e %%
ISeeteleteles

3
]

b
\\\

a . » /0‘
: <X X 30 K X X o ) &
Use you marthone o s Bl e
the QR Code for access to b:.ﬁg{:gél ORGP PGeO M ER SR E S c —
maps, cutting regulations, S e I o e S (N
special regulations, or visit our 0“0.{0:00%’.‘0:0’@”.’0’0‘0‘0"‘03‘;“’.0.0‘0.0‘3

website. gy

Survey Monuments

This isa compiltion ofrecords as theyappear n the Saint
Lowe County Offices afecting the sres shown. This drawing
E 10 be used onhyfor rerance puposes and the Countyis.
not msponsible for any inscouracss harein contained.

1in=0.125 miles

a N 025 Mies

G DO NOT DISTURB
£S5
%,
Prepared By: RLSzajna
Wap Credied 12712074 @ MARKED TIMBER HARVEST
TRS: ec 29, 30, (yellow marked pine and all white spruce)
Disclaimer:

forest management road (gravel)

unmaintained road (rough)

RD red painted private boundaries
Blocks are separated by roads. They will be painted on request.




Tract # 19
Grand Lake Township

Product

SOE Ash pulpwood
SOE Aspen pulpwood
SOE Balm Of Gilead pulpwood
SOE Balsam Fir pulpwood
SOE Basswood pulpwood
SOE Birch pulpwood
SOE Boxelder pulpwood
SOE Elm pulpwood
SOE Red Maple pulpwood
SOE Sugar Maple pulpwood
SOE White Spruce pulpwood
Comments:
ENTRANCE ONTO
PROPERTY WITHOUT

PERMISSION IS NOT
ALLOWED.This sale is not
certified through the SFI
certification of St. Louis

County Tax Forfeited lands.

NO Extensions will be allowed.
Block 1 - Dry Soil after July 1 or
frozen ground. Block 2 - Frozen
ground.

Tract 19

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

NERCC 2
Number of Blocks: 2

Total Acres: 108.2

Season of Operation: See comments

No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6

St. Louis County February 19, 2015 Timber Auction Listing

Sale Administrator: Gene Becker

NW1/4, NW1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 11, NW1/4 NE1/4, N 1/2 NW1/4, Sec. 14,

46° 55' 9.107" N 92° 20' 25.199" W

Twp. 51N Rge. 16W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

5 5Cords @ $3.30 = $16.50
634 144 778 Cords @ $19.44 = $15,124.32
104 104 Cords @ $18.68 = $1,942.72
879 49 928 Cords @ $1135 = $10,532.80
35 35Cords @ $4.78 = $167.30
104 6 110 Cords @ $5.54 = $609.40

2 2Cords @ $3.26 = $6.52
21 21 Cords @ $3.26 = $68.46
28 28 Cords @ $3.26 = $91.28
11 11 Cords @ $3.75 = $41.25
85 85Cords @ $1590 = $1,351.50

Down Payment Required (15%): $4,492.81 Total Appraised Value: $29,952.05
St. Louis County
NERCC 2 SALE 108 acres
T T T
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Prepared éy: Gene Beck

Map Crealed: 1202074

TR3: 5T-16-11,74

Disclaimer:

This is.3 compilton ofrecords s tfheysppes n the Saint
Louk County Offices afecting the ares shown. Thisdrawing
E 10 be used ontyfior reierende purposes.and the Countyis
not msponsible ©r amy insoouraciss hersin contained.
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0 "' Q.45 Mies

@ clearcut harvest area

BL blue painted harvest boundaries
RD red painted ownership boundaries
paved roads
gravel road
e+ proposed access routes

——

@ survey marker (protect from damage)
railroad

reserve areas

1,2a,2b block #s




St. Louis County February 19, 2015 Timber Auction Listing

PINE CREEK Sale Administrator: Thomas Robertson

Ault Township Number of Blocks: 3 W 1/2 SW1/4, Sec. 14, SE1/4, Sec. 15, NE1/4 SE1/4, SE1/4 NE1/4,
Pike Lake Area Total Acres: 87 Sec. 20, Twp. 55N Rge. 12W
C19150018 Season of Operation: See comments 47°14'47.920" N 91° 50' 3.670" W Expires: 4/15/2018
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Aspen pulp & bolts 160 645 175 980 Cords @ $1767 = $17,316.60
Balsam Fir pulp & bolts 75 165 23 263 Cords @ $5.00 = $1,315.00
SOE Birch pulpwood 17 17 34 Cords @ $5.04 = $171.36
Black Spruce pulp & bolts 55 7 62 Cords @ $17.41 = $1,079.42
Jack Pine pulp & bolts 212 72 5 289 Cords @ $16.48 = $4,762.72
White Spruce pulp & bolts 114 182 56 352 Cords @ $1445 = $5,086.40
Down Payment Required (15%): $4,459.73 Total Appraised Value: $29,731.50
Comments:
Blocks 1 and 2 - Frozen Groiund. St. Louis Cou nty

Block 3 - Dry soil after July 1 or Frozen Ground Pine Creek Sale

Two Harbors Brimson Rd

Tract 20

Pine Creek

Block 3
Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and @
special regulations, or visit our
website.
¥
g, g
ah‘r-ai:@
oy =
Prepared By: Robertson Black 1=131Ac
Wap Creaied: T2FBIZ0TE 7 CCT = Clear cut area Block 2 =47 Ac
: g Harvest areas
TRS: Sec 15 & 20 Twp 55 Rng 12 ; : Block 3= 9 Ac
Discamar BL = Blue painted line
This is 3 compilstion ofrecons & theyappear i the Ssint RD = Red painted line _
Louk County Offices aficting the sras shown, This drawing Total acres =87
& 1 b2 wsed only for reierence puposes and the Countyis | @ —— pro pUSBd access
not msponsible ©r amy insoouraciss hersin contained. i 5
_______ Snowmabile trail
1in=0.331 miles ’
5 —+—+—+— Railroad

] 065 Mies Reserve white pine & Red Maple




St. Louis County February 19, 2015 Timber Auction Listing

Tract # 21
Culver Township

Pike Lake Area
C19150019

Product

SOE Ash pulpwood

SOE Aspen pulpwood

SOE Balsam Fir pulpwood
SOE Birch pulpwood

SOE Black Spruce pulpwood
SOE Burr Oak pulpwood
SOE Elm pulpwood

SOE Red Maple pulpwood
SOE White Spruce pulpwood

Comments:

This sale does not meet
cruising error standards.
Please talk to the Sale
Administrator for more
information.

Tract 21

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

MUSSEL BEACH
Number of Blocks: 1

Total Acres: 33

Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Robert Hedburg
SW1/4 NW1/4, NE1/4 NW1/4, NW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 35, Twp. 51N Rge.
18W

46° 51' 48.723" N 92° 35' 35.261" W Expires:  6/1/2016

No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
48 48 Cords @ $2.10 = $100.80
172 172 Cords @ $12.37 = $2,127.64

1 1Cords @ $5.00 = $5.00
2 2Cords @ $353 = $7.06
3 3Cords @ $5.00 = $15.00
6 6 Cords @ $3.00 = $18.00
4 4 Cords @ $1.00 = $4.00
79 79 Cords @ $2.08 = $164.32
2 2Cords @ $5.00 = $10.00

Down Payment Required (15%): $367.77 Total Appraised Value: $2,451.82

St. Louis County
Mussel Beach Sale

Private
Cheryl B Dietrich

Private
Cully J Hall
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DHECHITTTET. : —————— County Road (gravel)
'{;usl isa mm{?ﬁmnngmns:: Ma';pgaa;srthe Saint . m = mm g AbEndoned o
& Coun fiecting the ares shown. This drawin P i i
b;ieﬁlgonl;sj?eémﬁep|_.|]::oa:esja.|ﬂ-drﬂ:e_?m_-rgl:r{f township road FoF Snowmaobile Trail
not msponsible or any inscouracss harein contained. ’ 1/16 Corner pri\-'ate survey Gravel p”_
1in = 0.063 miles
a " O N @ 174 Comer buried in road
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SCAEFFER EAST PINE Sale Administrator: Randy Roff
Number of Blocks: 2 SW1/4 SE1/4, SW1/4 NE1/4, N 1/2 SE1/4, Sec. 23, W 1/2 NE1/4, Sec.
Total Acres: 84.6 26, Twp. 54N Rge. 12W
Season of Operation: DrySummer 47°8'32.185" N 91° 49' 14.247" W Expires: 4/15/2017

No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6

Tract # 22
Pequaywan Township

Pike Lake Area
C19150020

Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Product

Aspen pulpwood 232 149 381 Cords @ $1767 = $6,732.27

Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 12 7 19 Cords @ $16.98 = $322.62

Balsam Fir pulpwood 102 65 167 Cords @ $5.00 = $835.00

SOE Birch pulpwood 166 106 272 Cords @ $5.04 = $1,370.88
Jack Pine pulpwood 17 11 28 Cords @ $16.48 = $461.44

Norway Pine pulp & bolts 63 40 103 Cords @ $29.92 = $3,081.76

SOE Red Maple pulpwood 30 19 49 Cords @ $2.97 = $145.53
White Pine pulp & bolts 263 168 431 Cords @ $2163 = $9,322.53

116 74 190 Cords @ $1445 = $2,745.50

White Spruce pulp & bolts
Total Appraised Value:  $25,017.53

Down Payment Required (15%): $3,752.63

Comments:

The Purchaser has the option St Louis Cou nty
to purchase this sale as :
advertised or to purchase all Scheaffer East Pine

species, except White and
Red pine, as Sold

On Appraised Volume
(SOAV).
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j"t,/}
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Tract # 23 UPS II Sale Administrator: Brian Rusk

Grand Lake Township Number of Blocks: 1 SW1/4, SW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 10, NE1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 14, NE1/4 SE1/4,
Pike Lake Area Total Acres: 31.5 Sec. 23, Twp. 52N Rge. 16W

C19150021 Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd 46° 59' 58.340" N 92° 21' 35.989" W Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

Aspen pulpwood 15 15Cords @ $1767 = $265.05

Balsam Fir pulpwood 5 5Cords @ $10.32 = $51.60

Birch pulpwood 10 10 Cords @ $5.04 = $50.40

Norway Pine pulp & bolts 340 340 Cords @ $29.92 = $10,172.80

White Spruce pulp & bolts 2 2Cords @ $1445 = $28.90

Down Payment Required (15%):  $1,585.31 Total Appraised Value:  $10,568.75

Comments:

St. Louis County
UpPs

Tract 23

—_

15 16 Uskabwanka Forest Management Rd_
Block 1A 6.5 ac
Use your smartphone to scan Block 1B 1.5 ac
the QR Code for access to Block 1C 14 ac
maps, cutting regulations, Block 1D 6.0 ac
contract information and Block 1E 3.5 ac

special regulations, or visit our

website. Total 31.5 acres

Additional Map showing Block 1E available
on-line or from Area Office.

Frepared By"  Rusk B. Marked timber removal. Harvest all Yellow
Wap Created. 121314 painted pine and all Aspen, Birch. Balsam fir and Spruce.
TRST  T52N RT6W Sectl, 11&23 *Reserve all unpainted pine.
LITSCHETTTET.
This isa compiltion ofrecords as theyappear n the Saint

Lowe County Offices afecting the sres shown. This drawing ~——— Gravel Road

E 10 be used onhyfor rerance puposes and the Countyis.

not msponsible for any inscouracss harein contained. ————==- Woods Road

4" =1 mile )
—_—



ReedM
Typewritten Text
Additional Map showing Block 1E available
on-line or from Area Office.
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SHORT CUT Sale Administrator: John Kloster
Number of Blocks: 1 N 1/2 NE1/4, NE1/4 NW1/4, S 1/2 NW1/4, Sec. 15, Twp. 53N Rge.
Total Acres: 31 17W

Tract # 24
Northland Township

Pike Lake Area

C19150022 Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd 47° 4' 57.198" N 92° 28' 44.277" W Expires: 4/15/2017
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Aspen pulpwood 445 445 Cords @ $1767 = $7,863.15
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 65 65 Cords @ $16.98 = $1,103.70
Balsam Fir pulpwood 5 5Cords @ $5.00 = $25.00
SOE Birch pulpwood 10 10 Cords @ $5.04 = $50.40
Black Spruce pulpwood 5 5Cords @ $17.41 = $87.05
White Spruce pulp & bolts 10 B ) 10 Cords @ $1445 = $144.50
Down Payment Required (15%): $1,391.07 Total Appraised Value: $9,273.80
Comments:

St. Louis County

SHORT CUT
LAKE NICHOLS ROAD
1
1
*
LY
b
LY
MN STATE DMR ‘\ PRIVATE PRIVATE
1
¥
¢
l '
g_ﬂn 5 RD RD
6 15
L}
Tract 24
[42]
w
p
£
I
SIX YEAR OLD
CLEARCUT
Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to BL
maps, cutting regulations, PRIVATE
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.
BL
: RD
MM STATE DNR
Prepared By: | Kloster
Map Creafed” 12H72074 @ = CLEARCUT AREA PAINTED RED OR BLUE | BLOCKACRES
TRS: T53, R17, 5.15
L A tesant | 4 1=31.0
S 153 D0 l N O reno aa ey i the i s
Lou'E.Comnl)f-p{ﬁnE.aﬂE::irqtheareﬂsl?g::Thisfrra\-\"rn; ,’ = GUARANTEED ACCESS
E 10 be used onhyfor rerence puposes and the Countyis | #
not msponsible for amyi ies harsin contsined.
1in=0.125 miles v@-
¢ ) 92 s RESERVE: MAPLE, BASSWOOD, AND SNAGS
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NO BARS Sale Administrator: Erik Anton
Number of Blocks: 2 S 1/2 SE1/4, Sec. 13, NE1/4 SE1/4, E 1/2 NE1/4, Sec. 23, N 1/2
Total Acres: 152 SE1/4, NW1/4, NE1/4, N 1/2 SW1/4, Sec. 24, Twp. 50N Rge. 20W

Tract # 25
Fine Lakes Township

Pike Lake Area

C19150023 Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd 46° 48' 9.216" N 92° 48' 37.214" W Expires: 4/15/2018
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Aspen pulpwood 309 253 562 Cords @ $21.21 = $11,920.02
SOE Basswood pulpwood 823 796 1619 Cords @ $5.21 = $8,434.99
SOE Birch pulpwood 525 1181 1706 Cords @ $6.05 = $10,321.30
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 143 41 184 Cords @ $3.56 = $655.04
SOE Red Oak pulpwood 169 85 254 Cords @ $12.00 = $3,048.00
SOE Sugar Maple pulﬂvooL - 514 655 B ) 1169 Cords @ $4.09 = $4,781.21
Down Payment Required (15%):  $5,874.08 Total Appraised Value:  $39,160.56
Comments:
NO EXTENSIONS will be allowed. St_ Louis County
NO BARS SALE
RESERVE ALL
ASH
ELM
YELLOW BIRCH
CONIFERS 13
14 ORANGE-PAINTED TREES 13
AND SNAG

Tract 25

Use your smartphone to scan
the QR Code for access to
maps, cutting regulations,
contract information and
special regulations, or visit our
website.

26 25 a0

p—
Prepared By: M BAKER

WMap Created: 121772014 @ SEED TREE HARVEST AREA
TRS: 502024, 23,13
Qég%glg%imw_rmsaMaw e | T PROPOSED NEW ROAD CONSTRUCTION
Lowss County’ Oﬁnt_zsa’i_a_::ilq lfeafeﬂshun'n.ThEﬁra‘n"_rg =':__ CU LVERT |NSTALLAT| ON

e s 5| BL  BLUE PAINTED HARVEST BOUNDARY

: : - (internal reserves are marked double blue)
1in=0.25 miles -JF-s

s : 045 s Sale Acres: 152
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WOLF ATTACK Sale Administrator: Nate Anderson
Number of Blocks: 4 SW1/4 NW1/4, N 1/2 NE1/4, NE1/4 SW1/4, E 1/2 NW1/4, Sec. 1,
Total Acres: 108.3 SE1/4 NE1/4, NE1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 2, Twp. 55N Rge. 12W

Pike Lake Area

Tract 26

C19150024 Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd 47°17' 0.000" N 91° 48' 2.532" W Expires: 4/15/2018
Product No Bid Blockl Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value
Aspen pulpwood 691 401 221 149 1462 Cords @ $19.44 = $28,421.28
Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 16 16 Cords @ $18.68 = $298.88
Balsam Fir pulpwood 280 113 90 15 498 Cords @ $11.35 = $5,652.30
SOE Birch pulpwood 132 160 70 28 390 Cords @ $5.54 = $2,160.60
Black Spruce pulpwood 46 13 29 88 Cords @ $19.15 = $1,685.20
Jack Pine pulpwood 10 13 62 85Cords @ $18.13 = $1,541.05
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 1 1Cords @ $3.26 = $3.26
White Spruce pulpwood 77 133 49 30 ) B 289grds 7@ ;&515.90 =7$4,595.10
Down Payment Required (15%): $6,653.65 Total Appraised Value:  $44,357.67
Comments:
The Purchaser has the option St. Louis Cou nty
to purchase this sale as
advertised or to purchase all Wolf Attack Sale Map
species as Sold On Appraised 3 Sal A 2 ?
Volume (SOAV). ale Area & / Reserve: White Pine, Red Pine, Cedar, and Snags.
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1 45 ; 7/_/(/
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Barrier Freé: All St. Louis County
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Please contact the St. Louis County
- Land and Minerals Department
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