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Published as follows is the list of timber to be offered at public auction sale as announced and 
advertised in the official newspaper within this County. 

NOTICE OF ST. LOUIS COUNTY PUBLIC TIMBER AUCTION  
 
Notice is hereby given that the St. Louis County Auditor shall sell to the highest bidder the 
designated timber located on the following described parcels of land forfeited to the State for the 
nonpayment of taxes which have been classified and appraised as provided by Minnesota 
Statutes 282.04, Sub. 1 (1982) subject, in part, to the following conditions: 
 

1. To be eligible to bid at a St. Louis County Timber auction, a Responsible Operator 
Application Form must be on file at the St. Louis County Land and Minerals Department, 
320 West 2nd Street, Room 208, Duluth, MN 55802 at least 2 working days prior to the 
auction.  This application will remain on file with the Land and Minerals Department.  An 
application can be obtained at any Land and Minerals Department Office. 

 
2. A minimum of fifteen percent of the appraised value shall be paid at time of sale. The 

remaining balance shall be paid prior to entry. REQUIRED DOWN PAYMENT IS 
SPECIFIED ON LIST.  

 
3. Minimum bid shall be the appraised value of the sale.  Bids shall be at one (l) or more 

percent over and above the appraised prices.  The final percent bid is to be added to the 
price of each kind of timber advertised, unless otherwise stipulated in individual contract 
regulations.  Species denoted with an NBS or NBE are non-bid species and will not be 
subject to the percent bid increase.  

 
4. Many of the tracts have special requirements.  The St. Louis County Land and Minerals 

Department offers sales of various sizes, species and products to meet the needs of a 
wide variety of purchasers.  There are some sales offered on this auction that allow the 
purchaser to decide if they want to purchase the sale as offered, either all species scaled 
or a mix of scaled and SOE species, or choose to have all the species sold as SOE.  
These are identified with the following sentence in the comments of each tract:  “The 
purchaser has the option to purchase this sale as advertised or to purchase all species as 
Sold on Appraised Volume (SOAV)”.  Prospective bidders should get maps, cutting 
regulations, contract information and special regulations at the applicable AREA OFFICE 
listed below or on the County Website: 

 

Tracts 1 through 17 Contact: 
Virginia Area 

Mark Kailanen, Area Land Manager 
7820 Highway #135 
Virginia, MN 55792 

 
(218) 742-9898 

Tracts 18 through 37 Contact: 
Pike Lake Area 

Mark Pannkuk, Interim Area Land Manager 
5713 Old Miller Trunk Highway 

Duluth, MN 55811 
 

(218) 625-3700 
Sale will be held in the 

Cotton Town Hall 
Highway 53, Cotton, Minnesota 
11:00 a.m. – October 2, 2014 

 
St. Louis County Land and Minerals Department does not accept cash payments. 

Payments must be made by check or money order. 
 

STLOUISCOUNTYMN.GOV 



Please Note: 
 
Successful bidders of sales with the option of choosing Sold on Appraised 
Volume (SOAV) will have 10 business days to choose the option for the sale(s). 
A $300 bid bond, i.e. personal check, payable to the St. Louis County Auditor is 
required and must be paid the day of the auction. One bid bond will cover all 
purchased tracts that have an SOAV option. 
 
 
 
Successful bidders using a Letter of Credit to secure the purchase of a sale will 
have 10 business days to provide the Letter of Credit to the Land and Minerals 
Department. A $300 bid bond, i.e. personal check, payable to the St. Louis 
County Auditor is required and must be paid the day of the auction. One bid bond 
will cover all purchased tracts that will be secured by Letter of Credit. 
 
 
 
Timber Sale Operators must have the following minimum training for at least the 
owner of the firm and the foreman who will supervise the logging on St. Louis 
County Lands: 
 

• Master Logger Certification; or 
• Minnesota Logger Education (MLEP) Member in Good Standing; or 

SFI Trained FISTA member; or 
• Training equivalent to the Minnesota SFI Implementation Committee 

Training Standard for a trained Professional Logger. 
 
All field employees must have training in best management practices. 
 
 
 



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 1 TOPSIDE
White Township
Virginia Area
C19140090

Number of Blocks: 3
Total Acres: 132
Season of Operation: Dry SummerOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Robert Benson
N 1/2 SW1/4, NE1/4 SE1/4, W 1/2 SE1/4, S 1/2 NW1/4, Sec. 15, Twp. 

59N Rge. 15W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 35' 38.572" N 92° 13' 52.159" W

   Aspen pulpwood 270 230 90 590 $17.67 $10,425.30= Cords     @
   Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 5 5 $17.67 $88.35= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 65 75 10 150 $5.00 $750.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 140 50 30 220 $5.04 $1,108.80= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 285 155 40 480 $2.97 $1,425.60= Cords     @
   Sugar Maple pulpwood 290 20 310 $3.41 $1,057.10= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 40 25 5 70 $14.45 $1,011.50= Cords     @

$15,866.65$2,380.00Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 2 SOUTH TOWER
Kugler Township
Virginia Area
C19140091

Number of Blocks: 1
Total Acres: 34
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Robert Cozzo
SW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 4, SE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 5, Twp. 61N Rge. 15W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 47' 42.327" N 92° 15' 49.046" W

   Aspen pulpwood 683 683 $17.67 $12,068.61= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 64 64 $5.00 $320.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 5 5 $5.04 $25.20= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulpwood 122 122 $16.48 $2,010.56= Cords     @
   Norway Pine pulpwood 35 35 $29.92 $1,047.20= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 53 53 $2.97 $157.41= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 18 18 $14.45 $260.10= Cords     @

$15,889.08$2,383.36Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
The purchaser has the option 
to purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all 
species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 3 BOULDER COURSE
Kugler Township
Virginia Area
C19140092

Number of Blocks: 1
Total Acres: 32
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Michael Stubbs
SE1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 11, SW1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 12, NW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 

13, NE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 14, Twp. 61N Rge. 15W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 46' 22.143" N 92° 12' 8.808" W

   Aspen pulpwood 215 215 $15.90 $3,418.50= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 5 5 $5.00 $25.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 245 245 $4.54 $1,112.30= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 5 5 $15.67 $78.35= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulpwood 5 5 $14.83 $74.15= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 175 175 $2.67 $467.25= Cords     @

$5,175.55$776.98Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
The Purchaser has the option 
to purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all 
species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing

Tract # 4 NEEDLEBOY BLUE
Breitung Township
Virginia Area
C19140093

Number of Blocks: 9
Total Acres: 144.3

Season of Operation: DrySummer

Sale Administrator: James Simons
N 1/2 SE1/4,  SE1/4, Sec. 20, NW1/4 SE1/4, S 1/2 SE1/4, NE1/4 SE1/4, E 1/2 SW1/4, 

Sec. 21, NE1/4 NW1/4, NW1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 28,  NE1/4, Sec. 29, Twp. 62N Rge. 14W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total ValueBlock7 Block8No Bid Block9 Block10

Aspen pulpwood 40 150 25 115 110 1130 $17.67 $19,967.10= Cords     @590 20 80

Balsam Fir pulpwood 5 10 $5.00 $50.00= Cords     @5

Birch pulpwood 10 10 5 90 $5.04 $453.60= Cords     @60 5

Jack Pine pulp & bolts 10 15 35 $16.48 $576.80= Cords     @10

Norway Pine pulp & bolts 58 4 49 58 45 22 444 $29.92 $13,284.48= Cords     @44 50 114

Red Maple pulpwood 10 50 $2.97 $148.50= Cords     @30 5 5

White Pine pulp & bolts 4 2 11 3 3 44 $21.63 $951.72= Cords     @4 5 12

White Spruce pulp & bolts 5 10 5 10 50 $14.45 $722.50= Cords     @15 5

$36,154.70$5,423.21Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

There are two streams 
crossings on this sale.  Inspect 

 access beforebidding.

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 5 CENTRAL AMERICA
Kugler Township
Virginia Area
C19140094

Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 76.5
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: James Simons
SW1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 3, S 1/2 SE1/4, SE1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 4, NE1/4 NW1/4, NW1/4 NE1/4, 

Sec. 9, NW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 10, Twp. 61N Rge. 15W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 47' 13.856" N 92° 14' 58.425" W

   Aspen pulpwood 55 790 845 $17.67 $14,931.15= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 5 30 35 $5.00 $175.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 15 65 80 $5.04 $403.20= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 20 20 $17.41 $348.20= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulp & bolts 10 10 $16.48 $164.80= Cords     @
   Norway Pine pulp & bolts 105 18 123 $29.92 $3,680.16= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 10 95 105 $2.97 $311.85= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 15 15 $14.45 $216.75= Cords     @

$20,231.11$3,034.67Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 6 NORTHEAST LEAN
White Township
Virginia Area
C19140095

Number of Blocks: 4
Total Acres: 54
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Robert Cozzo
NW1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 30, Twp. 59N Rge. 14W, SE1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 24, 

NW1/4 NE1/4, SE1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 25, Twp. 59N Rge. 15W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 34' 18.630" N 92° 10' 55.337" W

   Ash pulpwood 1 2 3 $2.10 $6.30= Cords     @
   Aspen pulpwood 292 112 233 118 755 $12.37 $9,339.35= Cords     @
   Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 40 40 $11.89 $475.60= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 124 72 64 79 339 $5.00 $1,695.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 14 110 24 4 152 $3.53 $536.56= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 4 5 9 $12.19 $109.71= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulpwood 1 1 $11.54 $11.54= Cords     @
   Norway Pine pulpwood 6 4 10 $20.94 $209.40= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 4 10 9 23 $2.08 $47.84= Cords     @
   White Pine pulpwood 19 32 3 54 $15.14 $817.56= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 9 4 5 18 $15.14 $272.52= Cords     @

$13,521.38$2,028.21Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
No extensions allowed. There 
is a higher insurance 

 requirement for access   
through RGGS Land & 
Minerals LTD and Mesabi 

 Nugget.The Purchaser has 
the option to purchase this 

 sale as advertised or to 
purchase all species as Sold 
On Appraised Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 7 LEFTOVER BEAR HEAD
Unorganized Township
Virginia Area
C19140096

Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 29
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Robert Cozzo
 SW1/4, Sec. 23, N 1/2 SE1/4, SE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 26, Twp. 61N Rge. 

14W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 44' 34.737" N 92° 5' 3.794" W

   Aspen pulpwood 48 68 116 $14.14 $1,640.24= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 6 20 26 $5.00 $130.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 239 156 395 $4.03 $1,591.85= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 5 5 $13.93 $69.65= Cords     @
   Norway Pine pulpwood 27 5 32 $23.94 $766.08= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 21 21 $2.37 $49.77= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 14 80 94 $11.56 $1,086.64= Cords     @

$5,334.23$800.13Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
Cruise error exceeds 
department standards.  

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 8 LUNA LAKE NW
French Township
Virginia Area
C19140097

Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 108.5
Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Dave Skurla
 SE1/4, SE1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 11, NW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 13, NE1/4 NW1/4, 

NE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 14, Twp. 60N Rge. 21W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 41' 32.504" N 92° 57' 30.656" W

   Aspen pulpwood 330 400 730 $21.21 $15,483.30= Cords     @
   Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 95 140 235 $20.38 $4,789.30= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 105 65 170 $5.00 $850.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 190 70 260 $6.05 $1,573.00= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 605 595 1200 $19.15 $22,980.00= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 115 115 $3.56 $409.40= Cords     @
   Tamarack pulpwood 5 5 10 $4.00 $40.00= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 70 25 95 $19.15 $1,819.25= Cords     @

$47,944.25$7,191.64Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
The purchaser has the option 
to purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all 
species as Sold on Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 9 BAT RUSH
Bassett Township
Virginia Area
C19140098

Number of Blocks: 1
Total Acres: 42
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Nick Hoff
SW1/4 SE1/4, E 1/2 SW1/4, Sec. 20, Twp. 58N Rge. 13W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 29' 25.821" N 92° 0' 56.281" W

   Aspen pulpwood 740 740 $17.67 $13,075.80= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 65 65 $5.00 $325.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 115 115 $10.32 $1,186.80= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulpwood 25 25 $16.48 $412.00= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 5 5 $2.97 $14.85= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 120 120 $14.45 $1,734.00= Cords     @

$16,748.45$2,512.27Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
The purchaser has the option 
to purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all 
species as Sold on Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 10 STICKS AND STONES
Bassett Township
Virginia Area
C19140099

Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 65.5
Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Kelly Anderson
NE1/4 NE1/4, SE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 31, NW1/4 NW1/4, SW1/4 NW1/4, 

Sec. 32, Twp. 57N Rge. 13W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 23' 1.404" N 92° 1' 40.601" W

   Aspen pulpwood 115 220 335 $17.67 $5,919.45= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 290 150 440 $5.00 $2,200.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 315 170 485 $5.04 $2,444.40= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 35 105 140 $2.97 $415.80= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 100 35 135 $14.45 $1,950.75= Cords     @

$12,930.40$1,939.56Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
The purchaser has the option 
to purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all 
species as Sold on Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 11 THE BIG B
Leiding Township
Virginia Area
C19140100

Number of Blocks: 3
Total Acres: 163.5
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Shontel Kinkel
 SE1/4, Sec. 10,  SW1/4, Sec. 11, NW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 14,  NE1/4, 

Sec. 15, Twp. 65N Rge. 20W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

48° 7' 26.888" N 92° 52' 49.377" W

   Aspen pulpwood 125 360 955 1440 $17.67 $25,444.80= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 10 40 30 80 $5.00 $400.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 105 250 365 720 $5.04 $3,628.80= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulpwood 110 30 20 160 $16.48 $2,636.80= Cords     @
   Norway Pine pulp & bolts 20 20 $29.92 $598.40= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 35 265 280 580 $2.97 $1,722.60= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 5 10 25 40 $14.45 $578.00= Cords     @

$35,009.40$5,251.41Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
The purchaser has the option 
to purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all  
species as Sold on Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 12 BIG BORE
Leiding Township
Virginia Area
C19140101

Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 67
Season of Operation: FrozenGround or dry summer

Sale Administrator: Tom Salzer
SE1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 6, W 1/2 NW1/4, Sec. 7, Twp. 65N Rge. 20W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

48° 8' 11.540" N 92° 57' 29.766" W

   Aspen pulpwood 255 525 780 $14.14 $11,029.20= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 5 20 25 $5.00 $125.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 170 100 270 $4.03 $1,088.10= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 30 30 $17.41 $522.30= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulpwood 10 10 $13.19 $131.90= Cords     @
   Norway Pine pulpwood 70 15 85 $23.94 $2,034.90= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 55 30 85 $2.37 $201.45= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 85 85 $11.56 $982.60= Cords     @

$16,115.45$2,417.32Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
Current state access permit is 
granted for winter only. 

 

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 13 DOGBONE
Beatty Township
Virginia Area
C19140102

Number of Blocks: 1
Total Acres: 21
Season of Operation: Dry SummerOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Christophr Lintula
NW1/4 SE1/4, SW1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 14, Twp. 64N Rge. 18W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

48° 1' 44.162" N 92° 35' 57.298" W

   Aspen pulpwood 225 225 $14.14 $3,181.50= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 10 10 $4.03 $40.30= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 15 15 $13.93 $208.95= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulpwood 30 30 $13.19 $395.70= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 35 35 $2.37 $82.95= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulp & bolts 20 20 $11.56 $231.20= Cords     @

$4,140.60$621.09Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
The purchaser has the option 
to purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all 
species as Sold on Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 14 LEAVE A COUPLE 2
Portage Township
Virginia Area
C19140103

Number of Blocks: 5
Total Acres: 214.2
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Mark Kailanen
 N 1/2, NE1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 29, N 1/2 SE1/4, NE1/4 SW1/4, SE1/4 

NE1/4, Sec. 30, Twp. 66N Rge. 18W
Expires: 4/15/2018

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

48° 10' 34.827" N 92° 41' 3.082" W

   Ash pulpwood 5 5 30 20 60 $3.30 $198.00= Cords     @
   Aspen pulpwood 845 975 630 560 905 3915 $19.44 $76,107.60= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 65 10 5 5 85 $5.00 $425.00= Cords     @
   Basswood pulpwood 5 5 $4.78 $23.90= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 55 40 85 130 40 350 $5.54 $1,939.00= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 10 10 $19.15 $191.50= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulpwood 10 15 5 210 5 245 $18.13 $4,441.85= Cords     @
   Norway Pine pulp & bolts 13 13 25 45 1 97 $32.91 $3,192.27= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 20 50 45 15 5 135 $3.26 $440.10= Cords     @
   White Pine pulp & bolts 174 135 126 5 440 $23.80 $10,472.00= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 40 55 45 20 55 215 $15.90 $3,418.50= Cords     @

$100,849.72$15,127.46Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
Purchaser is required to obtain 
a Road Use Permit from the 

 LaCroix Ranger District and 
will involve road tolls and/or a 

  maintenance agreement.The 
Purchaser has the option to 
purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all 
species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 15 STUCK BORE
Unorganized Township
Virginia Area
C19140104

Number of Blocks: 1
Total Acres: 56
Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Christophr Lintula
SE1/4 NW1/4, NW1/4 SW1/4, NE1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 18, Twp. 66N Rge. 

20W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

48° 12' 24.044" N 92° 57' 33.856" W

   Ash pulpwood 5 5 $2.70 $13.50= Cords     @
   Aspen pulpwood 440 440 $15.90 $6,996.00= Cords     @
   Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 10 10 $15.28 $152.80= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 55 55 $5.00 $275.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 55 55 $9.29 $510.95= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 135 135 $15.67 $2,115.45= Cords     @
   Tamarack pulpwood 25 25 $3.00 $75.00= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulp & bolts 45 45 $13.00 $585.00= Cords     @

$10,723.70$1,608.56Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
Purchaser is required to obtain 
a Road Use Permit from the 

  LaCroix Ranger District.The  
Purchaser has the option to 
purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all  
species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 16 ARMSTRONG VALLEY
Breitung Township
Virginia Area
C19130011

Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 28
Season of Operation: FrozenGround or Dry Soil

Sale Administrator: James Simons
SW1/4 NE1/4,  NW1/4, Sec. 15, Twp. 62N Rge. 14W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 51' 15.500" N 92° 6' 37.938" W

   Aspen pulpwood 30 85 115 $10.00 $1,150.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 5 5 10 $3.53 $35.30= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 190 5 195 $10.00 $1,950.00= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulpwood 15 0 15 $10.00 $150.00= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 0 10 10 $2.08 $20.80= Cords     @
   Tamarack pulpwood 50 0 50 $2.33 $116.50= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 5 25 30 $10.00 $300.00= Cords     @

$3,722.60$558.39Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
The Purchaser has the option 
to purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all  
species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 17 HAAPALA
Morse Township
Virginia Area
C19140055

Number of Blocks: 5
Total Acres: 89.5
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: James Simons
SW1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 5, NW1/4 NW1/4, SW1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 8, W 1/2 

NW1/4, SE1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 17, Twp. 62N Rge. 12W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 51' 54.215" N 91° 54' 6.183" W

   Aspen pulpwood 210 125 160 240 5 740 $5.00 $3,700.00= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 55 0 15 25 0 95 $5.00 $475.00= Cords     @
   Birch pulpwood 10 0 5 55 0 70 $3.53 $247.10= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 0 0 0 175 10 185 $5.00 $925.00= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulp & bolts 0 0 0 15 5 20 $5.00 $100.00= Cords     @
   Norway Pine pulp & bolts 0 0 0 5 31 36 $20.94 $753.84= Cords     @
   Red Maple pulpwood 20 15 5 40 0 80 $2.08 $166.40= Cords     @
   Tamarack pulpwood 0 0 0 10 0 10 $2.33 $23.30= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulp & bolts 0 0 0 15 5 20 $5.00 $100.00= Cords     @

$6,490.64$973.60Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
Blocks 4 (July 1) and 5 
(August 1) will support dry 

 soil operations, but   
secured access requires 
frozen ground.

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing

Tract # 18 RAGING RAPTORS SALE
Unorganized Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140075

Number of Blocks: 9
Total Acres: 211.9

Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Rebecca Szajna
SW1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 1, N 1/2 SE1/4, SE1/4 SE1/4,  SW1/4, S 1/2 NW1/4, Sec. 2, E 1/2 

SE1/4, S 1/2 NE1/4, Sec. 3, NE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 10, SE1/4 NE1/4, E 1/2 SE1/4, Sec. 11, 
SW1/4 SW1/4, N 1/2 SW1/4, S 1/2 NW1/4, NW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 12, Twp. 54N Rge. 15W

Expires: 4/15/2018

Product Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total ValueBlock7 Block8No Bid Block9 Block10

Ash pulpwood 0 90 20 20 0 5 140 $3.60 $504.00= Cords     @5

Aspen pulpwood 5 235 205 195 15 870 2965 $21.21 $62,887.65= Cords     @220 830 390

Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 10 155 150 5 335 $20.38 $6,827.30= Cords     @10 5

Balsam Fir pulpwood 60 160 70 135 10 45 535 $5.00 $2,675.00= Cords     @10 25 20

Birch pulpwood 70 90 285 120 70 55 795 $6.05 $4,809.75= Cords     @15 55 35

Black Spruce pulpwood 15 $20.89 $313.35= Cords     @10 5

Red Maple pulpwood 5 80 150 20 10 150 505 $3.56 $1,797.80= Cords     @20 70

Tamarack pulpwood 5 $4.00 $20.00= Cords     @5

White Spruce pulpwood 5 45 55 60 60 265 $17.34 $4,595.10= Cords     @10 15 15

$84,429.95$12,664.49Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 19 DOS CAMPOS
Ault Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140076

Number of Blocks: 5
Total Acres: 161.2
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Nate Anderson
 SE1/4, E 1/2 SW1/4, Sec. 14, E 1/2 NW1/4, SW1/4 NE1/4, SW1/4 

NW1/4, N 1/2 NE1/4, Sec. 23, Twp. 55N Rge. 12W
Expires: 4/15/2018

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 14' 34.017" N 91° 49' 19.577" W

   Aspen pulpwood 225 280 740 115 420 1780 $19.44 $34,603.20= Cords     @
   Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 5 10 5 20 $19.68 $393.60= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 95 165 285 15 245 805 $5.00 $4,025.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 25 20 50 5 30 130 $5.54 $720.20= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 10 10 15 15 50 $19.15 $957.50= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulpwood 10 15 15 40 $18.13 $725.20= Cords     @
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 25 15 5 45 $3.26 $146.70= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 35 45 85 5 70 240 $15.90 $3,816.00= Cords     @

$45,387.40$6,808.11Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
The purchaser has the option 
to purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all 
species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 20 HOWLIN WOLF
Industrial Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140077

Number of Blocks: 3
Total Acres: 180.9
Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Mark Baker
W 1/2 NE1/4,  SE1/4,  SW1/4, Sec. 19, W 1/2 NE1/4, E 1/2 NW1/4, 

Sec. 30, Twp. 51N Rge. 17W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

46° 53' 0.075" N 92° 32' 29.715" W

SOE Ash pulpwood 15 25 40 $3.30 $132.00= Cords     @
   Aspen pulpwood 765 600 185 1550 $19.44 $30,132.00= Cords     @
   Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 175 20 10 205 $18.68 $3,829.40= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 20 15 35 $5.00 $175.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 15 15 5 35 $5.54 $193.90= Cords     @

$34,462.30$5,169.35Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 21 WEEKEND WOLF
Unorganized Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140078

Number of Blocks: 6
Total Acres: 180.8
Season of Operation: See comments.

Sale Administrator: William Hakala
NE1/4 NW1/4,  SE1/4,  NE1/4, Sec. 21, NW1/4 NE1/4, NW1/4 SW1/4, 

NE1/4 NW1/4, SW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 22, Twp. 54N Rge. 13W
Expires: 4/15/2018

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 8' 53.599" N 91° 59' 18.628" W

   Aspen pulpwood 780 540 140 915 325 60 2760 $17.67 $48,769.20= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 245 290 20 265 120 25 965 $5.00 $4,825.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 80 25 15 270 10 10 410 $5.04 $2,066.40= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 35 15 25 75 $17.41 $1,305.75= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 155 45 200 $14.45 $2,890.00= Cords     @

$59,856.35$8,978.45Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
Season of Operation: Blk 1 dry 
soil after September 15 or frozen 
ground, Blocks 2 and 6 dry soil
after road restrictions or frozen
ground and Blocks 3, 4, and 5 
frozen ground.  The purchaser has 
the option  to purchase the sale as
advertised or to purchase all species
as Sold on Appraised Volume (SOAV). 

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 22 BIRD HEAD
Ault Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140079

Number of Blocks: 3
Total Acres: 114.1
Season of Operation: SummerOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Erik Anton
      NW1/4 SW1/4,  NW1/4, Sec. 29,  , NE1/4 SE1/4, NE1/4, Sec. 30 

    Twp. 55N Rge. 12W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 13' 21.866" N 91° 53' 51.248" W

   Aspen pulpwood 5 250 255 510 $21.21 $10,817.10= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 10 80 130 220 $5.00 $1,100.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 10 20 30 $6.05 $181.50= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 20 320 115 455 $20.89 $9,504.95= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulp & bolts 865 160 70 1095 $19.78 $21,659.10= Cords     @
   Norway Pine pulp & bolts 45 95 60 200 $35.90 $7,180.00= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 25 45 85 155 $17.34 $2,687.70= Cords     @

$53,130.35$7,969.55Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 23 NORTH WEST PASSAGE
Normanna Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140080

Number of Blocks: 3
Total Acres: 218.3
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Tim Rutka
 NW1/4, Sec. 6, Twp. 52N Rge. 12W, NE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 1, Twp. 52N 

Rge. 13W, S 1/2 SW1/4, Sec. 31, Twp. 53N Rge. 12W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 1' 21.436" N 91° 55' 3.903" W

SOE Ash pulpwood 45 150 35 230 $3.30 $759.00= Cords     @
SOE Aspen pulpwood 80 440 280 800 $19.44 $15,552.00= Cords     @
SOE Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 15 20 35 $18.68 $653.80= Cords     @
SOE Balsam Fir pulpwood 65 245 230 540 $5.00 $2,700.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 100 220 200 520 $5.54 $2,880.80= Cords     @
SOE Black Spruce pulpwood 60 60 $19.15 $1,149.00= Cords     @
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 25 65 55 145 $3.26 $472.70= Cords     @
SOE Sugar Maple pulpwood 10 90 100 $3.75 $375.00= Cords     @
SOE White Spruce pulpwood 10 50 10 70 $15.90 $1,113.00= Cords     @

$25,655.30$3,848.30Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
No extensions will be 
allowed on this sale.

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 24 DANCES
Unorganized Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140081

Number of Blocks: 6
Total Acres: 189.3
Season of Operation:  See comments.

Sale Administrator: William Hakala
NW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 3, NE1/4 NE1/4, NW1/4 NW1/4, NE1/4 NW1/4, S 1/2 NE1/4, NW1/4 
NE1/4, Sec. 4, Twp. 54N Rge. 13W, SW1/4 SE1/4, E 1/2 SE1/4,  SW1/4, SE1/4 NE1/4, 

Sec. 33, SW1/4 NW1/4, W 1/2 SW1/4, Sec. 34, Twp. 55N Rge. 13W
Expires: 4/15/2018

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 11' 58.201" N 91° 59' 20.110" W

   Aspen pulpwood 60 245 280 85 215 420 1305 $19.44 $25,369.20= Cords     @
   Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 10 10 $18.68 $186.80= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 45 75 230 85 165 120 720 $5.00 $3,600.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 75 95 415 135 145 210 1075 $5.54 $5,955.50= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 75 30 10 25 140 $19.15 $2,681.00= Cords     @
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 5 5 60 5 80 155 $3.26 $505.30= Cords     @
   Tamarack pulpwood 50 50 $3.67 $183.50= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 15 50 80 25 55 50 275 $15.90 $4,372.50= Cords     @

$42,853.80$6,428.07Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
Season of Operation: Block 1,
3,4 and 5 dry soil after July 1 or
frozen ground and Blocks 2 and
6 frozen ground. 
The purchaser has the option 
to purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all 
species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 25 EVIL BEAVERS
Fine Lakes Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140082

Number of Blocks: 3
Total Acres: 98
Season of Operation:  See comments.

Sale Administrator: Mark Baker
SW1/4, S1/2NW1/4,S1/2SE1/4,SW1/4NE1/4,Sec.18, E1/2,NE1/4,NW1/4NE1/4,Sec.19

W1/2SE1/4, S1/2SW1/4, NW1/4SW1/4, Sec.20, N1/2,NW1/4, SW1/4NW1/4, Sec. 29,
E1/2NE1/4, Sec.30, Twp.50N Rge.19W,NE1/4SE1/4,NE1/4NE1/4, Sec.13,Twp.50N Rge.20W 

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

46° 48' 17.950" N 92° 47' 27.574" W

   Aspen pulpwood 370 140 325 835 $21.21 $17,710.35= Cords     @
   Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 5 5 10 $20.38 $203.80= Cords     @
SOE Basswood pulpwood 5 630 635 $5.21 $3,308.35= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 85 5 745 835 $6.05 $5,051.75= Cords     @
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 30 5 50 85 $3.56 $302.60= Cords     @
SOE Sugar Maple pulpwood 75 5 215 295 $4.09 $1,206.55= Cords     @

$27,783.40$4,167.51Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
Season of Operation:  Blocks 1 and 2
frozen ground abd Block 3 dry soil
after July 1 or frozen ground. 

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 26 BLACK & MILD
Cedar Valley Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140083

Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 45.3
Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Erik Anton
NW1/4 SW1/4, SE1/4 NW1/4, SW1/4 SW1/4, NW1/4 NW1/4, SW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 22, 

NE1/4 SW1/4, SE1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 27, Twp. 54N Rge. 21W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 8' 6.973" N 92° 59' 48.895" W

SOE Ash pulpwood 105 45 150 $2.70 $405.00= Cords     @
   Aspen pulpwood 30 350 380 $15.90 $6,042.00= Cords     @
   Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 30 10 40 $15.28 $611.20= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 75 140 215 $5.00 $1,075.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 20 30 50 $4.54 $227.00= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 5 5 $15.67 $78.35= Cords     @
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 5 5 10 $2.67 $26.70= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 15 15 $13.00 $195.00= Cords     @

$8,660.25$1,299.04Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 27 OLD BATTERY
Arrowhead Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140084

Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 48.6
Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Erik Anton
SE1/4 NE1/4, SW1/4 NE1/4, SE1/4 SE1/4, SW1/4 SE1/4, NW1/4 

SE1/4, Sec. 13, Twp. 51N Rge. 19W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

46° 54' 16.411" N 92° 41' 9.024" W

   Aspen pulpwood 520 520 $17.67 $9,188.40= Cords     @
   Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 10 10 $16.98 $169.80= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 90 90 $5.00 $450.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 25 25 $5.04 $126.00= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 310 115 425 $17.41 $7,399.25= Cords     @
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 100 100 $2.97 $297.00= Cords     @
   Tamarack pulpwood 30 30 $3.33 $99.90= Cords     @

$17,730.35$2,659.55Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 28 END OF THE ROAD
Ault Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140085

Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 89
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Thomas Robertson
E1/2NW1/4,Sec. 18 NE1/4SE1/4,S1/2NE1/4,Sec.13,Twp.55N Rge.13W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 15' 7.351" N 91° 55' 12.900" W

SOE Aspen pulpwood 18 33 51 $15.90 $810.90= Cords     @
SOE Balsam Fir pulpwood 1 1 2 $5.00 $10.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 10 10 $5.04 $50.40= Cords     @
   Jack Pine pulp & bolts 216 46 262 $14.00 $3,668.00= Cords     @
   Norway Pine pulp & bolts 437 107 544 $14.00 $7,616.00= Cords     @

$12,155.30$1,823.30Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 29 SNOW BUNNY
Payne Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140086

Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 203
Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Troy Lindgren
SE1/4 SW1/4, SW1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 30, NE1/4 SW1/4,  NW1/4, N 1/2 SE1/4, NW1/4 

NE1/4, SW1/4 NE1/4, SE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 31, Twp. 53N Rge. 18W, SE1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 25, 
Twp. 53N Rge. 19W

Expires: 4/15/2018

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 2' 20.545" N 92° 40' 19.688" W

   Black Spruce pulpwood 665 670 1335 $20.89 $27,888.15= Cords     @
   Tamarack pulpwood 1585 1600 3185 $4.00 $12,740.00= Cords     @

$40,628.15$6,094.22Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 30 GOOD LUCK
Gnesen Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140087

Number of Blocks: 1
Total Acres: 17.9
Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Rebecca Szajna
NE1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 15, Twp. 52N Rge. 14W

Expires: 4/15/2016

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

46° 59' 10.415" N 92° 6' 13.657" W

SOE Aspen pulpwood 190 190 $15.90 $3,021.00= Cords     @
SOE Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 2 2 $15.28 $30.56= Cords     @
SOE Balsam Fir pulpwood 85 85 $5.00 $425.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 15 15 $4.54 $68.10= Cords     @
SOE Black Spruce pulpwood 35 35 $15.67 $548.45= Cords     @
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 15 15 $2.67 $40.05= Cords     @
SOE Tamarack pulpwood 15 15 $3.00 $45.00= Cords     @
SOE White Spruce pulpwood 5 5 $13.00 $65.00= Cords     @

$4,243.16$636.47Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 31 RES REMAINS
Normanna Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140088

Number of Blocks: 1
Total Acres: 21.7
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: Randy Roff
NE1/4 SE1/4, SE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 9, NW1/4 SW1/4, NE1/4 SW1/4, 

SW1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 10, Twp. 52N Rge. 13W
Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 0' 9.085" N 91° 58' 57.165" W

   Aspen pulpwood 105 105 $14.14 $1,484.70= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 45 45 $5.00 $225.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 85 85 $4.03 $342.55= Cords     @
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 5 5 $2.37 $11.85= Cords     @

$2,064.10$309.62Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
This sale does not meet 
our cruising error 
standards. Please talk 

 to the sale administrator 
for more information.

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 32 HEXUM ROAD
Ness Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140089

Number of Blocks: 1
Total Acres: 31.5
Season of Operation: DrySumOrFrznGrnd

Sale Administrator: John Kloster
NE1/4 NW1/4, SE1/4 NW1/4, Sec. 4, Twp. 52N Rge. 19W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 1' 25.233" N 92° 45' 22.698" W

   SOE Aspen pulp & bolt 255 255 $5.00 $1,275.00= Cords     @
$1,275.00$191.25Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
This is a hybrid aspen 
plantation.

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 33 TRICKY TRAIL
Cedar Valley Township
Pike Lake Area
C19140063

Number of Blocks: 1
Total Acres: 23
Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Gene Becker
S 1/2 NE1/4, W 1/2 SE1/4, N 1/2 SW1/4, Sec. 20, Twp. 54N Rge. 21W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 8' 35.584" N 93° 2' 9.536" W

SOE Ash pulpwood 175 175 $2.70 $472.50= Cords     @
SOE Aspen pulpwood 48 48 $15.90 $763.20= Cords     @
SOE Balsam Fir pulpwood 63 63 $5.00 $315.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 27 27 $4.54 $122.58= Cords     @
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 3 3 $2.67 $8.01= Cords     @

$1,681.29$252.19Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 34 BIG NOISE THIN
Ault Township
Pike Lake Area
C19130048

Number of Blocks: 2
Total Acres: 92
Season of Operation:  See comments.

Sale Administrator: Thomas Robertson
S 1/2 NW1/4,  SE1/4, SW1/4 NE1/4, E 1/2 SW1/4, Sec. 12, Twp. 55N 

Rge. 12W
Expires: 4/15/2016

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 15' 43.878" N 91° 48' 7.516" W

   Aspen pulp & bolts 10 175 185 $5.00 $925.00= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 15 10 25 $5.00 $125.00= Cords     @
   Norway Pine pulp & bolts 114 0 114 $5.00 $570.00= Cords     @
   Tamarack pulpwood 0 10 10 $5.00 $50.00= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulp & bolts 25 358 383 $5.00 $1,915.00= Cords     @

$3,585.00$537.75Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
Season of Operation: Block 1 dry soil
after July 1 or frozen ground and Block 
2 frozen ground with conventional
equipment or dry soil after road
restrictions or frozen ground with Cut-to-
Length. 
 

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 35 NEEDLEBACK
Ault Township
Pike Lake Area
C19130023

Number of Blocks: 6
Total Acres: 145.5
Season of Operation:  See comments.

Sale Administrator: Nate Anderson
SW1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 26, SE1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 34, SE1/4 NE1/4, N 1/2 SW1/4, NW1/4 

SE1/4,  NW1/4, W 1/2 NE1/4, Sec. 35, Twp. 55N Rge. 13W

Expires: 4/15/2018

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 12' 29.687" N 91° 57' 21.356" W

   Aspen pulpwood 150 150 75 55 20 40 490 $17.67 $8,658.30= Cords     @
   Balm Of Gilead pulpwood 0 0 20 5 25 $16.98 $424.50= Cords     @
   Balsam Fir pulpwood 150 75 110 60 20 30 445 $5.00 $2,225.00= Cords     @
SOE Birch pulpwood 390 210 180 40 35 95 950 $5.04 $4,788.00= Cords     @
   Black Spruce pulpwood 5 50 0 20 75 $17.41 $1,305.75= Cords     @
SOE Red Maple pulpwood 70 10 55 10 5 150 $2.97 $445.50= Cords     @
   White Spruce pulpwood 25 45 15 25 5 115 $14.45 $1,661.75= Cords     @

$19,508.80$2,926.32Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
Season of Operation: Block 1 and
3 frozen ground, Blocks 2, 5 and 6 dry 
soil after July 1 or frozen ground and
Block 4 dry soil after September 15 or
frozen ground. 
The purchaser has the option 
to purchase this sale as 

 advertised or to purchase all 
species as Sold On Appraised 
Volume (SOAV).

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 36 MISTLETOE
Unorganized Township
Pike Lake Area
C19130080

Number of Blocks: 1
Total Acres: 15
Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Gene Becker
SW1/4 NW1/4, NW1/4 SW1/4, Sec. 3, NE1/4 SE1/4, Sec. 4, Twp. 54N 

Rge. 14W
Expires: 4/15/2016

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

47° 11' 22.568" N 92° 6' 35.705" W

   Black Spruce pulp & bolts 125 125 $10.00 $1,250.00= Cords     @
   Tamarack pulpwood 75 75 $2.67 $200.25= Cords     @

$1,450.25$217.54Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:
This sale does not meet 
our cruising error 
standards. Please talk 

 to the sale administrator  
for more information.

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.



St. Louis County October 2, 2014 Timber Auction Listing
Tract # 37 LITTLE PIG
Halden Township
Pike Lake Area
C19130076

Number of Blocks: 3
Total Acres: 139.3
Season of Operation: FrozenGround

Sale Administrator: Erik Anton
NE1/4 NW1/4, NW1/4 NE1/4, SW1/4 NW1/4, SE1/4 NW1/4, SE1/4 SW1/4, NW1/4 SW1/4, 

NE1/4 SW1/4, NW1/4 SE1/4, SW1/4 NE1/4, Sec. 18, Twp. 51N Rge. 21W

Expires: 4/15/2017

Product No Bid Block1 Block2 Block3 Block4 Block5 Block6 Total Volume Appraised Value Total Value

46° 54' 18.161" N 93° 3' 5.655" W

   Black Spruce pulpwood 325 195 255 775 $15.67 $12,144.25= Cords     @
SOE Tamarack pulpwood 675 525 285 1485 $3.00 $4,455.00= Cords     @

$16,599.25$2,489.89Down Payment Required (15%): Total Appraised Value:

Comments:

Use your smartphone to scan 
the QR Code for access to 
maps, cutting regulations, 
contract information and 
special regulations, or visit our 
website.
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Land and MineralsLand and Minerals
DEPDEPARTMENTARTMENT

Government Services Center, 320 West 2nd Street, Room 208

Public Oral Timber Auction - Cotton Town Hall, Highway 53, Cotton, Minnesota

Barrier Free:  All St. Louis
County Timber Auctions are
accessible to the handicapped.
Attempts will be made to acco-
modate any other individual
needs for special services.
Please contact St. Louis County
Land and Minerals Department
(218-726-2606) prior to the auc-
tion, so necessary arrangements
can be made.
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