February 8th 2007 Land Sale Summary

Purchaser
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Terry Hauer
Thomas Clarke & Linda L. Clarke
No Bid
Reiner Nelson
PULLED
PULLED
Nicholas Williams & Lacie Farmer
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Skip Parrott
Roy Marlow & Lisa Marlow
No Bid
Leila Klasse
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Kenneth Mattson
PULLED
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Paul E Johnson
Martin Stocke
Martin Stocke
Mike Amendola
Rick Clark
Jason Siveny, Sr
PULLED
No Bid
PULLED
PULLED
PULLED
Gregory Wessels
Rick Clark
Paige Southgate

David Peter & Beverlee Caple-Peter

No Bid

Appraised Value

$71,000.00
$6,500.00
$25,200.00
$30,300.00
$12,500.00
$13,400.00
$13,500.00
$46,000.00
$0.00
$9,600.00
$354,000.00
$41,700.00
$22,350.00
$121,500.00
$8,400.00
$7,125.00
$22,000.00
$12,900.00
$2,000.00
$29,000.00
$3,700.00
$4,800.00
$4,000.00
$7,250.00
$7,200.00
$3,200.00
$160,000.00
$12,300.00
$48,000.00
$82,800.00
$54,000.00
$54,000.00
$44,100.00
$18,400.00
$8,500.00
$0.00
$5,100.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$19,000.00
$5,580.00
$7,560.00
$5,500.00
$27,160.00

Sold Value

$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$40,500.00
$12,500.00
$0.00
$13,500.00
$0.00
$0.00
$9,600.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$20,000.00
$18,000.00
$0.00
$12,900.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$13,100.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$92,500.00
$91,000.00
$98,000.00
$68,000.00
$30,000.00
$8,500.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$66,000.00
$5,580.00
$7,560.00
$9,100.00
$0.00



