June 2008 - ADJOINING OWNER SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 2 Richard V. Fisher $84,500.00 $84,500.00
2 0 NO BID $2,100.00 $0.00
3 0 NO BID $3,250.00 $0.00
4 0 NO BID $1,200.00 $0.00
5 3 Travis Stejskal $3,500.00 $3,500.00
6 0 NO BID $11,400.00 $0.00
7 0 NO BID $1,000.00 $0.00
8 4 Snowflake Nordic Inc. $2,000.00 $2,000.00
9 5 The Vineyard Church $3,200.00 $3,200.00
10 0 NO BID $13,100.00 $0.00
11 6 Kent and Mary Giese $1,660.00 $1,660.00
12 0 NO BID $1,870.00 $0.00
13 9 Thomas and Phyllis Ruper $700.00 $700.00
14 10 Richard Starich $2,350.00 $2,350.00
15 11 Jennifer and Dean Dowden $700.00 $700.00
16 0 NO BID $400.00 $0.00
17 12 Edward and Yuriko Bradach $500.00 $500.00
18 13 Phyllis Gentilini $250.00 $250.00
19 7 James L. and Gayle P. Maruska $950.00 $2,200.00
20 0 NO BID $570.00 $0.00
21 14 Bernice Polichnick $72.00 $72.00
22 0 NO BID $1,960.00 $0.00
23 16 Carey Rae Lokken $1,030.00 $1,030.00
24 23 Arlene and martin Petrie $138.00 $138.00
25 17 Gene and Julie Hippe $400.00 $400.00
26 18 Regan Scuffy $3,256.00 $3,256.00
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27 999 PULLED $170.00 $0.00
28 15 Wallace E. Bergsnev and Steven C. Larson $280.00 $280.00
29 0 NO BID $92,700.00 $0.00
30 19 James Hanneberry $200.00 $200.00
31 20 John Kurtz and Timothy Kurtz $91,440.00 $91,440.00
32 21 Robert Gould and Jennifer Marshall $72,720.00 $72,720.00
33 1 Richard Auger, Thomas Johnson, Ronald Johnson $3,000.00 $3,000.00
34 22 Gregg Hennek $94.00 $94.00
35 0 NO BID $110.00 $0.00
36 8 Richard and Pamela Dado $3,750.00 $3,750.00
Total Tracts 36 Total Value $406,520.00
Pulled Tracts 1 Pulled Tracts Value $170.00
Net Available Tracts 35 Net Total Value $406,350.00 $277,940.00
Total Tracts Sold 23
Percent of Available 65.71% Percent of 68.40%
Tracts Sold Appraised Value
Sold
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