June 2014 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 0 NO BID $36,050.00 50.00
2 0 NOBID $9,200.00 $0.00
3 0 NOBID $13,800.00 $0.00
4 0 NOBID $12,600.00 $0.00
5 106 William P Maney $11,750.00 $11,750.00
6 0 NOBID $56,500.00 $0.00
7 0 NOBID $16,000.00 $0.00
8 0 NO BID $12,250.00 $0.00
9 107 Kent J Kochler Sandra E Koehler $500,00 $900.00
10 0 NOBID $17,000.00 $0.00
11 0 NOBID $67,800.00 $0.00
12 0 NO BID $26,300.00 $0.00
13 112 James M Jorissen and Christine M Jorissen $26,600.00 $26,600.00
14 0 NOBID $13,150.00 $0.00
15 0 NO BID $11,300.00 $0.00
16 0 NOBID $32,750.00 $0.00
17 109 Thomas D Setter and Julaine D Setter $14,800.00 $14,800.00
18 0 NO BID $17,150.00 $0.00
19 0 NOBID $14,000.00 $0.00
20 0 NO BID $5,500.00 $0.00
21 111 Daniel E. Parr £2,900.00 $10,500.00
22 104 Bart Polacsek $1,150.00 $1,150.00
23 0 NOBID $400.00 £0.00
24 0 NO BID $400.00 $0.00
25 113 Seth Levanen $1,200.00 $1,200.00
Thursday, June 12, 2014 Page | of 2



Tract Number Bidder Name

Appraised Price Sale Amount

Total Tracts

Pulled Tracts

Net Available Tracts

Total Tracts Sold

Percent of Available Tracts Sold

;I'hursdny, Juric 12, 20I4.

25
0
25
7

28 00%

Total Value $421,450.00
Pulled Tracts Value $0.00
Net Total Value $421,450.00 $66,900.00

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 15.87%
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