June 2011 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 0 NO BID $18,000.00

2 109 Michelle Holmes $12,000.00 $12,000.00
3 0 NOBID $31,000.00

4 102 Darin Lind and Sherri Lind $23,600.00 $23,600.00
5 0 NO BID $30,000.00

6 0 NO BID $26,000.00

7 105 Randy Schroetter $19,800.00 $19,800.00
8 999 PULLED $57,750.00

9 0 NO BID $47,000.00

10 999 PULLED $24,400.00

il 0 NO BID $3,000.00

12 0 NOBID $18,650.00

13 0 NOBID $33,000.00

14 0 NO BID $24,000.00

15 0 NOBID $37,800.00

16 0 NOBID $37,800.00

17 0 NOBID $360.00

18 0 NO BID $660.00

19 0 NOBID $660.00

20 0 NOBID $660.00

21 0 NOBID $660.00

22 103 Christopher S Cotton $660.00 $660.00
23 0 NO BID $660.00

24 0 NOBID $660.00
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24

2

22

4
18.18%

Total Value $448,780.00
Pulled Tracts Value $246,450.00
Net Total Value $202,330.00 $56,060.00

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 27.71%
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