Request for Bids

Demolition — Tax Forfeited Property
Contract 5349 - Sites 1 thru 9
Opening: Friday, October 14, 2016 1:00 P.M. CT

=4
%
pa ? Site 1 Site 2 Site 3 Site 4 Site 5 Site 6 Site 7 Site 8 Site 8
= | | REMOVED FROM
§ % LIST
Name / City State SIC /I 220 0 090 092 ISR 20 009090 (USRS 00 ISThamaaaaesl 00000 [ |
T = mental Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
G Men :E\“V‘S’:J $ 13,535.00 |§ 3a4000 | $§154a5.00 | § NB | S $ $ $
=y, ™ / |/ | REMOVEDFROM | Sepictni SeptichUnt SepticiUni SeplichUnit sepiount~ ™NB | sepicunt NB | sepiount  NB | sepiount N E
LIST $ Hoooo | § N/A $§ Hyoo.00 $ $ $ $ $
B il BO\F\d / Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit
§ L1500 |8 N/A $§ 12500 |[§ $ $ $ $
T’(‘) ‘S C S“Y _* Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
Ny anTtroction $ 430000 | § HUB0 00 | §1IH0.0O |§QUHoo0 | §a34coc0 [§ Q3c000 |§ 8 Loo.co |§ 93coco
Hdobt ‘ N(\( REMOVED FROM | Septic/Unit | SeplicUnit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Seplic/Unit SepticAUnit Seplic/Unit Seplic/Unit
“3 / \/ LIST $ |,0co.Co | § L ooo.cO | § | 0000 | § 00000 | § 100000 [§ | 00002 [§ 1000.C0 | § 1 000.00
Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit | Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit
Bid Bond v S 150000 |§ | o000 | § 130000 |5 150000 | | scmoo |5 scaoco |s | sooco | s { Soo.co
l < : Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
aski / $ $ 33,852.00 | § 5 U 00 | § 23,6400 [ § 17QA% .00 | §$ qT0cO | §17Q35.00
Dolotn MN v REMOVED FROM | Septicnt N3 | Septictunit N3 | septicsunit | Septic/Unit Septic/Unit SepticUnit SeplicUnit Septic/Unit
' LIST $ $ $ Soo.co | § & $ & $ $ & $ @
‘B 4 B r‘c( / Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Weli Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit
e $ $ $ A50000 |§ o $ o $ & $ & $ &
‘ Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
Mefﬁ%; E*JTMLT\?‘WS $ 20,000.00 | § Som.co | § 2000000 | § MB": § $ $ . $ .
' REMOVED FROM | Seplic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Seplic/Unit (3| SepticcUnit  N{3 | Septic/Unit N SepticUnit Ni
7 4 / LIST $ Lococo | § & - $ Ctpoo.m ‘;etlc Avs $ N sIC $ $
Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit apping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit
B'd Bo«'\d v § 2.750.00 $ ép $ L 73a500 |§ $ $ $ $ ng
v [ c + Lurnp Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
iele Cortroc b $25 3700 | $13075.00 | $30RT.0O | $I1535300 | $33,17S.c0 | $13,707.00 | §13,335.00 | $12Quaco
DU[U'H‘\ [\ru\f REMOVED FROM | Septic/Unit SepticAUnit Septic/Unit Seplic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septidhnii Seplic/Unit
' Yav4 LIST § 3,d. 00 |§ & $ 359300 |§ $ & $ & $ \QT500 | § &
9 Weli Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit
13id {Jond $ B0 | § $ %5700 |§ & $ $ & $ 3ia500 [(§&
NB=No Bid

-~
Bids Opened By: //@%M %G/ '2%0{

In Presence Of;

aﬁﬂﬁ_ﬁt Ma&;é/f
L7



Request for Bids

Demolition — Tax Forfeited Property
Contract 5349 - Sites 10 thru 18
Opening: Friday, October 14, 2016 1:00 P.M. CT

5 Site 10 Site 11 Sita 12 Site 13 Site 14 Site 15 Site 16 Site 17 Site 18
s |3
s |29
Name / City State 2(2]
_ : Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum tump Sum
G-Men Envirormental Nk s $12,550.00 | $ 810000 |§ THAO.CO |§ 5LR0CO |$ 6,00.00 | $ 375000 |$ HQ50.00
l:‘l}(, MN Sseptichnll N3 SsepticIUnil NG S;epticiUSkllOD SsepticlUnil o Septic/Unit = SepitUnt | Sepcln Septic/Unit SepticUnit o
: Hoo. $ Hoo. $ Yoo $ c0.c0 | § cocd | §  Hoo.
Wiell Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit V;ell Capqpl nito Well Capping/Unit Well Cappi On“OO Wel Clapﬂngé!n‘icujo Well C:!ap;!ingIUnltoo Well Cla‘;';{pingIUnit Well Cappi niéD
$ 0 $ . $ 1,250 $ : $ 100, $ LIooCo § 1,300,
T ! Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
tory 5 Canstrochion sl 200 | § Qloo00 | §|0,wcoco| $ it acoon | § 1080000 |$ 7,300.C0 | §11300.C0 | § 7.500.00 | § |03c0.C0
H blowﬁ ,MN /| ] septicunt SeplichUrit SepliciUnit Seplc/Unit SeplicUnit Septic/Unit Septic/Uni SepticiUni SepiciUnit
$ (,oc;o.qo $ \,Qoopo $§ Lo | § [ 000.CO |8 |ocoen|§ |,00.00| s 1,0600.00 | § LOOO.00 [§ | 00000
W$ell lC'.aagjmcn(%n’unll V;'ell (iapgl_ggmé)o V:ell gappingfllnitoo V;'ell ?é?n {Unit V;’ell Ctap%n(g:’lgﬁoo V;’el‘. Cfppsi[\cg%ﬂtcx) V;ell lC:a%)_piC;l%NgO V;ell ?a%)gl;rztgo V;’ell Ci%méo
H S 4 k Lump 'Sum Lump S'um . Lump Sl:m Lump Slum Lump S;Jm . Lump Sdm : Lurmp lSurn Lump ISum Lump Sium
$ 21,2580 | $ 13250 | § 432300 | § $ $ LHULoO | §{(,3co.co | $10aco.c0 | § \OTHO.0O
DL)( U‘Hd")I Ml\r S:pﬁcgnit Sseplic.fUnit S:pﬂc!Unil Septic/Unit NS Sseptic!Unll ™3 | SepticiUnit Septic/Unit Sepl(i%Unit Seplic/Unit
S00.C0 | $ $ Soo.co |$  Soo. $ $§ So000
}/ / V;ell Capping/Unit V:ell &ppingIUnil Vgell (g;ppssnglgl}m V\slell Capping/Unit ‘Asletl Capping/Unit ‘J‘slell g.aprg_it&ggn&) Well CagginglUnll Wsell cCéapping!Unit Well CappingﬁJniérD
' . G $ A.500.C0 $ 2500,
Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum i Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
Mesglo 1Btumincos $ $ $ $15.000.00 | $15,000.00 | § 850000 |$ 150000 | 500000 |§
Glbert, MW |/ |/ | sopiount N3 | septiounit N3 | Septirtmt (N3 | septicili Septic/Unit Septic/Uni Septic/Unit Septic/Uni Sepinit (3
$ $ $ $ {,000.00 |§ LOOOOO | § (0000 [§ (OCOCO | § | 00000 |§
V;ell Capping/Unit V;ell Capping/Unit V;’ell Capping/Unit \r;fellc ingfUnit V;ell ga%)l?gmoo V:ell g‘a%giggfgnit Well ?a&iggnét)o Well C;?pingIUnit Well Capping/Unit
f : : OO | § 1 Loo $ $
. Lump Sum l.ump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
Viele CO"’*‘"‘?#"B | $10,a54.co | $11,500.00 |$20Q8.60 | $37,CHT.00 | $2964 00 | si5a3Tco | $I4TAS500 | $13357.00 | $15368.00
Doloth, M | /| septictunit SeplicUnit SepticUnit Septic/Unit SepticlUnit Seplic/Unit SepticiUnit SepticUnt Septichunit
$ & e $ $ Jlbaco|$ 3,3 co | § 6IHOO |§ 31300 | §31LA00 | § 3140 $ 301260
Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Cappi it Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit
s & s o S o] et | | s ehoo |5 LT |y iestes s TR 00
NB=No Bid |BS7.00

Bids Opened By:

In Presence Of:&@gﬂwfﬂ Z/(/a/céu /A
‘ /4




Opening: Friday, October 14, 2016 1:00 P.M. CT

Request for Bids

Demolition - Tax Forfeited Property
Contract 5349 - Sites 1 thru 9

N
- é Site 1 Site 2 Site 3 Site 4 Site 5 Site 6 Site 7 Site 8 Site 9
'E -§ REMOVED FROM
B |5 LIST |
Name / City State i |
6{_ ack B ros Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum i
- § HhSoco [ $iScoco | §2H 30000 [ $19530.00 | § 30,6000 | $30,6SH 00 | § QLHS.CO | $IT 20500 |
Super( o, WL / / REMOVED FROM | Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit SepticUnit ,
LIST § 130000 |§ 1800.00 |§ | 30000 |§ B $ & $ & $ 18COC0 [§ & !
Well Cappunngnlt Well Capping/Unit Weli Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit
Bld Bom! v’ $§ 3,300.00 |§ 33000 $§ 230000 | § $ & $ & $ 330000 |§
/d<‘ D(LD ) ‘ Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum |
$ $ $ $15,075.00 $ U5 50000 | $ Y4 Hoo.cOo $ Goco.oD $ lT,QO0,00
SOS\DOW Mt\f l/ / REMOVED FROM | SeplictUnit  \{[3 | SepticfUnit N3 | Septiciunit N3 | SepticfUnit Septic/Unit Seplic/Unit Seplic/Unit Septic/Unit
’ LIST $ $ $ $ & $ & $ & $ @ $ @
- m : Well Capping/Unit Weil Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Wetl Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit
Bid Bond v~ $ s $ $ 2 $ & $ O & $ &
~ Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum mp Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
Ud?lvlfh chi; &Q $llasoco | $350000 |3 s 5 s B . \
Jhreen REMOVED FROM | Seplic/Unit SeplchUmt Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit 13| Septic/Unit
’ 104 LIST $ 250.00 $ 1p0.00 $ NG $ NG $ NG $ $ N $
Well CapplngIUmln? Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit | Well Capping/Unit | Well Capping/Unit
Check ¥730L53 $ 6o/t |§ lcocO | $ $ $ $ $ $
Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
$ f $ $ $ $ $ $ $
REMOVED FROM SsepticIUniI Sseptic!Unit !SsepliclUnit Sseptic!Unit SsepliclUnit SsepﬂclUnit SsepticlUnil Sseptic!Unll
LIST
Well Capping/Unit V;’el[ Capping/Unit Wsell Capping/Unit V;’ell Capping/Unit \zell Capping/Unit ‘J‘sJeII Capping/Unit V;ell Capping/Unit ‘Aslell Capping/Unit
$
Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum o Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
REMOVED FROM | Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Seplic/Unit
LIST $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
Well Capping/Unit \nslell Capping/Unit V;'ell Capping/Unit \nslell Capping/Unit V:ell Capping/Unit M,.'ell Capping/Unit V\slell Capping/Unit V;eil Capping/Unit
$

NB=No Bid

Bids Opened By:

In Presence Of .

aruelo /J{JQZM




Request for Bids
Demolition — Tax Forfeited Property
Contract 5349 - Sites 10 thru 18
Opening: Friday, October 14, 2016 1:00 P.M. CT

E Site 10 Site 11 Site 12 Site 13 Site 14 Site 15 Site 16 Site 17 Site 18
|2
K f
2|5
Name | City State 2|2
S {' K Bt‘ Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lurnp Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
ac S $1LQlR.CO $13,35000 | $14H 3850 $1QA5ccco | §IL]BOoCO | §13Hmoo | §1a8c0.co | §15,30000 | §(3UHco.co
NS peror, WL / / SeplicUnit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Eapia%n Sepiic/Unit SepticiUnit
$ & $ 1300.C0 $ | 3CO.00 $ |,300.00 $ 1,300.00 |§ 130000 o008 | § |,800.00 $ 30000
Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well dapmngIUnll Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well CappunglUnit Well Capping/Unit Well Cappmg!Umt
$ X $§ 3.300.00 | §3B/OLO | § 330000 $ 2.3C0.00 | §3300.00 | $aAJCOCO | §3,30000 | § 235000
A- P(ws Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
S ML /| $irs0000 | 8 Boco.co |8 $ $ $ $ $ $
Qi:v)l iglel’\g N v Ssept.gUnit Septic/Unit s:pﬁdumt NB SsepticlUnit NB Ssepllc!UnIt N S;.‘ptidUnit NG Sseplini.lnit NB| seplicunt 3 S:pliclUnit NG
$ & )
Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit
$ & $ & $ = $ $ $ $ $
Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
Udovich GO"““QS@ $ $ $ $§Q35000 | $ $ $ §
G\neen M t\( \/ / Sseplichnit NR SseplicJUnit N3 Sseptichnit N SseptidUnil ND S:phcélgto oo SsepticlUnil D s:ptidumt N3 SseptidUnik NGB SsepticlUnIt NG
Well Capping/Unit Weli Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit 1., | Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Weil Capping/Unit
$ $ $ $ $ o OC ot $ $ $
Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum | Lump Sum Lump Sum
$ $ i $ $ $ $ $ $ $
Seplic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Seplic/Unit Septic/Unit SepticUnit Seplic/Unit Septic/Unit
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unil Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit
$ $ $ == $ $ $ $ $ $
Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum Lump Sum
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Septic/Unit Seplic/Unit Septic/Unit
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ $
Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Wel! Capping/Unit | Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit Well Capping/Unit | Well Capping/Unit | Well Capping/Unit
§ $ $ $ [ $ $ $ | $ )

NB=No Bid

Bids Opened By:_@ﬂ W? M‘i

In Presence Of: 5'" "Jﬁ’ arvie i;_; Z /L/&ﬂaé& %—5{
%




