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Location Vendor Tank 
Size Product

2016/2017
Est. Annual 

Usage 
(Gallons)

250 to
999

Gallons

1000
to 1999
Gallons

2000
to 2999
Gallons

3000
to 3999
Gallons

4000
to 4999
Gallons

5000
to 5999
Gallons

6000
and up
Gallons

Div. 4 – Buyck Rainy Lake 1,000 Gasohol 1,000 0.4600 0.4600 0.4600 0.4600 0.4600 0.4600 0.4600

Div. 4 – Buyck Rainy Lake  10,000 D.F. 1-2  10,000 0.3320 0.3320 0.3320 0.3320 0.3320 0.3320 0.3320

Div. 4 – Cook Rainy Lake 12,000 D.F. 1-2 25,000 0.3148 0.3148 0.3148 0.3148 0.3148 0.3148 0.3148

Land Dept - Cook  County's Fleet Card Vendor 
Location Gasohol 3,200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Div. 4 – Ely Starkman Oil Vendor 
Location D.F. 1-2 23,000 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990

Div. 4 – Ely Starkman Oil Vendor 
Location Gasohol 7,500 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990

Land Dept – Ely Starkman Oil Vendor 
Location Gasohol 2,000 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990

Motor Pool – Ely Starkman Oil Vendor 
Location Gasohol 2,000 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990 0.4990

Div. 4 - Embarrass Como Oil 3,000 D.F. 1-2 20,000 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360

Div. 4 - Embarrass Como Oil 3,000 Gasohol 5,000 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360

Div. 4 – Kabetogama Rainy Lake 1,000 D.F. 1-2 4,000 0.4600 0.4600 0.4600 0.4600 0.4600 0.4600 0.4600

Div. 4 – Linden Grove Rainy Lake 10,000 Gasohol 22,000 0.2910 0.2910 0.2910 0.2910 0.2910 0.2910 0.2910

Div. 4 – Linden Grove Rainy Lake 10,000 D.F. 1-2 60,000 0.3072 0.3072 0.3072 0.3072 0.3072 0.3072 0.3072

Div. 4 – Tower Petroleum Traders 4,000 Gasohol 17,000 1.0387 0.6487 0.4887 0.3937 0.3637 0.3537 0.3182

Div. 4 – Tower Rainy Lake 10,000 D.F. 1-2 22,000 0.3230 0.3230 0.3230 0.3230 0.3230 0.3230 0.3230

Div. 5 – Brookston Como Oil 3,000 Gasohol 5,000 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360

Div. 5 – Brookston Como Oil 3,000 D.F. 1-2  35,000 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360
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Div. 5 – Jean Duluth Petroleum Traders 10,000 Gasohol 12,000 0.5887 0.4537 0.3887 0.3437 0.3237 0.3137 0.2880

Div. 5 – Jean Duluth Petroleum Traders 10,000 D.F. 1-2 48,000 0.5888 0.4538 0.3888 0.3438 0.3238 0.3138 0.3067

Div. 5 – Pike Lake Petroleum Traders 10,000 Gasohol 95,000 0.5887 0.4537 0.3887 0.3437 0.3237 0.3137 0.2850

Div. 5 – Pike Lake Petroleum Traders 10,000 D.F. 1-2 85,000 0.5888 0.4538 0.3888 0.3438 0.3238 0.3138 0.2837

Div. 6 – Brimson Weekly Keep 
Fill Como Oil 1,000 D.F. 1-2 10,000 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360

Div. 6 – Cotton ICO Vendor 
Location Gasohol 6,000 0.4350 0.4350 0.4350 0.4350 0.4350 0.4350 0.4350

Div. 6 – Cotton ICO Vendor 
Location D.F. 1-2 34,000 0.4350 0.4350 0.4350 0.4350 0.4350 0.4350 0.4350

Div. 6 – Town of White - Keep 
Fill Como Oil 1,000 Gasohol 5,000 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360

Div. 6 – Town of White - Keep 
Fill Como Oil 2,000 D.F. 1-2 35,000 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360 0.6360

Div. 6 – Virginia Rainy Lake 8,000 Gasohol 55,000 0.2990 0.2990 0.2990 0.2990 0.2990 0.2990 0.2990

Div. 6 – Virginia Rainy Lake 8,000 Gasohol 39,000 0.2990 0.2990 0.2990 0.2990 0.2990 0.2990 0.2990

Div. 6 – Virginia Rainy Lake 12,000 D.F. 1-2 66,000 0.3050 0.3050 0.3050 0.3050 0.3050 0.3050 0.3050

Motor Pool, Virginia Virginia Public Works Vendor 
Location Gasohol 15,500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Div. 7 - Floodwood County's Fleet Card Vendor 
Location Gasohol 4,000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Div. 7 - Floodwood Petroleum Traders 12,000 D.F. 40,000 0.9388 0.5488 0.4638 0.3738 0.3438 0.3238 0.2975
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Div. 7 – Hibbing Petroleum Traders 10,000 Gasohol 65,000 0.9387 0.5487 0.4637 0.3737 0.3437 0.3324 0.3120

Div. 7 – Hibbing Petroleum Traders 12,000 Gasohol 40,000 0.9387 0.5487 0.4637 0.3737 0.3437 0.3324 0.3120

Div. 7 – Hibbing Petroleum Traders 12,000 D.F. 1-2 85,000 0.9388 0.5488 0.4638 0.3738 0.3438 0.3238 0.3118

Div. 7 – Hibbing Petroleum Traders 12,000 D.F. 1-2 85,000 0.9388 0.5488 0.4638 0.3738 0.3438 0.3238 0.3118

Div. 7 – Meadowlands Petroleum Traders 10,000 D.F. 25,000 0.9388 0.5488 0.4638 0.3738 0.3438 0.3238 0.3076

Div. 7 – Meadowlands Como Oil 1,500 Gasohol 5,000 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360

Motor Pool Duluth Petroleum Traders 6,000 Gasohol 24,000 0.5887 0.4537 0.3887 0.3437 0.3237 0.3137 0.2860

Motor Pool Duluth Petroleum Traders 10,000 Gasohol 20,000 0.5887 0.4537 0.3887 0.3437 0.3237 0.3137 0.2860

Public Safety Building, Duluth Como Oil 2,800 D.F. 1-2 1,200 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360

Public Safety Building, Duluth Como Oil 280 F.O. 1 400 0.2510 0.2510 0.2510 0.2510 0.2510 0.2510 0.2510

N.E.R.C.C. Saginaw Como Oil 2,000 Gasohol 6,000 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360

N.E.R.C.C. Saginaw Como Oil 2,000 D.F. 1-2 3,000 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360 0.5360

N.E.R.C.C. Saginaw Como Oil 500 F.O. 1 500 0.2510 0.2510 0.2510 0.2510 0.2510 0.2510 0.2510
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